New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Shorelands Construction Inc.

Contract No. P500.493

Hall Building Corp.

Item No.

Unit Code
1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 107-0001
4 108-0001
5 201-0002
6 202-0002
7 202-0007
8 205-0002
9 208-0008
10 208-0022
11 208-N0001
12 213-0002
13 301-0002
14 302-0004
15 302-0064
16 302-0073
17 303-N0004
18 305-0006
19 401-0066
20 502-0251
21 504-0011
22 506-0003
23 509-0001
24 509-0002
25 514-0001
26 516-0009
27 516-0013
28 517-0003
29 517-0009
30 522-0001
31 528-0001
32 599-N0003
33 599-N0018
34 599-N0022
35 599-N0023
36 599-N0024
37 703-0001
38 704-0003
39 803-0001
40 2000-N007
41 2000-N008
42 2000-N009
43 2000-N015
44 2000-N025
45 2000-N026
46 2000-N027
47 2000-N028
48 2000-N029
49 2000-N030
50 2000-N031
51 2000-N032

Qty

uomM
1LS.
1LS.
1LS.
10,000.00 USD
1LS.
29 C.Y.
4 CY.
13 C.Y.
425 L.F.
2 Each
1 Each
5 Ton
8 S..
2 Ton
67 GAL
98 Ton
17 S.Y.
821 S.Y.
265 LB
150 L.F.
20 C.Y.
35 L.F.
11 S.F.
30 L.F.
100 S.Y.
500 L.F.
16 S.F.
1LS.
10 Mnth
5 Each
2 Each
50,000.00 USD
10 L.F.
3 Each
80 L.F.
1 Each
42 SY.
42 SY.
1LS.
40,000.00 USD
10,000.00 USD
L.S.
L.S.
L.S.
L.S.
L.S.
L.S.
L.S.
50,000.00 USD
10,000.00 USD
40,000.00 USD

G

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Progress Schedule

Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Clearing and Grubbing

Roadway Excavation, Earth

Stripping Topsoil

Coarse Aggregate Layer

Heavy Duty Silt Fence

Inlet Filter, Type 2

Concrete Washout Facility

Disposal of Regulated Material

Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick

Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course

Tack Coat

Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M64 Surface Course
Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 4In Thick
Pavement Removal, 2in Depth
Reinforcement Steel

Cleaning Existing Storm Drains

Incidental Concrete

9in X 18in Concrete Vertical Curb

Sign Panels

U-channel Post

Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick

Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic
Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic
Furnish Field Office, Type C

Maintain Field Office, Type C

Test Pits

Reset Junction Box

Project Allowances (No-Bid)

2in Plastic Gas Main

Bollards

2in Copper Water Pipe, Type K

2in Water Valve

Topsoil

Seeding, Type C

Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 1
Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID)

Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID)
Building Electric Work - Location No. 1
Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1
Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1
Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1
Building Fire Protection Work - Location No. 1
Site Electrical Work

Demolition of Buildings (1)

NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid)
Universal Waste Removal (No-Bid)

Mold Remediation (No-Bid)

Unit Price Line Total
$5,000.00 $5,000.00
$142,514.00 $142,514.00
$6,000.00 $6,000.00
$1.00 $10,000.00
$1,100.00 $1,100.00
$432.00 $12,528.00
$165.00 $660.00
$110.00 $1,430.00
$6.60 $2,805.00
$275.00 $550.00
$400.00 $400.00
$500.00 $2,500.00
$22.00 $176.00
$330.00 $660.00
$7.70 $515.90
$198.00 $19,404.00
$55.00 $935.00
$14.00 $11,494.00
$3.00 $795.00
$22.00 $3,300.00
$420.00 $8,400.00
$55.00 $1,925.00
$132.00 $1,452.00
$5.50 $165.00
$89.00 $8,900.00
$2.20 $1,100.00
$22.00 $352.00
$11,000.00 $11,000.00
$550.00 $5,500.00
$500.00 $2,500.00
$3,025.00 $6,050.00
$1.00 $50,000.00
$132.00 $1,320.00
$1,500.00 $4,500.00
$82.00 $6,560.00
$935.00 $935.00
$165.00 $6,930.00
$17.00 $714.00
$1.00 $1.00
$1.00 $40,000.00
$1.00 $10,000.00

$314,823.00 $314,823.00
$137,700.00 $137,700.00
$345,000.00 $345,000.00

$42,900.00 $42,900.00
$24,750.00 $24,750.00
$75,257.00 $75,257.00
$19,800.00 $19,800.00
$1.00 $50,000.00
$1.00 $10,000.00
$1.00 $40,000.00

$1,451,300.90

Unit Price Line Total
$22,000.00 $22,000.00
$160,000.00 $160,000.00
$4,000.00 $4,000.00
$1.00 $10,000.00
$15,000.00 $15,000.00
$225.00 $6,525.00
$390.00 $1,560.00
$80.00 $1,040.00
$16.00 $6,800.00
$425.00 $850.00
$1,500.00 $1,500.00
$350.00 $1,750.00
$180.00 $1,440.00
$720.00 $1,440.00
$15.00 $1,005.00
$270.00 $26,460.00
$90.00 $1,530.00
$15.00 $12,315.00
$5.50 $1,457.50
$14.00 $2,100.00
$620.00 $12,400.00
$100.00 $3,500.00
$26.00 $286.00
$25.00 $750.00
$79.00 $7,900.00
$2.50 $1,250.00
$18.00 $288.00
$10,000.00 $10,000.00
$600.00 $6,000.00
$1,700.00 $8,500.00
$1,500.00 $3,000.00
$1.00 $50,000.00
$676.00 $6,760.00
$800.00 $2,400.00
$138.00 $11,040.00
$750.00 $750.00
$150.00 $6,300.00
$3.00 $126.00
$7,000.00 $7,000.00
$1.00 $40,000.00
$1.00 $10,000.00

$318,000.00 $318,000.00
$156,000.00 $156,000.00
$340,000.00 $340,000.00

$56,000.00 $56,000.00
$44,100.00 $44,100.00
$58,000.00 $58,000.00
$90,000.00 $90,000.00
$1.00 $50,000.00
$1.00 $10,000.00
$1.00 $40,000.00

$1,629,122.50
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