
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.468 Letting Date: 3/27/18

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $64,288.00 $64,288.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $143,927.00 $143,927.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00

2 2000-N006 50,000.00 USD Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

3 2000-N007 50,000.00 USD Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

4 2000-N008 30,000.00 USD Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

5 2000-N009 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $16,104.00 $16,104.00 $14,030.00 $14,030.00 $8,900.00 $8,900.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $9,800.00 $9,800.00

6 2000-N010 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $7,441.00 $7,441.00 $12,535.00 $12,535.00 $8,600.00 $8,600.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00

7 2000-N011 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 3 $4,186.00 $4,186.00 $6,791.00 $6,791.00 $6,800.00 $6,800.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00

8 2000-N012 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 4 $13,197.00 $13,197.00 $17,020.00 $17,020.00 $15,500.00 $15,500.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $17,050.00 $17,050.00

9 2000-N013 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 5 $5,814.00 $5,814.00 $14,720.00 $14,720.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,650.00 $12,650.00

10 2000-N014 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 6 $18,023.00 $18,023.00 $26,220.00 $26,220.00 $14,900.00 $14,900.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $16,400.00 $16,400.00

11 2000-N015 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $113,018.00 $113,018.00 $148,193.00 $148,193.00 $135,130.00 $135,130.00 $172,000.00 $172,000.00 $182,400.00 $182,400.00 $222,424.00 $222,424.00

12 2000-N016 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $86,105.00 $86,105.00 $111,540.00 $111,540.00 $95,455.00 $95,455.00 $126,000.00 $126,000.00 $142,500.00 $142,500.00 $181,948.00 $181,948.00

13 2000-N017 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3 $76,943.00 $76,943.00 $156,489.00 $156,489.00 $142,778.00 $142,778.00 $218,000.00 $218,000.00 $212,500.00 $212,500.00 $323,798.00 $323,798.00

14 2000-N018 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 4 $240,241.00 $240,241.00 $308,056.00 $308,056.00 $338,491.00 $338,491.00 $381,000.00 $381,000.00 $422,500.00 $422,500.00 $407,246.00 $407,246.00

15 2000-N019 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 5 $69,942.00 $69,942.00 $122,257.00 $122,257.00 $90,137.00 $90,137.00 $128,000.00 $128,000.00 $150,500.00 $150,500.00 $151,608.00 $151,608.00

16 2000-N020 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 6 $247,457.00 $247,457.00 $362,851.00 $362,851.00 $443,520.00 $443,520.00 $489,000.00 $489,000.00 $485,500.00 $485,500.00 $527,076.00 $527,076.00

17 2000-N021 70,000.00 USD Force Account for Building Architectural Work Allowances (NO-BID) $1.00 $70,000.00 $1.00 $70,000.00 $1.00 $70,000.00 $1.00 $70,000.00 $1.00 $70,000.00 $1.00 $70,000.00

18 2000-N022 25,000.00 USD Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00

19 2000-N023 500,000.00 USD Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00

20 2000-N024 150,000.00 USD Force Account for Temporary Heating Allowance (NO-BID) $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00

$1,837,759.00 $2,180,702.00 $2,330,638.00 $2,452,500.00 $2,554,900.00 $2,822,000.00

EACM CORPKaser Mechanical, LLCBaseLine Item Detail ACP Contracting Inc. Gaudelli Bros Inc. Estock Piping Co LLC Industrial Cooling Corp.
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