New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P200.469 Letting Date: 2/21/2018

BaseLine Item Detail Earle Asphalt Company C. J. Hesse Rencor, Inc. South State, Inc. Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. Ferreira Construction Co. Inc. Berto Construction, Inc.
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1]104-0001 1|L.S. Construction Layout $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $100.00 $100.00 $32,700.00 $32,700.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $1.00
2(104-0002 1|L.S. Mobilization $290,000.00 $290,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $380,000.00 $380,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00] $398,000.00 $398,000.00| $375,000.00 $375,000.00| $300,000.00 $300,000.00
3[107-0001 1|L.S. Progress Schedule $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $10,701.00 $10,701.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $8,500.00 8,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $6,000.00 6,000.00
4]108-0001 8700|USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $8,700.00 $1.00 $8,700.00 $1.00 $8,700.00 $1.00 $8,700.00 $1.00 8,700.00 $1.00 $8,700.00 $1.00 8,700.00
5[208-0022 75|Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $160.00 $12,000.00 $185.00 $13,875.00 $200.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $75.00 $100.00 7,500.00 $500.00 $37,500.00 $100.00 7,500.00
6[302-0002 16600/ Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $84.52 $1,403,032.00 $85.00 $1,411,000.00 $88.50 $1,469,100.00 $115.00 $1,909,000.00 $100.00{ $1,660,000.00 $112.00 $1,859,200.00 $91.00{ $1,510,600.00
7[302-0063 17000|{USD Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $17,000.00 $1.00 $17,000.00 $1.00 $17,000.00 $1.00 $17,000.00 $1.00 $17,000.00 $1.00 $17,000.00 $1.00 $17,000.00
8]302-0064 10850|GAL Tack Coat $0.01 $108.50 $3.90 $42,315.00 $0.01 $108.50 $0.01 $108.50 $0.01 $108.50 $0.01 $108.50 $0.01 $108.50
9]305-0001 1800(S.Y. Pavement Removal, 5in Depth $30.00 $54,000.00 $30.00 $54,000.00 $55.00 $99,000.00 $40.00 $72,000.00 $20.00 $36,000.00 $150.00 $270,000.00 $275.00 $495,000.00
10{305-N0001 21000|L.F. Remove Existing Rumble Strip $0.50 $10,500.00 $8.00 $168,000.00 $10.00 $210,000.00 $2.50 $52,500.00 $8.50 $178,500.00 $11.00 $231,000.00 $7.50 $157,500.00
11{305-0002 135000]S.Y. Surface Milling, 2in Average Depth $2.23 $301,050.00 $2.75 $371,250.00 $2.30 $310,500.00 $4.00 $540,000.00 $2.65 $357,750.00 $2.75 $371,250.00 $2.40 $324,000.00
12{306-0001 41100(L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $0.54 $22,194.00 $0.65 $26,715.00 $0.70 $28,770.00 $0.40 $16,440.00 $0.60 $24,660.00 $0.40 $16,440.00 $1.20 $49,320.00
13{401-0070 94000|S.F. Concrete Penetrating Sealer Treatment $1.10 $103,400.00 $1.40 $131,600.00 $0.50 $47,000.00 $0.50 $47,000.00 $1.38 $129,720.00 $1.50 $141,000.00 $1.25 $117,500.00
14{499-N0009 1[Each Heat-Straightening of Girder $35,498.25 $35,498.25 $62,000.00 $62,000.00 $94,000.00 $94,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
15(508-0001 11000|L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Roadway. $148.79 $1,636,690.00 $150.00 $1,650,000.00 $198.00 $2,178,000.00 $175.00 $1,925,000.00 $193.20 $2,125,200.00 $155.00( $1,705,000.00 $180.00 $1,980,000.00
16(508-0007 11000|L.F. Concrete Median Barrier Removal, Roadway $32.45 $356,950.00 $15.00 $165,000.00 $46.00 $506,000.00 $55.00 $605,000.00 $82.00 $902,000.00 $50.00 $550,000.00 $50.00 $550,000.00
17{509-0007 1[Each Removal of Existing Overhead and Ground-Mounted Sign Panels $3,134.55 $3,134.55 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 $12,750.00 $12,750.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $60,600.00 $60,600.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
18(516-0004 280|L.F. Epoxy Resin Contrast Stripe $7.18 $2,010.40 $7.35 $2,058.00 $10.00 $2,800.00 $7.00 $1,960.00 $8.00 $2,240.00 $7.75 $2,170.00 $7.25 $2,030.00
19(516-0005 118000|L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $0.62 $73,160.00 $0.63 $74,340.00 $0.60 $70,800.00 $0.65 $76,700.00 $0.70 $82,600.00 $0.70 $82,600.00 $0.64 $75,520.00
20(516-0007 62000|L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $1.00 $62,000.00 $0.25 $15,500.00 $0.27, $16,740.00 $2.00 $124,000.00 $0.25 $15,500.00 $0.30 $18,600.00 $0.25 $15,500.00
21(516-0009 57000|L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $1.00 $57,000.00 $0.74 $42,180.00 $0.76 $43,320.00 $2.50 $142,500.00 $0.80 $45,600.00 $0.80 $45,600.00 $0.85 $48,450.00
22(517-0003 1|L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $15,482.63 $15,482.63 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
23(517-0009 10|Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $2,868.75 $28,687.50 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $1,400.00 $14,000.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,300.00 $23,000.00 $3,000.00 $30,000.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00
24(517-0013 5000{USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00
25(524-0042 2|Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard, 10 Bays, 24in Wide $1,718.00 $3,436.00 $18,000.00 $36,000.00 $9,240.00 $18,480.00 $1.00 $2.00 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $13,000.00 $26,000.00 $28,500.00 $57,000.00
26(524-0062 8|Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard $1.00 $8.00 $1,600.00 $12,800.00 $4,910.00 $39,280.00 $1.00 $8.00 $4,000.00 $32,000.00 $2,800.00 $22,400.00 $3,400.00 $27,200.00
27(524-0063 3[Each Repair Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard $1.00 $3.00 $2,625.00 $7,875.00 $6,910.00 $20,730.00 $1.00 $3.00 $1.00 $3.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $7,000.00 $21,000.00
28]530-0001 1300|Each Raised Pavement Markers $25.57 $33,241.00 $27.50 $35,750.00 $25.10 $32,630.00 $25.00 $32,500.00 $30.00 $39,000.00 $27.50 $35,750.00 $26.00 $33,800.00
29(532-0001 50000{USD Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00
30)801-0001 1|L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $524,472.29 $524,472.29 $398,250.00 $398,250.00 $395,000.00 $395,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00] $306,000.00 $306,000.00| $600,000.00 $600,000.00| $850,000.00 $850,000.00
31{801-0002 10100|L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $26.58 $268,458.00 $0.01 $101.00 $39.00 $393,900.00 $20.00 $202,000.00 $23.00 $232,300.00 $20.00 $202,000.00 $35.00 $353,500.00
32]801-0003 15700|L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $8.87 $139,259.00 $30.00 $471,000.00 $5.00 $78,500.00 $63.00 $989,100.00 $22.00 $345,400.00 $30.00 $471,000.00 $25.00 $392,500.00
33]801-0009 3|Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $3,750.00 $11,250.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $8,600.00 $25,800.00 $12,000.00 $36,000.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00
34{801-N0O003 5[Day Placing and Removing Portable Variable Message Sign $885.40 $4,427.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,270.00 $6,350.00 $200.00 $1,000.00 $2,100.00 $10,500.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $500.00 $2,500.00
35(801-0010 2|Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator $1.00 $2.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,485.00 $6,970.00 $1.00 $2.00 $4,600.00 $9,200.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00
36/801-0011 5[Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator $1.00 $5.00 $250.00 $1,250.00 $3,600.00 $18,000.00 $1.00 $5.00 $1,750.00 $8,750.00 $2,500.00 $12,500.00 $2,500.00 $12,500.00
37]801-0012 4|Each Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $1.00 $4.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 $4,900.00 $19,600.00 $1.00 $4.00 $1.00 $4.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $3,500.00 $14,000.00
381801-0013 3|Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $35,000.00 $105,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $8,600.00 $25,800.00 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00
39]803-N0001 1fL.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $0.01 $0.01 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00
$5,565,913.13 $5,696,960.00 $6,846,778.50 $7,143,707.50 $7,278,135.50 $7,392,418.50 $7,641,329.50
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