New Jersey Turnpike Authority

T500.434

Base Line Item Detail ACP Contracting Inc. Estock Piping Co LLC Industrial Cooling Corp. Amco Enterprises Inc Gaudelli Bros Inc.

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1/1D10MOBX 1|L.S. Mobilization $71,586.00 $71,586.00 $105,434.00 $105,434.00 $319,865.00 $319,865.00 $180,000.00 $180,000.00 $27,800.00 $27,800.00
2|9A00078 1|L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $13,034.00 $13,034.00 $15,950.00 $15,950.00 $11,210.00 $11,210.00 $18,600.00 $18,600.00 $14,600.00 $14,600.00
3|9A00079 1JL.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $7,146.00 $7,146.00 $8,030.00 $8,030.00 $8,614.00 $8,614.00 $9,960.00 $9,960.00 12,200.00 12,200.00
4|9A00107 1JL.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 3 $14,178.00 $14,178.00 $16,940.00 $16,940.00 $13,452.00 13,452.00 $19,680.00 19,680.00 16,900.00 16,900.00
5|9A00108 1JL.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 4 $2,629.00 $2,629.00 $4,620.00 $4,620.00 $10,738.00 10,738.00 $12,600.00 12,600.00 14,200.00 14,200.00
6|9A00110 1JL.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 6 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $10,450.00 $10,450.00 $29,353.00 29,353.00 $34,200.00 34,200.00 33,400.00 33,400.00
7]19A00080 1JL.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $307,514.00 $307,514.00 $434,075.00 $434,075.00 $480,971.00 $480,971.00 $422,000.00 $422,000.00 | $556,000.00 $556,000.00
8|9A00081 1JL.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $271,390.00 $271,390.00 $265,152.00 $265,152.00 $250,974.00 $250,974.00 $297,000.00 $297,000.00 | $372,000.00 $372,000.00
9|9A00113 1JL.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3 $187,232.00 $187,232.00 $260,108.00 $260,108.00 $143,716.00 $143,716.00 $278,000.00 $278,000.00 | $373,900.00 $373,900.00

10/9A00114 1JL.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 4 $164,068.00 $164,068.00 $168,144.00 $168,144.00 $120,855.00 $120,855.00 $201,000.00 $201,000.00 | $364,200.00 $364,200.00
11|9A00115 1JL.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 5 $185,440.00 $185,440.00 $217,537.00 $217,537.00 $289,378.00 $289,378.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 | $265,700.00 $265,700.00
12|9A00116 1JL.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 6 $187,147.00 $187,147.00 $197,692.00 $197,692.00 $189,497.00 $189,497.00 $215,000.00 $215,000.00 | $283,500.00 $283,500.00
13|9AFAEOB 1|C.P. Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
14|9AFAMOB 1|C.P. Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 | $250,000.00 $250,000.00
15|9AFAAOB 1|C.P. Force Account for Building Architectural Work Allowances (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
16|5Z0ROA0B 1JL.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
17|5Z0OLAMOB 1JL.S. Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
18|5Z0OROLOB 1JL.S. Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
19|9A00173 1|C.P. Force Account for Temporary Heating Allowance (NO-BID) $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 | $100,000.00 $100,000.00

$1,941,364.00 $2,214,132.00 $2,378,623.00 $2,498,040.00 $2,844,400.00
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