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RESULT FOR BID RM-98127 
 INTERNATIONAL OEM PARTS 

 
LINE # 

 
QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT 

PRICE 
TOTAL 

 
1 

 
1 

 
EACH 

PUMP-W/WASHER & MOTOR  
(IH468885C91)  
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #106117 

 
$35.55 

 
$35.55 

 
2 

 
8 

 

 
EACH 

Clamp-Muffler, 4" I.H. (554318C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #119308  

 
$9.65 

 
$77.20 

 
3 

 
2 

 
EACH 

SPACER-WHEEL (4 1/4"X22")  (I.H. 
A4222KSB) 
 TURNPIKE INVENTORY #120494 

 
$39.22 

 
$78.44 

 
4 

 
4 

 
EACH 

FILTER-AIR`02 I.H. 4700 DT466E  
( I.H. 482644C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #121836 

 
$23.97 

 
$95.88 

 
5 

 
15 

 
EACH 

Clamp Turbo, 02 Inter. 2554  
(IH 1674053C1)  
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #122116 

 
$25.29 

 
$379.35 

 
6 

 
1 

 
EACH 

Muffler f/02 IH 2554 (IH 2018471C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #122337 

 
$210.99 

 
$210.99 

 
7 

 
1 

 
EACH 

Pipe-Exhaust, 02 IH 2554 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #122338 

NO BID NO BID 

 
8 

 
4 

 
EACH 

CLAMP-TURBO,F/92  4700 
(3553803C2)  
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #122524 

 
$20.07 

 
$80.28 

 
9 

 
1 

 
EACH 

PIPE-FLEX 3.50X24 IN  
(IH 320230C1)  
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #122531 

 
$39.04 

 
$39.04 

 
10 

 
2 

 
EACH 

LINE OIL BRADED 02 IH  
(1829802C1) 
 TURNPIKE INVENTORY# 122868 

 
$38.55 

 
$77.10 

 
11 

 
2 

 
EACH 

HORN-89-2002  3523  
( I.H.  3903524C91)  
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 123715 

 
$16.53 

 
$33.06 

 
12 

 
5 

 
EACH 

CABLE-JUMPER,POS.  
( I.H.  BSP95263 )  
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 123832 

 
$6.57 

 
$32.85 

 
13 

 

 
3 

 
EACH 

SWITCH-PRESSURE, LOW AIR  
(IH1658820C1)  
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #124133  
 

 
$20.79 

 
$62.37 

 
14 

 

 
6 

 
EACH 

BUZZER LOW AIR  S25 47 4900   
1688  (IH1688312C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 124172 

 
$23.17 

 
$139.02 



2 
 

 
LINE # 

 
QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT 

PRICE 
TOTAL 

 
15 

 

 
7 

 
EACH 

BUSHING BRAKE 02 S4900 2554 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 125416 

 
$NO BID 

 
$NO BID 

 
16 

 
5 

 
EACH 

SEAL-AXLE,REAR,F/`01 
International  (IHV370120A) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #126914 

 
$78.58 

 
$392.90 

 
17 
 

 
6 

 
EACH 

LIGHT-RIGHT STOP-TAIL  '90     
166 ( I.H.  1661282C91) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #128768 

 
$26.79 

 
$160.74 

 
18 
 

 
1 

 
EACH 

Pipe-Front,International 2002,2554  
(2004504C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #130889 

 
$73.22 

 
$73.22 

 
19 

 
15 

 
EACH 

Line-oil,Turbo Feed (DT530E) (INT  
1842907C93  ) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 131092 

 
$62.13 

 
$931.95 

 
20 
 

 
4 

 
EACH 

Sensor-Cam,F/Int. DT530E  (INT 
1885812C91) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #131263 

 
$109.68 

 
$438.72 

 
21 

 

 
14 

 
EACH 

O-Ring_Turbo Drain, F/02 Int-DT-530  
(INT 1818402C2) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 131462 

 
$1.78 

 
$24.92 

 
22 

 
9 

 
EACH 

Tube-Turbo Drain, F/02 Int. DT-530 
1825669C1 (1259400) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #131463 

 
$24.87 

 
$223.83 

 
23 

 
2 

 
EACH 

Reservoir-Power Steering, F/02 
International IH-3538315C1 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 131476 

 
$114.10 

 
$228.20 

 
24 
 

 
2 

 
EACH 

Switch-Ignition, F/02 International (IH  
468438C-91) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #131479 

 
$35.02 

 
$70.04 

 
25 

 
5 

 
EACH 

"Starter, F/02 International 4700 
(INT10461304) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 131557 

 
$262.33 

 
$1311.65 

 
26 

 
3 

 
EACH 

Starter, F/05 International (IH 
LNM105602) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #131562 

 
$276.68 

 
$830.04 

 
27 

 
24 

 
EACH 

Sensor-Thermistor, F/05 INT. 
7400(NO SUB)  3622764C2 / Replaced 
with (part # 3622764C3) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 131617 

 
$39.06 

 
$937.44 

 
 
 



3 
 

 
 
LINE # 

 
QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT 

PRICE 
TOTAL 

 
28 

 
14 

 
EACH 

Alternator-International Truck 
Internationa lL/N2800LC 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132212 

 
$299.09 

 
$4187.26 

 
29 
 

 
3 

 
EACH 

Radiator, 2002 International 2554  
(INT  IH 1698845C91) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132264 

 
$1969.67 

 
$5909.01 

 
30 
 

 
7 

 
EACH 

Chamber Brake-30-30 (rear) w/Clevis 
Pin INT. 5700  
(INTERNAT  ZAJ3232951) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #132309 

 
$167.77 

 
$1174.39 

 
31 
 

 
4 

 
EACH 

Bolt, Oil Pan, 05-07 INT(DT 570 
ENG) INT 1817978C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #132549 

 
$.58 

 
$2.32 

 
32 
 

 
2 

 
EACH 

Gasket, Oil Pan 05 - 07 INT (DT570 
ENG)(INT 1836197C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132552 

 
$132.80 

 
$265.60 

 
33 

 
1 

 
EACH 

Pan-Oil, 05 - 07 INT (DT 570 ENG) 
(INT 1876974C91) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #132553 

 
$488.07 

 
$488.07 

 
34 
 

 
36 

 
EACH 

Bolt, Oil Pan, 05 -07 INT (DT 570 
ENG)(INT1823291C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132554 

 
$.49 

 
$17.64 

 
35 
 

 
1 

 
EACH 

Pipe-Turbo, to Air Cooler (02 INT 
2554)(INT2023535C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132555 

 
$127.90 

 
$127.90 
 

 
36 
 

 
1 

 
EACH 

Hose, Air Tube to Cooler, 02 INT 2554 
International (1673866C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132556 

 
$31.44 

 
$31.44 

 
37 
 

 
1 

 
EACH 

Hose-Turbo, to Air Tube 02, INT 2554 
international (2024703C2 ) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132557 

 
$36.98 

 
$36.98 

 
38 
 

 
5 

 
EACH 

Clamp-Hose Turbo, 2.5" to 2.9" (INT  
3557854C1  ) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132558 

 
$9.51 

 
$47.55 

 
39 

 
3 

 
EACH 

Clamp-Hose Turbo, Hose to Air Pipe 
3.5" - 3.9" (INT 2026653C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132559 

 
$8.36 

 
$25.08 

 
40 
 

 
1 

 
EACH 

Tube-Water Inlet, F/F7400 INT. 
(INT1817669C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132582 

 
$20.49 

 
$20.49 
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LINE # 

 
QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT 

PRICE 
TOTAL 

 
41 

 
7 

 
EACH 

Chamber-Brake, 36/36 (INT  
ZAJ34337051  ) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132583 

 
$236.91 

 
$1658.37 

 
42 

 
2 

 
EACH 

Motor-Blower, 05-07 International 
(INT  3542611C2 ) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132585 

 
$86.02 

 
$172.04 

 
43 

 
10 

 
EACH 

Resistor, Blower Motor 05-07 Int  
(INT3562102C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #132586 

 
$135.20 

 
$1352.00 

 
44 

 
11 

 
EACH 

Trans-Wiper, 05-10 INT 7400 Replaces 
PS#132184 (INT  3554255C98) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132588 

 
$141.87 

 
$1560.57 

 
45 

 
7 

 
EACH 

Belt-Serp.05 Inter DT 570  (INT 
1842468C91) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132598 

 
$31.37 

 
$219.59 

 
46 

 
6 

 
EACH 

Alternator, 05-07 Inter. INT 
3558757C91 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 132930 

 
$236.39 

 
$1418.34 

 
47 

 
40 

 
EACH 

Fluid Transynd International 27101 
5Gal/can 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 133442 

 
$171.25 

 
$6850.00 

 
48 

 
7 

 
EACH 

Hose,Turbo-Oil Feed, Inter. 2005-Up 
(1844998C2 / 1875053C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134064 

 
$34.31 

 
$240.17 

 
49 

 
6 

 
EACH 

O-Ring,Turbo-Oil Feed, Inter. 
(1820878C2) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134065 

 
$1.51 

 
$9.06 

 
50 

 
32 

 
EACH 

Filter,Oil-Inter.Max Force 10, 2011-Up 
(INT 1884508C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134066 

 
$48.84 

 
$1562.88 

 
51 

 
5 

 
EACH 

Bolt,Turbo-Feed Line, Inter. 2005-Up 
(INT 1817957C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134067 

 
$1.93 

 
$9.65 

 
52 

 
22 

 
EACH 

Filter,Oil-Centrifuge Inter.Max Force 
10, 2011-Up (2606467C91 ) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134135 

 
$25.59 

 
$562.98 

 
53 

 
1 

 
EACH 

Fitting,Hose,Turbo-Oil Feed, Inter. 
2005-Up (INT 1842021C91 ) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134136 

 
$28.66 

 
$28.66 

 
54 

 
18 

 
EACH 

"Shoe,Brake-Rear P16.5x7 w/Hdwr.-
Int.7400/05-up (INTXK3124515Q) 
(Core charge seperate)" 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134179 

 
$87.77 

 
$1579.86 



5 
 

 
LINE # 

 
QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT 

PRICE 
TOTAL 

 
55 

 
6 

 
EACH 

Drum,Brake-Rear P16.5x7 Hub Pilot- 
Int.7400/05-up (INTZBR3600AX / 
260507261 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134180 

 
$180.98 

 
$1085.88 

 
56 

 
4 

 
EACH 

Sensor,Crankshaft, Int. DT570 eng. 
(INT1835985C92) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134181 

 
$81.91 

 
$327.64 

 
57 

 
3 

 
EACH 

Sensor,Coolant Reservoir- Int.7400 
(INT2587324C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134183 
 

 
$18.65 

 
$55.95 

 
58 

 
20 

 
EACH 

Clamp,Front Exhst-Int.7400 
(INT35538032C2) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134276 

 
$20.07 

 
$401.40 

 
59 

 
20 

 
EACH 

Pipe,Front Exhst-Int.7400 
(INT3582606C6) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 134277 

 
$104.81 

 
$2096.20 

 
60 

 
30 

 
EACH 

Filter,Air- Cab International 11-Up 
INT 3839141C1 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #134579 

 
$20.47 

 
$614.10 

 
61 

 
16 

 
EACH 

Filter,Fuel-Inter.Max Force 10, 2010-
Up INT 1878042C92 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY #134591 

 
$46.09 

 
$737.44 

 
62 

 
2 

EACH Alternator, INT. 7500 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 135138 

 
$302.74 

 
$605.48 

 
63 

 
2 

EACH Alternator, INT. 7400, "11" & Up 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 135139 

 
$209.19 

 
$418.38 

 
64 

 
12 

 
EACH 

Mirror, F/7400 Int. Dump ( INT  
2505818C2) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 135184 

 
$36.82 

 
$441.84 

 
65 

 
80 

 
EACH 

Fuse 40 AMP. ECM (INT3504540C1) 
TURNPIKE INVENTORY # 135180 

 
$1.26 

 
$100.80 

 
                                                            TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 65    $ 43,407.79____ 
 

PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT 
 

PLEASE LIST A DISCOUNT OFF ANY AND ALL MANUFACTURERS LIST PRICE FOR 
ANY AND ALL MISCELLANEOUS PARTS NOT LISTED IN THIS BID. THE DISCOUNT 
WILL BE GIVEN BY THE AWARDED BIDDER TO ANY AND ALL OTHER ITEMS 
PURCHASED BY THE AUTHORITY UNDER THIS CONTRACT. IF BIDDING ZERO, 
PLEASE MARK AS SUCH.    
                                                                  _______42______% 


