
SECTION 403 – STEEL STRUCTURES 

403.19 PAYMENT. 

Payment will be made under: 
 

PAY ITEM PAY UNIT 
Formed Steel Flooring for Pedestrian Bridges ..............................................  Square Foot 

 
Begin DCA 2007SS-06 

[Include for all contracts requiring Catches and Protective Shielding for Bridge Work.] 

The following is added: 
 
No separate payment will be made for catches or protective shielding, but costs 
thereof shall be included in the price bid for the pay item “Structural Steel”. 
 

End DCA 2007SS-06 
 

[Note to Designer: Include the below in contracts which involve the off-site storage of structural steel 
to be reviewed with and approved by the Authority’s Design Project Engineer. ] 

 
The following is added to the end of the subsection: 

 
Should the Authority permit the Contractor to order and store raw materials for the 
purposes of fabricating structural steel for bridges, partial payment for the materials 
will be made as follows: 

 
Payment of up to a maximum of 25% of the total  lump sum bid amount of the 
Structural Steel Pay Item will be made to the Contractor upon confirmed delivery of 
raw materials to the approved storage facilities, not to exceed the raw materials 
quantities shown on bills of materials in approved shop drawings.  
 
No payment will be made without substantiating documentation in the form of the 
following: 
 
• Bill(s) of lading for the receipt of the material delivery to the approved storage 

facility. 
• All required material certifications.  
• Proof of insurance for the materials stored at the approved storage facility. 

 
Payment will only be made as a direct reimbursement for costs of materials ordered. 
No payment will be made for related or unrelated expenses or any other premiums 
over and above the direct cost of bill(s) of lading from materials vendor(s). No 
further payments for any work performed as part of the overall contract will be made 
until proof of payment to the raw materials vendor has been submitted and approved 
by the Engineer. 

 
No payment will be made for any materials until delivery to the approved storage 
facility has been confirmed by the Engineer. 

 



When the approved storage facility is on property not belonging to the Authority, the 
material shall be stored in a fenced area with access limited to the Authority and the 
Contractor.  The stored material shall be covered, or otherwise protected from the 
elements to the satisfaction of the Engineer. Additionally, the Contractor shall post a 
sign at the location clearly identifying that the materials are without encumbrances 
and are to be solely used for this Contract. 

 
Payment for materials does not constitute Authority approval or acceptance of the 
materials or work.  If materials paid for are damaged, stolen or prove to be 
unacceptable, the Authority retains the right to recover the costs from the 
Contractor. 

 
Payment for the balance of the total value for each of the Structural Steel Pay Items 
will be made upon complete fabrication and erection, shop and field welding, non-
destructive quality control testing of welds, galvanizing, and shop and field painting 
less any retainage as specified in Subsection 108.03. 

 
No separate payment will be made for storage of the material at the approved 
storage facility. 

 
No separate payment will be made for the insurance required for the storage of the 
material at the approved storage facility. 

 


