10-7-2009

New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T00.109
Contract P500.109 - Bid Tabulation
Railroad Construction Company,
ITEMS A.P. Construction, Inc. Inc. Hall Building Corporation D&K Construction Co., Inc. Alna Construction Corp. G & P Parlamas,Inc. Crosson construction company APS Contracting Inc. Wallace Bros., Inc.
Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT
1 1DO1LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $380,000.00 $380,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $76,650.00 $76,650.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $90,882.00 $90,882.00
2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $680,000.00 $680,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $429,949.00 $429,949.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $128,396.88 $128,396.88
3 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $62,100.00 $62,100.00
Fuel Price Adjustment
(This is a NO BID, Lump
Sum item for this contract.
The Lump Sum price is
$15,000. Enter a Unit Price
of $15,000 as your bid item
for this item.
4 1HFP0O15 1 L.S. ) $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
5 2A01CAG 5 Acre Clearing and Grubbing $55,000.00 $275,000.00 $10,000.00 $50,000.00 $8,500.00 $42,500.00 $7,500.00 $37,500.00 $8,500.00 $42,500.00 $7,000.00 $35,000.00 $5,000.00 $25,000.00 $7,000.00 $35,000.00 $5,400.00 $27,000.00
Roadway Excavation and
6 2BO4REX 6,762.00 C.. Embankment $55.00 $371,910.00 $21.00 $142,002.00 $10.50 $71,001.00 $25.00 $169,050.00 $10.00 $67,620.00 $8.00 $54,096.00 $15.00 $101,430.00 $12.00 $81,144.00 $10.80 $73,029.60
Riprap Stone Scour Hole,
7 2G00022 15 Ton 12" Thick, D50=6" $50.00 $750.00 $80.00 $1,200.00 $150.00 $2,250.00 $60.00 $900.00 $50.00 $750.00 $50.00 $750.00 $98.00 $1,470.00 $60.00 $900.00 $54.00 $810.00
Riprap Stone Aprons, 12"
8 2G12A06 13 Ton Thick, D50=6" $55.00 $715.00 $80.00 $1,040.00 $150.00 $1,950.00 $60.00 $780.00 $50.00 $650.00 $50.00 $650.00 $98.00 $1,274.00 $60.00 $780.00 $54.00 $702.00
Riprap Stone Ditch
Protection, 12" Thick,
9 2G12D07 108 Ton D50=6" $55.00 $5,940.00 $160.00 $17,280.00 $150.00 $16,200.00 $75.00 $8,100.00 $50.00 $5,400.00 $50.00 $5,400.00 $98.00 $10,584.00 $75.00 $8,100.00 $54.00 $5,832.00
Heavy Duty Silt Fence,
10 2H00006 6,844.00 L.F. Orange $10.00 $68,440.00 $2.50 $17,110.00 $3.00 $20,532.00 $4.00 $27,376.00 $3.00 $20,532.00 $2.00 $13,688.00 $3.00 $20,532.00 $5.00 $34,220.00 $2.16 $14,783.04
11 2H01DSC 9,680.00 SY. Temporary Seeding $2.00 $19,360.00 $0.80 $7,744.00 $0.50 $4,840.00 $0.70 $6,776.00 $1.10 $10,648.00 $1.50 $14,520.00 $0.01 $96.80 $5.00 $48,400.00 $0.22 $2,129.60
12 2H25TEC 4 C.Y. Hay Bales $30.00 $120.00 $160.00 $640.00 $100.00 $400.00 $150.00 $600.00 $35.00 $140.00 $100.00 $400.00 $0.01 $0.04 $100.00 $400.00 $37.80 $151.20
13 2H40TEC 13 Each Inlet Filters $350.00 $4,550.00 $200.00 $2,600.00 $150.00 $1,950.00 $222.00 $2,886.00 $175.00 $2,275.00 $300.00 $3,900.00 $5.00 $65.00 $100.00 $1,300.00 $59.40 $772.20
14 2HA45TEC 400 Ton Construction Driveway $60.00 $24,000.00 $35.00 $14,000.00 $26.25 $10,500.00 $28.00 $11,200.00 $27.50 $11,000.00 $40.00 $16,000.00 $0.01 $4.00 $30.00 $12,000.00 $25.92 $10,368.00
15 NLF0001 1| Ls  |Concrete Washout Facilit $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $7,020.00 $7,020.00
Aggregate Base Course, 4"
16 3A04ABC 374 S.Y. Thick $15.00 $5,610.00 $6.25 $2,337.50 $10.00 $3,740.00 $6.60 $2,468.40 $8.02 $2,999.48 $9.00 $3,366.00 $5.00 $1,870.00 $6.00 $2,244.00 $5.40 $2,019.60
Aggregate Base Course,
17 3A07ABC 11,341.00 S.Y 6.5" Thick $20.00 $226,820.00 $8.25 $93,563.25 $8.50 $96,398.50 $10.00 $113,410.00 $7.50 $85,057.50 $14.00 $158,774.00 $6.00 $68,046.00 $8.00 $90,728.00 $7.56 $85,737.96
HMA Surface Course, Mix |
18 3BO3HMA 324 Ton 5 $65.00 $21,060.00 $75.00 $24,300.00 $80.00 $25,920.00 $88.00 $28,512.00 $82.22 $26,639.28 $92.00 $29,808.00 $65.00 $21,060.00 $75.00 $24,300.00 $69.12 $22,394.88
Asphalt Price Adjustment
(This is a NO-BID, Lump
Sum item for this contract.
The Lump Sum price is
$30,000. Enter a Unit Price
of $30,000 as your bid for
this item.
19 3B30APA 1 L.S. ) $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt
19H 76 Intermediate
20 3B24SUP 2,571.00 Ton Course $85.00 $218,535.00 $80.00 $205,680.00 $65.00 $167,115.00 $85.00 $218,535.00 $77.79 $199,998.09 $91.00 $233,961.00 $66.00 $169,686.00 $75.00 $192,825.00 $66.96 $172,154.16
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt
12.5H 76 Surface Course
21 3B25SUP 2,124.00 Ton $85.00 $180,540.00 $85.00 $180,540.00 $66.00 $140,184.00 $90.00 $191,160.00 $78.15 $165,990.60 $92.00 $195,408.00 $69.00 $146,556.00 $80.00 $169,920.00 $70.20 $149,104.80
22 3B26TAC 566 Gallon Tack Coat $5.00 $2,830.00 $4.50 $2,547.00 $5.00 $2,830.00 $6.00 $3,396.00 $3.53 $1,997.98 $7.00 $3,962.00 $0.01 $5.66 $2.00 $1,132.00 $3.24 $1,833.84
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt
23 3B34SUP 322100 Ton |?°M64Base Course $85.00|  $273,785.00 $75.00|  $241,575.00 $60.00|  $193,260.00 $85.00]  $273,785.00 $77.31|  $249,015.51 $88.00|  $283,448.00 $66.00]  $212,586.00 $65.00]  $209,365.00 $62.64|  $201,763.44
Portland Cement Concrete
24 3D08PCP 213 SY. Pavement, 8 Thick $250.00 $53,250.00 $125.00 $26,625.00 $80.00 $17,040.00 $115.00 $24,495.00 $98.59 $20,999.67 $110.00 $23,430.00 $95.00 $20,235.00 $100.00 $21,300.00 $79.92 $17,022.96
Pavement Removal, 5"
25 3E14PMR 3,553.00 S.Y Depth $10.00 $35,530.00 $5.25 $18,653.25 $4.00 $14,212.00 $5.00 $17,765.00 $4.78 $16,983.34 $8.00 $28,424.00 $3.00 $10,659.00 $6.00 $21,318.00 $3.78 $13,430.34
Surface Milling, 2" Average
26 3E50PMR 2,511.00 S.Y. Depth $5.00 $12,555.00 $7.00 $17,577.00 $4.00 $10,044.00 $4.00 $10,044.00 $4.78 $12,002.58 $6.00 $15,066.00 $3.00 $7,533.00 $3.00 $7,533.00 $3.24 $8,135.64
Surface Milling, 2.5"
27 3E51PMR 837 SY. Average Depth $5.00 $4,185.00 $16.00 $13,392.00 $4.00 $3,348.00 $5.00 $4,185.00 $4.54 $3,799.98 $7.00 $5,859.00 $3.00 $2,511.00 $3.00 $2,511.00 $3.78 $3,163.86
Aluminum Posts for Ground
28 4F01GMP 2,429.00 Pound Mounted Signs $20.00 $48,580.00 $18.00 $43,722.00 $10.00 $24,290.00 $50.00 $121,450.00 $17.99 $43,697.71 $22.00 $53,438.00 $20.00 $48,580.00 $18.00 $43,722.00 $17.06 $41,438.74
Concrete Foundations for
Ground Mounted Signs
29 4FO5GMF 14! Cc.Y $700.00 $9,800.00 $800.00 $11,200.00 $400.00 $5,600.00 $638.00 $8,932.00 $714.29 $10,000.06 $750.00 $10,500.00 $805.00 $11,270.00 $650.00 $9,100.00 $378.00 $5,292.00
18" Ductile Iron Pipe, Class
30 5B00022 666 L.F. 52 $80.00 $53,280.00 $95.00 $63,270.00 $70.00 $46,620.00 $85.00 $56,610.00 $73.57 $48,997.62 $65.00 $43,290.00 $74.00 $49,284.00 $60.00 $39,960.00 $70.20 $46,753.20
15" Reinforced Concrete
31 5B15RC3 20 L.F. Pipe $45.00 $900.00 $85.00 $1,700.00 $30.00 $600.00 $65.00 $1,300.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $30.00 $600.00 $56.00 $1,120.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $28.08 $561.60
18" Reinforced Concrete
32 5B18RC3 797 L.F. Pipe $50.00 $39,850.00 $75.00 $59,775.00 $30.00 $23,910.00 $55.00 $43,835.00 $31.37 $25,001.89 $34.00 $27,098.00 $37.00 $29,489.00 $35.00 $27,895.00 $31.31 $24,954.07
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10-7-2009

New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T00.109
Contract P500.109 - Bid Tabulation
Railroad Construction Company,
ITEMS A.P. Construction, Inc. Inc. Hall Building Corporation D&K Construction Co., Inc. Alna Construction Corp. G & P Parlamas,Inc. Crosson construction company APS Contracting Inc. Wallace Bros., Inc.
Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

18" Reinforced Concrete

33 5B18RCE 2 Each Flared End Section $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 $800.00 $1,600.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $2,050.00 $4,100.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $810.00 $1,620.00

34 5C00004 1 Each Outlet Control Structure $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $6,588.00 $6,588.00

35 5C00008 1 Each Inlet, Type Double D2 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $4,590.00 $4,590.00

36 5CO1IND2 4 Each Inlet, Type D2 $5,500.00 $22,000.00 $2,550.00 $10,200.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $3,500.00 $14,000.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $3,500.00 $14,000.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $3,500.00 $14,000.00 $2,332.80 $9,331.20

37 5C01ND3 3 Each Inlet, Type D3 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $2,600.00 $7,800.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,110.00 $6,330.00 $2,733.33 $8,199.99 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $3,600.00 $10,800.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,041.20 $6,123.60

38 5C02ND3 1 Each Inlet, Type Double D3 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,550.00 $2,550.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,575.00 $4,575.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,451.76 $4,451.76

39 5C20NP1 3 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $6,000.00 $18,000.00 $2,600.00 $7,800.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 $1,909.00 $5,727.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $3,100.00 $9,300.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $1,857.60 $5,572.80

40 5C20NP2 1 Each Manhole, Type P-2 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $3,250.00 $3,250.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,021.84 $3,021.84

41 5D10INC 7 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $225.00 $1,575.00 $600.00 $4,200.00 $400.00 $2,800.00 $300.00 $2,100.00 $450.00 $3,150.00 $750.00 $5,250.00 $0.01 $0.07 $200.00 $1,400.00 $216.00 $1,512.00

42 5E01ALC 30 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $35.00 $1,050.00 $12.00 $360.00 $18.00 $540.00 $20.00 $600.00 $66.67 $2,000.10 $50.00 $1,500.00 $16.50 $495.00 $20.00 $600.00 $12.96 $388.80

43 N5F0001 1,751.00 L.F. 9" X 18" Concrete Curb $30.00 $52,530.00 $19.50 $34,144.50 $16.00 $28,016.00 $20.00 $35,020.00 $17.99 $31,500.49 $20.00 $35,020.00 $16.50 $28,891.50 $20.00 $35,020.00 $9.40 $16,459.40

44 N510002 627 L.F. Timber Posts $5.00 $3,135.00 $12.50 $7,837.50 $18.00 $11,286.00 $12.50 $7,837.50 $45.00 $28,215.00 $20.00 $12,540.00 $12.50 $7,837.50 $12.00 $7,524.00 $48.60 $30,472.20
Relocate Existing Ground-

45 501RES 3 Each Mounted Sign $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $175.00 $525.00 $150.00 $450.00 $175.00 $525.00 $300.00 $900.00 $250.00 $750.00 $170.00 $510.00 $150.00 $450.00 $324.00 $972.00

46 5101SNP 703 S.F. Sign Panels $15.00 $10,545.00 $22.50 $15,817.50 $20.00 $14,060.00 $25.00 $17,575.00 $50.78 $35,698.34 $25.00 $17,575.00 $21.50 $15,114.50 $20.00 $14,060.00 $42.54 $29,905.62
Beam Guide Rail,

47 5J50BGW 413 L.F. Weathering Steel $20.00 $8,260.00 $15.00 $6,195.00 $50.00 $20,650.00 $16.25 $6,711.25 $58.11 $23,999.43 $25.00 $10,325.00 $16.50 $6,814.50 $15.00 $6,195.00 $20.34 $8,400.42

48 5J00FGT 1 Each Flared Guide Rail Terminal $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,782.43 $2,782.43
Beam Guide Rail

49 5J52ABG 2 Each Anchorage $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $825.00 $1,650.00 $675.00 $1,350.00 $700.00 $1,400.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $775.00 $1,550.00 $700.00 $1,400.00 $980.28 $1,960.56
Pedestrian Gate, Type I,

50 5KO00PGT 24/ L.F. 72" High, 12' Wide $200.00 $4,800.00 $90.00 $2,160.00 $100.00 $2,400.00 $225.00 $5,400.00 $181.25 $4,350.00 $175.00 $4,200.00 $1,150.00 $27,600.00 $100.00 $2,400.00 $159.75 $3,834.00
Chain Link Fence, Type Il,

51 5K72CLB 1,517.00 L.F. 72" High $25.00 $37,925.00 $22.00 $33,374.00 $22.00 $33,374.00 $68.00 $103,156.00 $19.78 $30,006.26 $30.00 $45,510.00 $25.00 $37,925.00 $45.00 $68,265.00 $19.44 $29,490.48
Concrete Sidewalk,

52 5N00001 340 S.Y Reinforced, 4" Thick $60.00 $20,400.00 $55.00 $18,700.00 $40.00 $13,600.00 $40.00 $13,600.00 $58.82 $19,998.80 $52.00 $17,680.00 $50.00 $17,000.00 $90.00 $30,600.00 $38.88 $13,219.20

53 5NO7CHR 1 Each Concrete Handicap Ramp $350.00 $350.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $600.00 $600.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $450.00 $450.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $195.00 $195.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $486.00 $486.00
Traffic Stripes, Long - Life,

54 5P21LLS 5,737.00 L.F. thermoplastic $5.00 $28,685.00 $0.50 $2,868.50 $0.50 $2,868.50 $0.75 $4,302.75 $0.51 $2,925.87 $1.00 $5,737.00 $0.45 $2,581.65 $2.00 $11,474.00 $0.45 $2,581.65
Traffic Markings, Symbols,

55 5P33LLM 16| sp  |-on9-Life, Thermoplastic $35.00 $560.00 $22.00 $352.00 $20.00 $320.00 $6.00 $96.00 $25.00 $400.00 $50.00 $800.00 $22.00 $352.00 $10.00 $160.00 $4.86 $77.76
Furnish Field Office, Type

56 5Q01FOE 1 Unit E $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $32,400.00 $32,400.00
Maintain Field Office, Type

57 5Q02MFE 18 Month E $1,500.00 $27,000.00 $275.00 $4,950.00 $300.00 $5,400.00 $1,000.00 $18,000.00 $361.11 $6,499.98 $3,000.00 $54,000.00 $1,000.00 $18,000.00 $3,000.00 $54,000.00 $648.00 $11,664.00

58 5RO01RPG 3 Each Horizontal Ramp Gate $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $950.00 $2,850.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $2,775.00 $8,325.00 $4,666.67 $14,000.01 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,700.00 $8,100.00
Manufactured Treatment

59 5ZL10MTD 1 Each Devices $145,000.00 $145,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $103,000.00 $103,000.00 $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $103,572.00 $103,572.00

60 5ZL01FHA 8 Each Fire Hydrant Assemblies $4,500.00 $36,000.00 $4,500.00 $36,000.00 $4,000.00 $32,000.00 $3,135.00 $25,080.00 $3,875.00 $31,000.00 $5,000.00 $40,000.00 $3,400.00 $27,200.00 $4,000.00 $32,000.00 $3,051.00 $24,408.00

61 5710059 1 Each Yard Hydrant $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $900.00 $900.00 $1,887.00 $1,887.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,296.00 $1,296.00

62 5ZL0060 2 Each Curb Stop And Box $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $450.00 $900.00 $600.00 $1,200.00 $445.00 $890.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $700.00 $1,400.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $648.00 $1,296.00
6" Ductile Iron Water Pipe,

63 5ZL06DP 270 L.F. Class 52 $72.00 $19,440.00 $60.00 $16,200.00 $40.00 $10,800.00 $42.00 $11,340.00 $44.44 $11,998.80 $42.00 $11,340.00 $65.00 $17,550.00 $45.00 $12,150.00 $32.40 $8,748.00
8" Ductile Iron Water Pipe,

64 5ZL0061 5,035.00 L.F. Class 52 $85.00 $427,975.00 $65.00 $327,275.00 $55.00 $276,925.00 $60.00 $302,100.00 $69.51 $349,982.85 $64.00 $322,240.00 $66.00 $332,310.00 $65.00 $327,275.00 $47.52 $239,263.20
2" Copper Water Pipe,

65 5710062 270 L.F. Type K $25.00 $6,750.00 $30.00 $8,100.00 $25.00 $6,750.00 $35.00 $9,450.00 $33.33 $8,999.10 $35.00 $9,450.00 $48.90 $13,203.00 $40.00 $10,800.00 $27.00 $7,290.00
8" Gate Valve And Valve

66 5710063 8 Each Box $2,000.00 $16,000.00 $1,600.00 $12,800.00 $1,200.00 $9,600.00 $1,300.00 $10,400.00 $1,800.00 $14,400.00 $1,500.00 $12,000.00 $1,500.00 $12,000.00 $1,500.00 $12,000.00 $1,259.28 $10,074.24
6" Gate Valve And Valve

67 5ZL0064 9 Each Box $1,500.00 $13,500.00 $1,300.00 $11,700.00 $1,000.00 $9,000.00 $950.00 $8,550.00 $1,500.00 $13,500.00 $1,100.00 $9,900.00 $1,150.00 $10,350.00 $1,200.00 $10,800.00 $1,069.20 $9,622.80

68 5710065 60 L.F. 8" Steel Casing $25.00 $1,500.00 $60.00 $3,600.00 $120.00 $7,200.00 $55.00 $3,300.00 $100.00 $6,000.00 $75.00 $4,500.00 $100.00 $6,000.00 $50.00 $3,000.00 $59.40 $3,564.00

69 570015 2,275.00 L.F. 4" Sanitary Force Main $35.00 $79,625.00 $29.00 $65,975.00 $20.00 $45,500.00 $24.00 $54,600.00 $35.60 $80,990.00 $25.00 $56,875.00 $25.00 $56,875.00 $25.00 $56,875.00 $18.90 $42,997.50
6" Polyvinyl Chloride

70 5710032 1,043.00 L.F. Sewer Pipe $35.00 $36,505.00 $40.00 $41,720.00 $25.00 $26,075.00 $34.00 $35,462.00 $23.01 $23,999.43 $30.00 $31,290.00 $35.00 $36,505.00 $35.00 $36,505.00 $22.68 $23,655.24
4" Sanitary Sewer Clean

71 5ZL0067 10 Each Out $500.00 $5,000.00 $725.00 $7,250.00 $360.00 $3,600.00 $600.00 $6,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $600.00 $6,000.00 $450.00 $4,500.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $189.00 $1,890.00
6" Sanitary Sewer Clean

72 5710068 6 Each Out $500.00 $3,000.00 $800.00 $4,800.00 $400.00 $2,400.00 $800.00 $4,800.00 $250.00 $1,500.00 $400.00 $2,400.00 $525.00 $3,150.00 $500.00 $3,000.00 $270.00 $1,620.00
Manhole, Sanitary Sewer

73 BDX652420M 4 Unit (4' Diameter) $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $3,200.00 $12,800.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,442.00 $9,768.00 $2,762.50 $11,050.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,600.00 $10,400.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,700.00 $10,800.00
Connection To Existing

74 5ZL0069 1 Each Sanitary Manhole $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,250.00 $2,250.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,160.00 $2,160.00

75 5710070 1 L.S. Sanitary Pump Station $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $36,500.00 $36,500.00 $87,000.00 $87,000.00 $55,500.00 $55,500.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $79,000.00 $79,000.00 $77,679.00 $77,679.00

76 5200027 29 Each Bollards $1,000.00 $29,000.00 $700.00 $20,300.00 $700.00 $20,300.00 $500.00 $14,500.00 $275.86 $7,999.94 $500.00 $14,500.00 $450.00 $13,050.00 $500.00 $14,500.00 $297.00 $8,613.00

77 9A01UBW 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work $2,400,000.00|  $2,400,000.00| $2,068,900.00| $2,068,900.00| $1,915,000.00] $1,915,000.00 $1,692,396.26] $1,692,396.26| $3,849,000.00| $3,849,000.00| $2,736,618.00| $2,736,618.00| $1,925,000.00| $1,925,000.00 $1,946,000.00| $1,946,000.00| $2,176,788.98| $2,176,788.98
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10-7-2009

New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T00.109
Contract P500.109 - Bid Tabulation
Railroad Construction Company,
ITEMS A.P. Construction, Inc. Inc. Hall Building Corporation D&K Construction Co., Inc. Alna Construction Corp. G & P Parlamas,Inc. Crosson construction company APS Contracting Inc. Wallace Bros., Inc.
Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT
78 9A02UBW 1 L.S. Building HVAC Work $490,000.00 $490,000.00 $495,601.80 $495,601.80 $468,000.00 $468,000.00 $494,000.00 $494,000.00 $451,000.00 $451,000.00 $545,000.00 $545,000.00 $473,000.00 $473,000.00 $468,000.00 $468,000.00 $513,648.00 $513,648.00
79 9A03UBW 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $228,000.00 $228,000.00 $187,000.00 $187,000.00 $241,000.00 $241,000.00 $265,000.00 $265,000.00 $177,000.00 $177,000.00 $290,000.00 $290,000.00 $167,400.00 $167,400.00
80 9A04UBW 1 L.S. Building Electric Work $950,000.00 $950,000.00 $700,000.00 $700,000.00 $640,000.00 $640,000.00| $1,005,660.00 $1,005,660.00 $890,000.00 $890,000.00 $825,000.00 $825,000.00 $675,000.00 $675,000.00 $490,000.00 $490,000.00 $702,237.60 $702,237.60
81 5ZL0071 2,946.00 L.F. Verizon Ductbank $16.50 $48,609.00 $15.50 $45,663.00 $25.00 $73,650.00 $26.00 $76,596.00 $15.00 $44,190.00 $18.00 $53,028.00 $17.00 $50,082.00 $15.00 $44,190.00 $16.20 $47,725.20
82 5710072 12 Each Verizon Handhole $2,300.00 $27,600.00 $950.00 $11,400.00 $1,800.00 $21,600.00 $1,500.00 $18,000.00 $850.00 $10,200.00 $1,000.00 $12,000.00 $975.00 $11,700.00 $850.00 $10,200.00 $918.00 $11,016.00
83 5ZL0073 2,096.00 L.F. JCP&L Ductbank $20.00 $41,920.00 $22.50 $47,160.00 $35.00 $73,360.00 $32.00 $67,072.00 $19.00 $39,824.00 $20.00 $41,920.00 $22.00 $46,112.00 $20.00 $41,920.00 $20.52 $43,009.92
84 5710074 6 Each JCP&L Handhole $2,350.00 $14,100.00 $8,500.00 $51,000.00 $8,500.00 $51,000.00 $8,000.00 $48,000.00 $9,000.00 $54,000.00 $5,000.00 $30,000.00 $10,000.00 $60,000.00 $9,000.00 $54,000.00 $9,720.00 $58,320.00
85 5ZL0075 1 Each JCP&L Transformer Pad $6,700.00 $6,700.00 $1,850.00 $1,850.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,275.00 $2,275.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,160.00 $2,160.00
JCP&L Electrical Service
86 6J00012 1 L.S. Contract $79,200.00 $79,200.00 $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $122,000.00 $122,000.00 $133,500.00 $133,500.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $288,777.14 $288,777.14 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $118,494.36 $118,494.36
87 5710076 A77 L.F. Adesta Ductbank $24.00 $11,448.00 $17.50 $8,347.50 $20.00 $9,540.00 $18.00 $8,586.00 $15.09 $7,197.93 $17.00 $8,109.00 $17.00 $8,109.00 $16.00 $7,632.00 $16.20 $7,727.40
88 5ZL0077 2 Each Adesta Handhole $2,865.00 $5,730.00 $1,850.00 $3,700.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $950.00 $1,900.00 $1,650.00 $3,300.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,875.00 $3,750.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00 $1,782.00 $3,564.00
2" Rigid Non-Metallic
Conduit, PVC - Schedule
89 6A00024 5,600.00 L.F. 40 $8.70 $48,720.00 $9.25 $51,800.00 $8.00 $44,800.00 $6.00 $33,600.00 $5.36 $30,016.00 $15.00 $84,000.00 $17.00 $95,200.00 $20.00 $112,000.00 $10.54 $59,024.00
#2 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting
90 6A02MLC 23,900.00 L.F. Cable $3.25 $77,675.00 $3.25 $77,675.00 $3.50 $83,650.00 $3.14 $75,046.00 $2.83 $67,637.00 $4.00 $95,600.00 $4.25 $101,575.00 $2.00 $47,800.00 $3.53 $84,367.00
3" Rigid Nonmetallic
Conduit, PVC-(Schedule
91 6A03RNC 4,875.00 L.F. 40) $12.50 $60,937.50 $19.50 $95,062.50 $16.00 $78,000.00 $8.00 $39,000.00 $6.91 $33,686.25 $16.00 $78,000.00 $19.00 $92,625.00 $25.00 $121,875.00 $7.83 $38,171.25
92 6A08GWR 5,950.00 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.45 $8,627.50 $1.25 $7,437.50 $1.50 $8,925.00 $1.27 $7,556.50 $1.15 $6,842.50 $2.00 $11,900.00 $1.95 $11,602.50 $1.00 $5,950.00 $1.40 $8,330.00
3" Rigid Nonmetallic
Conduit, PVC-(Schedule
93 6A13RNC 825 L.F. 80) $12.80 $10,560.00 $18.50 $15,262.50 $17.00 $14,025.00 $8.00 $6,600.00 $7.27 $5,997.75 $17.00 $14,025.00 $22.00 $18,150.00 $30.00 $24,750.00 $10.80 $8,910.00
Junction Box Foundation,
94 6A21JF1 43 Each Type 1 $3,445.00 $148,135.00 $5,000.00 $215,000.00 $3,500.00 $150,500.00 $666.00 $28,638.00 $600.00 $25,800.00 $1,000.00 $43,000.00 $3,000.00 $129,000.00 $2,500.00 $107,500.00 $3,391.20 $145,821.60
95 6B00048 5 Each Type P2 Luminaire, 100W $1,485.00 $7,425.00 $1,200.00 $6,000.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,555.00 $7,775.00 $1,400.00 $7,000.00 $1,750.00 $8,750.00 $1,350.00 $6,750.00 $1,200.00 $6,000.00 $1,285.20 $6,426.00
Type P2 Luminaire, 150W
96 6B15TP2 10 Each $1,485.00 $14,850.00 $1,100.00 $11,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,555.00 $15,550.00 $1,400.00 $14,000.00 $1,750.00 $17,500.00 $1,350.00 $13,500.00 $1,200.00 $12,000.00 $1,285.20 $12,852.00
Type P4 Luminaire, 150W
97 6B00051 27 Each $1,510.00 $40,770.00 $1,200.00 $32,400.00 $1,100.00 $29,700.00 $1,900.00 $51,300.00 $1,518.52 $41,000.04 $1,850.00 $49,950.00 $1,350.00 $36,450.00 $1,200.00 $32,400.00 $1,319.76 $35,633.52
Lighting Standard, Type L-
98 6B26LMG 5 Each MG-26 $1,775.00 $8,875.00 $2,500.00 $12,500.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,800.00 $9,000.00 $2,200.00 $11,000.00 $1,850.00 $9,250.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,809.00 $9,045.00
Lighting Standard, Type L-
99 6B27LMG 37| Each [MC-26-X(Single 150W) $1,775.00 $65,675.00 $2,200.00 $81,400.00 $2,000.00 $74,000.00 $2,110.00 $78,070.00 $1,900.00 $70,300.00 $2,300.00 $85,100.00 $1,850.00 $68,450.00 $2,000.00 $74,000.00 $1,809.00 $66,933.00
Furnish & Install Variable
100 6K02VMS 2 Each Message Sign $200,000.00 $400,000.00 $255,500.00 $511,000.00 $126,000.00 $252,000.00 $155,000.00 $310,000.00 $115,000.00 $230,000.00 $120,000.00 $240,000.00 $150,000.00 $300,000.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00 $132,840.00 $265,680.00
101 6J00054 1 L.S. Wims System $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $50,500.00 $50,500.00 $260,000.00 $260,000.00 $334,682.00 $334,682.00 $46,000.00 $46,000.00 $375,000.00 $375,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $268,000.00 $268,000.00 $199,492.20 $199,492.20
102 7C01TOP 19,681.00 S.Y. Topsoil $5.00 $98,405.00 $1.65 $32,473.65 $1.50 $29,521.50 $1.75 $34,441.75 $4.35 $85,612.35 $3.00 $59,043.00 $1.50 $29,521.50 $2.00 $39,362.00 $1.89 $37,197.09
Seeding, Type Parkway
103 7D13SED 1,380.00 S.Y. South - Mainline $1.00 $1,380.00 $0.90 $1,242.00 $0.90 $1,242.00 $1.00 $1,380.00 $1.81 $2,497.80 $3.00 $4,140.00 $1.00 $1,380.00 $10.00 $13,800.00 $0.22 $303.60
Seeding, Type Parkway
104 7D15SED 16,512.00 S.Y. South - Facility Seed Mix $1.00 $16,512.00 $0.90 $14,860.80 $0.50 $8,256.00 $1.00 $16,512.00 $1.82 $30,051.84 $3.00 $49,536.00 $0.90 $14,860.80 $7.00 $115,584.00 $0.22 $3,632.64
105 7D20MOW 8 Acre Mowing $400.00 $3,200.00 $350.00 $2,800.00 $500.00 $4,000.00 $555.00 $4,440.00 $4,031.25 $32,250.00 $1,000.00 $8,000.00 $550.00 $4,400.00 $1,000.00 $8,000.00 $340.20 $2,721.60
106 7D30WAT 40 M.G. Watering $300.00 $12,000.00 $300.00 $12,000.00 $100.00 $4,000.00 $125.00 $5,000.00 $806.25 $32,250.00 $500.00 $20,000.00 $115.00 $4,600.00 $1,000.00 $40,000.00 $270.00 $10,800.00
Planting, Red Cedar
107 N7E0031 50 Each (Juniperis Virginiana) $200.00 $10,000.00 $155.00 $7,750.00 $150.00 $7,500.00 $175.00 $8,750.00 $300.00 $15,000.00 $500.00 $25,000.00 $170.00 $8,500.00 $300.00 $15,000.00 $378.00 $18,900.00
108 7F01SSM 550 SY. Soil Stablization Matting $4.00 $2,200.00 $3.75 $2,062.50 $7.00 $3,850.00 $4.50 $2,475.00 $20.00 $11,000.00 $3.00 $1,650.00 $4.00 $2,200.00 $20.00 $11,000.00 $7.29 $4,009.50
109 7N00009 3 Each Flagpole $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $5,500.00 $16,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,950.00 $8,850.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $1,296.00 $3,888.00
Maintenance and
110 8B31MPT 1 L.S Protection of Traffic $550,000.00 $550,000.00 $46,500.00 $46,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $16,200.00 $16,200.00
Maintenance and
Protection of Traffic on
111 8C100MLR 1 L.S. Local Roads $750,000.00 $750,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $5,400.00 $5,400.00
112 6A21CCC 350 L.F. 15" Coaxial Cable $4.55 $1,592.50 $1.35 $472.50 $5.00 $1,750.00 $1.75 $612.50 $1.00 $350.00 $2.00 $700.00 $1.50 $525.00 $3.00 $1,050.00 $3.24 $1,134.00
113 6A00065 6,550.00 L.F. Communication Cable $8.75 $57,312.50 $2.75 $18,012.50 $2.50 $16,375.00 $1.50 $9,825.00 $1.22 $7,991.00 $2.00 $13,100.00 $3.00 $19,650.00 $5.00 $32,750.00 $5.40 $35,370.00
Building Card Access
114 9A17UBW 1 L.S. System $35,135.00 $35,135.00 $58,000.00 $58,000.00 $39,000.00 $39,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00 $168,000.00 $168,000.00 $18,144.00 $18,144.00
Lighting Standard, Type L-
115 6B45LMG 1 Each MG-40 $2,365.00 $2,365.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,675.00 $1,675.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 $1,850.00 $3,400.00 $3,400.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $3,888.00 $3,888.00
116 6A24JBC 14/ Each Junction Box, Type C $2,975.00 $41,650.00 $3,700.00 $51,800.00 $3,600.00 $50,400.00 $700.00 $9,800.00 $607.14 $8,499.96 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 $4,000.00 $56,000.00 $2,000.00 $28,000.00 $3,213.00 $44,982.00
117 5710110 1 Each Water Meter Pit $5,900.00 $5,900.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,818.00 $10,818.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,074.00 $7,074.00
118 5111REM 12 Each Remove Signs $60.00 $720.00 $150.00 $1,800.00 $50.00 $600.00 $50.00 $600.00 $83.33 $999.96 $150.00 $1,800.00 $50.00 $600.00 $50.00 $600.00 $45.36 $544.32
Reinforcement Steel,
119 4A11RFS 257 Pound Epoxy Coated $3.00 $771.00 $2.25 $578.25 $1.40 $359.80 $5.00 $1,285.00 $7.00 $1,799.00 $10.00 $2,570.00 $3.00 $771.00 $2.00 $514.00 $0.63 $161.91
TOTAL OF ABOVE ITEMS $11,533,405.00 $8,192,639.00 $6,909,503.30 $7,986,999.91 $9,074,604.06 $8,771,107.00 $7,456,021.16 $7,198,827.00 $7,086,420.00
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority

George Harms Construction Co.,

ITEMS Inc. Michael Riesz and Co.
Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

1 1DO1LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $52,729.60 $52,729.60

2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $910,000.00 $910,000.00 $373,725.35 $373,725.35

3 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $12,300.00 $12,300.00 $15,150.00 $15,150.00
Fuel Price Adjustment
(This is a NO BID, Lump
Sum item for this contract.
The Lump Sum price is
$15,000. Enter a Unit Price
of $15,000 as your bid item
for this item. )

4 1HFP0O15 1 L.S. $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

5 2A01CAG 5 Acre Clearing and Grubbing $11,800.00 $59,000.00 $16,532.00 $82,660.00
Roadway Excavation and

6 2BO4REX 6,762.00 C.Y. Embankment $29.50 $199,479.00 $22.71 $153,565.02
Riprap Stone Scour Hole,

7 2G00022 15 Ton 12" Thick, D50=6" $190.00 $2,850.00 $105.13 $1,576.95
Riprap Stone Aprons, 12"

8 2G12A06 13 Ton Thick, D50=6" $180.00 $2,340.00 $118.03 $1,534.39
Riprap Stone Ditch
Protection, 12" Thick,

9 2G12D07 108 Ton D50=6" $115.00 $12,420.00 $125.04 $13,504.32
Heavy Duty Silt Fence,

10 2H00006 6,844.00 L.F. Orange $6.50 $44,486.00 $2.72 $18,615.68

11 2H01DSC 9,680.00 S.Y. Temporary Seeding $0.35 $3,388.00 $0.49 $4,743.20

12 2H25TEC 4 C.Y. Hay Bales $195.00 $780.00 $402.08 $1,608.32

13 2H40TEC 13 Each Inlet Filters $140.00 $1,820.00 $371.54 $4,830.02

14 2H45TEC 400 Ton Construction Driveway $35.00 $14,000.00 $28.56 $11,424.00

15 N1F0001 1| Ls.  |Conerete Washout Facility $27,500.00 $27,500.00 $5,489.48 $5,489.48
Aggregate Base Course, 4"

16 3A04ABC 374 S.Y. Thick $19.00 $7,106.00 $13.58 $5,078.92
Aggregate Base Course,

17 3A07ABC 11,341.00 S.Y 6.5" Thick $16.00 $181,456.00 $9.94 $112,729.54
HMA Surface Course, Mix |

18 3BO3HMA 324 Ton 5 $82.00 $26,568.00 $107.71 $34,898.04
Asphalt Price Adjustment
(This is a NO-BID, Lump
Sum item for this contract.
The Lump Sum price is
$30,000. Enter a Unit Price
of $30,000 as your bid for
this item.)

19 3B30APA 1 L.S. $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt
19H 76 Intermediate

20 3B24SUP 2,571.00 Ton Course $76.00 $195,396.00 $78.75 $202,466.25
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt

21 38255UP 212400 Ton  |t%5H 76 Surface Course $80.00  $169,920.00 $88.75|  $188,505.00

22 3B26TAC 566 Gallon Tack Coat $8.00 $4,528.00 $3.30 $1,867.80
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt

23 3B34SUP 322100 Ton |?°M64Base Course $65.00]  $209,365.00 $73.30]  $236,099.30
Portland Cement Concrete

24 3D08PCP 213] sy, |Pavement 8" Thick $120.00 $25,560.00 $117.60 $25,048.80
Pavement Removal, 5"

25 3E14PMR 3,553.00 S.Y Depth $10.50 $37,306.50 $17.98 $63,882.94
Surface Milling, 2" Average

26 3E50PMR 2,511.00 S.Y. Depth $5.75 $14,438.25 $7.63 $19,158.93
Surface Milling, 2.5"

27 3E51PMR 837 SY. Average Depth $6.75 $5,649.75 $17.70 $14,814.90
Aluminum Posts for Ground

28 4F01GMP 2,429.00 Pound Mounted Signs $19.25 $46,758.25 $20.10 $48,822.90
Concrete Foundations for

29 4FO5GMF 14 cy.  |GroundMounted Signs $765.00 $10,710.00 $795.20 $11,132.80
18" Ductile Iron Pipe, Class

30 5B00022 666 L.F. 52 $84.00 $55,944.00 $103.69 $69,057.54
15" Reinforced Concrete

31 5B15RC3 20 L.F. Pipe $87.00 $1,740.00 $23.68 $473.60
18" Reinforced Concrete

32 5B18RC3 797 L.F. Pipe $53.00 $42,241.00 $65.99 $52,594.03
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18" Reinforced Concrete

33 5B18RCE 2 Each Flared End Section $1,765.00 $3,530.00 $2,397.70 $4,795.40

34 5C00004 1 Each Outlet Control Structure $8,575.00 $8,575.00 $16,555.37 $16,555.37

35 5C00008 1 Each Inlet, Type Double D2 $6,560.00 $6,560.00 $9,961.87 $9,961.87

36 5CO1IND2 4 Each Inlet, Type D2 $4,340.00 $17,360.00 $5,369.96 $21,479.84

37 5C01ND3 3 Each Inlet, Type D3 $4,125.00 $12,375.00 $5,107.32 $15,321.96

38 5C02ND3 1 Each Inlet, Type Double D3 $6,230.00 $6,230.00 $9,628.34 $9,628.34

39 5C20NP1 3 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $3,340.00 $10,020.00 $5,179.06 $15,537.18

40 5C20NP2 1 Each Manhole, Type P-2 $4,875.00 $4,875.00 $5,671.02 $5,671.02

41 5D10INC 7 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $975.00 $6,825.00 $353.76 $2,476.32

42 5E01ALC 30| L |AsphaltConcrete Lip Curb $60.00 $1,800.00 $119.79 $3,593.70

43 N5F0001 1,751.00 L.F. 9" X 18" Concrete Curb $19.25 $33,706.75 $15.68 $27,455.68

44 N510002 627 L.F. Timber Posts $12.00 $7,524.00 $12.43 $7,793.61
Relocate Existing Ground-

45 5I01RES 3 Each Mounted Sign $162.00 $486.00 $168.00 $504.00

46 5101SNP 703 S.F. Sign Panels $20.75 $14,587.25 $21.56 $15,156.68
Beam Guide Rail,

47 5J50BGW 413 L.F. Weathering Steel $15.60 $6,442.80 $16.24 $6,707.12

48 5J00FGT 1| Each |Flared Guide Rail Terminal $2,775.00 $2,775.00 $2,884.00 $2,884.00
Beam Guide Rail

49 5J52ABG 2 Each Anchorage $730.00 $1,460.00 $756.00 $1,512.00
Pedestrian Gate, Type I,

50 5KO00PGT 24 L.F. 72" High, 12' Wide $94.50 $2,268.00 $217.00 $5,208.00
Chain Link Fence, Type Il,

51 5K72CLB 1,517.00 L.F. 72" High $23.75 $36,028.75 $21.95 $33,298.15
Concrete Sidewalk,

52 5N00001 340 S.Y Reinforced, 4" Thick $66.50 $22,610.00 $50.40 $17,136.00

53 5NO7CHR 1| Each |Concrete Handicap Ramp $285.00 $285.00 $672.00 $672.00
Traffic Stripes, Long - Life,

54 5P21LLS 5,737.00 L.F. thermoplastic $0.55 $3,155.35 $0.47 $2,696.39
Traffic Markings, Symbols,

55 5P33LLM 16| sp  |-on9-Life, Thermoplastic $4.75 $76.00 $22.40 $358.40
Furnish Field Office, Type

56 5Q01FOE 1 Unit E $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $52,520.00 $52,520.00
Maintain Field Office, Type

57 5Q02MFE 18 Month E $2,450.00 $44,100.00 $305.55 $5,499.90

58 5R01RPG 3 Each Horizontal Ramp Gate $545.00 $1,635.00 $4,676.88 $14,030.64
Manufactured Treatment

59 5ZL10MTD 1 Each Devices $126,100.00 $126,100.00 $152,359.26 $152,359.26

60 5ZLO1FHA 8 Each Fire Hydrant Assemblies $4,570.00 $36,560.00 $3,207.44 $25,659.52

61 5710059 1 Each Yard Hydrant $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $1,384.81 $1,384.81

62 5710060 2 Each Curb Stop And Box $1,150.00 $2,300.00 $314.64 $629.28
6" Ductile Iron Water Pipe,

63 5ZL06DP 270 L.F. Class 52 $84.00 $22,680.00 $102.39 $27,645.30
8" Ductile Iron Water Pipe,

64 5710061 5,035.00 L.F. Class 52 $65.50 $329,792.50 $86.38 $434,923.30
2" Copper Water Pipe,

65 5710062 270 L.F. Type K $40.00 $10,800.00 $54.71 $14,771.70
8" Gate Valve And Valve

66 5710063 8 Each Box $1,250.00 $10,000.00 $1,455.61 $11,644.88
6" Gate Valve And Valve

67 5710064 9 Each Box $750.00 $6,750.00 $1,064.36 $9,579.24

68 5710065 60 L.F. 8" Steel Casing $130.00 $7,800.00 $109.98 $6,598.80

69 5710015 2,275.00 L.F. 4" Sanitary Force Main $26.50 $60,287.50 $46.55 $105,901.25
6" Polyvinyl Chloride

70 5710032 1,043.00 L.F. Sewer Pipe $32.50 $33,897.50 $42.01 $43,816.43
4" Sanitary Sewer Clean

71 5210067 10 Each Out $960.00 $9,600.00 $909.23 $9,092.30
6" Sanitary Sewer Clean

72 5710068 6 Each Out $1,860.00 $11,160.00 $1,331.00 $7,986.00
Manhole, Sanitary Sewer

73 BDX652420M 4 Unit (4' Diameter) $4,950.00 $19,800.00 $5,555.29 $22,221.16
Connection To Existing

74 5710069 1 Each Sanitary Manhole $14,100.00 $14,100.00 $4,708.49 $4,708.49

75 5710070 1 L.S. Sanitary Pump Station $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $60,484.33 $60,484.33

76 5200027 29 Each Bollards $410.00 $11,890.00 $947.77 $27,485.33

77 9A01UBW 1| Ls.  |Building Architectural Work | g5 305 600.00|  $2,300,000.00| $2,328,083.67| $2,328,083.67
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78 9A02UBW 1 L.S. Building HVAC Work $530,000.00 $530,000.00 $509,040.00 $509,040.00
79 9A03UBW 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work $325,200.00 $325,200.00 $226,947.00 $226,947.00
80 9A04UBW 1 L.S. Building Electric Work $705,220.00 $705,220.00 $748,864.00 $748,864.00
81 5ZL0071 2,946.00 L.F. Verizon Ductbank $27.00 $79,542.00 $26.42 $77,833.32
82 5710072 12 Each Verizon Handhole $2,400.00 $28,800.00 $2,366.71 $28,400.52
83 5210073 2,096.00 L.F. JCP&L Ductbank $31.00 $64,976.00 $36.47 $76,441.12
84 5710074 6 Each JCP&L Handhole $7,900.00 $47,400.00 $9,329.60 $55,977.60
85 5ZL0075 1 Each JCP&L Transformer Pad $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $1,764.00 $1,764.00
JCP&L Electrical Service
86 6J00012 1 L.S. Contract $86,000.00 $86,000.00 $149,352.00 $149,352.00
87 5710076 A77 L.F. Adesta Ductbank $22.00 $10,494.00 $32.05 $15,287.85
88 5ZL0077 2 Each Adesta Handhole $2,300.00 $4,600.00 $2,352.00 $4,704.00
2" Rigid Non-Metallic
Conduit, PVC - Schedule
89 6A00024 5,600.00 L.F. 40 $8.50 $47,600.00 $9.34 $52,304.00
#2 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting
90 6A02MLC 23,900.00 L.F. Cable $5.40 $129,060.00 $3.29 $78,631.00
3" Rigid Nonmetallic
Conduit, PVC-(Schedule
91 6A03RNC 4,875.00 L.F. 40) $8.75 $42,656.25 $20.14 $98,182.50
92 6A08GWR 5,950.00 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.65 $9,817.50 $1.29 $7,675.50
3" Rigid Nonmetallic
Conduit, PVC-(Schedule
93 6A13RNC 825 L.F. 80) $9.00 $7,425.00 $19.03 $15,699.75
Junction Box Foundation,
94 6A21JF1 43 Each Type 1 $2,400.00 $103,200.00 $4,859.68 $208,966.24
95 6800048 5| Each |TYPe P2 Luminaire, 100W $1,200.00 $6,000.00 $1,176.00 $5,880.00
96 6B15TP2 10| Each |/YPe P2 Luminaire, 150W $1,250.00 $12,500.00 $1,128.96 $11,289.60
97 6800051 27| Each |TYPe P4 Luminaire, 150W $1,400.00 $37,800.00 $1,176.00 $31,752.00
Lighting Standard, Type L-
98 6B26LMG 5 Each MG-26 $2,275.00 $11,375.00 $2,587.20 $12,936.00
Lighting Standard, Type L-
99 6B27LMG 37|  Each [MC-26-X(Single 150W) $2475.00]  $91,575.00 $2,352.00]  $87,024.00
Furnish & Install Variable
100 6K02VMS 2 Each Message Sign $132,800.00 $265,600.00 $128,772.00 $257,544.00
101 6J00054 1 L.S. Wims System $260,000.00 $260,000.00 $338,459.14 $338,459.14
102 7C01TOP 19,681.00 S.Y. Topsoil $1.40 $27,553.40 $1.57 $30,899.17
Seeding, Type Parkway
103 7D13SED 1,380.00 S.Y. South - Mainline $1.05 $1,449.00 $1.01 $1,393.80
Seeding, Type Parkway
104 7D15SED 16,512.00 S.Y. South - Facility Seed Mix $0.60 $9,907.20 $0.90 $14,860.80
105 7D20MOW 8 Acre Mowing $250.00 $2,000.00 $560.00 $4,480.00
106 7D30WAT 40 M.G. Watering $120.00 $4,800.00 $112.00 $4,480.00
Planting, Red Cedar
107 N7E0031 50 Each (Juniperis Virginiana) $135.00 $6,750.00 $168.00 $8,400.00
108 7F01SSM 550 SY. Soil Stablization Matting $3.25 $1,787.50 $4.48 $2,464.00
109 7N00009 3 Each Flagpole $3,600.00 $10,800.00 $8,488.41 $25,465.23
Maintenance and
110 8B31MPT 1 L.S Protection of Traffic $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $157,843.95 $157,843.95
Maintenance and
Protection of Traffic on
111 8C100MLR 1 L.S. Local Roads $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $17,447.01 $17,447.01
112 6A21CCC 350 L.F. 15" Coaxial Cable $3.50 $1,225.00 $1.53 $535.50
113 6A00065 6,550.00 L.F. Communication Cable $5.50 $36,025.00 $2.97 $19,453.50
Building Card Access
114 9A17UBW 1 L.S. System $18,150.00 $18,150.00 $45,450.00 $45,450.00
Lighting Standard, Type L-
115 6B45LMG 1 Each MG-40 $3,250.00 $3,250.00 $2,940.00 $2,940.00
116 6A24JBC 14/ Each Junction Box, Type C $2,450.00 $34,300.00 $4,200.00 $58,800.00
117 5710110 1 Each Water Meter Pit $5,900.00 $5,900.00 $6,851.48 $6,851.48
118 5I111REM 12 Each Remove Signs $45.25 $543.00 $47.04 $564.48
Reinforcement Steel,
119 4A11RFS 257 Pound Epoxy Coated $2.00 $514.00 $2.80 $719.60
TOTAL OF ABOVE ITEMS $9,151,252.00 $8,970,219.90
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