Contract T869.120.801 - Bid Tabulation

New Prince Concrete Construction

JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING CO.,

ITEMS Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. D'Annunzio & Sons, Inc. Trap Rock Industries, Inc. Co. INC Tilcon New York Union Paving and Const. Co., Inc. Tarheel Enterprises Inc. Agate Construction Co., Inc. Crisdel Group, Inc. J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc.
Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT
1 1DO1LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $130,000.00 $130,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $179,999.00 $179,999.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $282,000.00 $282,000.00 $220,000.00 $220,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $175,911.12 $175,911.12 $106,000.00 $106,000.00
2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $700,000.00 $700,000.00 $658,500.00 $658,500.00] $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $755,000.00 $755,000.00 $800,000.00 $800,000.00 $740,000.00 $740,000.00 $615,000.00 $615,000.00 $750,000.00 $750,000.00 $694,145.80 $694,145.80 $620,000.00 $620,000.00
Progress Schedule (This is
a NO-BID, Lump Sum item
for this contract. The Lump
Sum price is $250,000.
Enter a Unit Price of
$250,000 as your bid for
3 1G03SCH 1 L.S. this item.) $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00
Fuel Price Adjustment (This
is a NO BID, Lump Sum
item for this contract. The
Lump Sum price is
$66,000. Enter a Unit Price
of $66,000 as your bid item
4 1HFP066 1 L.S. for this item.) $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00
5 2A01CAG 14 Acre Clearing and Grubbing $18,000.00 $252,000.00 $10,000.00 $140,000.00 $5,750.00 $80,500.00 $8,000.00 $112,000.00 $2,500.00 $35,000.00 $6,000.00 $84,000.00 $1.00 $14.00 $5,000.00 $70,000.00 $6,000.00 $84,000.00 $8,727.56 $122,185.84 $8,000.00 $112,000.00
Roadway Excavation and
6 2B04REX 40,510.00 C.Y. Embankment $27.00 $1,093,770.00 $18.00 $729,180.00 $26.00 $1,053,260.00 $16.00 $648,160.00 $15.85 $642,083.50 $30.00 $1,215,300.00 $16.00 $648,160.00 $38.50 $1,559,635.00 $25.00 $1,012,750.00 $19.07 $772,525.70 $25.00 $1,012,750.00
7 2B15STS 7,129.00 Cc.y. Stripping Topsoil $27.00 $192,483.00 $18.00 $128,322.00 $16.00 $114,064.00 $10.00 $71,290.00 $8.50 $60,596.50 $10.00 $71,290.00 $12.00 $85,548.00 $12.00 $85,548.00 $20.00 $142,580.00 $15.93 $113,564.97 $16.00 $114,064.00
8 N2B0001 143 LF Removal of Existing Barrier $22.00 $3,146.00 $50.00 $7,150.00 $50.00 $7,150.00 $50.00 $7,150.00 $90.00 $12,870.00 $52.00 $7,436.00 $44.00 $6,292.00 $46.00 $6,578.00 $60.00 $8,580.00 $76.99 $11,009.57 $100.00 $14,300.00
9 2C02EMB 10,163.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $35.00 $355,705.00 $24.00 $243,912.00 $30.00 $304,890.00 $35.00 $355,705.00 $23.85 $242,387.55 $24.00 $243,912.00 $25.00 $254,075.00 $42.00 $426,846.00 $24.00 $243,912.00 $29.71 $301,942.73 $33.00 $335,379.00
Trench Excavation,
10 2F04TEX 2,123.00 L.F. Electrical $20.00 $42,460.00 $25.00 $53,075.00 $50.00 $106,150.00 $6.00 $12,738.00 $5.75 $12,207.25 $10.00 $21,230.00 $12.00 $25,476.00 $15.50 $32,906.50 $6.00 $12,738.00 $12.63 $26,813.49 $17.00 $36,091.00
Riprap Stone Slope
Protection, 18" Thick,
11 2G00032 864 Ton (D50=5") $52.00 $44,928.00 $50.00 $43,200.00 $29.00 $25,056.00 $50.00 $43,200.00 $37.50 $32,400.00 $68.00 $58,752.00 $50.00 $43,200.00 $56.00 $48,384.00 $35.00 $30,240.00 $65.72 $56,782.08 $100.00 $86,400.00
12 2G04SEC 25 Ton Stone, Grade D $43.00 $1,075.00 $50.00 $1,250.00 $50.00 $1,250.00 $100.00 $2,500.00 $45.00 $1,125.00 $80.00 $2,000.00 $56.00 $1,400.00 $180.00 $4,500.00 $100.00 $2,500.00 $69.02 $1,725.50 $50.00 $1,250.00
13 2G10SEC 288 Ton Filter Blanket $43.00 $12,384.00 $50.00 $14,400.00 $46.00 $13,248.00 $50.00 $14,400.00 $36.25 $10,440.00 $40.00 $11,520.00 $72.00 $20,736.00 $60.00 $17,280.00 $60.00 $17,280.00 $61.88 $17,821.44 $75.00 $21,600.00
Heavy Duty Silt Fence,
14 2H00006 9,330.00 L.F. Orange $5.00 $46,650.00 $4.50 $41,985.00 $4.00 $37,320.00 $6.00 $55,980.00 $4.75 $44,317.50 $2.50 $23,325.00 $7.00 $65,310.00 $4.00 $37,320.00 $6.00 $55,980.00 $4.43 $41,331.90 $5.25 $48,982.50
Heavy Duty Silt Fence,
15 2H00007 8,891.00 L.F. Black $5.00 $44,455.00 $4.50 $40,009.50 $4.00 $35,564.00 $6.00 $53,346.00 $4.75 $42,232.25 $2.50 $22,227.50 $7.00 $62,237.00 $4.00 $35,564.00 $6.00 $53,346.00 $4.29 $38,142.39 $5.25 $46,677.75
Sediment Containment
16 2H00009 2 Each Bags $100.00 $200.00 $600.00 $1,200.00 $300.00 $600.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $250.00 $500.00 $300.00 $600.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $450.00 $900.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,242.37 $4,484.74 $1,500.00 $3,000.00
17 2H40TEC 172 Each Inlet Filters $180.00 $30,960.00 $100.00 $17,200.00 $150.00 $25,800.00 $100.00 $17,200.00 $70.00 $12,040.00 $175.00 $30,100.00 $100.00 $17,200.00 $100.00 $17,200.00 $100.00 $17,200.00 $43.42 $7,468.24 $100.00 $17,200.00
18 2H45TEC 50 Ton Construction Driveway $50.00 $2,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $42.00 $2,100.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $30.00 $1,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $43.00 $2,150.00 $100.00 $5,000.00 $34.71 $1,735.50 $50.00 $2,500.00
Temporary Stone Check
19 N2H0004 60 C.y. Dam $150.00 $9,000.00 $100.00 $6,000.00 $60.00 $3,600.00 $50.00 $3,000.00 $46.50 $2,790.00 $50.00 $3,000.00 $80.00 $4,800.00 $220.00 $13,200.00 $100.00 $6,000.00 $94.93 $5,695.80 $60.00 $3,600.00
Temporary Orange Plastic
20 2KO1TPF 1,134.00 L.F. Fence $5.00 $5,670.00 $2.00 $2,268.00 $2.75 $3,118.50 $6.00 $6,804.00 $2.50 $2,835.00 $2.50 $2,835.00 $6.00 $6,804.00 $3.00 $3,402.00 $4.00 $4,536.00 $3.22 $3,651.48 $5.00 $5,670.00
Excavation, Acid Producing
21 2M00006 3,049.00 C.y. Soils $15.00 $45,735.00 $18.00 $54,882.00 $8.50 $25,916.50 $20.00 $60,980.00 $7.00 $21,343.00 $10.00 $30,490.00 $4.00 $12,196.00 $37.00 $112,813.00 $10.00 $30,490.00 $20.24 $61,711.76 $8.00 $24,392.00
Disposal of Acid Producing
22 2M00008 4,939.00 Ton Soil $100.00 $493,900.00 $15.00 $74,085.00 $15.00 $74,085.00 $100.00 $493,900.00 $15.00 $74,085.00 $36.00 $177,804.00 $40.00 $197,560.00 $34.00 $167,926.00 $10.00 $49,390.00 $16.56 $81,789.84 $40.00 $197,560.00
Testing for Acid Producing
23 2M00009 7 Each Soil Deposits $1,000.00 $7,000.00 $1,800.00 $12,600.00 $1,500.00 $10,500.00 $1,610.00 $11,270.00 $250.00 $1,750.00 $900.00 $6,300.00 $1,000.00 $7,000.00 $1,200.00 $8,400.00 $2,000.00 $14,000.00 $473.30 $3,313.10 $500.00 $3,500.00
Aggregate Base Course,
24 3A07ABC 45,573.00 S.Y. 6.5" Thick $9.00 $410,157.00 $5.50 $250,651.50 $7.75 $353,190.75 $6.00 $273,438.00 $8.25 $375,977.25 $7.25 $330,404.25 $7.00 $319,011.00 $9.50 $432,943.50 $8.00 $364,584.00 $5.10 $232,422.30 $9.00 $410,157.00
Asphalt Price Adjustment
(This is a NO-BID, Lump
Sum item for this contract.
The Lump Sum price is
$120,000. Enter a Unit
Price of $120,000 as your
25 3B120APA 1 L.S. bid for this item.) $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt
26 3B21SUP | 21,780.00] Ton  |?5H 64 Base Course $65.00|  $1,416,285.00 $57.00|  $1,241,973.00 $65.00|  $1,416,285.00 $56.00|  $1,220,184.00 $62.30|  $1,357,454.70 $63.50|  $1,383,601.50 $62.00]  $1,350,918.00 $58.50|  $1,274,656.50 $54.00|  $1,176,606.00 $59.45|  $1,295,356.05 $54.00|  $1,176,606.00
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt
19H 76 Intermediate
27 3B24SUP 8,782.00 Ton Course $71.00 $623,522.00 $63.00 $553,266.00 $70.50 $619,131.00 $69.00 $605,958.00 $65.60 $576,099.20 $74.00 $649,868.00 $68.00 $597,176.00 $72.00 $632,304.00 $60.00 $526,920.00 $68.84 $604,552.88 $60.00 $526,920.00
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt
28 3B25SUP | 14,043.00] Ton  [12-5H 76 Surface Course $73.00|  $1,025,139.00 $68.00 $954,924.00 $72.00[  $1,011,096.00 $75.00|  $1,053,225.00 $72.00|  $1,011,096.00 $77.00|  $1,081,311.00 $74.00|  $1,039,182.00 $71.50|  $1,004,074.50 $65.00 $912,795.00 $69.08 $970,090.44 $65.00 $912,795.00
29 3B26TAC 50,211.00 Gallon Tack Coat $0.10 $5,021.10 $0.10 $5,021.10 $0.01 $502.11 $0.01 $502.11 $0.01 $502.11 $0.10 $5,021.10 $0.01 $502.11 $3.50 $175,738.50 $0.01 $502.11 $0.01 $502.11 $0.01 $502.11
Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches
30 3C01BRS 4,370.00 S.Y. Thick $11.00 $48,070.00 $20.00 $87,400.00 $16.50 $72,105.00 $20.00 $87,400.00 $10.00 $43,700.00 $19.00 $83,030.00 $8.00 $34,960.00 $20.00 $87,400.00 $20.00 $87,400.00 $20.31 $88,754.70 $20.00 $87,400.00
Berm Surfacing, Crushed
31 3C02BRS 12,085.00 S.Y. Stone, 6" Thick $14.00 $169,190.00 $14.00 $169,190.00 $13.20 $159,522.00 $13.00 $157,105.00 $12.50 $151,062.50 $18.00 $217,530.00 $12.00 $145,020.00 $13.50 $163,147.50 $10.00 $120,850.00 $13.36 $161,455.60 $13.00 $157,105.00
32 3D05APS 270 S.Y. Bridge Approach Slab $340.00 $91,800.00 $350.00 $94,500.00 $450.00 $121,500.00 $425.00 $114,750.00 $430.00 $116,100.00 $400.00 $108,000.00 $450.00 $121,500.00 $500.00 $135,000.00 $330.00 $89,100.00 $347.19 $93,741.30 $330.00 $89,100.00
Pavement Removal, 2"
33 3E07PMR 54,847.00 S.Y. Depth $4.00 $219,388.00 $2.20 $120,663.40 $4.50 $246,811.50 $2.60 $142,602.20 $2.15 $117,921.05 $2.00 $109,694.00 $2.50 $137,117.50 $1.80 $98,724.60 $2.00 $109,694.00 $1.92 $105,306.24 $2.00 $109,694.00
34 3FO01MRS 42,000.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $0.50 $21,000.00 $0.30 $12,600.00 $0.40 $16,800.00 $0.50 $21,000.00 $0.25 $10,500.00 $0.40 $16,800.00 $0.50 $21,000.00 $0.20 $8,400.00 $0.50 $21,000.00 $0.35 $14,700.00 $0.40 $16,800.00
35 4A10RFS 91 Pound Reinforcement Steel $2.00 $182.00 $3.00 $273.00 $1.90 $172.90 $3.00 $273.00 $5.00 $455.00 $4.00 $364.00 $1.50 $136.50 $1.80 $163.80 $2.00 $182.00 $2.41 $219.31 $1.40 $127.40
Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy
36 4A11RFS 6,000.00 Pound Coated $2.00 $12,000.00 $2.80 $16,800.00 $2.20 $13,200.00 $3.00 $18,000.00 $2.70 $16,200.00 $2.00 $12,000.00 $1.50 $9,000.00 $2.00 $12,000.00 $1.50 $9,000.00 $2.55 $15,300.00 $1.60 $9,600.00
Concrete Foundations for
37 4F100HF 80 C.Y. Overhead Sign Structures $770.00 $61,600.00 $550.00 $44,000.00 $790.00 $63,200.00 $450.00 $36,000.00 $1,100.00 $88,000.00 $800.00 $64,000.00 $1,000.00 $80,000.00 $750.00 $60,000.00 $800.00 $64,000.00 $1,110.16 $88,812.80 $800.00 $64,000.00
Ground Mounted Noise
39 4ZA00NBP 38,000.00 S.F. Barrier Panel $21.00 $798,000.00 $17.00 $646,000.00 $18.00 $684,000.00 $17.00 $646,000.00 $20.00 $760,000.00 $17.50 $665,000.00 $17.00 $646,000.00 $7.25 $275,500.00 $14.00 $532,000.00 $16.53 $628,140.00 $32.00 $1,216,000.00
40 4zA10NBS | 38,000.00| sF.  |Concrete Penetrating Stain $1.00 $38,000.00 $1.10 $41,800.00 $2.75 $104,500.00 $2.25 $85,500.00 $2.40 $91,200.00 $2.50 $95,000.00 $1.00 $38,000.00 $1.30 $49,400.00 $1.60 $60,800.00 $2.21 $83,980.00 $1.00 $38,000.00
41 4ZA12GMP 3,100.00 L.F. Ground Mounted Post $240.00 $744,000.00 $250.00 $775,000.00 $230.00 $713,000.00 $225.00 $697,500.00 $270.00 $837,000.00 $225.00 $697,500.00 $225.00 $697,500.00 $225.00 $697,500.00 $200.00 $620,000.00 $255.05 $790,655.00 $42.50 $131,750.00
42 4ZA42CRA 50/ c.. |Additional Crushed Stone $50.00 $2,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $120.00 $6,000.00 $100.00 $5,000.00 $100.00 $5,000.00 $175.00 $8,750.00 $80.00 $4,000.00 $110.00 $5,500.00 $35.00 $1,750.00 $28.99 $1,449.50 $275.00 $13,750.00
Drilled Shaft for Sign
43 4710013 450 L.F. Structures $475.00 $213,750.00 $180.00 $81,000.00 $450.00 $202,500.00 $450.00 $202,500.00 $550.00 $247,500.00 $425.00 $191,250.00 $465.00 $209,250.00 $610.00 $274,500.00 $365.00 $164,250.00 $550.59 $247,765.50 $500.00 $225,000.00
Install Overhead Span
Variable Message Sign and
Variable Speed Limit Sign
44 4ZN0037 1 L.S. Support Structure No. 1 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,750.00 $15,750.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $11,600.00 $11,600.00 $15,500.00 $15,500.00 $11,573.10 $11,573.10 $16,000.00 $16,000.00
Install Overhead Span
Variable Message Sign and
Variable Speed Limit Sign
45 4ZN0038 1 L.S. Support Structure No. 2 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,750.00 $15,750.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $11,600.00 $11,600.00 $15,500.00 $15,500.00 $11,573.10 $11,573.10 $16,000.00 $16,000.00
Install Overhead Span
Variable Message Sign and
Variable Speed Limit Sign
46 4ZN0039 1 L.S. Support Structure No. 3 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,750.00 $15,750.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $11,600.00 $11,600.00 $15,500.00 $15,500.00 $11,573.10 $11,573.10 $16,000.00 $16,000.00
Install Overhead Span
Variable Message Sign and
Variable Speed Limit Sign
47 4ZN0040 1 L.S. Support Structure No. 4 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,750.00 $15,750.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $11,600.00 $11,600.00 $15,500.00 $15,500.00 $11,573.10 $11,573.10 $16,000.00 $16,000.00




Contract T869.120.801 - Bid Tabulation

New Prince Concrete Construction | JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING CO.,
ITEMS Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. D'Annunzio & Sons, Inc. Trap Rock Industries, Inc. Co. INC Tilcon New York Union Paving and Const. Co., Inc. Tarheel Enterprises Inc. Agate Construction Co., Inc. Crisdel Group, Inc. J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc.
Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

48 5A00004 143 L.F. 8" Outlet Pipe $36.00 $5,148.00 $25.00 $3,575.00 $31.00 $4,433.00 $35.00 $5,005.00 $25.00 $3,575.00 $35.00 $5,005.00 $57.00 $8,151.00 $110.00 $15,730.00 $50.00 $7,150.00 $46.30 $6,620.90 $30.00 $4,290.00

49 5A08PUD 13,689.00 L.F. 8" Pipe Underdrain $25.00 $342,225.00 $22.00 $301,158.00 $33.50 $458,581.50 $30.00 $410,670.00 $26.00 $355,914.00 $30.00 $410,670.00 $24.00 $328,536.00 $28.50 $390,136.50 $25.00 $342,225.00 $29.54 $404,373.06 $20.00 $273,780.00
Cleaning Existing Storm

50 5B01CSD 170 L.F. Drains $11.00 $1,870.00 $20.00 $3,400.00 $19.00 $3,230.00 $50.00 $8,500.00 $12.00 $2,040.00 $15.00 $2,550.00 $5.00 $850.00 $21.00 $3,570.00 $10.00 $1,700.00 $15.47 $2,629.90 $15.00 $2,550.00
15" Reinforced Concrete

51 5B15RC3 693 L.F. Pipe $63.00 $43,659.00 $35.00 $24,255.00 $68.20 $47,262.60 $50.00 $34,650.00 $52.15 $36,139.95 $63.00 $43,659.00 $35.00 $24,255.00 $40.00 $27,720.00 $75.00 $51,975.00 $90.17 $62,487.81 $75.00 $51,975.00
18" Reinforced Concrete

52 5B18RC3 383 L.F. Pipe $69.00 $26,427.00 $45.00 $17,235.00 $74.50 $28,533.50 $55.00 $21,065.00 $59.00 $22,597.00 $86.00 $32,938.00 $40.00 $15,320.00 $50.00 $19,150.00 $100.00 $38,300.00 $92.58 $35,458.14 $85.00 $32,555.00
24" Reinforced Concrete

53 5B24RC3 131 L.F. Pipe $75.00 $9,825.00 $70.00 $9,170.00 $136.50 $17,881.50 $65.00 $8,515.00 $106.00 $13,886.00 $94.00 $12,314.00 $70.00 $9,170.00 $130.00 $17,030.00 $125.00 $16,375.00 $159.27 $20,864.37 $90.00 $11,790.00
30 " Reinforced Concrete

54 5B30RC3 244 L.F. Pipe, Class IlI $60.00 $14,640.00 $70.00 $17,080.00 $142.50 $34,770.00 $75.00 $18,300.00 $115.00 $28,060.00 $143.00 $34,892.00 $72.00 $17,568.00 $85.00 $20,740.00 $150.00 $36,600.00 $126.03 $30,751.32 $100.00 $24,400.00
36" Reinforced Concrete

55 5B36RC3 208 L.F. Pipe, Class IlI $78.00 $16,224.00 $100.00 $20,800.00 $161.25 $33,540.00 $100.00 $20,800.00 $127.00 $26,416.00 $160.00 $33,280.00 $83.00 $17,264.00 $90.00 $18,720.00 $175.00 $36,400.00 $137.85 $28,672.80 $130.00 $27,040.00
12" Corrugated Metal Pipe,

56 N5B0002 22 L.F. Gauge 16 $8.00 $176.00 $200.00 $4,400.00 $62.00 $1,364.00 $100.00 $2,200.00 $50.00 $1,100.00 $90.00 $1,980.00 $40.00 $880.00 $50.00 $1,100.00 $50.00 $1,100.00 $327.95 $7,214.90 $50.00 $1,100.00

57 5C00023 1 Each Flow Control Structure $9,800.00 $9,800.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $17,398.50 $17,398.50 $8,100.00 $8,100.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $13,372.77 $13,372.77 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

58 5C01ND1 9 Each Inlet, Type D1 $3,330.00 $29,970.00 $2,000.00 $18,000.00 $2,850.00 $25,650.00 $2,000.00 $18,000.00 $2,185.00 $19,665.00 $2,170.00 $19,530.00 $2,400.00 $21,600.00 $2,600.00 $23,400.00 $1,700.00 $15,300.00 $2,271.64 $20,444.76 $2,000.00 $18,000.00

59 5C01ND2 16 Each Inlet, Type D2 $3,500.00 $56,000.00 $2,500.00 $40,000.00 $3,720.00 $59,520.00 $2,200.00 $35,200.00 $2,920.00 $46,720.00 $3,390.00 $54,240.00 $3,300.00 $52,800.00 $3,300.00 $52,800.00 $1,800.00 $28,800.00 $3,362.80 $53,804.80 $2,400.00 $38,400.00

60 5C01ND3 2 Each Inlet, Type D3 $3,700.00 $7,400.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $3,350.00 $6,700.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $2,565.00 $5,130.00 $2,810.00 $5,620.00 $3,400.00 $6,800.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00 $4,135.23 $8,270.46 $2,400.00 $4,800.00
New Inlet Frame & Grate,

64 5CO5NG1 42 Each Type G-1 $610.00 $25,620.00 $800.00 $33,600.00 $805.00 $33,810.00 $750.00 $31,500.00 $675.00 $28,350.00 $1,000.00 $42,000.00 $1,050.00 $44,100.00 $750.00 $31,500.00 $700.00 $29,400.00 $971.16 $40,788.72 $560.00 $23,520.00
New Inlet Frame & Grate,

65 5CO5NG2 84 Each Type G-2 $950.00 $79,800.00 $1,100.00 $92,400.00 $1,220.00 $102,480.00 $1,000.00 $84,000.00 $1,050.00 $88,200.00 $1,535.00 $128,940.00 $1,250.00 $105,000.00 $1,000.00 $84,000.00 $900.00 $75,600.00 $1,340.51 $112,602.84 $840.00 $70,560.00
Reconstructed Inlet, Type
D1, Using New Grate and

66 5C10ND1 10 Each Frame $750.00 $7,500.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $1,220.00 $12,200.00 $1,200.00 $12,000.00 $965.00 $9,650.00 $1,555.00 $15,550.00 $1,200.00 $12,000.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $3,000.00 $30,000.00 $1,409.78 $14,097.80 $800.00 $8,000.00
Reconstructed Inlet, Type
D2, Using New Grate and

67 5C10ND2 10 Each Frame $1,340.00 $13,400.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $1,620.00 $16,200.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $1,310.00 $13,100.00 $2,265.00 $22,650.00 $1,550.00 $15,500.00 $1,800.00 $18,000.00 $4,000.00 $40,000.00 $1,620.10 $16,201.00 $1,100.00 $11,000.00
Reconstructed Inlet, Type
D3, Using New Grate and

68 5C10ND3 5 Each Frame $1,290.00 $6,450.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,620.00 $8,100.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,195.00 $5,975.00 $2,205.00 $11,025.00 $1,550.00 $7,750.00 $1,800.00 $9,000.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00 $1,569.15 $7,845.75 $1,100.00 $5,500.00

69 5C20NP1 12 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $3,600.00 $43,200.00 $2,200.00 $26,400.00 $3,425.00 $41,100.00 $2,200.00 $26,400.00 $2,440.00 $29,280.00 $2,905.00 $34,860.00 $2,350.00 $28,200.00 $3,000.00 $36,000.00 $2,000.00 $24,000.00 $3,414.65 $40,975.80 $2,000.00 $24,000.00

70 5C20NP2 4 Each Manhole, Type P-2 $6,250.00 $25,000.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $3,225.00 $12,900.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $4,580.00 $18,320.00 $6,065.00 $24,260.00 $4,700.00 $18,800.00 $4,500.00 $18,000.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $5,236.41 $20,945.64 $3,000.00 $12,000.00

71 5C40RSF 6 Each Reset Frame $147.00 $882.00 $200.00 $1,200.00 $300.00 $1,800.00 $500.00 $3,000.00 $225.00 $1,350.00 $495.00 $2,970.00 $700.00 $4,200.00 $450.00 $2,700.00 $1,000.00 $6,000.00 $396.01 $2,376.06 $250.00 $1,500.00

72 5D10INC 2 C.y. Incidental Concrete $155.00 $310.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $335.00 $670.00 $1,980.00 $3,960.00 $1,300.00 $2,600.00 $850.00 $1,700.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,562.18 $3,124.36 $500.00 $1,000.00
Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb

73 5E01ALC 7,343.00 L.F. $9.00 $66,087.00 $9.00 $66,087.00 $9.00 $66,087.00 $10.00 $73,430.00 $8.00 $58,744.00 $7.00 $51,401.00 $8.00 $58,744.00 $8.75 $64,251.25 $8.00 $58,744.00 $6.31 $46,334.33 $15.00 $110,145.00
Asphalt Concrete lip Curb

74 5E02ALC 4 Each Inlet $980.00 $3,920.00 $400.00 $1,600.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $504.00 $2,016.00 $785.00 $3,140.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $450.00 $1,800.00 $400.00 $1,600.00 $1,122.55 $4,490.20 $300.00 $1,200.00

75 5F01VCA 338 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $21.00 $7,098.00 $30.00 $10,140.00 $26.00 $8,788.00 $25.00 $8,450.00 $27.25 $9,210.50 $35.00 $11,830.00 $28.00 $9,464.00 $24.75 $8,365.50 $18.00 $6,084.00 $19.83 $6,702.54 $18.85 $6,371.30

76 5H00004 2 Each VMS Equipment Median $42,000.00 $84,000.00 $90,000.00 $180,000.00 $90,000.00 $180,000.00 $85,000.00 $170,000.00 $44,000.00 $88,000.00 $75,000.00 $150,000.00 $135,000.00 $270,000.00 $105,000.00 $210,000.00 $68,000.00 $136,000.00 $80,114.59 $160,229.18 $81,000.00 $162,000.00
Concrete Median Barrier,

77 5H01CMB 154 L.F. Roadway $250.00 $38,500.00 $250.00 $38,500.00 $210.00 $32,340.00 $215.00 $33,110.00 $215.00 $33,110.00 $215.00 $33,110.00 $225.00 $34,650.00 $205.00 $31,570.00 $225.00 $34,650.00 $236.72 $36,454.88 $225.00 $34,650.00
Concrete Median Barrier,

78 5H03CMB 46 L.F. Protection $275.00 $12,650.00 $260.00 $11,960.00 $135.00 $6,210.00 $140.00 $6,440.00 $142.25 $6,543.50 $140.00 $6,440.00 $150.00 $6,900.00 $420.00 $19,320.00 $250.00 $11,500.00 $263.03 $12,099.38 $250.00 $11,500.00

79 5101SNP 570 S.F. Sign Panels $24.00 $13,680.00 $16.00 $9,120.00 $26.00 $14,820.00 $25.00 $14,250.00 $14.70 $8,379.00 $25.00 $14,250.00 $17.00 $9,690.00 $16.00 $9,120.00 $15.00 $8,550.00 $15.78 $8,994.60 $11.00 $6,270.00

80 5105SPP 900 L.F. U-channel Post $15.00 $13,500.00 $6.00 $5,400.00 $16.00 $14,400.00 $8.00 $7,200.00 $10.50 $9,450.00 $15.50 $13,950.00 $6.50 $5,850.00 $6.00 $5,400.00 $6.00 $5,400.00 $6.05 $5,445.00 $12.00 $10,800.00

81 N510002 100 L.F. Timber Posts $55.00 $5,500.00 $7.00 $700.00 $58.00 $5,800.00 $60.00 $6,000.00 $26.25 $2,625.00 $56.50 $5,650.00 $29.00 $2,900.00 $6.35 $635.00 $6.00 $600.00 $6.31 $631.00 $50.00 $5,000.00

82 5J00FGT 10 Each Flared Guide Rail Terminal $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $1,800.00 $18,000.00 $2,100.00 $21,000.00 $1,750.00 $17,500.00 $18.35 $183.50 $2,050.00 $20,500.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $1,850.00 $18,500.00 $1,600.00 $16,000.00 $1,830.65 $18,306.50 $1,800.00 $18,000.00
Parapet Connection, Type

83 5J01PCA 18 Each A $1,500.00 $27,000.00 $1,300.00 $23,400.00 $1,575.00 $28,350.00 $2,100.00 $37,800.00 $1,575.00 $28,350.00 $1,545.00 $27,810.00 $1,700.00 $30,600.00 $1,325.00 $23,850.00 $2,000.00 $36,000.00 $1,325.65 $23,861.70 $1,300.00 $23,400.00
Parapet Connection, Type

84 5J01PCB 19 Each B $145.00 $2,755.00 $500.00 $9,500.00 $153.00 $2,907.00 $210.00 $3,990.00 $367.50 $6,982.50 $150.00 $2,850.00 $400.00 $7,600.00 $510.00 $9,690.00 $200.00 $3,800.00 $505.01 $9,595.19 $130.00 $2,470.00
Removal of Beam Guide rail

85 5J01RBG 23,777.00 L.F. $1.00 $23,777.00 $1.50 $35,665.50 $1.10 $26,154.70 $1.00 $23,777.00 $0.55 $13,077.35 $1.00 $23,777.00 $1.00 $23,777.00 $1.00 $23,777.00 $1.00 $23,777.00 $1.05 $24,965.85 $1.50 $35,665.50
Beam Guide Rail Post

86 5J01RPW 53 Each Weldment $250.00 $13,250.00 $200.00 $10,600.00 $263.00 $13,939.00 $235.00 $12,455.00 $157.50 $8,347.50 $250.00 $13,250.00 $175.00 $9,275.00 $155.00 $8,215.00 $200.00 $10,600.00 $154.66 $8,196.98 $225.00 $11,925.00
Beam Guide Rail

87 5J52ABG 18 Each Anchorage $500.00 $9,000.00 $500.00 $9,000.00 $525.00 $9,450.00 $450.00 $8,100.00 $735.00 $13,230.00 $500.00 $9,000.00 $800.00 $14,400.00 $425.00 $7,650.00 $400.00 $7,200.00 $426.10 $7,669.80 $450.00 $8,100.00
Beam Guide Rail Buried

88 5J52BET 4 Each End Terminal $700.00 $2,800.00 $1,300.00 $5,200.00 $750.00 $3,000.00 $1,300.00 $5,200.00 $1,575.00 $6,300.00 $700.00 $2,800.00 $1,750.00 $7,000.00 $1,275.00 $5,100.00 $1,200.00 $4,800.00 $1,262.52 $5,050.08 $450.00 $1,800.00

89 5J52BGR 16,399.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $14.00 $229,586.00 $17.00 $278,783.00 $15.00 $245,985.00 $16.00 $262,384.00 $14.70 $241,065.30 $15.00 $245,985.00 $16.00 $262,384.00 $17.00 $278,783.00 $15.00 $245,985.00 $16.62 $272,551.38 $13.00 $213,187.00

90 5001CAR 7 Each Delineator, Type CA-R $35.00 $245.00 $70.00 $490.00 $37.00 $259.00 $35.00 $245.00 $42.00 $294.00 $35.00 $245.00 $75.00 $525.00 $69.00 $483.00 $65.00 $455.00 $68.39 $478.73 $35.00 $245.00

91 5001CAW 16 Each Delineator, Type CA-W $35.00 $560.00 $70.00 $1,120.00 $37.00 $592.00 $35.00 $560.00 $42.00 $672.00 $35.00 $560.00 $75.00 $1,200.00 $69.00 $1,104.00 $65.00 $1,040.00 $68.39 $1,094.24 $35.00 $560.00

92 5001CAY 7 Each Delineator, Type CA-Y $35.00 $245.00 $70.00 $490.00 $37.00 $259.00 $36.00 $252.00 $42.00 $294.00 $35.00 $245.00 $75.00 $525.00 $69.00 $483.00 $65.00 $455.00 $68.39 $478.73 $35.00 $245.00

93 5001PAW 91 Each Delineator, Type PA-W $35.00 $3,185.00 $40.00 $3,640.00 $37.00 $3,367.00 $39.00 $3,549.00 $57.75 $5,255.25 $35.00 $3,185.00 $45.00 $4,095.00 $41.00 $3,731.00 $40.00 $3,640.00 $41.03 $3,733.73 $35.00 $3,185.00

94 5001PAY 7 Each Delineator, Type PA-Y $35.00 $245.00 $40.00 $280.00 $37.00 $259.00 $39.00 $273.00 $57.75 $404.25 $35.00 $245.00 $45.00 $315.00 $41.00 $287.00 $40.00 $280.00 $41.03 $287.21 $35.00 $245.00
Pavement Striping, White,

95 5P00007 400 L.F. 12" Wide $0.70 $280.00 $1.00 $400.00 $1.00 $400.00 $1.00 $400.00 $0.80 $320.00 $0.75 $300.00 $1.00 $400.00 $0.80 $320.00 $1.00 $400.00 $2.10 $840.00 $2.00 $800.00
Preformed Contrast

96 5P01CMT 400 L.F. Marking Tape $6.50 $2,600.00 $6.00 $2,400.00 $7.00 $2,800.00 $7.00 $2,800.00 $5.50 $2,200.00 $5.75 $2,300.00 $7.00 $2,800.00 $6.00 $2,400.00 $6.00 $2,400.00 $5.52 $2,208.00 $5.25 $2,100.00
Pavement Striping, White

97 5P06PTW 73,200.00 L.F. 6" Wide $0.40 $29,280.00 $0.25 $18,300.00 $0.25 $18,300.00 $0.25 $18,300.00 $0.20 $14,640.00 $0.20 $14,640.00 $0.25 $18,300.00 $0.21 $15,372.00 $0.20 $14,640.00 $0.25 $18,300.00 $0.24 $17,568.00
Pavement Striping, Yellow,

98 5P0O6PTY 1,800.00 L.F. 6" Wide $0.40 $720.00 $0.25 $450.00 $0.25 $450.00 $0.25 $450.00 $0.20 $360.00 $0.20 $360.00 $0.25 $450.00 $0.21 $378.00 $0.20 $360.00 $0.25 $450.00 $0.24 $432.00
Pavement Striping, White,

99 5P24PTW 250 L.F. 24" Wide $1.25 $312.50 $2.00 $500.00 $2.00 $500.00 $2.00 $500.00 $1.55 $387.50 $1.50 $375.00 $2.00 $500.00 $1.60 $400.00 $2.00 $500.00 $4.21 $1,052.50 $4.00 $1,000.00

100 5Y01MRC 22 Each Mile Marker, Type RC $75.00 $1,650.00 $70.00 $1,540.00 $70.00 $1,540.00 $75.00 $1,650.00 $57.75 $1,270.50 $75.00 $1,650.00 $65.00 $1,430.00 $105.00 $2,310.00 $65.00 $1,430.00 $68.39 $1,504.58 $55.00 $1,210.00

101 5YO1MRP 57 Each Mile Marker, Type RP $75.00 $4,275.00 $70.00 $3,990.00 $70.00 $3,990.00 $75.00 $4,275.00 $78.75 $4,488.75 $75.00 $4,275.00 $85.00 $4,845.00 $53.00 $3,021.00 $65.00 $3,705.00 $68.39 $3,898.23 $55.00 $3,135.00
Manufactured Treatment

102 5710022 1 Each Devices, Type 1 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $43,000.00 $43,000.00 $54,000.00 $54,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $68,300.00 $68,300.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $41,189.42 $41,189.42 $80,000.00 $80,000.00
#4/0 A.W.G. Multiple

103 6A00006 7,768.00 L.F. Lighting Cable $9.00 $69,912.00 $9.00 $69,912.00 $7.00 $54,376.00 $10.00 $77,680.00 $8.25 $64,086.00 $9.25 $71,854.00 $8.50 $66,028.00 $8.80 $68,358.40 $7.00 $54,376.00 $6.84 $53,133.12 $9.10 $70,688.80
#2 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting

104 6A02MLC 8,741.00 L.F. Cable $4.00 $34,964.00 $4.50 $39,334.50 $4.00 $34,964.00 $6.00 $52,446.00 $4.40 $38,460.40 $5.15 $45,016.15 $3.75 $32,778.75 $4.30 $37,586.30 $3.00 $26,223.00 $3.95 $34,526.95 $4.00 $34,964.00
3" Rigid Metallic Conduit,

105 6A03RMU 726 L.F. Underground $20.00 $14,520.00 $45.00 $32,670.00 $27.00 $19,602.00 $34.00 $24,684.00 $30.25 $21,961.50 $33.00 $23,958.00 $25.00 $18,150.00 $40.50 $29,403.00 $30.00 $21,780.00 $26.30 $19,093.80 $20.00 $14,520.00
3" Rigid Nonmetallic
Conduit, PVC-(Schedule

106 6A03RNC 3,642.00 L.F. 40) $7.00 $25,494.00 $4.20 $15,296.40 $15.00 $54,630.00 $12.00 $43,704.00 $7.35 $26,768.70 $11.00 $40,062.00 $2.00 $7,284.00 $13.50 $49,167.00 $7.00 $25,494.00 $14.73 $53,646.66 $7.00 $25,494.00
#6 A.W.G. Service Cable

107 6A06SVC 130 L.F. (600V) $2.00 $260.00 $3.00 $390.00 $2.50 $325.00 $5.00 $650.00 $3.15 $409.50 $4.00 $520.00 $4.00 $520.00 $3.00 $390.00 $3.00 $390.00 $2.10 $273.00 $2.00 $260.00

108 6A08GWR 6,564.00 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $2.00 $13,128.00 $2.50 $16,410.00 $2.00 $13,128.00 $2.00 $13,128.00 $1.65 $10,830.60 $1.50 $9,846.00 $2.00 $13,128.00 $2.50 $16,410.00 $2.00 $13,128.00 $1.58 $10,371.12 $1.50 $9,846.00
#1/0 AW.G. Multiple

109 6A10MLC 14,846.00 L.F. Lighting Cable $6.00 $89,076.00 $5.50 $81,653.00 $5.00 $74,230.00 $6.50 $96,499.00 $5.60 $83,137.60 $6.00 $89,076.00 $5.50 $81,653.00 $5.75 $85,364.50 $5.00 $74,230.00 $4.63 $68,736.98 $6.25 $92,787.50
3" Rigid Nonmetallic
Conduit, PVC-(Schedule

110 6A13RNC 906 L.F. 80) $8.00 $7,248.00 $2.00 $1,812.00 $18.50 $16,761.00 $16.00 $14,496.00 $19.50 $17,667.00 $15.00 $13,590.00 $3.00 $2,718.00 $14.75 $13,363.50 $10.00 $9,060.00 $15.78 $14,296.68 $7.50 $6,795.00

111 6A24JBC 247 Each Junction Box, Type C $3,000.00 $741,000.00 $2,800.00 $691,600.00 $2,750.00 $679,250.00 $3,000.00 $741,000.00 $3,000.00 $741,000.00 $2,600.00 $642,200.00 $2,200.00 $543,400.00 $3,200.00 $790,400.00 $2,800.00 $691,600.00 $3,449.10 $851,927.70 $2,500.00 $617,500.00

112 6A25JPS 3 Each Junction Box, Type PS $1,525.00 $4,575.00 $2,800.00 $8,400.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,900.00 $8,700.00 $2,600.00 $7,800.00 $4,350.00 $13,050.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $2,104.20 $6,312.60 $1,500.00 $4,500.00
Remove and Salvage

113 6A65RAS 1 Lump Existing Facilities $3,050.00 $3,050.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $17,650.00 $17,650.00 $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,450.00 $6,450.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $4,208.40 $4,208.40 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
Type A, Luminaire, 150W

114 6B00002 11 Each HPS $475.00 $5,225.00 $330.00 $3,630.00 $600.00 $6,600.00 $1,050.00 $11,550.00 $446.00 $4,906.00 $1,025.00 $11,275.00 $500.00 $5,500.00 $350.00 $3,850.00 $425.00 $4,675.00 $526.05 $5,786.55 $450.00 $4,950.00
Type C Luminaire, 250W

115 6B00017 8 Each HPS $620.00 $4,960.00 $400.00 $3,200.00 $750.00 $6,000.00 $1,050.00 $8,400.00 $545.00 $4,360.00 $1,025.00 $8,200.00 $600.00 $4,800.00 $420.00 $3,360.00 $520.00 $4,160.00 $683.87 $5,470.96 $600.00 $4,800.00
Meter Cabinet, Type G,

116 6B00030 1 Each Voltage 120/240V $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $7,725.00 $7,725.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $9,468.90 $9,468.90 $11,600.00 $11,600.00




Contract T869.120.801 - Bid Tabulation

New Prince Concrete Construction

JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING CO.,

ITEMS Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. D'Annunzio & Sons, Inc. Trap Rock Industries, Inc. Co. INC Tilcon New York Union Paving and Const. Co., Inc. Tarheel Enterprises Inc. Agate Construction Co., Inc. Crisdel Group, Inc. J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc.
ltem No. | Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

Meter Cabinet, Type G,

117 6B00032 1| Each |voltage 240/480V $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $3,350.00 $3,350.00 $7,725.00 $7,725.00 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $12,625.20 $12,625.20 $13,100.00 $13,100.00

118 6B01LS1 6| Each |-ighting Standard, Type 1 $2,300.00 $13,800.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $2,200.00 $13,200.00 $2,600.00 $15,600.00 $2,950.00 $17,700.00 $2,550.00 $15,300.00 $3,200.00 $19,200.00 $3,200.00 $19,200.00 $2,800.00 $16,800.00 $2,025.29 $12,151.74 $2,100.00 $12,600.00
RELOCATE JUNCTION
BOX FOUNDATION, TYPE

119 6BO6RWL 12| Each |JBF $1.00 $12.00 $2,100.00 $25,200.00 $1,300.00 $15,600.00 $1,450.00 $17,400.00 $1,675.00 $20,100.00 $1,450.00 $17,400.00 $1,150.00 $13,800.00 $2,200.00 $26,400.00 $1,600.00 $19,200.00 $1,052.10 $12,625.20 $998.00 $11,976.00
RELOCATE LIGHTING

120 6BO7RWL 9] Each |STANDARD $1,400.00 $12,600.00 $1,000.00 $9,000.00 $1,400.00 $12,600.00 $900.00 $8,100.00 $1,250.00 $11,250.00 $1,000.00 $9,000.00 $1,400.00 $12,600.00 $1,050.00 $9,450.00 $1,200.00 $10,800.00 $1,262.52 $11,362.68 $1,362.00 $12,258.00

121 6B25TP3 3| Each |TYPe P3Luminaire, 250W $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $1,100.00 $3,300.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $2,100.00 $6,300.00 $610.00 $1,830.00 $2,100.00 $6,300.00 $700.00 $2,100.00 $1,120.00 $3,360.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $1,699.14 $5,097.42 $1,400.00 $4,200.00
Removal of Emergency
Speed Warning and Speed

122 6E03ESR 6| Each |LimitSigns $1,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,100.00 $6,600.00 $1,200.00 $7,200.00 $1,600.00 $9,600.00 $925.00 $5,550.00 $1,550.00 $9,300.00 $3,600.00 $21,600.00 $1,150.00 $6,900.00 $900.00 $5,400.00 $1,052.10 $6,312.60 $925.00 $5,550.00
System Manufacturer
Installation and Testing
(This is a NO-BID, Lump
Sum item for this contract.
The Lump Sum price is
$20,000. Enter a Unit Price
of $20,000 as your bid for

123 6H00001 1 L.S this item.) $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
In-Pavement Wireless

124 6J00001 36| Each |sensor $925.00 $33,300.00 $1,900.00 $68,400.00 $1,200.00 $43,200.00 $1,350.00 $48,600.00 $6,345.00 $228,420.00 $1,300.00 $46,800.00 $1,650.00 $59,400.00 $2,000.00 $72,000.00 $1,500.00 $54,000.00 $1,052.10 $37,875.60 $200.00 $7,200.00
Variable Message Sign

125 600017 4| Each |installation $10,000.00 $40,000.00 $3,600.00 $14,400.00 $5,300.00 $21,200.00 $8,000.00 $32,000.00 $18,000.00 $72,000.00 $10,000.00 $40,000.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00 $3,750.00 $15,000.00 $13,000.00 $52,000.00 $5,260.50 $21,042.00 $12,000.00 $48,000.00
Variable Speed Limit Sign

126 6300018 4|  Each |installation $1,900.00 $7,600.00 $3,600.00 $14,400.00 $2,200.00 $8,800.00 $8,000.00 $32,000.00 $9,870.00 $39,480.00 $9,000.00 $36,000.00 $7,500.00 $30,000.00 $3,750.00 $15,000.00 $6,400.00 $25,600.00 $2,104.20 $8,416.80 $3,000.00 $12,000.00
System Control Cabinet

127 6300020 4| Each |installation $9,000.00 $36,000.00 $11,000.00 $44,000.00 $7,500.00 $30,000.00 $8,000.00 $32,000.00 $4,145.00 $16,580.00 $7,750.00 $31,000.00 $4,500.00 $18,000.00 $11,600.00 $46,400.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $7,364.70 $29,458.80 $8,600.00 $34,400.00

128 600022 2| Each |Power Equipmenton ITSS $26,000.00 $52,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $28,000.00 $56,000.00 $29,500.00 $59,000.00 $6,825.00 $13,650.00 $30,000.00 $60,000.00 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $10,500.00 $21,000.00 $6,500.00 $13,000.00 $27,354.60 $54,709.20 $25,600.00 $51,200.00
Transformer, Type 37.5kVA

129 6300023 1|  Each $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $4,145.00 $4,145.00 $5,400.00 $5,400.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $6,750.00 $6,750.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,208.40 $4,208.40 $6,400.00 $6,400.00
CCTV Camera, ITSS

130 6300024 2|  Each  |Mounted $14,000.00 $28,000.00 $16,000.00 $32,000.00 $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $16,000.00 $32,000.00 $17,535.00 $35,070.00 $15,500.00 $31,000.00 $19,000.00 $38,000.00 $16,500.00 $33,000.00 $16,700.00 $33,400.00 $14,729.40 $29,458.80 $14,200.00 $28,400.00
4-Way Power/Comm Duct

132 6J00030 40,191.00 LF. Bank, Concrete Encased $23.00 $924,393.00 $40.00|  $1,607,640.00 $44.00|  $1,768,404.00 $47.00|  $1,888,977.00 $45.00]  $1,808,595.00 $50.00|  $2,009,550.00 $33.00]  $1,326,303.00 $41.00|  $1,647,831.00 $37.00|  $1,487,067.00 $38.44|  $1,544,942.04 $40.00|  $1,607,640.00
2-Way Duct Bank, 4" HDPE

133 6J00031 646 L.F Conduits Directional Drilled $65.00 $41,990.00 $70.00 $45,220.00 $75.00 $48,450.00 $68.00 $43,928.00 $310.00 $200,260.00 $65.00 $41,990.00 $365.00 $235,790.00 $80.00 $51,680.00 $90.00 $58,140.00 $57.39 $37,073.94 $125.00 $80,750.00
Wireless Access Point,

134 6J00032 4| Each  |ITSS Mounted $8,000.00 $32,000.00 $10,000.00 $40,000.00 $8,500.00 $34,000.00 $9,800.00 $39,200.00 $13,300.00 $53,200.00 $10,000.00 $40,000.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00 $10,250.00 $41,000.00 $13,000.00 $52,000.00 $8,416.80 $33,667.20 $7,700.00 $30,800.00
4-Way Duct Bank, 4" HDPE

135 6300049 125 L.F. Conduits Directional Drilled $125.00 $15,625.00 $100.00 $12,500.00 $150.00 $18,750.00 $105.00 $13,125.00 $325.00 $40,625.00 $150.00 $18,750.00 $450.00 $56,250.00 $170.00 $21,250.00 $1.00 $125.00 $101.79 $12,723.75 $300.00 $37,500.00
4-Way Power/Comm Duct

136 6J00057 1,248.00 L.F. Bank, On Structure $125.00 $156,000.00 $100.00 $124,800.00 $85.00 $106,080.00 $47.00 $58,656.00 $35.50 $44,304.00 $50.00 $62,400.00 $100.00 $124,800.00 $83.00 $103,584.00 $26.00 $32,448.00 $118.65 $148,075.20 $40.00 $49,920.00

137 7C01TOP 17,170.00 S.Y. Topsoil $1.50 $25,755.00 $3.50 $60,095.00 $1.75 $30,047.50 $2.00 $34,340.00 $1.65 $28,330.50 $1.40 $24,038.00 $2.00 $34,340.00 $1.40 $24,038.00 $1.00 $17,170.00 $1.58 $27,128.60 $3.25 $55,802.50

138 7DO1SED 11,200.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $1.00 $11,200.00 $0.50 $5,600.00 $0.75 $8,400.00 $1.00 $11,200.00 $0.75 $8,400.00 $0.80 $8,960.00 $0.50 $5,600.00 $0.70 $7,840.00 $1.00 $11,200.00 $0.47 $5,264.00 $0.70 $7,840.00

139 7DOSSED 5,020.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type L $1.00 $5,020.00 $0.50 $2,510.00 $1.25 $6,275.00 $1.00 $5,020.00 $1.15 $5,773.00 $0.60 $3,012.00 $0.50 $2,510.00 $0.75 $3,765.00 $1.00 $5,020.00 $0.47 $2,359.40 $1.11 $5,572.20

140 7D17SED 950 S.Y. Seeding, Type W $1.00 $950.00 $2.00 $1,900.00 $3.00 $2,850.00 $1.00 $950.00 $2.85 $2,707.50 $1.20 $1,140.00 $2.00 $1,900.00 $0.80 $760.00 $1.00 $950.00 $1.84 $1,748.00 $2.75 $2,612.50

141 7D20MOW 4 Acre  [Mowing $600.00 $2,400.00 $550.00 $2,200.00 $300.00 $1,200.00 $350.00 $1,400.00 $275.00 $1,100.00 $300.00 $1,200.00 $570.00 $2,280.00 $530.00 $2,120.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $526.05 $2,104.20 $265.00 $1,060.00

142 7D30WAT 193]  MG. |watering $325.00 $62,725.00 $110.00 $21,230.00 $145.00 $27,985.00 $0.01 $1.93 $140.00 $27,020.00 $250.00 $48,250.00 $195.00 $37,635.00 $150.00 $28,950.00 $200.00 $38,600.00 $105.21 $20,305.53 $160.00 $30,880.00

143 7F01SSM 5,020.00 S.Y. Soil Stablization Matting $8.00 $40,160.00 $3.50 $17,570.00 $2.00 $10,040.00 $4.00 $20,080.00 $3.15 $15,813.00 $3.75 $18,825.00 $7.50 $37,650.00 $2.40 $12,048.00 $2.00 $10,040.00 $3.42 $17,168.40 $1.76 $8,835.20
Repair Temporary Impact

144 8AO6MPT 196| Barrel  [Attenuators $240.00 $47,040.00 $400.00 $78,400.00 $1.00 $196.00 $0.01 $1.96 $262.50 $51,450.00 $1.00 $196.00 $225.00 $44,100.00 $300.00 $58,800.00 $1.00 $196.00 $105.21 $20,621.16 $180.00 $35,280.00
Repair Truck Mounted

145 8AO7TMPT 4| Each [impact Attenuators $100.00 $400.00 $16,000.00 $64,000.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $0.01 $0.04 $20,000.00 $80,000.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,630.25 $10,521.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00
Furnishing Temporary
Impact Attenuator,

146 N8A0005 4| Each |Frangible Module Type A $2,900.00 $11,600.00 $3,500.00 $14,000.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $4,500.00 $18,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $3,600.00 $14,400.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $3,663.92 $14,655.68 $3,500.00 $14,000.00
Placing and Removing
Temporary Impact
Attenuator, Frangible

147 N8A0006 14| Each  |Module Type $605.00 $8,470.00 $2,000.00 $28,000.00 $1,800.00 $25,200.00 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 $2,000.00 $28,000.00 $2,500.00 $35,000.00 $2,150.00 $30,100.00 $5,000.00 $70,000.00 $1,213.71 $16,991.94 $2,500.00 $35,000.00

148 8BOIMPT 13,100.00 L.F. Furnishing Concrete Barrier $10.00 $131,000.00 $35.00 $458,500.00 $34.00 $445,400.00 $38.00 $497,800.00 $61.50 $805,650.00 $20.00 $262,000.00 $23.00 $301,300.00 $41.00 $537,100.00 $120.00|  $1,572,000.00 $21.51 $281,781.00 $35.00 $458,500.00
Placing and Removing

149 8B10MPT 46,606.00 L.F. Concrete Barrier $11.00 $512,666.00 $11.00 $512,666.00 $5.00 $233,030.00 $4.00 $186,424.00 $3.20 $149,139.20 $12.00 $559,272.00 $8.00 $372,848.00 $3.30 $153,799.80 $13.00 $605,878.00 $7.49 $349,078.94 $29.00|  $1,351,574.00

150 8B15MPT 2,600.00( M.H. [Traffic Protection Patrol $90.00 $234,000.00 $70.00 $182,000.00 $20.00 $52,000.00 $25.00 $65,000.00 $10.00 $26,000.00 $65.00 $169,000.00 $60.00 $156,000.00 $87.00 $226,200.00 $100.00 $260,000.00 $0.01 $26.00 $50.00 $130,000.00
Maintenance and Protection

151 8B31IMPT 1 L.S. of Traffic $340,000.00 $340,000.00 $132,052.10 $132,052.10 $380,000.00 $380,000.00 $525,000.00 $525,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $874,000.00 $874,000.00 $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $139,946.89 $139,946.89 $529,944.02 $529,944.02 $150,000.00 $150,000.00
Riprap Stone Aprons, 12"

152 2G12A06 12 Ton Thick, D50=6" $85.00 $1,020.00 $50.00 $600.00 $100.00 $1,200.00 $100.00 $1,200.00 $40.00 $480.00 $75.00 $900.00 $130.00 $1,560.00 $100.00 $1,200.00 $100.00 $1,200.00 $104.76 $1,257.12 $150.00 $1,800.00
Riprap Stone Aprons, 18"

153 2G00005 20 Ton Thick, (D50=9") $85.00 $1,700.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $40.00 $800.00 $75.00 $1,500.00 $90.00 $1,800.00 $92.00 $1,840.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $105.01 $2,100.20 $150.00 $3,000.00
Riprap Stone Aprons, 24"

154 2G12A08 26 Ton Thick (D50=12") $85.00 $2,210.00 $50.00 $1,300.00 $100.00 $2,600.00 $100.00 $2,600.00 $40.00 $1,040.00 $75.00 $1,950.00 $90.00 $2,340.00 $110.00 $2,860.00 $100.00 $2,600.00 $105.23 $2,735.98 $150.00 $3,900.00
Riprap Stone Aprons, 36"

155 2G00028 20 Ton Thick, D50=18" $85.00 $1,700.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $40.00 $800.00 $75.00 $1,500.00 $90.00 $1,800.00 $92.00 $1,840.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $105.44 $2,108.80 $150.00 $3,000.00

TOTAL OF ABOVE ITEMS $15,204,799.60 $14,397,000.00 $15,246,064.56 $15,980,362.24 $15,022,381.21 $15,904,000.00 $14,945,209.86 $15,850,436.15 $15,308,672.00 $14,617,247.00 $15,233,447.26
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