
Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT
1 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $433,457.00 $433,457.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $375,000.00 $375,000.00 $580,000.00 $580,000.00 
2 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $10,700.00 $10,700.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $5,558.00 $5,558.00 $1.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

3 1HFP005 1 L.S.

Fuel Price Adjustment 
(This is a NO BID, Lump 
Sum item for this contract. 
The Lump Sum price is 
$5,000. Enter a Unit Price 
of $5,000 as your bid item 
for this item.)

$5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

4 2C00010 250 S.Y.
Embankment 
Reconstruction $91.50 $22,875.00 $220.00 $55,000.00 $157.00 $39,250.00 $170.00 $42,500.00 $85.00 $21,250.00 

5 3B06SUP 3,820.00 Ton

Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 
12.5H 64 Surface Course $201.00 $767,820.00 $105.00 $401,100.00 $140.00 $534,800.00 $220.00 $840,400.00 $80.00 $305,600.00 

6 3B30HMA 65 Ton Temporary Surfacing $212.00 $13,780.00 $240.00 $15,600.00 $200.00 $13,000.00 $500.00 $32,500.00 $150.00 $9,750.00 

7 3B42ASB 14,300.00 S.Y. Membrane Waterproofing $16.00 $228,800.00 $40.00 $572,000.00 $20.50 $293,150.00 $15.00 $214,500.00 $8.00 $114,400.00 

8 3B45HPP 10 Ton
High Performance Cold 
Patch $235.50 $2,355.00 $200.00 $2,000.00 $478.00 $4,780.00 $90.00 $900.00 $80.00 $800.00 

9 3B52CSM 1,340.00 L.F. Crack Spanning Membrane $3.20 $4,288.00 $6.00 $8,040.00 $17.00 $22,780.00 $6.00 $8,040.00 $15.00 $20,100.00 

10 3B58APA 1 L.S.

Asphalt Price Adjustment 
(This is a NO-BID, Lump 
Sum item for this contract. 
The Lump Sum price is 
$5000. Enter a Unit Price 
of $5000 as your bid for 
this item.)

$5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 
11 3C03ASR 175 S.Y. Shoulder Reconstruction $103.00 $18,025.00 $200.00 $35,000.00 $192.00 $33,600.00 $300.00 $52,500.00 $140.00 $24,500.00 

12 3E20PMR 8,950.00 S.Y.
Pavement Removal, 
Variable Depth $27.12 $242,724.00 $40.00 $358,000.00 $16.00 $143,200.00 $30.00 $268,500.00 $2.00 $17,900.00 

13 3F01MRS 2,830.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $5.35 $15,140.50 $13.00 $36,790.00 $8.00 $22,640.00 $5.00 $14,150.00 $12.00 $33,960.00 

14 3L01SSJ 1,350.00 L.F.

Sawing and Sealing Joints 
in Asphalt Concrete 
Overlay $8.00 $10,800.00 $20.00 $27,000.00 $2.00 $2,700.00 $20.00 $27,000.00 $6.00 $8,100.00 
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15 4F00013 1 L.S.
Repair Sign Structure, 
Location No. 1 $1,391.00 $1,391.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,194.00 $3,194.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 

16 4F00014 1 L.S.
Repair Sign Structure, 
Location No. 2 $4,387.00 $4,387.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $7,800.00 $7,800.00 

17 4H68LEB 45 Each
Laminated Elastomeric 
Bearing, 9" X 14" $7,361.00 $331,245.00 $6,000.00 $270,000.00 $9,000.00 $405,000.00 $7,000.00 $315,000.00 $14,000.00 $630,000.00 

18 4H77LEB 16 Each
Laminated Elastomeric 
Bearing, 9" x 18" $6,639.00 $106,224.00 $6,000.00 $96,000.00 $9,200.00 $147,200.00 $7,000.00 $112,000.00 $14,000.00 $224,000.00 

19 4H78LEB 2 Each
Laminated Elastomeric 
Bearing, 8" x 8" $4,761.50 $9,523.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $8,095.00 $16,190.00 $7,000.00 $14,000.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 

20 4Q00001 380 S.Y. Catches $173.00 $65,740.00 $160.00 $60,800.00 $100.00 $38,000.00 $90.00 $34,200.00 $50.00 $19,000.00 

21 4Q00006 275 C.F.
Additional 1P Deck Joint 
Material $187.00 $51,425.00 $253.00 $69,575.00 $106.00 $29,150.00 $235.00 $64,625.00 $57.00 $15,675.00 

22 4Q00007 530 L.F.

Furnishing, Installation and 
Removal of Temporary 
Catch, Location No. 1 $106.00 $56,180.00 $300.00 $159,000.00 $90.00 $47,700.00 $400.00 $212,000.00 $150.00 $79,500.00 

23 4Q08BDR 14,300.00 S.Y.
Removal of Existing 
Surfacing $27.00 $386,100.00 $40.00 $572,000.00 $19.00 $271,700.00 $30.00 $429,000.00 $2.00 $28,600.00 

24 4Q20H01 25 L.F. Headblock Repair, Type 1 $423.00 $10,575.00 $300.00 $7,500.00 $224.00 $5,600.00 $240.00 $6,000.00 $250.00 $6,250.00 

25 4Q20H02 10 L.F. Headblock Repair, Type 2 $199.00 $1,990.00 $400.00 $4,000.00 $401.00 $4,010.00 $275.00 $2,750.00 $300.00 $3,000.00 
26 4Q30S05 6,820.00 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 5 $37.00 $252,340.00 $37.00 $252,340.00 $100.00 $682,000.00 $60.00 $409,200.00 $90.00 $613,800.00 
27 4Q30S5B 695 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 5B $43.00 $29,885.00 $44.00 $30,580.00 $100.00 $69,500.00 $60.00 $41,700.00 $90.00 $62,550.00 
28 4Q30S06 20 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 6 $744.00 $14,880.00 $500.00 $10,000.00 $414.00 $8,280.00 $175.00 $3,500.00 $450.00 $9,000.00 

29 4Q30SUD 50 S.F.
Repair Underdeck Spalls 
(Clean and Coat) $27.00 $1,350.00 $60.00 $3,000.00 $61.00 $3,050.00 $100.00 $5,000.00 $140.00 $7,000.00 

30 4Q50JC1 145 L.F.
Joint Reconstruction, Type 
C $8.50 $1,232.50 $20.00 $2,900.00 $33.00 $4,785.00 $30.00 $4,350.00 $30.00 $4,350.00 

31 4Q51J1P 1,810.00 L.F.
Joint Replacement, Type 
1P $135.00 $244,350.00 $120.00 $217,200.00 $141.00 $255,210.00 $175.00 $316,750.00 $101.00 $182,810.00 



Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT
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32 4Q60FAE 1 C.P.

Force Account for 
Emergency and Routine 
Bridge Repairs (This is a 
NO-BID, Lump Sum item 
for this contract. The Lump 
Sum price is $100,000. 
Enter a Unit Price of 
$100,000 as your bid for 
this item.) $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 

33 4R00013 530 L.F.
Parapet Reconstruction 
Location No. 1 $243.00 $128,790.00 $250.00 $132,500.00 $110.00 $58,300.00 $600.00 $318,000.00 $180.00 $95,400.00 

34 4R01BSR 285 S.F.
Sidewalk, Parapet and 
Curb Surface Repairs $86.00 $24,510.00 $130.00 $37,050.00 $78.00 $22,230.00 $100.00 $28,500.00 $110.00 $31,350.00 

35 4R01RSC 100 S.F. Vertical Spall Repair $95.00 $9,500.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $133.00 $13,300.00 $145.00 $14,500.00 $140.00 $14,000.00 

36 4R01SC1 270 S.F.
Repair Spalled Concrete, 
Type 1 - Abutment $151.00 $40,770.00 $260.00 $70,200.00 $200.00 $54,000.00 $275.00 $74,250.00 $275.00 $74,250.00 

37 4R01SC2 20 S.F.
Repair Spalled Concrete, 
Type 2 - Abutment $364.00 $7,280.00 $370.00 $7,400.00 $297.00 $5,940.00 $325.00 $6,500.00 $300.00 $6,000.00 

38 4R02SC1 1,200.00 S.F.
Repair Spalled Concrete, 
Type 1 - Pier $184.00 $220,800.00 $260.00 $312,000.00 $200.00 $240,000.00 $275.00 $330,000.00 $275.00 $330,000.00 

39 4R02SC2 20 S.F.
Repair Spalled Concrete, 
Type 2 - Pier $278.00 $5,560.00 $370.00 $7,400.00 $286.00 $5,720.00 $350.00 $7,000.00 $300.00 $6,000.00 

40 4R11RSS 2 Each
Repair of Structural Steel, 
Type A $4,280.00 $8,560.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,261.00 $6,522.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $16,000.00 

41 4R12RSS 1 Each
Repair of Structural Steel, 
Type B $3,531.00 $3,531.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 

42 4R13RSS 1 Each
Repair of Structural Steel, 
Type C $3,531.00 $3,531.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,221.00 $3,221.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 

43 4R14BSR 1,270.00 S.F.
Substructure 
Waterproofing $12.50 $15,875.00 $25.00 $31,750.00 $9.00 $11,430.00 $10.00 $12,700.00 $10.00 $12,700.00 

44 4R14RSS 1 Each
Repair Structural Steel, 
Type D $3,745.00 $3,745.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,476.00 $4,476.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 

45 4R15RSS 2 Each
Repair Structural Steel, 
Type E $3,558.00 $7,116.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $3,780.00 $7,560.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00 

46 4R25BSR 7,550.00 S.F.
Substructure Membrane 
Waterproofing $14.50 $109,475.00 $16.00 $120,800.00 $15.00 $113,250.00 $15.00 $113,250.00 $12.50 $94,375.00 

47 4R26RBG 7 Each Reconstruct Bearing Area $2,071.00 $14,497.00 $3,500.00 $24,500.00 $2,907.00 $20,349.00 $5,000.00 $35,000.00 $2,500.00 $17,500.00 
48 4R41TSS 7 Each Temporary Support $6,559.00 $45,913.00 $7,000.00 $49,000.00 $7,315.00 $51,205.00 $5,000.00 $35,000.00 $9,000.00 $63,000.00 
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49 4ZH03SPP 1 L.S.

Picking Up and Returning 
Authority's Steel Protection 
Plates $3,210.00 $3,210.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $6,999.00 $6,999.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,900.00 $1,900.00 

50 4ZI0001 100 S.F.

Repair Prestressed 
Concrete Stringer, Type 1 $358.00 $35,800.00 $500.00 $50,000.00 $285.00 $28,500.00 $300.00 $30,000.00 $200.00 $20,000.00 

51 4ZJ01SMF 1,100.00 S.F.
Remove and Reset Stone 
Masonry $91.00 $100,100.00 $180.00 $198,000.00 $84.00 $92,400.00 $160.00 $176,000.00 $60.00 $66,000.00 

52 4ZK01RSM 50 L.F. Repoint Stone Masonry $12.50 $625.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $53.00 $2,650.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 

53 4ZN0001 1,900.00 S.F.
Clean and Waterproof 
Concrete Parapets $8.00 $15,200.00 $11.00 $20,900.00 $4.00 $7,600.00 $3.00 $5,700.00 $5.00 $9,500.00 

54 5C60RIG 7 Each
Replace Existing Inlet 
Grate $319.00 $2,233.00 $600.00 $4,200.00 $679.00 $4,753.00 $500.00 $3,500.00 $500.00 $3,500.00 

55 5F01VCD 150 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type D $30.00 $4,500.00 $22.00 $3,300.00 $46.00 $6,900.00 $60.00 $9,000.00 $70.00 $10,500.00 

56 5J01PCA 4 Each
Parapet Connection, Type 
A $2,212.00 $8,848.00 $2,100.00 $8,400.00 $7,144.00 $28,576.00 $3,400.00 $13,600.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 

57 5J10RPA 3 Each
Repair Guide Rail Parapet 
Attachment $1,934.00 $5,802.00 $1,900.00 $5,700.00 $2,117.00 $6,351.00 $1,900.00 $5,700.00 $650.00 $1,950.00 

58 5J52BGR 150 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $21.50 $3,225.00 $21.00 $3,150.00 $37.00 $5,550.00 $20.00 $3,000.00 $54.00 $8,100.00 
59 5J53RRS 130 L.F. Rub Rail $7.00 $910.00 $7.00 $910.00 $16.00 $2,080.00 $12.00 $1,560.00 $15.00 $1,950.00 

60 5JGRP02 26 Each
Beam Guide Rail Post, 8' 
Long $88.00 $2,288.00 $90.00 $2,340.00 $70.00 $1,820.00 $60.00 $1,560.00 $100.00 $2,600.00 

61 5K00009 610 L.F.
Bridge Fencing, Curved 
Top, 75" High $102.00 $62,220.00 $100.00 $61,000.00 $35.00 $21,350.00 $105.00 $64,050.00 $65.00 $39,650.00 

62 5K72CLB 320 L.F.
Chain Link Fence, Type II, 
72" High $25.60 $8,192.00 $25.00 $8,000.00 $102.00 $32,640.00 $35.00 $11,200.00 $36.00 $11,520.00 

63 5N10RSW 285 S.F. Reconstruct Safetywalk $80.00 $22,800.00 $44.00 $12,540.00 $52.00 $14,820.00 $100.00 $28,500.00 $30.00 $8,550.00 

64 5P07REM 4,500.00 L.F.
Removal of Pavement 
Stripes (Hydromilling) $2.00 $9,000.00 $0.90 $4,050.00 $1.00 $4,500.00 $2.00 $9,000.00 $1.00 $4,500.00 

65 5P10TMP 14,170.00 L.F.
Temporary Pavement 
Striping $0.54 $7,651.80 $0.44 $6,234.80 $1.00 $14,170.00 $1.50 $21,255.00 $2.50 $35,425.00 

66 5P13TMP 5,940.00 L.F.
Removable Black Line 
Mask, 8" Wide $3.15 $18,711.00 $3.50 $20,790.00 $6.00 $35,640.00 $3.00 $17,820.00 $4.50 $26,730.00 

67 5P14TMP 2,700.00 L.F.
Removable Wet Weather 
Pavement Marking Tape $2.40 $6,480.00 $3.20 $8,640.00 $3.00 $8,100.00 $2.50 $6,750.00 $2.50 $6,750.00 

68 5P21LLS 11,710.00 L.F.
Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, 
thermoplastic $1.60 $18,736.00 $0.90 $10,539.00 $3.00 $35,130.00 $1.50 $17,565.00 $4.00 $46,840.00 

69 5Q01FOC 1 L.S.
Furnish Field Office, Type 
C $26,750.00 $26,750.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $22,233.00 $22,233.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 
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70 5Q02MFC 14 Month
Maintain Field Office, Type 
C $1,284.00 $17,976.00 $1,200.00 $16,800.00 $2,922.00 $40,908.00 $2,000.00 $28,000.00 $1,400.00 $19,600.00 

71 5ZD01RPM 70 Each Raised Pavement Markers $101.50 $7,105.00 $53.00 $3,710.00 $134.00 $9,380.00 $100.00 $7,000.00 $100.00 $7,000.00 

72 8A01MPT 1 L.S.
Furnishing Traffic Control 
Devices $107,000.00 $107,000.00 $180,000.00 $180,000.00 $151,364.00 $151,364.00 $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $860,000.00 $860,000.00 

73 8A05MPT 560 M.H. Police Traffic Directors $80.25 $44,940.00 $80.00 $44,800.00 $79.00 $44,240.00 $80.00 $44,800.00 $85.00 $47,600.00 

74 8A06MPT 4 Barrel
Repair Temporary Impact 
Attenuators $214.00 $856.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $225.00 $900.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 

75 8A07MPT 1 Each
Repair Truck Mounted 
Impact Attenuators $214.00 $214.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,132.00 $1,132.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 

76 8B17MPT 6 Each
Furnishing Truck with 
Mounted Attenuator $6,420.00 $38,520.00 $16,000.00 $96,000.00 $16,986.00 $101,916.00 $5,000.00 $30,000.00 $1,000.00 $6,000.00 

77 8B19MPT 100 M.H.

Furnishing Truck with 
Mounted Attenuator for 
Engineer's Use $64.00 $6,400.00 $70.00 $7,000.00 $62.00 $6,200.00 $80.00 $8,000.00 $90.00 $9,000.00 

78 8B23MPT 720 L.F. Modular Guidance System $16.00 $11,520.00 $10.00 $7,200.00 $26.00 $18,720.00 $20.00 $14,400.00 $1.00 $720.00 

79 8B26MPT 230 Each

Installation, Maintenance, 
and Removal of Lane 
Closing $2,461.00 $566,030.00 $2,700.00 $621,000.00 $1,583.00 $364,090.00 $500.00 $115,000.00 $1,900.00 $437,000.00 

80 8C21MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 1 $20,865.00 $20,865.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $29,565.00 $29,565.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00 

81 8C22MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 2 $24,262.00 $24,262.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $14,783.00 $14,783.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

82 8C23MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 3 $15,515.00 $15,515.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,020.00 $8,020.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

83 8C24MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 4 $29,265.00 $29,265.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $9,153.00 $9,153.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 

84 8C25MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 5 $18,270.00 $18,270.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $40,148.00 $40,148.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

85 8C26MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 6 $7,490.00 $7,490.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,178.00 $8,178.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 
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86 8C27MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 7 $16,318.00 $16,318.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,870.00 $8,870.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

87 8C28MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 8 $45,100.00 $45,100.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $27,867.00 $27,867.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 

88 8C29MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 9 $14,070.00 $14,070.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $16,198.00 $16,198.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

89 8C30MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 10 $10,486.00 $10,486.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $8,870.00 $8,870.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

90 8C31MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 11 $6,634.00 $6,634.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $11,826.00 $11,826.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

91 8C32MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and 
Protection of Traffic on 
Location No. 12 $11,021.00 $11,021.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,870.00 $8,870.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

92 8D30RRT 1 L.S.

Railroad Reimbursement 
Costs - New Jersey Transit 
(This is a NO-BID, Lump 
Sum item for this contract. 
The Lump Sum price is 
$30,000. Enter a Unit Price 
of $30,000 as your bid for 
this item.)

$30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 
93 N4Q0001 1 L.S. Concrete Repair Material $11,149.00 $11,149.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $13,671.00 $13,671.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

94 N8A0001 440 L.F.

Furnishing Precast 
Concrete Construction 
Barrier $16.00 $7,040.00 $60.00 $26,400.00 $15.00 $6,600.00 $60.00 $26,400.00 $20.00 $8,800.00 

95 N8A0002 880 L.F.

Placing and Removing 
Precast Concrete 
Construction Barrier $16.50 $14,520.00 $50.00 $44,000.00 $13.00 $11,440.00 $40.00 $35,200.00 $40.00 $35,200.00 

96 N8A0003 440 L.F.

Resetting Precast 
Concrete Construction 
Barrier $16.50 $7,260.00 $10.00 $4,400.00 $13.00 $5,720.00 $40.00 $17,600.00 $5.00 $2,200.00 

97 N8A0005 1 Each

Furnishing Temporary 
Impact Attenuator, 
Frangible Module Type A $6,313.00 $6,313.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $9,001.00 $9,001.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 



Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

Contract P100.108 - Bid Tabulation

Gardner M. Bishop Inc. H&G Contractors, INC.ITEMS Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc.
Railroad Construction Company, 

Inc.
Ferreira Construction Company, 

Inc.

98 N8A0006 5 Each

Placing and Removing 
Temporary Impact 
Attenuator, Frangible 
Module Type $963.00 $4,815.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $5,300.00 $26,500.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 

99 N8A0007 2 Each

Furnishing Temporary 
Impact Attenuator, 
Frangible Module Type B $3,424.00 $6,848.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,889.00 $9,778.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $3,200.00 $6,400.00 

$5,570,118.80 $6,367,028.80 $5,572,000.00 $6,941,427.00 $6,169,855.00 TOTAL OF ABOVE ITEMS
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