
Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

1 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $101,167.50 $101,167.50 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $60,200.00 $60,200.00 $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 

2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $380,000.00 $380,000.00 $380,000.00 $380,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 

3 1G03SCH 1 L.S.

Progress Schedule (This is 
a NO-BID, Lump Sum item 
for this contract. The Lump 
Sum price is $250,000. 
Enter a Unit Price of 
$250,000 as your bid for 
this item.) $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 

4 1HFP002 1 L.S.

Fuel Price Adjustment (This 
is a NO BID, Lump Sum 
item for this contract. The 
Lump Sum price is $2,000. 
Enter a Unit Price of $2,000 
as your bid item for this 
item.) $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 

5 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $265,000.00 $265,000.00 $31,200.00 $31,200.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 

6 2B02REX 2,430.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $21.21 $51,540.30 $100.00 $243,000.00 $15.00 $36,450.00 $20.00 $48,600.00 $58.00 $140,940.00 

7 2B15STS 1,420.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $16.17 $22,961.40 $4.00 $5,680.00 $7.00 $9,940.00 $20.00 $28,400.00 $14.00 $19,880.00 

8 2B20OVR 2,233.00 C.Y. Overload Removal $6.31 $14,090.23 $100.00 $223,300.00 $23.00 $51,359.00 $20.00 $44,660.00 $17.00 $37,961.00 

9 2C01EMB 4,366.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $9.95 $43,441.70 $100.00 $436,600.00 $7.00 $30,562.00 $10.00 $43,660.00 $46.00 $200,836.00 

10 2C02EMB 1,143.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $31.25 $35,718.75 $100.00 $114,300.00 $40.00 $45,720.00 $30.00 $34,290.00 $46.00 $52,578.00 

11 N2C0005 2 Each Settlement Platforms $2,753.65 $5,507.30 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,410.00 $2,820.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 

12 2E01FEX 1,770.00 C.Y. Foundataion Excavation $17.89 $31,665.30 $100.00 $177,000.00 $41.00 $72,570.00 $50.00 $88,500.00 $33.40 $59,118.00 

13 2F01TEX 30 C.Y.
Trench Excavation, Extra 
Depth $63.73 $1,911.90 $0.01 $0.30 $60.00 $1,800.00 $100.00 $3,000.00 $100.00 $3,000.00 

14 2G12A06 27 Ton
Riprap Stone Aprons, 12" 
Thick, D50=6" $217.83 $5,881.41 $100.00 $2,700.00 $140.00 $3,780.00 $100.00 $2,700.00 $114.00 $3,078.00 

15 2H00007 4,292.00 L.F.
Heavy Duty Silt Fence, 
Black $4.04 $17,339.68 $5.00 $21,460.00 $10.00 $42,920.00 $5.00 $21,460.00 $5.00 $21,460.00 

16 2H00016 16 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $193.53 $3,096.48 $100.00 $1,600.00 $320.00 $5,120.00 $600.00 $9,600.00 $150.00 $2,400.00 

17 2H45TEC 174 Ton Construction Driveway $93.60 $16,286.40 $25.00 $4,350.00 $37.00 $6,438.00 $80.00 $13,920.00 $46.00 $8,004.00 

18 N2H0006 5 Each Dewatering Basins $3,080.14 $15,400.70 $100.00 $500.00 $1,510.00 $7,550.00 $3,500.00 $17,500.00 $2,500.00 $12,500.00 

19 2K01TPF 775 L.F.
Temporary Orange Plastic 
Fence $3.91 $3,030.25 $3.00 $2,325.00 $9.00 $6,975.00 $5.00 $3,875.00 $5.00 $3,875.00 

20 2M00006 1,260.00 C.Y.
Excavation, Acid Producing 
Soils $17.35 $21,861.00 $0.01 $12.60 $56.00 $70,560.00 $13.00 $16,380.00 $36.00 $45,360.00 

21 2M00007 1,800.00 S.Y.
Acid-Producing Soils 
Remediation $3.46 $6,228.00 $2.00 $3,600.00 $13.00 $23,400.00 $9.00 $16,200.00 $52.00 $93,600.00 

22 2M00009 2 Each
Testing for Acid Producing 
Soil Deposits $367.50 $735.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $420.00 $840.00 $400.00 $800.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 

23 2M00011 24 Each
Testing of Soils for Waste 
Classification $934.50 $22,428.00 $100.00 $2,400.00 $600.00 $14,400.00 $900.00 $21,600.00 $1,000.00 $24,000.00 

24 3A05ABC 3,157.00 S.Y.
Aggregate Base Course, 5" 
Thick $9.47 $29,896.79 $5.00 $15,785.00 $8.00 $25,256.00 $7.00 $22,099.00 $10.00 $31,570.00 

25 3A06ABC 447 S.Y.
Aggregate Base Course, 6" 
Thick $14.86 $6,642.42 $8.00 $3,576.00 $10.00 $4,470.00 $7.00 $3,129.00 $14.00 $6,258.00 
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26 3B24SUP 624 Ton

Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 
19H 76 Intermediate Course $85.86 $53,576.64 $82.00 $51,168.00 $100.00 $62,400.00 $90.00 $56,160.00 $94.00 $58,656.00 

27 3B28SUP 442 Ton

Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 
12.5H 76 Surface Course 
(If and Where Directed) $101.76 $44,977.92 $88.00 $38,896.00 $110.00 $48,620.00 $90.00 $39,780.00 $96.00 $42,432.00 

28 3B26TAC 256 Gallon Tack Coat $4.20 $1,075.20 $3.00 $768.00 $0.10 $25.60 $3.00 $768.00 $1.00 $256.00 

29 3D08PCP 104 S.Y.

Portland Cement Concrete 
Pavement, 8" Thick $73.50 $7,644.00 $37.00 $3,848.00 $91.00 $9,464.00 $70.00 $7,280.00 $100.00 $10,400.00 

30 3E07PMR 239 S.Y.
Pavement Removal, 2" 
Depth $24.19 $5,781.41 $25.00 $5,975.00 $22.00 $5,258.00 $25.00 $5,975.00 $32.00 $7,648.00 

31 4A10RFS 164 Pound Reinforcement Steel $0.41 $67.24 $10.00 $1,640.00 $2.00 $328.00 $10.00 $1,640.00 $4.00 $656.00 

32 4O01TSP 4,800.00 S.F. Temporary Sheeting $52.87 $253,776.00 $0.01 $48.00 $100.00 $480,000.00 $55.00 $264,000.00 $42.00 $201,600.00 

33 5B05PVC 600 L.F. 5" PVC Pipe, Schedule 40 $19.75 $11,850.00 $25.00 $15,000.00 $12.00 $7,200.00 $40.00 $24,000.00 $28.00 $16,800.00 

34 5B12RC3 99 L.F.
12" Reinforced Concrete 
Pipe $52.71 $5,218.29 $45.00 $4,455.00 $39.00 $3,861.00 $42.00 $4,158.00 $87.00 $8,613.00 

35 5B15RC3 260 L.F.
15" Reinforced Concrete 
Pipe $50.06 $13,015.60 $65.00 $16,900.00 $39.00 $10,140.00 $85.00 $22,100.00 $98.00 $25,480.00 

36 5B18DIP 68 L.F. 18" Ductile Iron Pipe $100.19 $6,812.92 $95.00 $6,460.00 $120.00 $8,160.00 $105.00 $7,140.00 $140.00 $9,520.00 

37 5B18RC3 112 L.F.
18" Reinforced Concrete 
Pipe $49.17 $5,507.04 $45.00 $5,040.00 $61.00 $6,832.00 $55.00 $6,160.00 $114.00 $12,768.00 

38 5B24RC3 47 L.F.
24" Reinforced Concrete 
Pipe $103.14 $4,847.58 $60.00 $2,820.00 $76.00 $3,572.00 $68.00 $3,196.00 $122.00 $5,734.00 

39 5C01ND2 4 Each Inlet, Type D2 $2,419.45 $9,677.80 $3,500.00 $14,000.00 $3,300.00 $13,200.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 

40 5C01ND3 3 Each Inlet, Type D3 $4,054.82 $12,164.46 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $3,310.00 $9,930.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 

41 5C02ND3 1 Each Inlet, Type Double D3 $7,304.13 $7,304.13 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,140.00 $7,140.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 

42 5D01G06 48 S.Y. Concrete Gutter, 6" Thick $66.77 $3,204.96 $60.00 $2,880.00 $86.00 $4,128.00 $60.00 $2,880.00 $100.00 $4,800.00 

43 5D10INC 98 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $504.60 $49,450.80 $200.00 $19,600.00 $700.00 $68,600.00 $500.00 $49,000.00 $300.00 $29,400.00 

44 5F01VCA 72 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $15.75 $1,134.00 $15.00 $1,080.00 $27.00 $1,944.00 $15.00 $1,080.00 $32.00 $2,304.00 

45 5F01VCB 52 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type B $15.75 $819.00 $15.00 $780.00 $28.00 $1,456.00 $15.00 $780.00 $32.00 $1,664.00 

46 5F01VCD 187 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type D $15.75 $2,945.25 $15.00 $2,805.00 $26.00 $4,862.00 $15.00 $2,805.00 $32.00 $5,984.00 

47 5F20CWS 9 Each Concrete Wheel Stops $131.25 $1,181.25 $125.00 $1,125.00 $90.00 $810.00 $100.00 $900.00 $150.00 $1,350.00 

48 5G01GNC 133 L.F. Granite Curb $26.25 $3,491.25 $25.00 $3,325.00 $51.00 $6,783.00 $25.00 $3,325.00 $75.00 $9,975.00 

49 5I01SNP 19 S.F. Sign Panels $105.00 $1,995.00 $30.00 $570.00 $43.00 $817.00 $100.00 $1,900.00 $40.00 $760.00 

50 5I05SPP 78 L.F. U-channel Post $15.75 $1,228.50 $20.00 $1,560.00 $11.00 $858.00 $20.00 $1,560.00 $20.00 $1,560.00 

51 5I16REL 3 Each Relocate Sign Panels $525.00 $1,575.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $180.00 $540.00 $700.00 $2,100.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 

52 5K00013 375 L.F.
Chain Link Fence, Type II, 
96" High $36.75 $13,781.25 $35.00 $13,125.00 $42.00 $15,750.00 $40.00 $15,000.00 $70.00 $26,250.00 

53 5K00014 1 L.F.
Vehicular Gate, Type __, 
96" High, 12" Wide $1,260.00 $1,260.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,440.00 $1,440.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

54 5K00027 1 Each
Vehicular Gate, Type II, 96" 
High, 30' Wide $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,410.00 $2,410.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 

55 5K00030 4 Each
Vehicular Gate, Type II, 72" 
High, 12' Wide $1,050.00 $4,200.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,200.00 $4,800.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 

56 5K72CLB 764 L.F.
Chain Link Fence, Type II, 
72" High $25.20 $19,252.80 $24.00 $18,336.00 $29.00 $22,156.00 $26.00 $19,864.00 $32.00 $24,448.00 
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57 5N04PCS 347 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $54.98 $19,078.06 $30.00 $10,410.00 $68.00 $23,596.00 $50.00 $17,350.00 $70.00 $24,290.00 

58 5P00008 1,158.00 L.F.
Pavement Striping, White, 
4" Wide $0.84 $972.72 $1.00 $1,158.00 $1.00 $1,158.00 $1.00 $1,158.00 $1.00 $1,158.00 

59 5P10REM 750 L.F. Striping Removal $1.16 $870.00 $1.00 $750.00 $1.00 $750.00 $1.00 $750.00 $2.00 $1,500.00 

60 5P31LLM 100 L.F.

Traffic Markings, Lines, 
Long - Life, Thermoplastic $0.84 $84.00 $1.00 $100.00 $12.00 $1,200.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $100.00 

61 5P33LLM 220 S.F.

Traffic Markings, Symbols, 
Long - Life, Thermoplastic $7.14 $1,570.80 $7.00 $1,540.00 $6.00 $1,320.00 $5.00 $1,100.00 $10.00 $2,200.00 

62 5V01PIT 10 Each Test Pits $817.75 $8,177.50 $400.00 $4,000.00 $620.00 $6,200.00 $1,100.00 $11,000.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 

63 5ZC01LTF 1,327.00 C.Y. Lightweight Fill $33.49 $44,441.23 $100.00 $132,700.00 $73.00 $96,871.00 $100.00 $132,700.00 $90.00 $119,430.00 

64 5ZL01FHA 1 Each Fire Hydrant Assemblies $9,674.96 $9,674.96 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,600.00 $4,600.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 

65 5ZL0044 549 L.F.
8" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer 
Pipe $81.26 $44,611.74 $65.00 $35,685.00 $76.00 $41,724.00 $112.00 $61,488.00 $75.00 $41,175.00 

66 5ZL0045 380 L.F. 30" Ductile Iron Sewer Pipe $454.20 $172,596.00 $180.00 $68,400.00 $560.00 $212,800.00 $1,882.00 $715,160.00 $255.00 $96,900.00 

67 5ZL0047 1 L.S.
Bypass Connection 
Chamber, 12" Pipe $15,345.30 $15,345.30 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $17,800.00 $17,800.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

68 5ZL0048 1 L.S.
Pump Station No. 7 Utility 
Building $1,227,586.17 $1,227,586.17 $1,360,000.00 $1,360,000.00 $1,776,200.00 $1,776,200.00 $1,850,000.00 $1,850,000.00 $2,800,000.00 $2,800,000.00 

69 5ZL0049 1 L.S.
Pump Station No. 9 Utility 
Building $164,974.27 $164,974.27 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $223,100.00 $223,100.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 

70 5ZL0061 1,450.00 L.F.
8" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, 
Class 52 $118.34 $171,593.00 $50.00 $72,500.00 $92.00 $133,400.00 $170.00 $246,500.00 $75.00 $108,750.00 

71 5ZL0062 560 L.F.
2" Copper Water Pipe, Type 
K $65.87 $36,887.20 $25.00 $14,000.00 $29.00 $16,240.00 $66.00 $36,960.00 $40.00 $22,400.00 

72 5ZL0078 4 Each Manhole, Sanitary Sewer $4,640.90 $18,563.60 $6,000.00 $24,000.00 $3,410.00 $13,640.00 $4,500.00 $18,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 

73 5ZL0079 50 L.F.
4" Ductile Iron Sewer Force 
Main Pipe $214.68 $10,734.00 $85.00 $4,250.00 $91.00 $4,550.00 $90.00 $4,500.00 $58.00 $2,900.00 

74 5ZL0080 1,820.00 L.F.
12" Ductile Iron Sewer 
Force Main Pipe $109.52 $199,326.40 $65.00 $118,300.00 $77.00 $140,140.00 $142.00 $258,440.00 $86.00 $156,520.00 

75 5ZL0089 5 Each
Manhole, Sanitary Sewer, 6' 
Diameter $7,817.74 $39,088.70 $8,000.00 $40,000.00 $9,290.00 $46,450.00 $12,000.00 $60,000.00 $10,000.00 $50,000.00 

76 5ZL0094 1 L.S.
Utility Relocation, 
Telephone $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $17,200.00 $17,200.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 

77 5ZL0095 1 L.S. Utility Relocation, Electric $97,078.80 $97,078.80 $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $110,700.00 $110,700.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 

78 5ZL0097 1 L.S. Utility Relocation, Gas $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,100.00 $10,100.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 

79 5ZL0130 58 L.F.
4" Ductile Iron Pipe Sewer 
Main $259.62 $15,057.96 $17.00 $986.00 $73.00 $4,234.00 $68.00 $3,944.00 $58.00 $3,364.00 

80 5ZL0209 1 Each
Drop Manhole, Sanitary 
Sewer, 4' Diameter $8,567.44 $8,567.44 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $3,890.00 $3,890.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

81 5ZL0211 1 L.S. Relocated Deicing Station $11,445.05 $11,445.05 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,500.00 $15,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

82 5ZO0010 1 L.S.

Lead and Asbestos Survey, 
Report and Monitoring $7,613.13 $7,613.13 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,790.00 $8,790.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 

83 5ZO0012 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (1) $24,374.86 $24,374.86 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,400.00 $30,400.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 

84 5ZO0013 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (2) $7,394.12 $7,394.12 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $16,900.00 $16,900.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 
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85 5ZO0014 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (3) $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $125,600.00 $125,600.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 

86 5ZO0125 1 L.S.

Removal of Asbestos (This 
is a NO-BID, Lump Sum 
item for this contract. The 
Lump Sum price is $75,000. 
Enter a Unit Price of 
$75,000 as your bid for this 
item.) $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 

87 5ZO0018 1,100.00 Ton
Off-Site Disposal of ID-27 
Waste $48.15 $52,965.00 $35.00 $38,500.00 $40.00 $44,000.00 $33.00 $36,300.00 $42.00 $46,200.00 

88 5ZO0019 1 L.S.
Environmental Health and 
Safety Plans $7,875.00 $7,875.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,020.00 $6,020.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 

89 5ZO0027 11 Each Bollards $899.68 $9,896.48 $500.00 $5,500.00 $380.00 $4,180.00 $900.00 $9,900.00 $500.00 $5,500.00 

90 5ZO0114 66 Each Relocate Concrete Blocks $83.80 $5,530.80 $40.00 $2,640.00 $160.00 $10,560.00 $60.00 $3,960.00 $100.00 $6,600.00 

91 5ZO0123 1 L.S. Modify Handrail $3,771.62 $3,771.62 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,610.00 $3,610.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

92 6A00024 450 L.F.

2" Rigid Non-Metallic 
Conduit, PVC - Schedule 
40 $23.63 $10,633.50 $22.00 $9,900.00 $12.00 $5,400.00 $20.00 $9,000.00 $25.00 $11,250.00 

93 6A00051 4 Each

Concrete Foundations For 
Aluminum Light Assemblies $1,732.50 $6,930.00 $1,700.00 $6,800.00 $2,650.00 $10,600.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $1,700.00 $6,800.00 

94 6A08GWR 400 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $2.10 $840.00 $2.00 $800.00 $2.00 $800.00 $5.00 $2,000.00 $2.00 $800.00 

95 6A11MLC 750 L.F.
#10 A.W.G. Multiple 
Lighting Cable $4.20 $3,150.00 $4.00 $3,000.00 $2.00 $1,500.00 $5.00 $3,750.00 $5.00 $3,750.00 

96 6B00002 4 Each
Type A, Luminaire, 150W 
HPS $1,575.00 $6,300.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $870.00 $3,480.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 

97 6B00025 4 Each Lighting Standard, Type A $3,097.50 $12,390.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $870.00 $3,480.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,700.00 $10,800.00 

98 7C01TOP 10,450.00 S.Y. Topsoil $1.47 $15,361.50 $10.00 $104,500.00 $2.00 $20,900.00 $2.20 $22,990.00 $1.50 $15,675.00 

99 7D01SED 6,450.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $0.79 $5,095.50 $0.75 $4,837.50 $1.00 $6,450.00 $1.00 $6,450.00 $1.00 $6,450.00 

100 7D03SED 4,000.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $0.79 $3,160.00 $0.75 $3,000.00 $2.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00 

101 7D17SED 7,885.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type W $0.79 $6,229.15 $0.75 $5,913.75 $1.00 $7,885.00 $1.00 $7,885.00 $1.00 $7,885.00 

102 7D30WAT 22 M.G. Watering $157.50 $3,465.00 $150.00 $3,300.00 $360.00 $7,920.00 $150.00 $3,300.00 $200.00 $4,400.00 

103 N7E0010 5 Each
Planting, Bayberry (Myrica 
Pensylvanica) $47.25 $236.25 $50.00 $250.00 $78.00 $390.00 $50.00 $250.00 $55.00 $275.00 

104 N7E0021 1 Each

Planting, Shadbush 
Serviceberry (Amelanchier 
Canadensis) $68.25 $68.25 $75.00 $75.00 $120.00 $120.00 $70.00 $70.00 $225.00 $225.00 

105 N7E0042 6 Each
Planting, Red Maple (Acer 
Rubrum) $262.50 $1,575.00 $250.00 $1,500.00 $350.00 $2,100.00 $250.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $3,000.00 

106 N7E0045 72 Each
Planting, Inkberry (Ilex 
Glabra) $42.00 $3,024.00 $50.00 $3,600.00 $76.00 $5,472.00 $40.00 $2,880.00 $75.00 $5,400.00 

107 N7E0065 44 Each
Planting, Eastern White 
Pine (Pinus Strobus) $173.25 $7,623.00 $165.00 $7,260.00 $290.00 $12,760.00 $170.00 $7,480.00 $250.00 $11,000.00 

108 N7E0066 2 Each

Planting, Greenspire 
Littleleaf Linden (Tilia 
Cordata Greenspire) $262.50 $525.00 $250.00 $500.00 $380.00 $760.00 $250.00 $500.00 $455.00 $910.00 

109 N7E0067 1 Each
Planting, Hackleberry 
(Celtis Occidentiis) $262.50 $262.50 $250.00 $250.00 $350.00 $350.00 $250.00 $250.00 $455.00 $455.00 



Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

A.P. Construction, Inc.

Contract T869.120.602 - Bid Tabulation

Base Line Item Detail
Crisdel Group-Sordoni Construction, 

Joint Venture Agate Construction Co., Inc. J. Fletcher Creamer and Son, Inc. Railroad Construction Company, Inc.

110 N7E0068 2 Each
Planting, Okame Cherry 
(Prumus "Okame") $220.50 $441.00 $200.00 $400.00 $300.00 $600.00 $210.00 $420.00 $375.00 $750.00 

111 N7E0069 4 Each

Planting, Compact Pjm 
Rhododendron 
(Rhododendrom Pjm 
Compactum) $47.25 $189.00 $50.00 $200.00 $94.00 $376.00 $50.00 $200.00 $87.00 $348.00 

112 N7E0070 17 Each

Planting, Little Princess 
Spiraea (Spiraea "Little 
Princess") $42.00 $714.00 $50.00 $850.00 $72.00 $1,224.00 $40.00 $680.00 $46.00 $782.00 

113 7F02SSM 380 S.Y.
Permanent Soil Stabilization 
Matting $4.20 $1,596.00 $4.00 $1,520.00 $8.00 $3,040.00 $4.00 $1,520.00 $7.00 $2,660.00 

114 7J01BLW 150 S.F. Block Wall $102.54 $15,381.00 $40.00 $6,000.00 $60.00 $9,000.00 $60.00 $9,000.00 $46.00 $6,900.00 

115 7N00007 1 Each Relocate Flag Pole $5,844.35 $5,844.35 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,950.00 $2,950.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

116 8A00025 1 L.S.

Uniform Traffic Directors, 
(This is a NO-BID, Lump 
Sum item for this contract. 
The Lump Sum price is 
$25,000. Enter a Unit Price 
of $25,000 as your bid for 
this item.) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 

117 8C21MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and Protection 
of Traffic on Location No. 1 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $6,320.00 $6,320.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 

118 8C22MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and Protection 
of Traffic on Location No. 2 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 

119 8C23MLR 1 L.S.

Maintenance and Protection 
of Traffic on Location No. 3 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,210.00 $2,210.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

120 9A01UBW 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work $1,175,000.00 $1,175,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $1,873,500.00 $1,873,500.00 $1,800,000.00 $1,800,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00 

121 9A03UBW 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work $105,000.00 $105,000.00 $135,000.00 $135,000.00 $180,800.00 $180,800.00 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $750,000.00 $750,000.00 

122 9A11UBW 1 L.S. Mechanical $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $90,300.00 $90,300.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $312,000.00 $312,000.00 

123 9A12UBW 1 L.S. Electrical $165,000.00 $165,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $356,200.00 $356,200.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $860,000.00 $860,000.00 

124 9A15UBW 1 L.S. Structural Steel $850,000.00 $850,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $22,900.00 $22,900.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $1,370,000.00 $1,370,000.00 

125 5K72TCL 880 L.F.
Temporary Chain Link 
Fence , 72" High $36.75 $32,340.00 $10.00 $8,800.00 $10.00 $8,800.00 $50.00 $44,000.00 $10.00 $8,800.00 

126 5K01TVG 4 Each
Temporary Vehicular Gate, 
72" High, 12' Wide $1,050.00 $4,200.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $600.00 $2,400.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 

$7,169,065.71 $7,742,469.15 $7,743,324.60 $8,888,259.00 $12,186,778.00 Base Total
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