
Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

1 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $78,000.00 $78,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $155,912.49 $155,912.49 

2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $711,000.00 $711,000.00 $821,000.00 $821,000.00 $900,000.00 $900,000.00 

3 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $0.01 $0.01 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $22,087.06 $22,087.06 

4 1HFP009 1 L.S.

Fuel Price Adjustment (This is 

a NO BID, Lump Sum item for 

this contract. The Lump Sum 

price is $9,000. Enter a Unit 

Price of $9,000 as your bid 

item for this item.)

$9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 

5 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $100,819.81 $100,819.81 

6 2B02REX 1,135.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $60.00 $68,100.00 $20.00 $22,700.00 $32.00 $36,320.00 $5.00 $5,675.00 $84.25 $95,623.75 

7 2B15STS 2,749.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $15.00 $41,235.00 $20.00 $54,980.00 $29.00 $79,721.00 $20.39 $56,052.11 $23.43 $64,409.07 

8 2C01EMB 2,104.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $21.00 $44,184.00 $38.00 $79,952.00 $49.00 $103,096.00 $36.86 $77,553.44 $36.14 $76,038.56 

9 2C02EMB 438 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $36.00 $15,768.00 $42.00 $18,396.00 $55.00 $24,090.00 $15.00 $6,570.00 $64.95 $28,448.10 

10 2G12A06 100 Ton
Riprap Stone Aprons, 12" 

Thick, D50=6"
$94.00 $9,400.00 $75.00 $7,500.00 $95.00 $9,500.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $74.04 $7,404.00 

11 2G12A08 802 Ton
Riprap Stone Aprons, 24" 

Thick (D50=12")
$95.00 $76,190.00 $50.00 $40,100.00 $95.00 $76,190.00 $45.00 $36,090.00 $75.09 $60,222.18 

12 2H00007 11,440.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $6.00 $68,640.00 $6.00 $68,640.00 $5.00 $57,200.00 $4.26 $48,734.40 $5.65 $64,636.00 

13 2H00016 110 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $139.00 $15,290.00 $100.00 $11,000.00 $100.00 $11,000.00 $122.75 $13,502.50 $160.53 $17,658.30 

14 2H25TEC 1,163.00 C.Y. Hay Bales $28.00 $32,564.00 $1.00 $1,163.00 $5.00 $5,815.00 $1.00 $1,163.00 $27.68 $32,191.84 

15 2K01TPF 5,130.00 L.F.
Temporary Orange Plastic 

Fence
$2.30 $11,799.00 $2.75 $14,107.50 $4.00 $20,520.00 $1.00 $5,130.00 $2.21 $11,337.30 

16 2M00008 1,338.00 Ton
Disposal of Acid Producing 

Soil
$39.00 $52,182.00 $40.00 $53,520.00 $10.00 $13,380.00 $1.00 $1,338.00 $37.09 $49,626.42 

17 3A07ABC 791 S.Y.
Aggregate Base Course, 6.5" 

Thick
$10.00 $7,910.00 $15.00 $11,865.00 $20.00 $15,820.00 $33.48 $26,482.68 $28.73 $22,725.43 

18 3B21SUP 346 Ton
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 

25H 64 Base Course
$131.00 $45,326.00 $125.00 $43,250.00 $135.00 $46,710.00 $50.00 $17,300.00 $254.06 $87,904.76 

19 3B24SUP 166 Ton
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 

19H 76 Intermediate Course
$150.00 $24,900.00 $150.00 $24,900.00 $145.00 $24,070.00 $50.00 $8,300.00 $451.51 $74,950.66 

20 3B25SUP 410 Ton
Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 

12.5H 76 Surface Course
$167.00 $68,470.00 $125.00 $51,250.00 $155.00 $63,550.00 $50.00 $20,500.00 $225.63 $92,508.30 

21 3B26TAC 140 Gallon Tack Coat $5.00 $700.00 $1.00 $140.00 $1.00 $140.00 $5.00 $700.00 $5.54 $775.60 

22 3B55APA 1 L.S.

Asphalt Price Adjustment 

(This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum 

item for this contract. The 

Lump Sum price is $4500. 

Enter a Unit Price of $4500 as 

your bid for this item.)

$4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 

23 3C01BRS 7,267.00 S.Y.
Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches 

Thick
$37.00 $268,879.00 $22.00 $159,874.00 $22.00 $159,874.00 $22.00 $159,874.00 $24.36 $177,024.12 

24 3E20PMR 1,369.00 S.Y.
Pavement Removal, Variable 

Depth
$12.00 $16,428.00 $15.00 $20,535.00 $20.00 $27,380.00 $5.00 $6,845.00 $60.56 $82,906.64 

25 4A11RFS 186,230.00 Pound
Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy 

Coated
$1.48 $275,620.40 $1.60 $297,968.00 $2.00 $372,460.00 $2.00 $372,460.00 $1.58 $294,243.40 

26 4F00015 5 Each
Remove Existing Overhead 

Span Sign Structure
$17,000.00 $85,000.00 $10,000.00 $50,000.00 $12,000.00 $60,000.00 $13,870.20 $69,351.00 $10,704.05 $53,520.25 
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27 4F11CSP 645 C.Y.
Concrete in Structures, 

Pedestals
$780.00 $503,100.00 $900.00 $580,500.00 $1,300.00 $838,500.00 $1,345.54 $867,873.30 $990.95 $639,162.75 

28 4O02TSP 100 S.F.
Temporary Sheeting to 

Remain in Place
$100.00 $10,000.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $80.00 $8,000.00 $200.00 $20,000.00 $75.14 $7,514.00 

29 4P01PSS 1,505.00 S.F.
Permanent Steel Sheeting, 

Type PZ27
$142.00 $213,710.00 $250.00 $376,250.00 $125.00 $188,125.00 $1.00 $1,505.00 $181.03 $272,450.15 

30 4P15PCS 4,525.00 S.F. Protective Coating $3.50 $15,837.50 $7.00 $31,675.00 $22.00 $99,550.00 $1.00 $4,525.00 $2.91 $13,167.75 

31 4ZL0001 4,588.00 L.F. 30" Diameter Drilled Shaft $407.00 $1,867,316.00 $375.00 $1,720,500.00 $777.00 $3,564,876.00 $450.00 $2,064,600.00 $498.65 $2,287,806.20 

32 4ZNI600 18 Each

Install Overhead Span 

VMS/VSLS Support Structure 

60'-0" Span

$13,300.00 $239,400.00 $12,000.00 $216,000.00 $10,000.00 $180,000.00 $11,000.00 $198,000.00 $21,532.08 $387,577.44 

33 4ZNI650 6 Each

Install Overhead Span 

VMS/VSLS Support Structure 

65'-0" Span

$14,000.00 $84,000.00 $12,000.00 $72,000.00 $10,000.00 $60,000.00 $12,000.00 $72,000.00 $21,532.08 $129,192.48 

34 4ZNI700 7 Each

Install Overhead Span 

VMS/VSLS Support Structure 

70'-0" Span

$14,640.00 $102,480.00 $15,000.00 $105,000.00 $10,000.00 $70,000.00 $12,000.00 $84,000.00 $20,592.79 $144,149.53 

35 4ZNI750 3 Each

Install Overhead Span 

VMS/VSLS Support Structure 

75'-0" Span

$14,640.00 $43,920.00 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $11,000.00 $33,000.00 $20,328.58 $60,985.74 

36 5A08PUD 718 L.F. 8" Pipe Underdrain $31.00 $22,258.00 $20.00 $14,360.00 $45.00 $32,310.00 $5.00 $3,590.00 $24.19 $17,368.42 

37 5A24PBD 50 L.F. 24" Bleeder Drain $45.00 $2,250.00 $40.00 $2,000.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $33.62 $1,681.00 $60.12 $3,006.00 

38 5B00042 40 L.F.
29"x45" Reinforced Concrete 

Elliptical Pipe
$157.00 $6,280.00 $100.00 $4,000.00 $120.00 $4,800.00 $91.85 $3,674.00 $130.90 $5,236.00 

39 5B00057 2 Each
29" X 45" Reinforced Concrete 

Elliptical Flared End Sections
$2,800.00 $5,600.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $2,408.00 $4,816.00 $3,855.63 $7,711.26 

40 5B15DIP 126 L.F. 15" Ductile Iron Pipe $88.00 $11,088.00 $50.00 $6,300.00 $50.00 $6,300.00 $70.41 $8,871.66 $106.25 $13,387.50 

41 5B24RC3 330 L.F. 24" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $54.00 $17,820.00 $60.00 $19,800.00 $55.00 $18,150.00 $31.73 $10,470.90 $56.05 $18,496.50 

42 5B24RCE 16 Each
24" Reinforced Concrete 

Flared End Sections
$1,300.00 $20,800.00 $600.00 $9,600.00 $1,000.00 $16,000.00 $1,208.19 $19,331.04 $2,527.08 $40,433.28 

43 5C01D4G1 2 Each Inlet, Type D4,G1-X1 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $5,234.00 $10,468.00 $4,753.69 $9,507.38 

44 5D10INC 42 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $575.00 $24,150.00 $300.00 $12,600.00 $100.00 $4,200.00 $2,362.50 $99,225.00 $351.14 $14,747.88 

45 5E01ALC 368 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $24.00 $8,832.00 $30.00 $11,040.00 $9.00 $3,312.00 $15.01 $5,523.68 $14.40 $5,299.20 

46 5H00001 74 L.F.
Concrete Median Barrier, 

Protection, Variable Height
$225.00 $16,650.00 $300.00 $22,200.00 $125.00 $9,250.00 $220.00 $16,280.00 $249.10 $18,433.40 

47 5H00004 2 Each VMS Equipment Median $84,000.00 $168,000.00 $125,000.00 $250,000.00 $75,000.00 $150,000.00 $125,000.00 $250,000.00 $93,662.42 $187,324.84 

48 5H01CMB 874 L.F.
Concrete Median Barrier, 

Roadway
$230.00 $201,020.00 $285.00 $249,090.00 $110.00 $96,140.00 $225.00 $196,650.00 $339.13 $296,399.62 

49 5H03CMB 2,389.00 L.F.
Concrete Median Barrier, 

Protection
$195.00 $465,855.00 $285.00 $680,865.00 $110.00 $262,790.00 $190.00 $453,910.00 $215.89 $515,761.21 

50 5H04CMB 46 L.F.
Concrete Median Barrier, 

Roadway, Vaiable Height
$280.00 $12,880.00 $300.00 $13,800.00 $125.00 $5,750.00 $275.00 $12,650.00 $309.99 $14,259.54 

51 5H30CRR 2,179.00 L.F.
Concrete Median Barrier 

Removal, Roadway
$22.00 $47,938.00 $100.00 $217,900.00 $40.00 $87,160.00 $180.00 $392,220.00 $95.58 $208,268.82 

52 5J00007 5 Each
Telescoping Guide Rail End 

Terminal
$3,890.00 $19,450.00 $4,500.00 $22,500.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00 $3,500.00 $17,500.00 $4,306.70 $21,533.50 

53 5J00FGT 12 Each Flared Guide Rail Terminal $2,160.00 $25,920.00 $2,200.00 $26,400.00 $2,100.00 $25,200.00 $2,100.00 $25,200.00 $2,380.31 $28,563.72 

54 5J01PCA 4 Each Parapet Connection, Type A $1,640.00 $6,560.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $1,400.00 $5,600.00 $1,600.00 $6,400.00 $1,815.68 $7,262.72 

55 5J01PCB 4 Each Parapet Connection, Type B $300.00 $1,200.00 $200.00 $800.00 $100.00 $400.00 $300.00 $1,200.00 $332.14 $1,328.56 
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56 5J51TTS 9 Each Tangent Guide Rail Terminal $2,000.00 $18,000.00 $2,200.00 $19,800.00 $2,100.00 $18,900.00 $2,000.00 $18,000.00 $2,214.24 $19,928.16 

57 5J52ABG 19 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $640.00 $12,160.00 $600.00 $11,400.00 $600.00 $11,400.00 $640.00 $12,160.00 $708.56 $13,462.64 

58 5J52BGR 10,894.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $21.00 $228,774.00 $18.00 $196,092.00 $16.50 $179,751.00 $21.50 $234,221.00 $22.92 $249,690.48 

59 5K72CLB 465 L.F.
Chain Link Fence, Type II, 72" 

High
$26.00 $12,090.00 $17.00 $7,905.00 $25.00 $11,625.00 $26.00 $12,090.00 $42.07 $19,562.55 

60 5P10TMP 13,200.00 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $0.46 $6,072.00 $2.00 $26,400.00 $0.50 $6,600.00 $0.24 $3,168.00 $0.27 $3,564.00 

61 5P12REM 9,000.00 L.F.
Striping and Marking 

Removal, Hydromilling
$0.66 $5,940.00 $1.00 $9,000.00 $0.80 $7,200.00 $0.79 $7,110.00 $0.87 $7,830.00 

62 5P14TMP 1,760.00 L.F.
Removable Wet Weather 

Pavement Marking Tape
$2.75 $4,840.00 $4.00 $7,040.00 $3.00 $5,280.00 $2.35 $4,136.00 $2.60 $4,576.00 

63 5P21LLS 9,000.00 L.F.
Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, 

thermoplastic
$1.10 $9,900.00 $1.80 $16,200.00 $1.10 $9,900.00 $0.90 $8,100.00 $1.00 $9,000.00 

64 5Q01FAL 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $31,324.82 $31,324.82 

65 5Q02MFA 30 Month Maintain Field Office, Type A $1,400.00 $42,000.00 $1,700.00 $51,000.00 $1,000.00 $30,000.00 $1,700.00 $51,000.00 $2,471.29 $74,138.70 

66 5V01PIT 119 Each Test Pits $387.00 $46,053.00 $250.00 $29,750.00 $150.00 $17,850.00 $525.00 $62,475.00 $93.65 $11,144.35 

67 5X00PRA 9 Each

Placing and Removing 

Temporary Impact Attenuator, 

Quadguard

$20,000.00 $180,000.00 $1,500.00 $13,500.00 $2,500.00 $22,500.00 $2,000.00 $18,000.00 $2,961.55 $26,653.95 

68 5X02FTA 9 Each

FURNISHING TEMPORARY 

IMPACT ATTENUATOR, 

QUADGUARD, 9 BAYS, 24" 

WIDE

$20,000.00 $180,000.00 $25,000.00 $225,000.00 $10,000.00 $90,000.00 $9,000.00 $81,000.00 $8,884.64 $79,961.76 

69 5ZM01FAS 1 C.P.

Force Account For Snow 

Removal. (This is a NO-BID, 

Lump Sum item for this 

contract. The Lump Sum price 

is $52,000. Enter a Unit Price 

of $52,000 as your bid for this 

item.)

$52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 

70 5ZO0018 1,205.00 Ton
Off-Site Disposal of ID-27 

Waste
$50.00 $60,250.00 $60.00 $72,300.00 $100.00 $120,500.00 $25.00 $30,125.00 $70.34 $84,759.70 

71 5ZO0066 110 L.F. Transite Duct Removal $50.00 $5,500.00 $30.00 $3,300.00 $50.00 $5,500.00 $36.00 $3,960.00 $79.75 $8,772.50 

72 6A00043 336 L.F.
1.5" Rigid Metallic Conduit, 

Underground
$19.85 $6,669.60 $26.00 $8,736.00 $18.00 $6,048.00 $20.00 $6,720.00 $21.98 $7,385.28 

73 6A00077 18,552.00 L.F.
#2/0 A.W.G. Service Cable 

(600v)
$5.85 $108,529.20 $6.65 $123,370.80 $6.00 $111,312.00 $6.00 $111,312.00 $6.48 $120,216.96 

74 6A00080 23 Each Foundation, Type MC $1,880.00 $43,240.00 $2,000.00 $46,000.00 $1,000.00 $23,000.00 $2,800.00 $64,400.00 $2,081.39 $47,871.97 

75 6A00081 2 Each Foundation, Type MC-T $2,165.00 $4,330.00 $2,600.00 $5,200.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,200.00 $8,400.00 $2,398.03 $4,796.06 

76 6A01SVC 2,106.00 L.F.
#1/0 A.W.G. Service Cable 

(600V)
$5.35 $11,267.10 $6.00 $12,636.00 $6.00 $12,636.00 $5.25 $11,056.50 $5.92 $12,467.52 

77 6A02SVC 13,374.00 L.F.
#2 A.W.G. Service Cable 

(600v)
$3.80 $50,821.20 $5.00 $66,870.00 $4.00 $53,496.00 $3.40 $45,471.60 $4.23 $56,572.02 

78 6A03RMU 1,131.00 L.F.
3" Rigid Metallic Conduit, 

Underground
$31.40 $35,513.40 $36.50 $41,281.50 $25.00 $28,275.00 $33.00 $37,323.00 $34.76 $39,313.56 

79 6A03RNC 28,006.00 L.F.
3" Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, 

PVC-(Schedule 40)
$8.85 $247,853.10 $10.00 $280,060.00 $8.00 $224,048.00 $9.00 $252,054.00 $9.76 $273,338.56 

80 6A04GWR 19,476.00 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Ground Wire $2.40 $46,742.40 $3.00 $58,428.00 $2.50 $48,690.00 $2.85 $55,506.60 $2.63 $51,221.88 

81 6A06SVC 17,828.00 L.F.
#6 A.W.G. Service Cable 

(600V)
$2.55 $45,461.40 $3.00 $53,484.00 $3.00 $53,484.00 $2.50 $44,570.00 $2.82 $50,274.96 
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82 6A08GWR 8,919.00 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.65 $14,716.35 $1.85 $16,500.15 $2.00 $17,838.00 $1.80 $16,054.20 $1.79 $15,965.01 

83 6A10RLM 1 Each Lighting Manhole $6,385.00 $6,385.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,068.97 $7,068.97 

84 6A13RNC 70 L.F.
3" Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, 

PVC-(Schedule 80)
$85.00 $5,950.00 $100.00 $7,000.00 $20.00 $1,400.00 $25.00 $1,750.00 $94.11 $6,587.70 

85 6A21JF1 14 Each
Junction Box Foundation, 

Type 1
$2,420.00 $33,880.00 $2,750.00 $38,500.00 $3,000.00 $42,000.00 $2,800.00 $39,200.00 $2,679.23 $37,509.22 

86 6A24JBC 126 Each Junction Box, Type C $1,980.00 $249,480.00 $2,200.00 $277,200.00 $2,000.00 $252,000.00 $2,100.00 $264,600.00 $2,192.10 $276,204.60 

87 6A25JPS 36 Each Junction Box, Type PS $3,185.00 $114,660.00 $3,500.00 $126,000.00 $1,750.00 $63,000.00 $3,300.00 $118,800.00 $3,526.18 $126,942.48 

88 6A40SVC 19,263.00 L.F.
#4/0 A.W.G. Service Cable 

(600V)
$7.65 $147,361.95 $8.75 $168,551.25 $8.00 $154,104.00 $8.00 $154,104.00 $8.47 $163,157.61 

89 6B00063 25 Each Meter Cabinet, Type H $3,885.00 $97,125.00 $4,200.00 $105,000.00 $4,000.00 $100,000.00 $4,000.00 $100,000.00 $4,301.16 $107,529.00 

90 6B00078 1 Each Load Center Cabinet, Type S $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $13,839.01 $13,839.01 

91 6E04ESR 13 Each

Removal of Emergency Speed 

Warning and Speed Limit Sign 

System, Ground Mounted

$1,885.00 $24,505.00 $3,000.00 $39,000.00 $4,500.00 $58,500.00 $3,000.00 $39,000.00 $4,763.18 $61,921.34 

92 6E05ESR 28 Each

Removal Of Emergency 

Speed Warning And Speed 

Limit Sign System, Structure 

Mounted

$5,000.00 $140,000.00 $10,000.00 $280,000.00 $7,500.00 $210,000.00 $3,500.00 $98,000.00 $8,299.01 $232,372.28 

93 6H175SMI 1 L.S.

System Manufacturer 

Installation and Testing (This 

is a NO-BID, Lump Sum item 

for this contract. The Lump 

Sum price is $170,000. Enter 

a Unit Price of $170,000 as 

your bid for this item.)

$170,000.00 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 

94 6J00001 447 Each In-Pavement Wireless Sensor $1,650.00 $737,550.00 $1,200.00 $536,400.00 $800.00 $357,600.00 $1,100.00 $491,700.00 $1,156.94 $517,152.18 

95 6J00007 1 L.S. Spare Parts $92,875.00 $92,875.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $78,200.00 $78,200.00 $102,823.85 $102,823.85 

96 6J00017 34 Each
Variable Message Sign 

Installation
$6,320.00 $214,880.00 $8,500.00 $289,000.00 $10,000.00 $340,000.00 $7,000.00 $238,000.00 $9,111.16 $309,779.44 

97 6J00018 34 Each
Variable Speed Limit Sign 

Installation
$4,465.00 $151,810.00 $5,000.00 $170,000.00 $5,000.00 $170,000.00 $4,000.00 $136,000.00 $5,246.72 $178,388.48 

98 6J00020 34 Each
System Control Cabinet 

Installation
$2,180.00 $74,120.00 $2,500.00 $85,000.00 $2,300.00 $78,200.00 $2,500.00 $85,000.00 $2,413.52 $82,059.68 

99 6J00023 21 Each Transformer, Type 37.5kVA $2,680.00 $56,280.00 $3,000.00 $63,000.00 $3,000.00 $63,000.00 $4,000.00 $84,000.00 $2,967.08 $62,308.68 

100 6J00024 31 Each CCTV Camera, ITSS Mounted $11,650.00 $361,150.00 $14,000.00 $434,000.00 $12,000.00 $372,000.00 $12,000.00 $372,000.00 $12,897.96 $399,836.76 

101 6J00025 14 Each CCTV Camera, Pole Mounted $14,800.00 $207,200.00 $16,000.00 $224,000.00 $16,000.00 $224,000.00 $12,000.00 $168,000.00 $16,385.39 $229,395.46 

102 6J00032 58 Each
Wireless Access Point, ITSS 

Mounted
$8,830.00 $512,140.00 $10,000.00 $580,000.00 $9,000.00 $522,000.00 $10,000.00 $580,000.00 $9,775.88 $567,001.04 

103 6J00049 957 L.F.
4-Way Duct Bank, 4" HDPE 

Conduits Directional Drilled
$144.75 $138,525.75 $185.00 $177,045.00 $150.00 $143,550.00 $150.00 $143,550.00 $160.26 $153,368.82 

104 6J00065 7,362.00 L.F.
Multi-Mode Fiber Optic Cable, 

6-Fibers
$5.20 $38,282.40 $6.20 $45,644.40 $6.00 $44,172.00 $5.00 $36,810.00 $5.76 $42,405.12 

105 6J00067 14 Each
Lighting Standard, Type L-ITS-

40
$2,835.00 $39,690.00 $3,000.00 $42,000.00 $3,000.00 $42,000.00 $3,000.00 $42,000.00 $3,138.69 $43,941.66 

106 6J00068 31 Each
ITS Power Equipment, 

Pedestal Mounted
$4,885.00 $151,435.00 $6,000.00 $186,000.00 $5,000.00 $155,000.00 $6,000.00 $186,000.00 $5,408.29 $167,656.99 



Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

IEW Construction Group, IncBase Line Item Detail Agate Construction Co., Inc. Griffin Sign Inc. J. Fletcher Creamer and Son, Inc. PKF-Mark III, Inc.

107 6J00069 1 Each ITS Power Equipment Cabinet $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,196.29 $7,196.29 

108 6J00070 1 Each
ITS Equipment Platform, Type 

1
$11,975.00 $11,975.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $9,650.00 $9,650.00 $18,571.99 $18,571.99 

109 6J00071 31 Each
ITS Equipment Platform, Type 

2
$13,680.00 $424,080.00 $15,000.00 $465,000.00 $11,000.00 $341,000.00 $25,000.00 $775,000.00 $19,148.10 $593,591.10 

110 6J00074 3 Each

Removal Of Variable Message 

Sign System, Structure 

Mounted

$10,825.00 $32,475.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $6,000.00 $18,000.00 $9,810.23 $29,430.69 

111 6J00076 34 Each Radio Antenna Mount $940.00 $31,960.00 $1,200.00 $40,800.00 $1,000.00 $34,000.00 $1,800.00 $61,200.00 $1,040.69 $35,383.46 

112 6J00112 34 Each End Node Radio Installation $1,180.00 $40,120.00 $1,380.00 $46,920.00 $1,300.00 $44,200.00 $1,200.00 $40,800.00 $1,306.40 $44,417.60 

113 6J00142 34 Each Network Switch $5,470.00 $185,980.00 $6,500.00 $221,000.00 $6,000.00 $204,000.00 $6,500.00 $221,000.00 $6,055.95 $205,902.30 

114 6J00150 28 Each End Node Radio Relocation $1,785.00 $49,980.00 $1,850.00 $51,800.00 $1,900.00 $53,200.00 $1,400.00 $39,200.00 $1,977.32 $55,364.96 

115 6J00157 7 Each
Highway Advisory Radio Sign 

Control Cabinet
$3,885.00 $27,195.00 $4,200.00 $29,400.00 $4,000.00 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $196,000.00 $4,301.16 $30,108.12 

116 6J00160 1 L.S.
Electrical Work at Location 

No. 1
$23,860.00 $23,860.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $26,415.90 $26,415.90 

117 6J00161 1 L.S.
Electrical Work at Location 

No. 2
$7,920.00 $7,920.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $8,768.40 $8,768.40 

118 6J01HAR 4 Each HAR Sign Power Modification $6,485.00 $25,940.00 $9,000.00 $36,000.00 $7,000.00 $28,000.00 $5,100.00 $20,400.00 $7,179.68 $28,718.72 

119 7C01TOP 20,800.00 S.Y. Topsoil $2.00 $41,600.00 $5.00 $104,000.00 $3.00 $62,400.00 $2.69 $55,952.00 $1.99 $41,392.00 

120 7D01SED 16,021.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $0.70 $11,214.70 $1.00 $16,021.00 $1.00 $16,021.00 $1.01 $16,181.21 $0.75 $12,015.75 

121 7D08SED 4,788.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type L $0.80 $3,830.40 $1.00 $4,788.00 $1.00 $4,788.00 $1.20 $5,745.60 $0.86 $4,117.68 

122 7F01SSM 4,788.00 S.Y. Soil Stablization Matting $3.00 $14,364.00 $3.50 $16,758.00 $3.00 $14,364.00 $2.08 $9,959.04 $2.93 $14,028.84 

123 8A01MPT 1 L.S.
Furnishing Traffic Control 

Devices
$2,183,018.08 $2,183,018.08 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $990,000.00 $990,000.00 

124 8A29MPT 500 M.H. Flaggers $75.00 $37,500.00 $64.00 $32,000.00 $1.00 $500.00 $20.00 $10,000.00 $83.59 $41,795.00 

125 8A30MPT 10 Each
Furnishing Portable Variable 

Message Sign
$6,100.00 $61,000.00 $5,000.00 $50,000.00 $5,000.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $10.00 $561.91 $5,619.10 

126 8B15MPT 2,500.00 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol $45.00 $112,500.00 $1.00 $2,500.00 $10.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $2,500.00 $0.01 $25.00 

127 8B17MPT 7 Each
Furnishing Truck with Mounted 

Attenuator
$0.01 $0.07 $10,000.00 $70,000.00 $10,000.00 $70,000.00 $1.00 $7.00 $0.01 $0.07 

128 8B18MPT 22 Each
Furnishing Temporary Impact 

Attenuator
$0.01 $0.22 $4,000.00 $88,000.00 $3,000.00 $66,000.00 $3,000.00 $66,000.00 $4,163.94 $91,606.68 

129 8B20MPT 108 Each
Placing and Removing 

Temporary Impact Attenuator
$0.01 $1.08 $500.00 $54,000.00 $2,000.00 $216,000.00 $420.00 $45,360.00 $769.18 $83,071.44 

130 8B35MPT 1 L.S.
Installation, Maintenance, and 

Removal of Lane Closing
$490,000.00 $490,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $574,000.00 $574,000.00 $693,000.00 $693,000.00 $1,240,000.00 $1,240,000.00 

131 N8A0001 15,000.00 L.F.
Furnishing Precast Concrete 

Construction Barrier
$0.01 $150.00 $35.00 $525,000.00 $35.00 $525,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $25.51 $382,650.00 

132 N8A0002 59,300.00 L.F.

Placing and Removing 

Precast Concrete Construction 

Barrier

$0.01 $593.00 $15.00 $889,500.00 $17.00 $1,008,100.00 $30.00 $1,779,000.00 $20.98 $1,244,114.00 

$15,421,164.31 $16,184,101.60 $16,217,181.00 $16,422,877.46 $18,632,158.28 Base Total


