
Base Line Item Detail Joseph A. Natoli Construction Corp. Brockwell and Carrington Contractors Dobco Inc. Niram Inc APS Contracting, Inc. Patock Construction Company Hall Building Corporation alna construction corp Worth Construction Co., Inc. Epic Management, Inc. Intercontinental Construction ContracDelric Construction Co., Inc. Wallace Bros., Inc. Paul Otto Building Co. G & P Parlamas,Inc.

Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

1 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $18,500.00 $18,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $50,140.00 $50,140.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $68,840.00 $68,840.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $86,680.00 $86,680.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $31,500.00 $31,500.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00

2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $10,800.00 $10,800.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $27,250.00 $27,250.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $64,145.00 $64,145.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $286,680.00 $286,680.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $84,000.00 $84,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $395,000.00 $395,000.00

3 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $11,700.00 $11,700.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $34,880.00 $34,880.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $35,500.00 $35,500.00 $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $31,500.00 $31,500.00 $33,500.00 $33,500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

4 1HFP004 1 L.S.
Fuel Price Adjustment (This Is A NO-BID, Lump Sum Item 
For This Contract. The Lump Sum Price Is $4,000. Enter A 
Unit Price Of $4,000 As Your Bid Item For This Item. )

$4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

5 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $102,000.00 $102,000.00 $78,200.00 $78,200.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $38,150.00 $38,150.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $62,000.00 $62,000.00 $75,973.00 $75,973.00 $240,000.00 $240,000.00 $251,156.00 $251,156.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $104,000.00 $104,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00

6 2A06CAG 6 Each Sealing of Abandoned Well $800.00 $4,800.00 $865.00 $5,190.00 $1,500.00 $9,000.00 $1,308.00 $7,848.00 $1,000.00 $6,000.00 $600.00 $3,600.00 $2,400.00 $14,400.00 $800.00 $4,800.00 $840.00 $5,040.00 $2,000.00 $12,000.00 $1,500.00 $9,000.00 $500.00 $3,000.00 $4,725.00 $28,350.00 $850.00 $5,100.00 $2,000.00 $12,000.00

7 2A08CAG 4 Each Monitoring Well $8,750.00 $35,000.00 $5,400.00 $21,600.00 $4,500.00 $18,000.00 $5,450.00 $21,800.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $4,400.00 $17,600.00 $10,000.00 $40,000.00 $9,188.00 $36,752.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $7,350.00 $29,400.00 $2,300.00 $9,200.00 $6,000.00 $24,000.00

8 2B02REX 3,703.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $8.00 $29,624.00 $5.00 $18,515.00 $21.00 $77,763.00 $13.08 $48,435.24 $12.00 $44,436.00 $8.00 $29,624.00 $7.00 $25,921.00 $12.00 $44,436.00 $4.00 $14,812.00 $10.00 $37,030.00 $20.00 $74,060.00 $12.00 $44,436.00 $15.75 $58,322.25 $12.00 $44,436.00 $30.00 $111,090.00

9 2B15STS 1,973.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $5.00 $9,865.00 $5.00 $9,865.00 $5.00 $9,865.00 $5.45 $10,752.85 $2.00 $3,946.00 $5.00 $9,865.00 $6.00 $11,838.00 $4.50 $8,878.50 $4.00 $7,892.00 $8.00 $15,784.00 $14.00 $27,622.00 $4.50 $8,878.50 $3.95 $7,793.35 $5.00 $9,865.00 $20.00 $39,460.00

10 2C01EMB 16,762.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $18.00 $301,716.00 $12.00 $201,144.00 $17.50 $293,335.00 $15.26 $255,788.12 $12.00 $201,144.00 $18.00 $301,716.00 $12.00 $201,144.00 $14.00 $234,668.00 $12.00 $201,144.00 $22.00 $368,764.00 $31.00 $519,622.00 $14.00 $234,668.00 $6.30 $105,600.60 $15.00 $251,430.00 $40.00 $670,480.00

11 2C02EMB 1,778.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $30.00 $53,340.00 $30.50 $54,229.00 $27.50 $48,895.00 $15.26 $27,132.28 $14.00 $24,892.00 $30.00 $53,340.00 $30.00 $53,340.00 $14.00 $24,892.00 $30.00 $53,340.00 $32.00 $56,896.00 $35.00 $62,230.00 $14.00 $24,892.00 $14.70 $26,136.60 $15.00 $26,670.00 $45.00 $80,010.00

12 2E01CAL 548 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate Layer $45.00 $24,660.00 $66.00 $36,168.00 $45.00 $24,660.00 $49.05 $26,879.40 $10.00 $5,480.00 $45.00 $24,660.00 $45.00 $24,660.00 $14.00 $7,672.00 $64.00 $35,072.00 $70.00 $38,360.00 $75.00 $41,100.00 $14.00 $7,672.00 $36.75 $20,139.00 $15.00 $8,220.00 $60.00 $32,880.00

13 2E01FEX 4,971.00 C.Y. Foundataion Excavation $12.00 $59,652.00 $23.00 $114,333.00 $20.00 $99,420.00 $27.25 $135,459.75 $25.00 $124,275.00 $12.00 $59,652.00 $16.00 $79,536.00 $12.00 $59,652.00 $22.00 $109,362.00 $8.00 $39,768.00 $22.00 $109,362.00 $12.00 $59,652.00 $10.50 $52,195.50 $12.00 $59,652.00 $30.00 $149,130.00

14 2G10SEC 11 Ton Filter Blanket $6,500.00 $71,500.00 $38.00 $418.00 $200.00 $2,200.00 $81.75 $899.25 $150.00 $1,650.00 $100.00 $1,100.00 $120.00 $1,320.00 $75.00 $825.00 $37.00 $407.00 $100.00 $1,100.00 $100.00 $1,100.00 $75.00 $825.00 $115.50 $1,270.50 $75.00 $825.00 $100.00 $1,100.00

15 2G12A06 66 Ton Riprap Stone Aprons, 12" Thick, D50=6" $60.00 $3,960.00 $43.00 $2,838.00 $125.00 $8,250.00 $65.40 $4,316.40 $150.00 $9,900.00 $60.00 $3,960.00 $45.00 $2,970.00 $85.00 $5,610.00 $42.00 $2,772.00 $120.00 $7,920.00 $125.00 $8,250.00 $85.00 $5,610.00 $52.50 $3,465.00 $85.00 $5,610.00 $110.00 $7,260.00

16 2H00007 2,999.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $4.00 $11,996.00 $5.00 $14,995.00 $4.50 $13,495.50 $3.27 $9,806.73 $5.00 $14,995.00 $4.00 $11,996.00 $5.00 $14,995.00 $2.00 $5,998.00 $5.00 $14,995.00 $7.00 $20,993.00 $5.00 $14,995.00 $2.00 $5,998.00 $3.68 $11,036.32 $3.00 $8,997.00 $10.00 $29,990.00

17 2H25TEC 6 C.Y. Hay Bales $50.00 $300.00 $44.00 $264.00 $295.00 $1,770.00 $196.20 $1,177.20 $100.00 $600.00 $50.00 $300.00 $120.00 $720.00 $100.00 $600.00 $42.00 $252.00 $125.00 $750.00 $150.00 $900.00 $75.00 $450.00 $73.50 $441.00 $100.00 $600.00 $75.00 $450.00

18 2H40TEC 18 Each Inlet Filters $150.00 $2,700.00 $135.00 $2,430.00 $200.00 $3,600.00 $218.00 $3,924.00 $150.00 $2,700.00 $150.00 $2,700.00 $135.00 $2,430.00 $30.00 $540.00 $131.00 $2,358.00 $150.00 $2,700.00 $200.00 $3,600.00 $250.00 $4,500.00 $52.50 $945.00 $50.00 $900.00 $150.00 $2,700.00

19 2H45TEC 31 Ton Construction Driveway $40.00 $1,240.00 $44.00 $1,364.00 $150.00 $4,650.00 $49.05 $1,520.55 $150.00 $4,650.00 $40.00 $1,240.00 $35.00 $1,085.00 $75.00 $2,325.00 $42.00 $1,302.00 $65.00 $2,015.00 $100.00 $3,100.00 $75.00 $2,325.00 $73.50 $2,278.50 $75.00 $2,325.00 $75.00 $2,325.00

20 2H00021 1 Each Concrete Washout Facility $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,620.00 $1,620.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,725.00 $2,725.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $3,150.00 $3,150.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $5,250.00 $5,250.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00

21 3A05ABC 5,319.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 5" Thick $8.00 $42,552.00 $7.00 $37,233.00 $8.00 $42,552.00 $8.72 $46,381.68 $10.00 $53,190.00 $6.25 $33,243.75 $10.00 $53,190.00 $9.00 $47,871.00 $7.00 $37,233.00 $10.00 $53,190.00 $20.00 $106,380.00 $9.00 $47,871.00 $5.25 $27,924.75 $9.00 $47,871.00 $10.00 $53,190.00

22 3A08ABC 3,090.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8" Thick $12.00 $37,080.00 $8.00 $24,720.00 $10.50 $32,445.00 $10.90 $33,681.00 $10.00 $30,900.00 $7.50 $23,175.00 $12.00 $37,080.00 $12.00 $37,080.00 $8.00 $24,720.00 $14.00 $43,260.00 $30.00 $92,700.00 $12.00 $37,080.00 $8.40 $25,956.00 $12.00 $37,080.00 $16.00 $49,440.00

23 3B84APA 1 L.S.
Asphalt Price Adjustment. (This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum 
item for this contract. The Lump Sum price is $8,400. Enter 
a Unit Price of $8,400 as your bid for this item.)

$8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00

24 3B21SUP 1,144.00 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 25H 64 Base Course $100.00 $114,400.00 $98.00 $112,112.00 $90.00 $102,960.00 $99.19 $113,473.36 $85.00 $97,240.00 $90.00 $102,960.00 $94.00 $107,536.00 $91.00 $104,104.00 $95.00 $108,680.00 $96.00 $109,824.00 $110.00 $125,840.00 $91.00 $104,104.00 $105.00 $120,120.00 $100.00 $114,400.00 $120.00 $137,280.00

25 3B24SUP 1,260.00 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 19H 76 Intermediate Course $100.00 $126,000.00 $101.00 $127,260.00 $95.00 $119,700.00 $112.27 $141,460.20 $85.00 $107,100.00 $93.00 $117,180.00 $97.00 $122,220.00 $103.00 $129,780.00 $98.00 $123,480.00 $106.00 $133,560.00 $118.00 $148,680.00 $103.00 $129,780.00 $105.00 $132,300.00 $109.00 $137,340.00 $150.00 $189,000.00

26 3B25SUP 1,034.00 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5H 76 Surface Course $100.00 $103,400.00 $104.00 $107,536.00 $100.00 $103,400.00 $114.45 $118,341.30 $80.00 $82,720.00 $96.00 $99,264.00 $98.00 $101,332.00 $103.00 $106,502.00 $101.00 $104,434.00 $102.00 $105,468.00 $118.00 $122,012.00 $103.00 $106,502.00 $105.00 $108,570.00 $106.00 $109,604.00 $150.00 $155,100.00

27 3B26TAC 27 Gallon Tack Coat $50.00 $1,350.00 $11.00 $297.00 $35.00 $945.00 $21.80 $588.60 $10.00 $270.00 $10.00 $270.00 $10.00 $270.00 $20.00 $540.00 $11.00 $297.00 $12.00 $324.00 $14.00 $378.00 $20.00 $540.00 $52.50 $1,417.50 $20.00 $540.00 $15.00 $405.00

28 3E07PMR 340 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2" Depth $15.00 $5,100.00 $20.00 $6,800.00 $25.00 $8,500.00 $27.25 $9,265.00 $6.00 $2,040.00 $18.75 $6,375.00 $18.00 $6,120.00 $25.00 $8,500.00 $20.00 $6,800.00 $9.00 $3,060.00 $9.00 $3,060.00 $25.00 $8,500.00 $15.75 $5,355.00 $25.00 $8,500.00 $20.00 $6,800.00

29 4A10RFS 237 Pound Reinforcement Steel $1.60 $379.20 $3.00 $711.00 $6.50 $1,540.50 $1.09 $258.33 $10.00 $2,370.00 $3.00 $711.00 $3.00 $711.00 $1.60 $379.20 $3.00 $711.00 $8.00 $1,896.00 $2.50 $592.50 $2.00 $474.00 $3.15 $746.55 $2.00 $474.00 $5.00 $1,185.00

30 5A00002 2,060.00 L.F. 8-Inch Combination Underdrain $25.00 $51,500.00 $23.00 $47,380.00 $27.00 $55,620.00 $50.14 $103,288.40 $50.00 $103,000.00 $21.20 $43,672.00 $28.00 $57,680.00 $46.00 $94,760.00 $22.00 $45,320.00 $27.00 $55,620.00 $30.00 $61,800.00 $46.00 $94,760.00 $31.50 $64,890.00 $46.00 $94,760.00 $35.00 $72,100.00

31 5B00012 72 L.F. 8" Ductile Iron Pipe $56.00 $4,032.00 $70.00 $5,040.00 $108.00 $7,776.00 $68.67 $4,944.24 $85.00 $6,120.00 $64.25 $4,626.00 $65.00 $4,680.00 $63.00 $4,536.00 $67.00 $4,824.00 $71.00 $5,112.00 $75.00 $5,400.00 $63.00 $4,536.00 $78.75 $5,670.00 $63.00 $4,536.00 $120.00 $8,640.00

32 5B04PVC 219 L.F. 4" PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $35.00 $7,665.00 $30.00 $6,570.00 $24.00 $5,256.00 $23.98 $5,251.62 $65.00 $14,235.00 $35.00 $7,665.00 $35.00 $7,665.00 $22.00 $4,818.00 $28.00 $6,132.00 $38.00 $8,322.00 $40.00 $8,760.00 $22.00 $4,818.00 $21.00 $4,599.00 $25.00 $5,475.00 $45.00 $9,855.00

33 5B06PVC 472 L.F. 6" PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $40.00 $18,880.00 $35.00 $16,520.00 $35.00 $16,520.00 $39.24 $18,521.28 $65.00 $30,680.00 $40.00 $18,880.00 $36.00 $16,992.00 $36.00 $16,992.00 $34.00 $16,048.00 $43.00 $20,296.00 $48.00 $22,656.00 $36.00 $16,992.00 $26.25 $12,390.00 $40.00 $18,880.00 $50.00 $23,600.00

34 5B08PVC 658 L.F. 8" PVC, Schedule 80 $45.00 $29,610.00 $40.00 $26,320.00 $37.50 $24,675.00 $47.96 $31,557.68 $80.00 $52,640.00 $45.00 $29,610.00 $44.00 $28,952.00 $44.00 $28,952.00 $39.00 $25,662.00 $48.00 $31,584.00 $55.00 $36,190.00 $44.00 $28,952.00 $31.50 $20,727.00 $44.00 $28,952.00 $55.00 $36,190.00

35 5B15RC3 367 L.F. 15" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $3.00 $1,101.00 $50.00 $18,350.00 $37.00 $13,579.00 $43.60 $16,001.20 $45.00 $16,515.00 $37.00 $13,579.00 $42.00 $15,414.00 $38.00 $13,946.00 $49.00 $17,983.00 $45.00 $16,515.00 $50.00 $18,350.00 $38.00 $13,946.00 $52.50 $19,267.50 $38.00 $13,946.00 $60.00 $22,020.00

36 5B16DIP 41 L.F. 16" Ductile Iron Pipe $99.00 $4,059.00 $119.00 $4,879.00 $139.00 $5,699.00 $141.70 $5,809.70 $80.00 $3,280.00 $99.00 $4,059.00 $100.00 $4,100.00 $132.00 $5,412.00 $116.00 $4,756.00 $111.00 $4,551.00 $100.00 $4,100.00 $132.00 $5,412.00 $94.50 $3,874.50 $132.00 $5,412.00 $170.00 $6,970.00

37 5B18RC3 647 L.F. 18" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $52.00 $33,644.00 $53.00 $34,291.00 $46.00 $29,762.00 $49.05 $31,735.35 $65.00 $42,055.00 $52.00 $33,644.00 $48.00 $31,056.00 $46.00 $29,762.00 $51.00 $32,997.00 $46.00 $29,762.00 $55.00 $35,585.00 $46.00 $29,762.00 $54.60 $35,326.20 $46.00 $29,762.00 $70.00 $45,290.00

38 5B24RC3 248 L.F. 24" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $48.00 $11,904.00 $61.00 $15,128.00 $50.00 $12,400.00 $53.41 $13,245.68 $80.00 $19,840.00 $48.00 $11,904.00 $56.00 $13,888.00 $49.00 $12,152.00 $59.00 $14,632.00 $50.00 $12,400.00 $65.00 $16,120.00 $49.00 $12,152.00 $63.00 $15,624.00 $50.00 $12,400.00 $80.00 $19,840.00

39 5B30RC3 169 L.F. 30 " Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $60.00 $10,140.00 $76.00 $12,844.00 $90.00 $15,210.00 $98.10 $16,578.90 $85.00 $14,365.00 $60.00 $10,140.00 $74.00 $12,506.00 $90.00 $15,210.00 $74.00 $12,506.00 $67.00 $11,323.00 $80.00 $13,520.00 $90.00 $15,210.00 $78.75 $13,308.75 $90.00 $15,210.00 $110.00 $18,590.00

40 5C00004 1 Each Outlet Control Structure $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $6,105.00 $6,105.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $11,990.00 $11,990.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $5,934.00 $5,934.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $6,300.00 $6,300.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00

41 5C01ND1 3 Each Inlet, Type D1 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,140.00 $9,420.00 $2,950.00 $8,850.00 $3,270.00 $9,810.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,100.00 $9,300.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,050.00 $9,150.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,415.00 $7,245.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00

42 5C01ND3 15 Each Inlet, Type D3 $2,500.00 $37,500.00 $2,675.00 $40,125.00 $2,850.00 $42,750.00 $3,052.00 $45,780.00 $3,000.00 $45,000.00 $2,500.00 $37,500.00 $2,500.00 $37,500.00 $2,800.00 $42,000.00 $2,598.00 $38,970.00 $3,800.00 $57,000.00 $2,800.00 $42,000.00 $2,800.00 $42,000.00 $3,045.00 $45,675.00 $2,900.00 $43,500.00 $4,500.00 $67,500.00

43 5C20NP1 1 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,450.00 $3,450.00 $3,750.00 $3,750.00 $3,379.00 $3,379.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $3,363.00 $3,363.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $3,150.00 $3,150.00 $4,400.00 $4,400.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

44 5D10INC 21 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $500.00 $10,500.00 $300.00 $6,300.00 $350.00 $7,350.00 $545.00 $11,445.00 $400.00 $8,400.00 $400.00 $8,400.00 $500.00 $10,500.00 $500.00 $10,500.00 $210.00 $4,410.00 $400.00 $8,400.00 $450.00 $9,450.00 $500.00 $10,500.00 $630.00 $13,230.00 $500.00 $10,500.00 $750.00 $15,750.00

45 5D00005 1 L.S. Dumpster Enclosure and Concrete Pad $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $8,720.00 $8,720.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $11,800.00 $11,800.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $11,164.00 $11,164.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $12,600.00 $12,600.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

46 5F01VCA 85 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $22.00 $1,870.00 $19.00 $1,615.00 $35.00 $2,975.00 $19.62 $1,667.70 $22.00 $1,870.00 $22.00 $1,870.00 $45.00 $3,825.00 $22.00 $1,870.00 $19.00 $1,615.00 $25.00 $2,125.00 $25.00 $2,125.00 $22.00 $1,870.00 $23.10 $1,963.50 $11.00 $935.00 $40.00 $3,400.00

47 N5F0001 3,422.00 L.F. 9" X 18" Concrete Curb $15.00 $51,330.00 $17.00 $58,174.00 $17.50 $59,885.00 $19.62 $67,139.64 $20.00 $68,440.00 $14.50 $49,619.00 $16.00 $54,752.00 $15.00 $51,330.00 $17.00 $58,174.00 $20.00 $68,440.00 $23.00 $78,706.00 $15.00 $51,330.00 $18.90 $64,675.80 $15.00 $51,330.00 $35.00 $119,770.00

48 5I01SNP 145 S.F. Sign Panels $20.00 $2,900.00 $22.00 $3,190.00 $21.00 $3,045.00 $26.16 $3,793.20 $20.00 $2,900.00 $20.00 $2,900.00 $22.00 $3,190.00 $24.00 $3,480.00 $21.00 $3,045.00 $22.00 $3,190.00 $50.00 $7,250.00 $24.00 $3,480.00 $21.00 $3,045.00 $24.00 $3,480.00 $30.00 $4,350.00

49 N5I0002 397 L.F. Timber Posts $25.50 $10,123.50 $31.00 $12,307.00 $30.00 $11,910.00 $26.16 $10,385.52 $30.00 $11,910.00 $25.50 $10,123.50 $22.00 $8,734.00 $12.00 $4,764.00 $27.00 $10,719.00 $28.00 $11,116.00 $30.00 $11,910.00 $12.00 $4,764.00 $26.75 $10,619.75 $12.00 $4,764.00 $40.00 $15,880.00

50 5J52BGR 372 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $35.00 $13,020.00 $32.00 $11,904.00 $32.00 $11,904.00 $58.86 $21,895.92 $30.00 $11,160.00 $37.50 $13,950.00 $35.00 $13,020.00 $54.00 $20,088.00 $39.00 $14,508.00 $32.00 $11,904.00 $55.00 $20,460.00 $54.00 $20,088.00 $24.75 $9,207.00 $56.00 $20,832.00 $45.00 $16,740.00

51 5K00021 1,529.00 L.F. Temporary Fencing, 96" High $12.00 $18,348.00 $11.00 $16,819.00 $14.25 $21,788.25 $21.80 $33,332.20 $5.00 $7,645.00 $4.93 $7,537.97 $12.00 $18,348.00 $14.00 $21,406.00 $21.00 $32,109.00 $14.00 $21,406.00 $5.00 $7,645.00 $8.00 $12,232.00 $3.15 $4,816.35 $14.00 $21,406.00 $20.00 $30,580.00

52 5N04PCS 1,249.00 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $47.00 $58,703.00 $50.00 $62,450.00 $50.00 $62,450.00 $58.86 $73,516.14 $55.00 $68,695.00 $45.65 $57,016.85 $45.00 $56,205.00 $54.00 $67,446.00 $48.00 $59,952.00 $67.00 $83,683.00 $70.00 $87,430.00 $54.00 $67,446.00 $49.35 $61,638.15 $55.00 $68,695.00 $90.00 $112,410.00

53 5N07CHR 3 Each Concrete Handicap Ramp $400.00 $1,200.00 $2,440.00 $7,320.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $545.00 $1,635.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,260.00 $6,780.00 $450.00 $1,350.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $2,373.00 $7,119.00 $700.00 $2,100.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $420.00 $1,260.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00

54 5O01PAW 3 Each Delineator, Type PA-W $200.00 $600.00 $27.00 $81.00 $75.00 $225.00 $119.90 $359.70 $100.00 $300.00 $125.00 $375.00 $140.00 $420.00 $110.00 $330.00 $131.00 $393.00 $150.00 $450.00 $300.00 $900.00 $110.00 $330.00 $131.25 $393.75 $110.00 $330.00 $100.00 $300.00

55 5O01PAY 3 Each Delineator, Type PA-Y $200.00 $600.00 $27.00 $81.00 $75.00 $225.00 $119.90 $359.70 $100.00 $300.00 $125.00 $375.00 $140.00 $420.00 $110.00 $330.00 $131.00 $393.00 $150.00 $450.00 $300.00 $900.00 $110.00 $330.00 $131.25 $393.75 $110.00 $330.00 $100.00 $300.00

56 5P21LLS 4,213.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $1.00 $4,213.00 $1.00 $4,213.00 $1.00 $4,213.00 $1.31 $5,519.03 $2.00 $8,426.00 $0.82 $3,454.66 $1.00 $4,213.00 $1.20 $5,055.60 $1.00 $4,213.00 $1.00 $4,213.00 $2.00 $8,426.00 $1.20 $5,055.60 $0.86 $3,623.18 $2.00 $8,426.00 $1.00 $4,213.00

57 5P33LLM 586 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long - Life, Thermoplastic $6.00 $3,516.00 $6.00 $3,516.00 $6.00 $3,516.00 $19.62 $11,497.32 $22.00 $12,892.00 $5.50 $3,223.00 $6.50 $3,809.00 $18.00 $10,548.00 $6.00 $3,516.00 $6.00 $3,516.00 $10.00 $5,860.00 $18.00 $10,548.00 $5.78 $3,387.08 $18.00 $10,548.00 $8.00 $4,688.00

58 5Q01FOE 1 Unit Furnish Field Office, Type E $44,500.00 $44,500.00 $59,400.00 $59,400.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $32,700.00 $32,700.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $84,484.00 $84,484.00 $89,000.00 $89,000.00 $62,000.00 $62,000.00 $33,000.00 $33,000.00 $51,800.00 $51,800.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $112,000.00 $112,000.00 $48,500.00 $48,500.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

59 5Q02MFE 20 Month Maintain Field Office, Type E $500.00 $10,000.00 $2,400.00 $48,000.00 $200.00 $4,000.00 $545.00 $10,900.00 $5,000.00 $100,000.00 $1,141.00 $22,820.00 $3,444.00 $68,880.00 $200.00 $4,000.00 $7,665.00 $153,300.00 $4,465.00 $89,300.00 $600.00 $12,000.00 $2,000.00 $40,000.00 $80,800.00 $1,616,000.00 $5,000.00 $100,000.00 $3,500.00 $70,000.00

60 5V01PIT 10 Each Test Pits $400.00 $4,000.00 $270.00 $2,700.00 $400.00 $4,000.00 $272.50 $2,725.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $150.00 $1,500.00 $750.00 $7,500.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $263.00 $2,630.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $420.00 $4,200.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $500.00 $5,000.00

61 5ZD01RPM 10 Each Raised Pavement Markers $150.00 $1,500.00 $108.00 $1,080.00 $110.00 $1,100.00 $43.60 $436.00 $40.00 $400.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $125.00 $1,250.00 $40.00 $400.00 $105.00 $1,050.00 $115.00 $1,150.00 $300.00 $3,000.00 $40.00 $400.00 $105.00 $1,050.00 $110.00 $1,100.00 $150.00 $1,500.00

62 5ZL0069 1 Each Connection To Existing Sanitary Manhole $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,250.00 $3,250.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $763.00 $763.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,150.00 $3,150.00 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $945.00 $945.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

63 5B00046 149 L.F. 3" Ductile Iron Pipe $57.00 $8,493.00 $45.00 $6,705.00 $62.00 $9,238.00 $70.85 $10,556.65 $50.00 $7,450.00 $42.05 $6,265.45 $44.00 $6,556.00 $65.00 $9,685.00 $44.00 $6,556.00 $74.00 $11,026.00 $50.00 $7,450.00 $65.00 $9,685.00 $63.00 $9,387.00 $64.00 $9,536.00 $100.00 $14,900.00

64 5ZL01FHA 2 Each Fire Hydrant Assemblies $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $4,600.00 $9,200.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $4,360.00 $8,720.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,250.00 $8,500.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $5,900.00 $11,800.00 $4,463.00 $8,926.00 $5,400.00 $10,800.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,900.00 $11,800.00 $3,780.00 $7,560.00 $5,900.00 $11,800.00 $7,000.00 $14,000.00

65 5ZL04DIP 149 L.F. 4" Ductile Iron Water Pipe Class 52 Force Main $47.00 $7,003.00 $45.00 $6,705.00 $60.00 $8,940.00 $63.22 $9,419.78 $50.00 $7,450.00 $42.05 $6,265.45 $50.00 $7,450.00 $58.00 $8,642.00 $44.00 $6,556.00 $62.00 $9,238.00 $65.00 $9,685.00 $58.00 $8,642.00 $49.35 $7,353.15 $58.00 $8,642.00 $85.00 $12,665.00

66 5ZL06DP 1,629.00 L.F. 6" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 52 $60.00 $97,740.00 $49.00 $79,821.00 $62.50 $101,812.50 $70.85 $115,414.65 $55.00 $89,595.00 $45.05 $73,386.45 $52.00 $84,708.00 $54.00 $87,966.00 $47.00 $76,563.00 $65.00 $105,885.00 $75.00 $122,175.00 $54.00 $87,966.00 $63.00 $102,627.00 $54.00 $87,966.00 $90.00 $146,610.00

67 5ZL0259 1 Each Post Mounted Siamese Connection $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $2,750.00 $2,750.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,379.00 $3,379.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,540.00 $2,540.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $2,667.00 $2,667.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $13,650.00 $13,650.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

68 5ZL0260 1 Each Wet Tap and 6" Gate Valve $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $5,750.00 $5,750.00 $6,540.00 $6,540.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

69 5B05PVC 386 L.F. 5" PVC Pipe, Schedule 40 $23.00 $8,878.00 $43.00 $16,598.00 $23.00 $8,878.00 $26.16 $10,097.76 $30.00 $11,580.00 $23.00 $8,878.00 $36.00 $13,896.00 $8.50 $3,281.00 $8.00 $3,088.00 $22.00 $8,492.00 $30.00 $11,580.00 $23.00 $8,878.00 $8.40 $3,242.40 $30.00 $11,580.00 $40.00 $15,440.00

70 N6B0001 1,832.00 L.F. 1¼" HDPE Conduit With Pull Cords $3.38 $6,192.16 $18.00 $32,976.00 $6.98 $12,787.36 $6.54 $11,981.28 $10.00 $18,320.00 $13.00 $23,816.00 $16.00 $29,312.00 $4.00 $7,328.00 $6.00 $10,992.00 $16.00 $29,312.00 $15.00 $27,480.00 $14.50 $26,564.00 $3.15 $5,770.80 $16.00 $29,312.00 $5.00 $9,160.00

71 9A01UBW 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work $5,196,837.44 $5,196,837.44 $5,701,302.00 $5,701,302.00 $6,478,715.41 $6,478,715.41 $5,515,400.00 $5,515,400.00 $5,849,000.00 $5,849,000.00 $6,566,120.00 $6,566,120.00 $6,125,000.00 $6,125,000.00 $7,399,196.70 $7,399,196.70 $7,020,692.00 $7,020,692.00 $6,693,000.00 $6,693,000.00 $4,989,000.00 $4,989,000.00 $6,805,780.00 $6,805,780.00 $6,842,890.00 $6,842,890.00 $8,362,454.00 $8,362,454.00 $6,693,922.00 $6,693,922.00

72 9A03UBW 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work $466,600.00 $466,600.00 $337,000.00 $337,000.00 $275,000.00 $275,000.00 $349,890.00 $349,890.00 $326,000.00 $326,000.00 $311,711.00 $311,711.00 $485,000.00 $485,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $481,211.00 $481,211.00 $311,000.00 $311,000.00 $342,000.00 $342,000.00 $312,000.00 $312,000.00 $365,400.00 $365,400.00 $325,000.00 $325,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00

73 9A04UBW 1 L.S. Building Electric Work $1,600,000.00 $1,600,000.00 $1,820,000.00 $1,820,000.00 $1,600,000.00 $1,600,000.00 $1,789,780.00 $1,789,780.00 $1,850,000.00 $1,850,000.00 $1,779,000.00 $1,779,000.00 $1,630,000.00 $1,630,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $1,779,250.00 $1,779,250.00 $1,650,000.00 $1,650,000.00 $1,980,000.00 $1,980,000.00 $1,800,000.00 $1,800,000.00 $1,725,000.00 $1,725,000.00 $1,650,000.00 $1,650,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00

74 9A44UBW 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work $1,216,000.00 $1,216,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $1,621,920.00 $1,621,920.00 $1,319,000.00 $1,319,000.00 $1,190,000.00 $1,190,000.00 $1,230,000.00 $1,230,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,216,000.00 $1,216,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,107,680.00 $1,107,680.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,302,000.00 $1,302,000.00 $1,240,000.00 $1,240,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,300,000.00

75 9A45UBW 1 L.S. Building Structural Work $600,500.00 $600,500.00 $605,000.00 $605,000.00 $550,000.00 $550,000.00 $616,940.00 $616,940.00 $635,000.00 $635,000.00 $621,400.00 $621,400.00 $604,000.00 $604,000.00 $640,000.00 $640,000.00 $527,000.00 $527,000.00 $706,000.00 $706,000.00 $1,313,156.00 $1,313,156.00 $651,000.00 $651,000.00 $595,350.00 $595,350.00 $650,000.00 $650,000.00 $750,000.00 $750,000.00

76 9A01FAA 1 C.P.

Force Account for Building Architectural Work Allowances 
(This is a NO-BID, Cost-Plus item for this contract. The Cost-
Plus price is $110,000. Enter a Unit Price of $110,000 as 
your bid for this item.)

$110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00

77 9A01FAE 1 C.P.

Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances (This 
is a NO-BID, Cost-Plus item for this contract. The Cost-Plus 
price is $15,000. Enter a Unit Price of $15,000 as your bid 
for this item )

$15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

78 9A01FAM 1 C.P.

Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances 
(This is a NO-BID, Cost-Plus item for this contract. The Cost-
Plus price is $30,000. Enter a Unit Price of $30,000 as your 
bid for this item.)

$30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

79 9A01FAP 1 C.P.

Force Account for Building Plumbing Work Allowances (This 
is a NO-BID, Cost-Plus item for this contract. The Cost-Plus 
price is $40,000. Enter a Unit Price of $40,000 as your bid 
for this item )

$40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00

80 9A01FAS 1 C.P.

Force Account for Building Structural Work Allowances (This 
is a NO-BID, Cost-Plus item for this contract. The Cost-Plus 
price is $30,000. Enter a Unit Price of $30,000 as your bid 
for this item )

$30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

81 5ZL0261 1 L.S. Site Electrical & Communication Work $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $149,600.00 $149,600.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $98,100.00 $98,100.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $281,000.00 $281,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $407,307.00 $407,307.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $68,680.00 $68,680.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $115,500.00 $115,500.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00

82 5ZO01FAH 1 C.P.

Force Account for Hazardous Regulated Material Handling 
(This is a NO-BID, Cost-Plus item for this contract. The Cost-
Plus price is $50,000. Enter a Unit Price of $50,000 as your 
bid for this item.)

$50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

83 5ZO0042 1 L.S.
Removal of Asbestos (This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum item for 
this contract. The Lump Sum price is $25,000. Enter a Unit 
Price of $25,000 as your bid for item.)

$25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

84 5ZO0012 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (1) $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $68,000.00 $68,000.00 $48,900.00 $48,900.00 $94,830.00 $94,830.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $58,000.00 $58,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $48,900.00 $48,900.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $105,000.00 $105,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00

85 5ZO0021 4 Each Removal of Underground Storage Tanks $7,500.00 $30,000.00 $4,900.00 $19,600.00 $7,500.00 $30,000.00 $8,175.00 $32,700.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $7,500.00 $30,000.00 $4,778.00 $19,112.00 $5,017.00 $20,068.00 $20,000.00 $80,000.00 $10,000.00 $40,000.00 $7,500.00 $30,000.00 $9,975.00 $39,900.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00

86 5ZO0033 1 Each Removal of Aboveground Storage Tanks $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $6,322.00 $6,322.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,475.00 $2,475.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,362.00 $2,362.00 $2,480.00 $2,480.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,800.00 $5,800.00 $4,725.00 $4,725.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

87 5ZO0027 17 Each Bollards $600.00 $10,200.00 $375.00 $6,375.00 $475.00 $8,075.00 $654.00 $11,118.00 $1,000.00 $17,000.00 $440.00 $7,480.00 $450.00 $7,650.00 $420.00 $7,140.00 $368.00 $6,256.00 $1,100.00 $18,700.00 $600.00 $10,200.00 $475.00 $8,075.00 $630.00 $10,710.00 $475.00 $8,075.00 $600.00 $10,200.00

88 5ZO0137 2 Each Lighted Bollards $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $2,600.00 $5,200.00 $2,800.00 $5,600.00 $1,635.00 $3,270.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,700.00 $3,400.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $945.00 $1,890.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00

89 5N01HPD 1 L.S. Helipad $56,000.00 $56,000.00 $87,800.00 $87,800.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $88,290.00 $88,290.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $84,000.00 $84,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $54,280.00 $54,280.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $209,475.00 $209,475.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00

90 5ZO0138 1 L.S. Fuel Island $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $192,500.00 $192,500.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $327,000.00 $327,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $196,100.00 $196,100.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $187,000.00 $187,000.00 $196,499.00 $196,499.00 $215,000.00 $215,000.00 $196,680.00 $196,680.00 $550,000.00 $550,000.00 $209,475.00 $209,475.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00

91 5C00076 2 Each Ejector Manhole $125,000.00 $250,000.00 $135,000.00 $270,000.00 $116,500.00 $233,000.00 $98,100.00 $196,200.00 $100,000.00 $200,000.00 $125,000.00 $250,000.00 $120,000.00 $240,000.00 $110,000.00 $220,000.00 $144,585.00 $289,170.00 $165,000.00 $330,000.00 $175,000.00 $350,000.00 $110,000.00 $220,000.00 $131,250.00 $262,500.00 $120,000.00 $240,000.00 $225,000.00 $450,000.00

92 6A03RNC 2,200.00 L.F. 3" Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $8.00 $17,600.00 $27.00 $59,400.00 $36.50 $80,300.00 $10.90 $23,980.00 $12.00 $26,400.00 $10.00 $22,000.00 $22.00 $48,400.00 $16.00 $35,200.00 $5.00 $11,000.00 $15.00 $33,000.00 $30.00 $66,000.00 $14.50 $31,900.00 $10.50 $23,100.00 $16.00 $35,200.00 $10.00 $22,000.00

93 6A08GPC 4,950.00 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Power Cable $1.00 $4,950.00 $2.00 $9,900.00 $1.35 $6,682.50 $1.09 $5,395.50 $4.00 $19,800.00 $1.70 $8,415.00 $2.20 $10,890.00 $1.65 $8,167.50 $1.00 $4,950.00 $2.00 $9,900.00 $40.00 $198,000.00 $0.85 $4,207.50 $1.05 $5,197.50 $1.00 $4,950.00 $3.00 $14,850.00

94 6A08GWR 1,100.00 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.00 $1,100.00 $2.00 $2,200.00 $1.40 $1,540.00 $0.98 $1,078.00 $2.00 $2,200.00 $1.65 $1,815.00 $2.20 $2,420.00 $1.65 $1,815.00 $1.00 $1,100.00 $2.00 $2,200.00 $35.00 $38,500.00 $0.85 $935.00 $1.05 $1,155.00 $1.00 $1,100.00 $2.00 $2,200.00

95 6A21JF1 6 Each Junction Box Foundation, Type 1 $3,500.00 $21,000.00 $2,700.00 $16,200.00 $2,200.00 $13,200.00 $3,815.00 $22,890.00 $4,000.00 $24,000.00 $2,500.00 $15,000.00 $4,800.00 $28,800.00 $2,500.00 $15,000.00 $1,449.00 $8,694.00 $500.00 $3,000.00 $1,500.00 $9,000.00 $1,550.00 $9,300.00 $2,625.00 $15,750.00 $4,000.00 $24,000.00 $4,000.00 $24,000.00

96 6B00072 6 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-8-26 $4,121.00 $24,726.00 $2,500.00 $15,000.00 $2,900.00 $17,400.00 $5,341.00 $32,046.00 $4,500.00 $27,000.00 $690.00 $4,140.00 $5,500.00 $33,000.00 $690.00 $4,140.00 $2,286.00 $13,716.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $3,200.00 $19,200.00 $2,500.00 $15,000.00 $1,680.00 $10,080.00 $2,300.00 $13,800.00 $5,000.00 $30,000.00



Base Line Item Detail Joseph A. Natoli Construction Corp. Brockwell and Carrington Contractors Dobco Inc. Niram Inc APS Contracting, Inc. Patock Construction Company Hall Building Corporation alna construction corp Worth Construction Co., Inc. Epic Management, Inc. Intercontinental Construction ContracDelric Construction Co., Inc. Wallace Bros., Inc. Paul Otto Building Co. G & P Parlamas,Inc.

97 6B00138 1 Each Type LC-1 Luminaire $650.00 $650.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $1,900.00 $1,900.00 $708.50 $708.50 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $690.00 $690.00 $1,150.00 $1,150.00 $690.00 $690.00 $806.00 $806.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $700.00 $700.00 $2,760.00 $2,760.00 $595.50 $595.50 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

98 6B00139 5 Each Type LC-2 Luminaire $750.00 $3,750.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,900.00 $9,500.00 $817.50 $4,087.50 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $690.00 $3,450.00 $1,400.00 $7,000.00 $690.00 $3,450.00 $907.00 $4,535.00 $1,900.00 $9,500.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 $5,190.00 $25,950.00 $686.50 $3,432.50 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $3,500.00 $17,500.00

99 7B13TWE 1,832.00 S.F. Landscape Wall $35.50 $65,036.00 $44.50 $81,524.00 $40.00 $73,280.00 $54.50 $99,844.00 $22.00 $40,304.00 $26.00 $47,632.00 $38.00 $69,616.00 $26.00 $47,632.00 $43.00 $78,776.00 $39.00 $71,448.00 $42.00 $76,944.00 $26.00 $47,632.00 $36.75 $67,326.00 $30.00 $54,960.00 $50.00 $91,600.00

100 7C01TOP 14,573.00 S.Y. Topsoil $1.00 $14,573.00 $3.00 $43,719.00 $3.00 $43,719.00 $3.27 $47,653.71 $2.00 $29,146.00 $2.00 $29,146.00 $3.00 $43,719.00 $3.00 $43,719.00 $2.00 $29,146.00 $1.00 $14,573.00 $3.00 $43,719.00 $3.00 $43,719.00 $1.05 $15,301.65 $3.00 $43,719.00 $5.00 $72,865.00

101 7D03SED 14,573.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $1.26 $18,361.98 $2.00 $29,146.00 $1.26 $18,361.98 $1.42 $20,693.66 $1.00 $14,573.00 $1.20 $17,487.60 $1.50 $21,859.50 $2.00 $29,146.00 $1.00 $14,573.00 $1.00 $14,573.00 $4.00 $58,292.00 $2.00 $29,146.00 $0.89 $12,969.97 $2.00 $29,146.00 $3.00 $43,719.00

102 N7E0041 1 Each Planting, Red Oak (Quercus Rubra) $753.82 $753.82 $865.00 $865.00 $500.00 $500.00 $490.50 $490.50 $500.00 $500.00 $425.00 $425.00 $750.00 $750.00 $450.00 $450.00 $840.00 $840.00 $450.00 $450.00 $500.00 $500.00 $450.00 $450.00 $656.25 $656.25 $450.00 $450.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00

103 7E00065 2 Each Planting, Paperbark Maple (Acer Griseum) $467.56 $935.12 $405.00 $810.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $490.50 $981.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $425.00 $850.00 $550.00 $1,100.00 $450.00 $900.00 $394.00 $788.00 $450.00 $900.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $450.00 $900.00 $490.35 $980.70 $450.00 $900.00 $750.00 $1,500.00

104 N7E0055 37 Each Planting, Stella D'Oro Daylilly (Hemerocallis Stella D'Oro) $20.99 $776.63 $13.00 $481.00 $20.00 $740.00 $10.90 $403.30 $10.00 $370.00 $18.00 $666.00 $15.00 $555.00 $9.00 $333.00 $13.00 $481.00 $18.00 $666.00 $50.00 $1,850.00 $9.00 $333.00 $17.85 $660.45 $9.00 $333.00 $25.00 $925.00

105 N7E0057 220 Each Planting, King Alfred Daffodil (Narcissus) $4.77 $1,049.40 $2.25 $495.00 $6.00 $1,320.00 $5.45 $1,199.00 $3.00 $660.00 $4.75 $1,045.00 $3.00 $660.00 $2.00 $440.00 $2.00 $440.00 $5.00 $1,100.00 $40.00 $8,800.00 $2.00 $440.00 $4.52 $994.40 $2.00 $440.00 $10.00 $2,200.00

106 N7E0058 1,045.00 Each Planting, Japanese Pachysandra (Pachysandra Terminalis) $2.20 $2,299.00 $1.00 $1,045.00 $3.00 $3,135.00 $2.18 $2,278.10 $2.00 $2,090.00 $3.00 $3,135.00 $3.00 $3,135.00 $1.50 $1,567.50 $1.00 $1,045.00 $3.00 $3,135.00 $25.00 $26,125.00 $1.50 $1,567.50 $2.31 $2,413.95 $2.00 $2,090.00 $10.00 $10,450.00

107 N7E0060 26 Each Planting, Spreading English Yew (Taxus Baccatta 
'Repandens') $183.21 $4,763.46 $98.00 $2,548.00 $55.00 $1,430.00 $49.05 $1,275.30 $50.00 $1,300.00 $55.00 $1,430.00 $95.00 $2,470.00 $40.00 $1,040.00 $96.00 $2,496.00 $60.00 $1,560.00 $85.00 $2,210.00 $40.00 $1,040.00 $77.70 $2,020.20 $40.00 $1,040.00 $100.00 $2,600.00

108 7E00058 37 Each Planting, Black Eyed Susan (Rudbeckia Fulgida Speciosa) $22.90 $847.30 $13.00 $481.00 $18.00 $666.00 $13.08 $483.96 $10.00 $370.00 $18.00 $666.00 $14.00 $518.00 $9.00 $333.00 $13.00 $481.00 $20.00 $740.00 $40.00 $1,480.00 $9.00 $333.00 $17.85 $660.45 $10.00 $370.00 $25.00 $925.00

109 7E00059 50 Each Planting, Blue Rug Juniper (Juniperus Horizontalis) $84.41 $4,220.50 $49.00 $2,450.00 $48.00 $2,400.00 $49.05 $2,452.50 $50.00 $2,500.00 $48.00 $2,400.00 $48.00 $2,400.00 $40.00 $2,000.00 $47.00 $2,350.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $65.00 $3,250.00 $40.00 $2,000.00 $34.65 $1,732.50 $40.00 $2,000.00 $100.00 $5,000.00

110 7E00060 517 Each Planting, Creeping Lilyturf (Liriope Spiciata) $11.45 $5,919.65 $11.00 $5,687.00 $20.00 $10,340.00 $12.54 $6,483.18 $10.00 $5,170.00 $17.00 $8,789.00 $12.00 $6,204.00 $9.00 $4,653.00 $11.00 $5,687.00 $18.00 $9,306.00 $30.00 $15,510.00 $9.00 $4,653.00 $11.55 $5,971.35 $9.00 $4,653.00 $25.00 $12,925.00

111 7E00061 220 Each Planting, Periwinkle (Vinca Minor) $1.84 $404.80 $3.25 $715.00 $3.00 $660.00 $2.18 $479.60 $3.00 $660.00 $3.00 $660.00 $4.00 $880.00 $2.25 $495.00 $3.00 $660.00 $3.00 $660.00 $25.00 $5,500.00 $2.25 $495.00 $4.20 $924.00 $3.00 $660.00 $10.00 $2,200.00

112 7E00062 220 Each Planting, Primeur Daffodil (Narcissus 'Primeur') $5.51 $1,212.20 $2.25 $495.00 $5.00 $1,100.00 $3.27 $719.40 $3.00 $660.00 $4.75 $1,045.00 $3.00 $660.00 $2.00 $440.00 $2.00 $440.00 $5.00 $1,100.00 $25.00 $5,500.00 $2.00 $440.00 $4.20 $924.00 $2.00 $440.00 $10.00 $2,200.00

113 7E00063 660 Each Planting, Shortleaf Stonecrop (Sedum Brevifolium) $4.40 $2,904.00 $3.25 $2,145.00 $5.00 $3,300.00 $4.80 $3,168.00 $10.00 $6,600.00 $5.00 $3,300.00 $4.00 $2,640.00 $9.00 $5,940.00 $3.00 $1,980.00 $5.00 $3,300.00 $28.00 $18,480.00 $9.00 $5,940.00 $4.62 $3,049.20 $9.00 $5,940.00 $10.00 $6,600.00

114 7E00064 23 Each Planting, Winter Gem Boxwood (Buxus Microphylla) $88.08 $2,025.84 $65.00 $1,495.00 $50.00 $1,150.00 $95.92 $2,206.16 $60.00 $1,380.00 $45.00 $1,035.00 $70.00 $1,610.00 $52.00 $1,196.00 $63.00 $1,449.00 $45.00 $1,035.00 $70.00 $1,610.00 $52.00 $1,196.00 $53.55 $1,231.65 $52.00 $1,196.00 $100.00 $2,300.00

115 7N00009 3 Each Flagpole $5,725.00 $17,175.00 $3,400.00 $10,200.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $2,180.00 $6,540.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,847.00 $5,541.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,625.00 $7,875.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00

116 8B31MPT 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $54,000.00 $54,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $49,050.00 $49,050.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $26,250.00 $26,250.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $172,101.50 $172,101.50 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $26,250.00 $26,250.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

117 5ZL0284 1 Each Post Indicator Valve $3,250.00 $3,250.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $3,488.00 $3,488.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $2,625.00 $2,625.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $3,425.00 $3,425.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

Base Total $12,277,000.00 $12,969,997.00 $13,350,000.00 $13,369,361.35 $13,389,044.00 $13,477,698.68 $13,657,075.50 $14,266,000.00 $14,486,000.00 $14,501,289.00 $14,531,880.00 $14,767,998.10 $15,618,601.25 $16,080,000.00 $16,977,107.00


