
New Jersey Turnpike Authority A600.277 3/12/13

Base Line Item Detail J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc. IEW Construction Group, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

0001 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $149,467.50 $149,467.50 $284,860.11 $284,860.11

0002 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $925,000.00 $925,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,300,000.00

0003 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $0.01 $0.01

0004 1HFP009 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (This is a NO BID, Lump Sum item for this contract. The Lump Sum price is $9,000. Enter a Unit Price of $9,000 as your bid item for this item.)$9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00

0005 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00

0006 2B02REX 1823 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $168.00 $306,264.00 $80.79 $147,280.17

0007 2B15STS 4660 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $45.00 $209,700.00 $15.72 $73,255.20

0008 2C01EMB 260 C.Y. Embankment, Common $140.00 $36,400.00 $31.83 $8,275.80

0009 2C02EMB 480 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $100.00 $48,000.00 $49.82 $23,913.60

0010 2H00007 17999 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $4.00 $71,996.00 $6.86 $123,473.14

0011 2H00016 175 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $75.00 $13,125.00 $188.86 $33,050.50

0012 2H25TEC 500 C.Y. Hay Bales $10.00 $5,000.00 $14.32 $7,160.00

0013 2H45TEC 150 Ton Construction Driveway $25.00 $3,750.00 $33.34 $5,001.00

0014 2K01TPF 5398 L.F. Temporary Orange Plastic Fence $1.00 $5,398.00 $5.01 $27,043.98

0015 2B03ETU 1 L.S. Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum item for this contract.  The Lump Sum price is $5,000.  Enter a Unit Price of $5,000 as your bid for this item.)$5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

0016 2M00008 407 Ton Disposal of Acid Producing Soil $1.00 $407.00 $53.61 $21,819.27

0017 3A07ABC 900 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6.5" Thick $30.00 $27,000.00 $33.61 $30,249.00

0018 3A08ABC 130 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8" Thick $90.00 $11,700.00 $41.95 $5,453.50

0019 3B21SUP 451 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 25H 64 Base Course$175.00 $78,925.00 $278.57 $125,635.07

0020 3B24SUP 160 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 19H 76 Intermediate Course$175.00 $28,000.00 $222.97 $35,675.20

0021 3B25SUP 2920 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5H 76 Surface Course$175.00 $511,000.00 $111.54 $325,696.80

0022 3B26TAC 1478 Gallon Tack Coat $1.00 $1,478.00 $5.58 $8,247.24

0023 3B57APA 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum item for this contract. The Lump Sum price is $3100. Enter a Unit Price of $3100 as your bid for this item.)$3,100.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00

0024 3C01BRS 12,164.00 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 inches Thick $29.00 $352,756.00 $38.46 $467,827.44

0025 3E20PMR 11,754.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Variable Depth $9.00 $105,786.00 $22.48 $264,229.92

0026 3F01MRS 17092 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $2.00 $34,184.00 $0.52 $8,887.84

0027 4A11RFS 368,670.00 Pound Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $2.00 $737,340.00 $1.65 $608,305.50

0028 4C00013 1.00 L.S. Structural Steel (Approximately 5100 Pounds) $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $36,917.15 $36,917.15

0029 4F00015 32 Each Remove Existing Overhead Span Sign Structure $15,000.00 $480,000.00 $21,110.98 $675,551.36

0030 4F00016 12 Each Remove Existing Overhead Cantilever Sign Structure$7,500.00 $90,000.00 $21,709.04 $260,508.48

0031 4F00018 315 C.Y. Concrete Column For Sign Structures $1,070.00 $337,050.00 $2,138.11 $673,504.65

0032 4F01BMS 4 Each Remove Existing Bridge Mounted Sign Support $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $13,516.88 $54,067.52

0033 4F01GMP 9450 Pound Aluminum Posts for Ground Mounted Signs $17.00 $160,650.00 $25.00 $236,250.00

0034 4F05GMF 83 C.Y. Concrete Foundations for Ground Mounted Signs$600.00 $49,800.00 $1,016.14 $84,339.62

0035 4F11CSP 1508 C.Y. Concrete in Structures, Pedestals $945.00 $1,425,060.00 $1,185.83 $1,788,231.64

0036 4F01SSS 26 Each Install Overhead Span Sign Structure For Span Up to 90 Feet$30,000.00 $780,000.00 $38,612.37 $1,003,921.62

0037 4F02SSS 15 Each Install Overhead Span Sign Structure For Span Over 90 Feet And Up to 120 Feet$35,000.00 $525,000.00 $49,765.92 $746,488.80

0038 4F03SSS 7 Each Install Overhead Span Sign Structure For Span Over 120 Feet$45,000.00 $315,000.00 $60,919.47 $426,436.29

0039 4F00020 22 Each Install Overhead Cantilever Sign Structure $15,000.00 $330,000.00 $19,306.18 $424,735.96

0040 4F00021 4 Each Relocate Overhead Cantilever Sign Structure $20,000.00 $80,000.00 $43,591.08 $174,364.32

0041 4O01TSP 360 S.F. Temporary Sheeting $1.00 $360.00 $99.65 $35,874.00

0042 4O02TSP 3070 S.F. Temporary Sheeting to Remain in Place $95.00 $291,650.00 $98.19 $301,443.30

0043 4ZL0001 3625 L.F. 30" Diameter Drilled Shaft $362.00 $1,312,250.00 $473.68 $1,717,090.00

0044 4ZL0009 2276 L.F. 36" Diameter Drilled Shaft $373.00 $848,948.00 $556.21 $1,265,933.96

0045 4ZL0014 540 L.F. 48" Drilled Shaft for Sign Structures $660.00 $356,400.00 $845.92 $456,796.80

0046 4ZL0016 1159 L.F. 54" Drilled Shaft for Sign Structures $887.00 $1,028,033.00 $862.27 $999,370.93

0047 5A08PUD 100 L.F. 8" Pipe Underdrain $12.00 $1,200.00 $50.54 $5,054.00

0048 5B15RC5 60 L.F. 15" Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class V $50.00 $3,000.00 $66.79 $4,007.40

0049 5B18DIP 245 L.F. 18" Ductile Iron Pipe $125.00 $30,625.00 $95.51 $23,399.95

0050 5B18RC3 105 L.F. 18" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $55.00 $5,775.00 $73.34 $7,700.70

0051 5C01ND1 3.00 Each Inlet, Type D1 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $4,277.85 $12,833.55

0052 5C01D4G1 4.00 Each Inlet, Type D4,G1-X1 $10,000.00 $40,000.00 $9,815.45 $39,261.80

0053 5D10INC 59 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $150.00 $8,850.00 $568.35 $33,532.65

0054 5E01ALC 780 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $8.00 $6,240.00 $14.32 $11,169.60

0055 5F00002 45.00 S.Y. Concrete Island, 4" Thick $45.00 $2,025.00 $74.85 $3,368.25

0056 5F01VCA 800 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $22.00 $17,600.00 $30.94 $24,752.00
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0057 5H01CMB 460 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Roadway $250.00 $115,000.00 $434.99 $200,095.40

0058 5H03CMB 1556 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Protection $240.00 $373,440.00 $289.99 $451,224.44

0059 5H30CRR 1566 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier Removal, Roadway $95.00 $148,770.00 $93.01 $145,653.66

0060 5I01FSP 48100 S.F. Furnish And Install Overhead Sign Panels $26.00 $1,250,600.00 $52.22 $2,511,782.00

0061 5I02FSP 7150 S.F. Furnish And Install Ground Mounted Sign Panels$26.00 $185,900.00 $34.83 $249,034.50

0062 N5I0002 2629 L.F. Timber Posts $33.00 $86,757.00 $56.24 $147,854.96

0063 5I00005 172 Each Remove Existing Overhead Sign Panels $500.00 $86,000.00 $3,356.60 $577,335.20

0064 5I00RGM 103.00 Each Removal of Existing Ground-Mounted Sign $1,250.00 $128,750.00 $3,419.52 $352,210.56

0065 5I05SPP 540 L.F. U-channel Post $10.00 $5,400.00 $38.06 $20,552.40

0066 5J00007 2.00 Each Telescoping Guide Rail End Terminal $4,700.00 $9,400.00 $5,688.31 $11,376.62

0067 5J00FGT 11 Each Flared Guide Rail Terminal $2,135.00 $23,485.00 $2,955.69 $32,512.59

0068 5J01PCB 1 Each Parapet Connection, Type B $375.00 $375.00 $418.26 $418.26

0069 5J01RBG 10771 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $3.00 $32,313.00 $2.23 $24,019.33

0070 5J51BGE 488 L.F. Beam Guide Rail Element $10.00 $4,880.00 $11.15 $5,441.20

0071 5J51TTS 32.00 Each Tangent Guide Rail Terminal $2,350.00 $75,200.00 $3,067.23 $98,151.36

0072 5J52ABG 56 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $500.00 $28,000.00 $724.98 $40,598.88

0073 5J52BET 1 Each Beam Guide Rail Buried End Terminal $500.00 $500.00 $1,115.36 $1,115.36

0074 5J52BGD 338 L.F. Beam Guide Rail, Dual-Faced $28.00 $9,464.00 $35.69 $12,063.22

0075 5J52BGR 19079 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $21.00 $400,659.00 $26.77 $510,744.83

0076 5J53RRS 2,250.00 L.F. Rub Rail $6.00 $13,500.00 $7.81 $17,572.50

0077 5J54BGP 307.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Post $85.00 $26,095.00 $94.81 $29,106.67

0078 5P10TMP 103810 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $0.50 $51,905.00 $0.86 $89,276.60

0079 5P12REM 56470 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $1.00 $56,470.00 $0.57 $32,187.90

0080 5P13TMP 4420 L.F. Removable Black Line Mask, 8" Wide $3.00 $13,260.00 $2.77 $12,243.40

0081 5P14TMP 5070 L.F. Removable Wet Weather Pavement Marking Tape$2.00 $10,140.00 $1.90 $9,633.00

0082 5P21LLS 56570 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long Life, Thermoplastic $1.00 $56,570.00 $0.85 $48,084.50

0083 5Q01FOF 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type F $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $60,956.34 $60,956.34

0084 5Q02MFF 26 Month Maintain Field Office, Type F $2,000.00 $52,000.00 $4,071.22 $105,851.72

0085 5V01PIT 54 Each Test Pits $250.00 $13,500.00 $420.81 $22,723.74

0086 5X00PRA 31 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard$2,500.00 $77,500.00 $2,788.39 $86,440.09

0087 5X00RPR 5.00 Each Repair Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard$2,500.00 $12,500.00 $0.01 $0.05

0088 5X02FTA 16.00 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard, 9 Bays, 24" Wide$10,000.00 $160,000.00 $10,263.50 $164,216.00

0089 5X03FTA 4.00 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard, 4 Bays, 24" Wide$10,000.00 $40,000.00 $7,876.64 $31,506.56

0090 5ZD01RPM 605.00 Each Raised Pavement Markers $25.00 $15,125.00 $26.51 $16,038.55

0091 5ZD04RPM 185 Each Removal of Raised Pavement Markers $10.00 $1,850.00 $83.65 $15,475.25

0092 5ZM03FAS 1 C.P. Force Account For Snow Removal. (This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum item for this contract. The Lump Sum price is $80,000. Enter a Unit Price of $80,000 as your bid for this item.)$80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00

0093 5ZO0018 2271 Ton Off-Site Disposal of ID-27 Waste $25.00 $56,775.00 $54.68 $124,178.28

0094 5ZO0066 1900 L.F. Transite Duct Removal $1.00 $1,900.00 $66.16 $125,704.00

0095 6A00006 2225 L.F. #4/0 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $13.00 $28,925.00 $14.79 $32,907.75

0096 6A00065 550 L.F. Communication Cable $6.00 $3,300.00 $6.26 $3,443.00

0097 6A00090 175 L.F. 3" PVC Coated Galvanized Conduit, Exposed $55.00 $9,625.00 $62.59 $10,953.25

0098 6A02MLC 7525 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $5.00 $37,625.00 $5.12 $38,528.00

0099 6A03RNC 8995 L.F. 3" Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40)$20.00 $179,900.00 $20.48 $184,217.60

0100 6A04GWR 600.00 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Ground Wire $3.00 $1,800.00 $2.85 $1,710.00

0101 6A04MLC 825.00 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $3.00 $2,475.00 $3.41 $2,813.25

0102 6A06GWR 3175 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Ground Wire $2.00 $6,350.00 $2.28 $7,239.00

0103 6A06MLC 15725 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $2.00 $31,450.00 $2.28 $35,853.00

0104 6A08GWR 5385 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $2.00 $10,770.00 $2.28 $12,277.80

0105 6A20MLC 3,675.00 L.F. #2 / 0 A.W.G.  Multiple Lighting Cable $7.00 $25,725.00 $7.40 $27,195.00

0106 6A21JF1 2 Each Junction Box Foundation, Type 1 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,324.42 $8,648.84

0107 6A24JBC 70 Each Junction Box, Type C $3,500.00 $245,000.00 $3,755.42 $262,879.40

0108 6A65RAS 1 L.S. Remove and Salvage Existing Facilities $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $40,285.42 $40,285.42

0109 N6B0007 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 1 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,380.06 $11,380.06

0110 6B08RWL 2.00 Each Relocate Light Pole and Luminaire $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,438.22 $8,876.44

0111 6C01ISS 1.00 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure No. 1 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $14,111.27 $14,111.27

0112 6C02ISS 1.00 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure No. 2 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $16,432.81 $16,432.81
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0113 6C03ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure No. 3 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,832.37 $9,832.37

0114 6C04ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure No. 4 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $19,118.51 $19,118.51

0115 6C05ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure No. 5 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,786.86 $9,786.86

0116 6C06ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 6 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $16,728.69 $16,728.69

0117 6C07ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 7 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,900.65 $9,900.65

0118 6C08ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 8 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $14,509.58 $14,509.58

0119 6C09ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 9 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $10,014.45 $10,014.45

0120 6C01MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 1$9,500.00 $9,500.00 $10,526.56 $10,526.56

0121 6C02MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 2$9,500.00 $9,500.00 $10,389.99 $10,389.99

0122 6C03MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 3$9,000.00 $9,000.00 $10,105.49 $10,105.49

0123 6C04MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 4$9,500.00 $9,500.00 $10,389.99 $10,389.99

0124 6C05MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 5$16,000.00 $16,000.00 $17,320.45 $17,320.45

0125 6C06MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 6$16,000.00 $16,000.00 $18,162.58 $18,162.58

0126 6C07MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 7$9,000.00 $9,000.00 $10,105.49 $10,105.49

0127 6C08MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 8$11,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,436.96 $11,436.96

0128 6C09MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 9$10,000.00 $10,000.00 $11,209.36 $11,209.36

0129 6C10MSS 1.00 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 10$10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,947.63 $10,947.63

0130 6C11MSS 1.00 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 11$14,000.00 $14,000.00 $15,670.36 $15,670.36

0131 6C12MSS 1.00 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 12$10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,936.24 $10,936.24

0132 6C13MSS 1.00 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 13$23,000.00 $23,000.00 $24,979.24 $24,979.24

0133 6C14MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 14$10,000.00 $10,000.00 $11,038.66 $11,038.66

0134 6C15MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 15$10,000.00 $10,000.00 $11,152.46 $11,152.46

0135 6C16MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 16$23,000.00 $23,000.00 $25,036.14 $25,036.14

0136 6C17MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 17$14,000.00 $14,000.00 $15,886.56 $15,886.56

0137 6H00012 1 L.S. Relocate Lane Control Signal Assembly $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $45,292.65 $45,292.65

0138 6J00007 1 L.S. Spare Parts $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,535.04 $8,535.04

0139 6J00170 1.00 Each Flashing Beacon and Controller Cabinet $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,811.06 $10,811.06

0140 7C01TOP 33,381.00 S.Y. Topsoil $3.00 $100,143.00 $1.62 $54,077.22

0141 7D01SED 25,576.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $0.50 $12,788.00 $0.50 $12,788.00

0142 7D08SED 7,806.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type L $0.55 $4,293.30 $0.56 $4,371.36

0143 7F01SSM 7806 S.Y. Soil Stabilization Matting $3.50 $27,321.00 $3.62 $28,257.72

0144 8A01MPT 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $4,040,000.00 $4,040,000.00 $846,000.00 $846,000.00

0145 8A06MPT 100.00 Barrel Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $100.00 $10,000.00 $0.01 $1.00

0146 8A07MPT 10 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $100.00 $1,000.00 $0.01 $0.10

0147 8A29MPT 1000 M.H. Flaggers $0.01 $10.00 $73.00 $73,000.00

0148 8A30MPT 16 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $100.00 $1,600.00 $6,598.37 $105,573.92

0149 8B15MPT 6000 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol $0.01 $60.00 $30.00 $180,000.00

0150 8B17MPT 16 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $100.00 $1,600.00 $0.01 $0.16

0151 8B18MPT 30 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator $3,500.00 $105,000.00 $4,194.91 $125,847.30

0152 8B19MPT 600 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use$95.00 $57,000.00 $95.00 $57,000.00

0153 8B20MPT 134 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator$1.00 $134.00 $1,080.65 $144,807.10

0154 N8A0001 22650 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier$0.01 $226.50 $14.66 $332,049.00

0155 N8A0002 84770 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier$0.01 $847.70 $15.90 $1,347,843.00

0156 8D01MRR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Railroad Traffic. (This  is a NO-BID, Lump Sum item for this contract. The Lump Sum price is $10,000. Enter a Unit Price of $10,000 as your bid for this item.$10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

0157 8C100SCL 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways$10,000.00 $10,000.00 $102,339.32 $102,339.32

$21,674,244.00 $26,626,257.62Base Total
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