
Base Line Item Detail A. P. Construction, Inc. D. A. Nolt, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

0001 1D10MOBX 1 L.S. Mobilization $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $86,544.00 $86,544.00

0002 5Q01FAL 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

0003 5Q02MFA 10 Month Maintain Field Office, Type A $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00

0004 2J31DES 1 L.S. Selective Demolition - Location No. 3 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $19,859.00 $19,859.00

0005 9A00085 12250 S.F. Roof - Restoration $40.00 $490,000.00 $33.64 $412,090.00

0006 9A00086 15900 S.F. Roof - Replacement $42.00 $667,800.00 $44.32 $704,688.00

0007 9A00087 3150 L.F. Sealant Type 1 - Frames $10.00 $31,500.00 $28.15 $88,672.50

0008 9A00133 981 L.F. Sealant Type 2 - Masonry Joints $12.00 $11,772.00 $29.75 $29,184.75

0009 9A00122 6 L.F. Sealant Type 3 - High Heat $16.00 $96.00 $125.00 $750.00

0010 9A00089 2365 S.F. Masonry - Repointing $10.00 $23,650.00 $38.75 $91,643.75

0011 9A00090 752 S.F. Masonry - Replace Bricks $14.00 $10,528.00 $145.00 $109,040.00

0012 9A00134 92 L.F. Masonry - Lintels $125.00 $11,500.00 $375.00 $34,500.00

0013 9A00123 1056 Each Masonry - Weep Holes $3.00 $3,168.00 $42.00 $44,352.00

0014 9A00092 50 L.F. Masonry - Concrete Stair Repair $110.00 $5,500.00 $255.00 $12,750.00

0015 9A00124 6 Each Steel - Column Repairs $1,400.00 $8,400.00 $1,200.00 $7,200.00

0016 9A00125 30 S.F. Steel - Floor Cover Plates $60.00 $1,800.00 $310.00 $9,300.00

0017 9A00126 40 S.F. Wood - Removable Platform $70.00 $2,800.00 $65.00 $2,600.00

0018 9A00093 20 S.F. Exterior Finish - Stucco Soffit / Fascia $250.00 $5,000.00 $260.00 $5,200.00

0019 9A00094 150 S.F. Exterior Finish - Metal Soffit $12.00 $1,800.00 $35.00 $5,250.00

0020 9A00095 384 S.F. Exterior Finish - Painting $45.00 $17,280.00 $26.35 $10,118.40

0021 9A00096 598 L.F. Glazing - Gasketing $5.00 $2,990.00 $37.25 $22,275.50

0022 9A00097 70 S.F. Glazing - Replacement $40.00 $2,800.00 $90.00 $6,300.00

0023 9A00127 34 L.F. Glazing - Flashings $68.00 $2,312.00 $325.00 $11,050.00

0024 9A00098 4 Each Doors - Replace 3'x7' Door $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00

0025 9A00099 4 Each Doors - Replace 3'x7' Frame $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00

0026 9A00128 36 Each Doors - Replace 3'x7' Hardware $400.00 $14,400.00 $1,245.00 $44,820.00

0027 9A00100 24 S.F. Louvers - Replacement $210.00 $5,040.00 $165.00 $3,960.00

0028 9A00101 2500 S.F. Interior Finish - Painting - Frames, Doors, and Windows $6.00 $15,000.00 $27.00 $67,500.00

0029 9A00102 588 S.F. Interior Finish - Painting - Walls and Ceilings $3.50 $2,058.00 $16.50 $9,702.00

0030 9A00103 340 S.F. Interior Finish - Gypsum Board $115.00 $39,100.00 $32.00 $10,880.00

0031 9A00129 100 S.F. Interior Finish - Plaster Repair $325.00 $32,500.00 $65.00 $6,500.00

0032 9A00104 16250 S.F. Interior Finish - Acoustical Ceiling Tiles $6.10 $99,125.00 $4.65 $75,562.50

0033 9A00105 8 S.F. Interior Finish - Tile Restoration $100.00 $800.00 $160.00 $1,280.00

0034 9A00106 280 S.F. Interior Finish - VCT Restoration $25.00 $7,000.00 $18.00 $5,040.00

0035 9A00078 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $14,080.00 $14,080.00

0036 9A00079 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,880.00 $11,880.00

0037 9A00107 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 3 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $22,440.00 $22,440.00

0038 9A00108 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 4 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,680.00 $20,680.00



Base Line Item Detail A. P. Construction, Inc. D. A. Nolt, Inc.

0039 9A00109 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 5 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $106,260.00 $106,260.00

0040 9A00110 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 6 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,980.00 $1,980.00

0041 9A00111 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 7 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $40,480.00 $40,480.00

0042 9A00112 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 8 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $60,280.00 $60,280.00

0043 9A00080 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $84,000.00 $84,000.00 $82,454.00 $82,454.00

0044 9A00081 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $135,000.00 $135,000.00 $78,171.00 $78,171.00

0045 9A00113 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3 $126,000.00 $126,000.00 $93,091.00 $93,091.00

0046 9A00114 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 4 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $102,801.00 $102,801.00

0047 9A00117 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 7 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $10,565.00 $10,565.00

0048 9A00118 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 8 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $86,595.00 $86,595.00

0049 9A00130 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Architectural Work Allowances 
(NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

0050 9A00131 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances 
(NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

0051 9A00132 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances 
(NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

0052 5ZO0125 1 L.S.
Removal of Asbestos (This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum item 
for this contract. The Lump Sum price is $75,000. Enter a 
Unit Price of $75,000 as your bid for this item.)

$75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

0053 5ZO0127 1 L.S.

Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (This is 
a NO-BID, Lump Sum item for this contract. The Lump 
Sum price is $50,000. Enter a Unit Price of $50,000 as 
your bid for this item.)

$50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

0054 5ZO0128 1 L.S.

Removal of Lead-Based Materials (This is a NO-BID, 
Lump Sum item for this contract. The Lump Sum price is 
$20,000. Enter a Unit Price of $20,000 as your bid for this 
item.)

$20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

$2,817,719.00 $2,971,369.40Base Total


