Base Line Item Detalil

J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc. & Joseph M.
Sanzari, Inc. A Joint Venture

Gardner M. Bishop, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT
0001 1DO1LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00
0002 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $1,100,000.00 $1,100,000.00
0003 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
Fuel Price Adjustment (This is a NO BID, Lump Sum item for
0004 1HFPOO1 1 L.S. this contract. The Lump Sum price is $1,000. Enter a Unit $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
Price of $1,000 as your bid item for this item.)
0005 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $450,000.00 $450,000.00
Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials
0006 2BO1ETU 1 LS. fﬂ?;spiséﬁnfﬁ}f'e?; ;Lérg%g;mgig ?Lﬁf;?::gfc;g’ggzo as $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
your bid for this item.)
0007 2B02REX 300 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $35.00 $10,500.00 $125.00 $37,500.00
0008 2C01EMB 50 C.Y. Embankment, Common $35.00 $1,750.00 $200.00 $10,000.00
0009 2C02EMB 154 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $100.00 $15,400.00 $40.00 $6,160.00
0010 2G00005 100 Ton Riprap Stone Aprons, 18" Thick, (D50=9") $70.00 $7,000.00 $125.00 $12,500.00
0011 2G00037 573 Ton Riprap Stone Scour Hole, 36" Thick, D50=18" $100.00 $57,300.00 $125.00 $71,625.00
0012 2G12A08 200 Ton Riprap Stone Aprons, 24" Thick (D50=12") $70.00 $14,000.00 $125.00 $25,000.00
0013 2H00007 1715 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $8.00 $13,720.00 $12.00 $20,580.00
0014 2H00016 697 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $200.00 $139,400.00 $150.00 $104,550.00
0015 2H00022 1 L.S. Flow Diversion $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $900,000.00 $900,000.00
0016 2HO5DSC 50 Thousand Gallons |Watering $1.00 $50.00 $1.00 $50.00
0017 2H25TEC 1164 C.Y. Hay Bales $55.00 $64,020.00 $60.00 $69,840.00
0018 2H45TEC 500 Ton Construction Driveway $35.00 $17,500.00 $130.00 $65,000.00
0019 2K01TPF 2050 L.F. Temporary Orange Plastic Fence $8.00 $16,400.00 $10.00 $20,500.00
0020 3A07ABC 282 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6.5" Thick $20.00 $5,640.00 $20.00 $5,640.00
0021 3B21SUP 126 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 25H 64 Base Course $250.00 $31,500.00 $65.00 $8,190.00
0022 3B24SUP 51 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 19H 76 Intermediate Course $250.00 $12,750.00 $65.00 $3,315.00
0023 3B25SUP 32 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5H 76 Surface Course $250.00 $8,000.00 $65.00 $2,080.00
0024 3C01BRS 135 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $80.00 $10,800.00 $50.00 $6,750.00
0025 4A00031 2096 C.F. Concrete in CIP Pipe Invert Slab $109.00 $228,464.00 $165.00 $345,840.00
0026 4A01CCC 31 C.Y. Concrete in CIP Collar $900.00 $27,900.00 $500.00 $15,500.00
0027 4A10RFS 4676 Pound Reinforcement Steel $3.00 $14,028.00 $2.00 $9,352.00
0028 4103PAM 15010 C.F. Pneumatically Applied Mortar, Centrifugally Cast $139.00 $2,086,390.00 $250.00 $3,752,500.00
0029 5B00087 100 Gallon Pressure Injection Resin $500.00 $50,000.00 $80.00 $8,000.00
0030 5B00088 1000 S.F. Patch Pipe $100.00 $100,000.00 $165.00 $165,000.00
Force Account for Pipe Replacement (This is a NO-BID, Cost-
0031 5BO1FAP 1 C.P. Plus item for this contract. The Cost-Plus price is $1,700,000. $1,700,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $1,700,000.00
Enter a Unit Price of $1,700,000 as your bid for this item.)
0032 5B0OOVID 35890 L.F. Video Inspection of Pipes $4.00 $143,560.00 $10.00 $358,900.00
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0033 5BOOPLR 6025 L.F. 24" Pipe Liner, Resin $131.00 $789,275.00 $370.00 $2,229,250.00
0034 5B04PLR 13467 L.F. 18" Pipe Liner, Resin $116.00 $1,562,172.00 $290.00 $3,905,430.00
0035 5BO6PLR 118 L.F. 12" Pipe Liner, Resin $108.00 $12,744.00 $150.00 $17,700.00
0036 5B07PLR 11330 L.F. 15" Pipe Liner, Resin $93.00 $1,053,690.00 $275.00 $3,115,750.00
0037 5B10PLR 1494 L.F. 21" Pipe Liner, Resin $140.00 $209,160.00 $340.00 $507,960.00
0038 5B15RC3 289 L.F. 15" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $100.00 $28,900.00 $400.00 $115,600.00
0039 5B18RC3 286 L.F. 18" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $105.00 $30,030.00 $400.00 $114,400.00
0040 5CO01ND3 7 Each Inlet, Type D3 $3,700.00 $25,900.00 $7,500.00 $52,500.00
0041 5C40RPI 500 S.F. Repair Inlets $100.00 $50,000.00 $175.00 $87,500.00
0042 5D10INC 49 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $2,500.00 $122,500.00 $3,000.00 $147,000.00
0043 5F01VCA 692 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $50.00 $34,600.00 $25.00 $17,300.00
0044 5J00004 5 Each Beam Guide Rail Blockout $80.00 $400.00 $35.00 $175.00
0045 5J00FGT 1 Each Flared Guide Rail Terminal $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
0046 5J01RBG 100 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $5.00 $500.00 $1.00 $100.00
0047 5J01RSG 481 L.F. Reset Beam Guide Rail $39.00 $18,759.00 $35.00 $16,835.00
0048 5J51BGE 25 L.F. Beam Guide Rail Element $13.00 $325.00 $25.00 $625.00
0049 5J52ABG 1 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $1,050.00 $1,050.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
0050 5J52BGR 100 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $22.00 $2,200.00 $40.00 $4,000.00
0051 5J54BGP 5 Each Beam Guide Rail Post $120.00 $600.00 $135.00 $675.00
0052 5P10TMP 1000 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $3.00 $3,000.00 $3.00 $3,000.00
0053 5P11REM 1000 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Mechanical $2.75 $2,750.00 $3.00 $3,000.00
0054 5P21LLS 1000 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long Life, Thermoplastic $4.50 $4,500.00 $10.00 $10,000.00
0055 5Q01FOD 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type D $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
0056 5Q02MFD 12 Month Maintain Field Office, Type D $2,000.00 $24,000.00 $3,000.00 $36,000.00
0057 5W01CDV 46408 L.F. Cleaning Existing Storm Drain, 12" to 48" Diameter $8.00 $371,264.00 $15.00 $696,120.00
0058 5W04CDV 2068 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drains, over 48" Diameter $10.00 $20,680.00 $30.00 $62,040.00
0059 5X00PRA 1 Each g'j;;”ggu:?; Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator, $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00
0060 5X00RPR 1 Each Repair Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
0061 5X02FTA 1 Each Ez,fmvjizigg Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard, 9 Bays, $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
Force Account For Snow Removal. (This is a NO-BID, Lump
0062 5ZMO1FAS 1 C.P. Sum item for this contract. The Lump Sum price is $52,000. $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00
Enter a Unit Price of $52,000 as your bid for this item.)
0063 7CO1TOP 1000 S.Y. Topsoil $9.00 $9,000.00 $10.00 $10,000.00
0064 7D0O1SED 1000 SY. Seeding, Type A $5.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00
0065 7F01SSM 200 S.Y. Soil Stabilization Matting $4.00 $800.00 $5.00 $1,000.00
0066 8A01IMPT 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $2,500,000.00 $2,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00
0067 8A07MPT 10 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00
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0068 8A29MPT 200 M.H. Flaggers $1.00 $200.00 $1.00 $200.00

0069 8A30MPT 4 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $8,000.00 $32,000.00 $7,500.00 $30,000.00
Police Traffic Directors (This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum item for

0070 8A25MPT 1 L.S. this contract. The Lump Sum price is $75,000. Enter a Unit $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00
Price of $75,000 as your bid for this item.)

0071 N8A0001 500 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $20.00 $10,000.00 $50.00 $25,000.00

0072 N8A0002 500 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $30.00 $15,000.00 $30.00 $15,000.00

0073 8B15MPT 1200 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol $100.00 $120,000.00 $1.00 $1,200.00

0074 8B17MPT 5 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $10,000.00 $50,000.00 $15,000.00 $75,000.00

0075 8C100SCL 1 LS. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

Local Roadways

Base Total

$12,863,171.00

$22,437,232.00




