
Base Line Item Detail Hall Building Corp. D. A. Nolt, Inc. A. P. Construction, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT

0001 1D10MOBX 1 L.S. Mobilization $365,750.00 $365,750.00 $219,000.00 $219,000.00 $480,000.00 $480,000.00

0002 2J32DES 1 L.S. Selective Demolition - Location No. 1 $172,301.00 $172,301.00 $33,014.00 $33,014.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

0003 5Q01FAL 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $107,350.00 $107,350.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

0004 5Q02MFA 10 Month Maintain Field Office, Type A $3,540.00 $35,400.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $3,500.00 $35,000.00

0005 9A00085 1870 S.F. Roof - Restoration $45.00 $84,150.00 $44.52 $83,252.40 $55.00 $102,850.00

0006 9A00086 14300 S.F. Roof - Replacement $30.00 $429,000.00 $26.86 $384,098.00 $50.00 $715,000.00

0007 9A00087 6534 L.F. Sealant Type 1 - Frames $10.00 $65,340.00 $16.00 $104,544.00 $25.00 $163,350.00

0008 9A00088 290 L.F. Sealant Type 2 - Control Joints $24.00 $6,960.00 $39.47 $11,446.30 $75.00 $21,750.00

0009 9A00153 400 Each Sealant Type 4 - Conduit Penetrations $40.00 $16,000.00 $153.90 $61,560.00 $15.00 $6,000.00

0010 9A00089 171 S.F. Masonry - Repointing $100.00 $17,100.00 $64.99 $11,113.29 $34.00 $5,814.00

0011 9A00090 28 S.F. Masonry - Replace Bricks $550.00 $15,400.00 $323.04 $9,045.12 $400.00 $11,200.00

0012 9A00123 864 Each Masonry - Weep Holes $20.00 $17,280.00 $21.24 $18,351.36 $25.00 $21,600.00

0013 9A00092 182 L.F. Masonry - Concrete Stair Repair $250.00 $45,500.00 $214.70 $39,075.40 $600.00 $109,200.00

0014 9A00147 567 S.F. Masonry - Concrete Restoration $100.00 $56,700.00 $454.98 $257,973.66 $250.00 $141,750.00

0015 9A00148 39 L.F. Metal Trench Drain $350.00 $13,650.00 $220.98 $8,618.22 $500.00 $19,500.00

0016 9A00093 301 S.F. Exterior Finish - Stucco Soffit / Fascia $25.00 $7,525.00 $120.02 $36,126.02 $17.00 $5,117.00

0017 9A00149 440 L.F. Exterior Finish - Soffit Venting / Insect Screen $20.00 $8,800.00 $24.82 $10,920.80 $24.00 $10,560.00

0018 9A00096 2123 L.F. Glazing - Gasketing $24.00 $50,952.00 $52.25 $110,926.75 $1.00 $2,123.00

0019 9A00097 101 S.F. Glazing - Replacement $150.00 $15,150.00 $286.81 $28,967.81 $25.00 $2,525.00

0020 9A00127 87 L.F. Glazing - Flashings $18.00 $1,566.00 $63.79 $5,549.73 $104.00 $9,048.00

0021 9A00098 5 Each Doors - Replace 3'x7' Door $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,586.50 $7,932.50 $744.00 $3,720.00

0022 9A00099 5 Each Doors - Replace 3'x7' Frame $850.00 $4,250.00 $1,710.00 $8,550.00 $624.00 $3,120.00

0023 9A00128 47 Each Doors - Replace 3'x7' Hardware $870.00 $40,890.00 $1,282.50 $60,277.50 $430.00 $20,210.00

0024 9A00101 1606 S.F. Interior Finish - Painting - Frames, Doors, and Windows $12.00 $19,272.00 $39.19 $62,939.14 $8.50 $13,651.00

0025 9A00102 319 S.F. Interior Finish - Painting - Walls and Ceilings $10.00 $3,190.00 $23.66 $7,547.54 $3.00 $957.00

0026 9A00103 220 S.F. Interior Finish - Gypsum Board $15.00 $3,300.00 $31.54 $6,938.80 $5.00 $1,100.00

0027 9A00104 26279 S.F. Interior Finish - Acoustical Ceiling Tiles $6.00 $157,674.00 $10.19 $267,783.01 $10.00 $262,790.00

0028 9A00106 30 S.F. Interior Finish - VCT Restoration $25.00 $750.00 $157.70 $4,731.00 $10.00 $300.00

0029 9A00150 22 L.F. Interior Finish - SS Plates and Angle $350.00 $7,700.00 $209.00 $4,598.00 $160.00 $3,520.00

0030 9A00136 3549 S.F. Tunnel - Concrete Removal $50.00 $177,450.00 $78.41 $278,277.09 $300.00 $1,064,700.00

0031 9A00137 3549 L.F. Tunnel - Clean and Seal Existing Reinforcement $20.00 $70,980.00 $75.51 $267,984.99 $6.00 $21,294.00

0032 9A00151 2822 S.F. Tunnel - Concrete Spall Repair - Type I $150.00 $423,300.00 $193.36 $545,661.92 $250.00 $705,500.00

0033 9A00152 726 S.F. Tunnel - Concrete Spall Repair - Type II $150.00 $108,900.00 $339.63 $246,571.38 $400.00 $290,400.00

0034 9A00139 578 L.F. Tunnel - Concrete Crack Repair $170.00 $98,260.00 $120.27 $69,516.06 $87.00 $50,286.00

0035 9A00140 156 S.F. Tunnel - Concrete Slab Replacement $1,050.00 $163,800.00 $887.11 $138,389.16 $356.00 $55,536.00

0036 9A00141 8 Each Tunnel - Concrete Lintel Repair $3,500.00 $28,000.00 $5,130.00 $41,040.00 $1,920.00 $15,360.00

0037 9A00143 693 L.F. Tunnel - Expansion Joint Repair $120.00 $83,160.00 $36.58 $25,349.94 $17.00 $11,781.00

0038 9A00144 238 Each Tunnel - Concrete Step Repair $500.00 $119,000.00 $686.75 $163,446.50 $950.00 $226,100.00

0039 9A00145 5 Each Replace Floor Drain Cover Casting $800.00 $4,000.00 $1,425.00 $7,125.00 $182.40 $912.00

0040 9A00078 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $182,000.00 $182,000.00 $128,127.45 $128,127.45 $64,000.00 $64,000.00

0041 9A00079 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $209,000.00 $209,000.00 $290,677.20 $290,677.20 $100,000.00 $100,000.00

0042 9A00107 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 3 $288,000.00 $288,000.00 $209,206.15 $209,206.15 $120,000.00 $120,000.00

0043 9A00108 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 4 $153,000.00 $153,000.00 $117,928.15 $117,928.15 $60,000.00 $60,000.00

0044 9A00109 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 5 $207,000.00 $207,000.00 $274,764.70 $274,764.70 $60,000.00 $60,000.00

0045 9A00110 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 6 $161,000.00 $161,000.00 $89,243.00 $89,243.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00

0046 9A00111 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 7 $167,000.00 $167,000.00 $166,231.00 $166,231.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

0047 9A00080 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $275,000.00 $275,000.00 $185,250.00 $185,250.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00

0048 9A00081 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $270,750.00 $270,750.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00

0049 9A00113 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3 $380,000.00 $380,000.00 $257,529.80 $257,529.80 $300,000.00 $300,000.00

0050 9A00114 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 4 $240,000.00 $240,000.00 $178,397.65 $178,397.65 $350,000.00 $350,000.00

0051 9A00115 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 5 $230,000.00 $230,000.00 $442,390.30 $442,390.30 $350,000.00 $350,000.00

0052 9A00116 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 6 $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $62,470.10 $62,470.10 $150,000.00 $150,000.00

0053 9A00117 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 7 $220,000.00 $220,000.00 $375,250.00 $375,250.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00

0054 9A00130 1 C.P.
Force Account for Building Architectural Work 
Allowances (NO-BID)

$50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

0055 9A00131 1 C.P.
Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances 
(NO-BID)

$50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

0056 9A00132 1 C.P.
Force Account for Building Mechanical Work 
Allowances (NO-BID)

$50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

0057 9A00135 1 C.P.
Force Account for Building Structural Work Allowances 
(NO-BID)

$50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

0058 5ZO0125 1 L.S.
Removal of Asbestos (This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum 
item for this contract. The Lump Sum price is $75,000. 
Enter a Unit Price of $75,000 as your bid for this item.)

$75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

0059 5ZO0127 1 L.S.

Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring 
(This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum item for this contract. 
The Lump Sum price is $50,000. Enter a Unit Price of 
$50,000 as your bid for this item.)

$50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

0060 5ZO0128 1 L.S.

Removal of Lead-Based Materials (This is a NO-BID, 
Lump Sum item for this contract. The Lump Sum price 
is $20,000. Enter a Unit Price of $20,000 as your bid for 
this item.)

$20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

0061 8C22MLR 1 L.S.
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 
2

$190,200.00 $190,200.00 $19,850.00 $19,850.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00

0062 8C25MLR 1 L.S.
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 
5

$127,000.00 $127,000.00 $27,500.00 $27,500.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00

$6,714,950.00 $7,107,307.89 $7,757,624.00Base Total


