

Base Line Item Detail				Anka Painting Company, Inc.		Allied Painting, Inc.		Corcon, Inc.		Atsalis Brothers Painting Company		
Item No.	Unit Code	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	RATE	AMOUNT	RATE	AMOUNT	RATE	AMOUNT	RATE	AMOUNT
0001	1D01SDP	1	L.S.	Shop Drawing Preparation	\$35,000.00	\$35,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$187,000.00	\$187,000.00
0002	1D10MOB	1	L.S.	Mobilization	\$317,562.00	\$317,562.00	\$500,000.00	\$500,000.00	\$1,000,000.00	\$1,000,000.00	\$700,000.00	\$700,000.00
0003	1G01SCH	1	L.S.	Progress Schedule	\$24,000.00	\$24,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$65,000.00	\$65,000.00
0004	4K01PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 1	\$362,750.00	\$362,750.00	\$225,000.00	\$225,000.00	\$71,000.00	\$71,000.00	\$292,912.00	\$292,912.00
0005	4K02PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 2	\$372,750.00	\$372,750.00	\$125,000.00	\$125,000.00	\$18,000.00	\$18,000.00	\$95,000.00	\$95,000.00
0006	4K03PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 3	\$277,750.00	\$277,750.00	\$450,000.00	\$450,000.00	\$108,000.00	\$108,000.00	\$797,000.00	\$797,000.00
0007	4K04PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 4	\$372,750.00	\$372,750.00	\$500,000.00	\$500,000.00	\$153,000.00	\$153,000.00	\$650,000.00	\$650,000.00
0008	4K05PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 5	\$647,750.00	\$647,750.00	\$800,000.00	\$800,000.00	\$280,000.00	\$280,000.00	\$855,000.00	\$855,000.00
0009	4K06PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 6	\$397,750.00	\$397,750.00	\$450,000.00	\$450,000.00	\$138,000.00	\$138,000.00	\$460,000.00	\$460,000.00
0010	4K07PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 7	\$292,750.00	\$292,750.00	\$450,000.00	\$450,000.00	\$195,000.00	\$195,000.00	\$468,000.00	\$468,000.00
0011	4K08PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 8	\$292,750.00	\$292,750.00	\$450,000.00	\$450,000.00	\$194,000.00	\$194,000.00	\$510,000.00	\$510,000.00
0012	4K09PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 9	\$117,750.00	\$117,750.00	\$150,000.00	\$150,000.00	\$82,000.00	\$82,000.00	\$330,000.00	\$330,000.00
0013	4K10PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 10	\$472,750.00	\$472,750.00	\$600,000.00	\$600,000.00	\$388,000.00	\$388,000.00	\$993,000.00	\$993,000.00
0014	4K11PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 11	\$142,750.00	\$142,750.00	\$175,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$101,000.00	\$101,000.00	\$352,000.00	\$352,000.00
0015	4K12PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 12	\$482,750.00	\$482,750.00	\$650,000.00	\$650,000.00	\$351,000.00	\$351,000.00	\$342,000.00	\$342,000.00
0016	4K13PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 13	\$125,000.00	\$125,000.00	\$140,000.00	\$140,000.00	\$54,000.00	\$54,000.00	\$265,000.00	\$265,000.00
0017	4K14PSW	1	L.S.	Painting Weathering Steelwork No. 14	\$175,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$140,000.00	\$140,000.00	\$55,000.00	\$55,000.00	\$198,000.00	\$198,000.00
0018	4K01RPS	1	L.S.	Repainting Steelwork No. 1	\$250,000.00	\$250,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$72,000.00	\$72,000.00	\$397,000.00	\$397,000.00
0019	4K02RPS	1	L.S.	Repainting Steelwork No. 2	\$1,700,000.00	\$1,700,000.00	\$2,000,000.00	\$2,000,000.00	\$2,152,000.00	\$2,152,000.00	\$3,678,522.00	\$3,678,522.00
0020	4K00CEW	1	L.S.	Containment, Environmental and Worker Protection	\$260,000.00	\$260,000.00	\$1,073,500.00	\$1,073,500.00	\$2,392,000.00	\$2,392,000.00	\$247,000.00	\$247,000.00
0021	4K03RSP	1	L.S.	Temporary Storage and Recycling/ Disposal of Hazardous Surface Preparation Waste	\$35,000.00	\$35,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$65,000.00	\$65,000.00
0022	4L05CBD	750	L.F.	Clean Bridge Drainage System	\$18.50	\$13,875.00	\$10.00	\$7,500.00	\$18.75	\$14,062.50	\$12.50	\$9,375.00
0023	4Q60J25	310	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type 25W	\$175.00	\$54,250.00	\$30.00	\$9,300.00	\$140.40	\$43,524.00	\$150.00	\$46,500.00
0024	4Q60J30	65	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type 30W	\$225.00	\$14,625.00	\$50.00	\$3,250.00	\$151.20	\$9,828.00	\$175.00	\$11,375.00
0025	4Q60J40	90	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type 40W	\$315.00	\$28,350.00	\$60.00	\$5,400.00	\$151.20	\$13,608.00	\$200.00	\$18,000.00
0026	4Q60J50	220	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type 50W	\$305.00	\$67,100.00	\$80.00	\$17,600.00	\$162.00	\$35,640.00	\$250.00	\$55,000.00
0027	4Q60J65	345	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type 65W	\$295.00	\$101,775.00	\$100.00	\$34,500.00	\$199.20	\$68,724.00	\$300.00	\$103,500.00
0028	4Q60J75	270	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type 75W	\$185.00	\$49,950.00	\$125.00	\$33,750.00	\$199.20	\$53,784.00	\$350.00	\$94,500.00
0029	4Q4J100	30	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type IV-100	\$350.00	\$10,500.00	\$50.00	\$1,500.00	\$258.00	\$7,740.00	\$250.00	\$7,500.00
0030	4Q4J150	30	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type IV-150	\$350.00	\$10,500.00	\$60.00	\$1,800.00	\$285.60	\$8,568.00	\$300.00	\$9,000.00
0031	4Q4J200	20	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type IV-200	\$495.00	\$9,900.00	\$70.00	\$1,400.00	\$319.20	\$6,384.00	\$400.00	\$8,000.00
0032	4Q4J250	20	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type IV-250	\$495.00	\$9,900.00	\$80.00	\$1,600.00	\$330.00	\$6,600.00	\$500.00	\$10,000.00
0033	4Q4J300	95	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type IV-300	\$245.00	\$23,275.00	\$90.00	\$8,550.00	\$228.00	\$21,660.00	\$350.00	\$33,250.00
0034	4Q4J400	30	L.F.	Joint Seal Replacement, Type IV-400	\$225.00	\$6,750.00	\$100.00	\$3,000.00	\$315.60	\$9,468.00	\$400.00	\$12,000.00
0035	4R25BSR	1650	S.F.	Substructure Membrane Waterproofing	\$22.00	\$36,300.00	\$20.00	\$33,000.00	\$17.25	\$28,462.50	\$11.50	\$18,975.00
0036	4R11RSS	2	Each	Repair of Structural Steel, Type A	\$3,250.00	\$6,500.00	\$2,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$5,244.00	\$10,488.00	\$1,300.00	\$2,600.00
0037	4R12RSS	12	Each	Repair of Structural Steel, Type B	\$1,350.00	\$16,200.00	\$3,000.00	\$36,000.00	\$5,244.00	\$62,928.00	\$1,500.00	\$18,000.00
0038	4R13RSS	8	Each	Repair of Structural Steel, Type C	\$1,650.00	\$13,200.00	\$3,000.00	\$24,000.00	\$5,244.00	\$41,952.00	\$2,000.00	\$16,000.00
0039	4ZN01REP	96	Each	Steel Repair - Type 1	\$900.00	\$86,400.00	\$500.00	\$48,000.00	\$3,960.00	\$380,160.00	\$135.00	\$12,960.00
0040	4ZN02REP	36	Each	Steel Repair - Type 2	\$1,125.00	\$40,500.00	\$500.00	\$18,000.00	\$3,960.00	\$142,560.00	\$475.00	\$17,100.00
0041	4ZN03REP	35	Each	Steel Repair - Type 3	\$650.00	\$22,750.00	\$500.00	\$17,500.00	\$3,960.00	\$138,600.00	\$550.00	\$19,250.00
0042	4ZN04REP	14	Each	Steel Repair - Type 4	\$900.00	\$12,600.00	\$500.00	\$7,000.00	\$3,960.00	\$55,440.00	\$1,000.00	\$14,000.00
0043	4ZN05REP	35	Each	Steel Repair - Type 5	\$750.00	\$26,250.00	\$500.00	\$17,500.00	\$3,960.00	\$138,600.00	\$400.00	\$14,000.00
0044	4ZN06REP	2	Each	Steel Repair - Type 6	\$3,075.00	\$6,150.00	\$500.00	\$1,000.00	\$3,960.00	\$7,920.00	\$2,000.00	\$4,000.00
0045	4C01BBR	30	Each	Box Beam Retrofit, Type 1	\$1,750.00	\$52,500.00	\$500.00	\$15,000.00	\$3,720.00	\$111,600.00	\$2,500.00	\$75,000.00
0046	4C02BBR	105	Each	Box Beam Retrofit, Type 2	\$850.00	\$89,250.00	\$500.00	\$52,500.00	\$1,092.00	\$114,660.00	\$1,000.00	\$105,000.00
0047	4R01RPL	70	Each	Replace Rivets with High Strength Bolts	\$100.00	\$7,000.00	\$60.00	\$4,200.00	\$366.00	\$25,620.00	\$200.00	\$14,000.00
0048	4QFAE0B	1	C.P.	Force Account for Emergency and Routine Bridge Repairs (NO-BID)	\$300,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$300,000.00
0049	4R40BPR	170	L.F.	Blast Plate Removal	\$125.00	\$21,250.00	\$100.00	\$17,000.00	\$243.60	\$41,412.00	\$115.00	\$19,550.00
0050	5J00004	30	Each	Beam Guide Rail Blockout	\$109.00	\$3,270.00	\$10.00	\$300.00	\$130.80	\$3,924.00	\$109.00	\$3,270.00
0051	5J01RBG	238	L.F.	Removal of Beam Guide Rail	\$6.00	\$1,428.00	\$10.00	\$2,380.00	\$7.20	\$1,713.60	\$6.00	\$1,428.00
0052	5J01RSG	238	L.F.	Reset Beam Guide Rail	\$225.00	\$53,550.00	\$10.00	\$2,380.00	\$270.00	\$64,260.00	\$225.00	\$53,550.00
0053	5J51BGE	75	L.F.	Beam Guide Rail Element	\$8.00	\$600.00	\$10.00	\$750.00	\$9.60	\$720.00	\$8.00	\$600.00
0054	5J54BGP	6	Each	Beam Guide Rail Post	\$40.00	\$240.00	\$50.00	\$300.00	\$48.00	\$288.00	\$40.00	\$240.00
0055	5Q01FAL	1	L.S.	Furnish Field Office, Type A	\$43,000.00	\$43,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$18,000.00	\$18,000.00
0056	5Q02MFA	21	Month	Maintain Field Office, Type A	\$1,650.00	\$34,650.00	\$1,500.00	\$31,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$52,500.00	\$2,750.00	\$57,750.00
0057	5ZMFASOB	1	C.P.	Force Account for Snow Removal (NO-BID)	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00
0058	8A01MPT	1	L.S.	Furnishing Traffic Control Devices	\$34,000.00	\$34,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$78,750.00	\$78,750.00

Base Line Item Detail				Anka Painting Company, Inc.		Allied Painting, Inc.		Corcon, Inc.		Atsalis Brothers Painting Company		
Item No.	Unit Code	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	RATE	AMOUNT	RATE	AMOUNT	RATE	AMOUNT	RATE	AMOUNT
0059	8A06MPT	10	Barrel	Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators	\$650.00	\$6,500.00	\$100.00	\$1,000.00	\$500.00	\$5,000.00	\$3,800.00	\$38,000.00
0060	8A07MPT	2	Each	Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators	\$6,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$100.00	\$200.00	\$9,000.00	\$18,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$90,000.00
0061	N8A0001	1060	L.F.	Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier	\$60.00	\$63,600.00	\$1.00	\$1,060.00	\$35.00	\$37,100.00	\$42.00	\$44,520.00
0062	8B17MPT	4	Each	Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator	\$15,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$37,500.00	\$150,000.00
0063	8B18MPT	2	Each	Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator	\$7,500.00	\$15,000.00	\$100.00	\$200.00	\$40,000.00	\$80,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$14,000.00
0064	8B19MPT	200	M.H.	Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use	\$200.00	\$40,000.00	\$1.00	\$200.00	\$150.00	\$30,000.00	\$145.00	\$29,000.00
0065	8B15MPT	200	M.H.	Traffic Protection Patrol	\$50.00	\$10,000.00	\$50.00	\$10,000.00	\$75.00	\$15,000.00	\$210.00	\$42,000.00
0066	8B31MPT	1	L.S.	Maintenance and Protection of Traffic	\$70,000.00	\$70,000.00	\$403,000.00	\$403,000.00	\$150,000.00	\$150,000.00	\$507,100.00	\$507,100.00
0067	8C21MLR	1	L.S.	Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 1	\$125,000.00	\$125,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$225,000.00	\$225,000.00
0068	8C22MLR	1	L.S.	Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 2	\$150,000.00	\$150,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$410,000.00	\$410,000.00
0069	8CPTDOB	1	L.S.	Police Traffic Directors (NO-BID)	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00
0070	8D60MRR	1	L.S.	Railroad Reimbursement Costs (This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum item for this contract. The Lump Sum price is \$65,000. Enter a Unit Price of \$65,000 as your bid for this item.)	\$65,000.00	\$65,000.00	\$65,000.00	\$65,000.00	\$65,000.00	\$65,000.00	\$65,000.00	\$65,000.00
Base Total						\$9,105,000.00		\$10,499,620.00		\$10,592,498.60		\$14,869,077.00