Base Line Item Detail A.P.S. Contracting Inc. Alna Construction Corp. M & M Construction Co. Dobco Inc. Hall Building Corp. A. P. Construction, Inc. Intercontinental Construction Contracting
Item No. Unit Code QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT RATE AMOUNT
0001 1DO1LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $26,550.00 $26,550.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $240,000.00 $240,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00
0002 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $37,170.00 $37,170.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $1,100,000.00 $1,100,000.00 $375,000.00 $375,000.00
0003 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $7,965.00 $7,965.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
0004 1HFPOB 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
0005 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $215,000.00 $215,000.00 $228,330.00 $228,330.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $270,000.00 $270,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $58,000.00 $58,000.00
0006 2A06CAG 4 Each Sealing of Abandoned Well $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $2,655.00 $10,620.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $850.00 $3,400.00 $1,300.00 $5,200.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00
0007 2A08CAG 4 Each Monitoring Well $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $4,610.00 $18,440.00 $2,182.41 $8,729.64 $8,500.00 $34,000.00 $1,750.00 $7,000.00 $2,600.00 $10,400.00 $1,400.00 $5,600.00
0008 2B02REX 8250 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $25.00 $206,250.00 $9.50 $78,375.00 $10.09 $83,242.50 $10.00 $82,500.00 $11.40 $94,050.00 $20.00 $165,000.00 $18.00 $148,500.00
0009 2B10CPR 279 S.Y. Removal of Concrete Pavement $10.00 $2,790.00 $45.00 $12,555.00 $47.79 $13,333.41 $45.00 $12,555.00 $54.00 $15,066.00 $150.00 $41,850.00 $9.00 $2,511.00
0010 2C01EMB 3410 C.Y. Embankment, Common $25.00 $85,250.00 $20.00 $68,200.00 $21.24 $72,428.40 $18.00 $61,380.00 $19.00 $64,790.00 $18.00 $61,380.00 $23.00 $78,430.00
0011 2C02EMB 4071 c.. Embankment, Grade A $30.00 $122,130.00 $26.00 $105,846.00 $27.61 $112,400.31 $25.00 $101,775.00 $25.00 $101,775.00 $19.00 $77,349.00 $25.00 $101,775.00
0012 2E01CAL 292 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate Layer $40.00 $11,680.00 $60.00 $17,520.00 $63.72 $18,606.24 $60.00 $17,520.00 $66.00 $19,272.00 $63.00 $18,396.00 $38.00 $11,096.00
0013 2EOQ01FEX 3300 c.. Foundation Excavation $25.00 $82,500.00 $14.50 $47,850.00 $15.40 $50,820.00 $17.50 $57,750.00 $15.00 $49,500.00 $14.00 $46,200.00 $26.00 $85,800.00
0014 2H00007 1167 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $5.00 $5,835.00 $6.00 $7,002.00 $6.48 $7,562.16 $4.00 $4,668.00 $5.60 $6,535.20 $5.00 $5,835.00 $8.00 $9,336.00
0015 2H00023 548 L.F. Silt Fence on Pavement $10.00 $5,480.00 $21.00 $11,508.00 $22.30 $12,220.40 $5.00 $2,740.00 $21.65 $11,864.20 $8.00 $4,384.00 $5.00 $2,740.00
0016 2H00021 1 Each Concrete Washout Facility $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $1,274.40 $1,274.40 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,400.00 $3,400.00
0017 2H40TEC 6 Each Inlet Filters $150.00 $900.00 $125.00 $750.00 $132.75 $796.50 $250.00 $1,500.00 $140.00 $840.00 $250.00 $1,500.00 $1,600.00 $9,600.00
0018 2H45TEC 128 Ton Construction Driveway $150.00 $19,200.00 $44.00 $5,632.00 $46.73 $5,981.44 $50.00 $6,400.00 $50.00 $6,400.00 $35.00 $4,480.00 $100.00 $12,800.00
0019 3A07ABC 8899 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6.5" Thick $10.00 $88,990.00 $8.25 $73,416.75 $8.76 $77,955.24 $15.00 $133,485.00 $8.25 $73,416.75 $9.00 $80,091.00 $15.00 $133,485.00
0020 3B21SUP 3590 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 25H 64 Base Course $75.00 $269,250.00 $75.00 $269,250.00 $91.00 $326,690.00 $103.00 $369,770.00 $91.00 $326,690.00 $107.00 $384,130.00 $105.00 $376,950.00
0021 3B24SUP 1409 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 19H 76 Intermediate Course $80.00 $112,720.00 $86.00 $121,174.00 $101.00 $142,309.00 $107.00 $150,763.00 $100.00 $140,900.00 $114.00 $160,626.00 $114.00 $160,626.00
0022 3B25SUP 965 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5H 76 Surface Course $80.00 $77,200.00 $86.00 $82,990.00 $106.00 $102,290.00 $107.00 $103,255.00 $110.00 $106,150.00 $120.00 $115,800.00 $114.00 $110,010.00
0023 3B26TAC 636 GAL Tack Coat $3.00 $1,908.00 $10.00 $6,360.00 $5.00 $3,180.00 $9.00 $5,724.00 $6.00 $3,816.00 $4.00 $2,544.00 $6.00 $3,816.00
0024 3BAPAOB 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 5000.00 5000.00
0025 3D08PCP 402 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement, 8" Thick $70.00 $28,140.00 $73.00 $29,346.00 $77.53 $31,167.06 $50.00 $20,100.00 $76.00 $30,552.00 $125.00 $50,250.00 125.00 50250.00
0026 3D01SCS 1 Each Oil-Water Separator Concrete Slab $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,372.00 $6,372.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $6,560.00 $6,560.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 6000.00 6000.00
0027 3E16PMR 8778 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 6" Depth $10.00 $87,780.00 $8.70 $76,368.60 $9.24 $81,108.72 $10.00 $87,780.00 $9.60 $84,268.80 $11.00 $96,558.00 16.00 140448.00
0028 4A10RFS 500 LB Reinforcement Steel $20.00 $10,000.00 $3.00 $1,500.00 $3.19 $1,595.00 $4.00 $2,000.00 $3.00 $1,500.00 $3.00 $1,500.00 3.00 1500.00
0029 4E00063 4550 L.F. Driving HP 10 X 57 Steel Piles $15.00 $68,250.00 $8.75 $39,812.50 $19.12 $86,996.00 $12.00 $54,600.00 $20.00 $91,000.00 $23.00 $104,650.00 85.00 386750.00
0030 4E00064 4550 L.F. Furnishing HP 10 X 57 Steel Piles $33.00 $150,150.00 $29.00 $131,950.00 $26.55 $120,802.50 $31.00 $141,050.00 $27.50 $125,125.00 $31.00 $141,050.00 45.00 204750.00
0031 4E00065 80 L.F. HP 10 X 57 Test Piles $140.00 $11,200.00 $137.00 $10,960.00 $45.67 $3,653.60 $180.00 $14,400.00 $47.30 $3,784.00 $55.00 $4,400.00 200.00 16000.00
0032 4E00066 133 Each Point Reinforcement for HP 10 X 57 Steel Piles $130.00 $17,290.00 $100.00 $13,300.00 $95.58 $12,712.14 $150.00 $19,950.00 $100.00 $13,300.00 $115.00 $15,295.00 625.00 83125.00
0033 4EO1EDP 1 L.S. Furnishing Equipment for Driving Piles $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $38,600.00 $38,600.00 $27,612.00 $27,612.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $33,000.00 $33,000.00 20000.00 20000.00
0034 4E01PLT 4 Each Dynamic Pile Load Tests $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $1,375.00 $5,500.00 $2,124.00 $8,496.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,200.00 $8,800.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 28000.00 112000.00
0035 4E000113 20 Each Splices for HP 10 X 57 Steel Piles $400.00 $8,000.00 $350.00 $7,000.00 $249.57 $4,991.40 $350.00 $7,000.00 $260.00 $5,200.00 $300.00 $6,000.00 800.00 16000.00
0036 5B06PVC 705 L.F. 6" PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $55.00 $38,775.00 $36.00 $25,380.00 $38.23 $26,952.15 $75.00 $52,875.00 $36.25 $25,556.25 $50.00 $35,250.00 44.00 31020.00
0037 5B12RC5 152 L.F. 12" Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class V $60.00 $9,120.00 $38.00 $5,776.00 $40.36 $6,134.72 $90.00 $13,680.00 $36.75 $5,586.00 $70.00 $10,640.00 40.00 6080.00
0038 5C40RSF Each Reset Frame $300.00 $600.00 $400.00 $800.00 $424.80 $849.60 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $450.00 $900.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 1500.00 3000.00
0039 5CO01ND2 3 Each Inlet, Type D2 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,655.00 $7,965.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,750.00 $8,250.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 2500.00 7500.00
0040 5C10ED2 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using Existing Grate and Frame $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $1,593.00 $3,186.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $1,650.00 $3,300.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 2300.00 4600.00
0041 5D10INC c.. Incidental Concrete $500.00 $1,000.00 $900.00 $1,800.00 $955.80 $1,911.60 $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,080.00 $2,160.00 $300.00 $600.00 1000.00 2000.00
0042 5F01VCA 513 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $25.00 $12,825.00 $18.00 $9,234.00 $19.12 $9,808.56 $28.00 $14,364.00 $18.90 $9,695.70 $30.00 $15,390.00 23.00 11799.00
0043 5I01SNP 8 S.F. Sign Panels $30.00 $240.00 $60.00 $480.00 $63.72 $509.76 $38.50 $308.00 $66.00 $528.00 $31.00 $248.00 50.00 400.00
0044 5105SPP 46 L.F. U-channel Post $30.00 $1,380.00 $15.00 $690.00 $15.93 $732.78 $18.50 $851.00 $16.50 $759.00 $190.00 $8,740.00 45.00 2070.00
0045 5J52ABG 6 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $1,000.00 $6,000.00 $900.00 $5,400.00 $531.00 $3,186.00 $1,050.00 $6,300.00 $945.00 $5,670.00 $900.00 $5,400.00 1000.00 6000.00
0046 5J52BGR 509 L.F. Beam Guide Rall $40.00 $20,360.00 $20.75 $10,561.75 $42.48 $21,622.32 $19.00 $9,671.00 $21.80 $11,096.20 $22.00 $11,198.00 20.00 10180.00
0047 5K00021 611 L.F. Temporary Fencing, 96" High $5.00 $3,055.00 $33.00 $20,163.00 $5.31 $3,244.41 $24.00 $14,664.00 $6.60 $4,032.60 $22.00 $13,442.00 7.00 4277.00
0048 5K00052 2 Each Pedestrian Gate, Type Il, 72" High, 6' Wide $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $995.00 $1,990.00 $1,056.69 $2,113.38 $650.00 $1,300.00 $1,045.00 $2,090.00 $1,300.00 $2,600.00 1500.00 3000.00
0049 5K00037 2 Each Vehicular Gate, Type Il, 96" High, 12' Wide $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,490.00 $2,980.00 $1,582.38 $3,164.76 $1,650.00 $3,300.00 $1,565.00 $3,130.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00 2500.00 5000.00
0050 5K72CLB 221 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type Il, 72" High $25.00 $5,525.00 $48.95 $10,817.95 $51.98 $11,487.58 $50.00 $11,050.00 $51.40 $11,359.40 $40.00 $8,840.00 48.00 10608.00
0051 5K04PGT 1 Each Pedestrian Gate, Type I, 96" High, 4' Wide $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,115.00 $1,115.00 $1,184.13 $1,184.13 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,170.00 $1,170.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 2400.00 2400.00
0052 5K00050 1 Each Vehicular Gate, Type Il, 72" High, 30' Wide $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,535.00 $3,535.00 $3,754.17 $3,754.17 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $3,715.00 $3,715.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 5000.00 5000.00
0053 5N04PCS 263 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $75.00 $19,725.00 $52.00 $13,676.00 $55.22 $14,522.86 $75.00 $19,725.00 $51.20 $13,465.60 $68.00 $17,884.00 75.00 19725.00
0054 5NO7CHR 1 Each Concrete Handicap Ramp $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,850.00 $1,850.00 $1,964.70 $1,964.70 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,760.00 $1,760.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 5000.00 5000.00
0055 5P21LLS 1471 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long Life, Thermoplastic $5.00 $7,355.00 $1.35 $1,985.85 $1.43 $2,103.53 $2.00 $2,942.00 $1.42 $2,088.82 $3.00 $4,413.00 3.00 4413.00
0056 5P33LLM 35 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long Life, Thermoplastic $20.00 $700.00 $5.50 $192.50 $5.83 $204.05 $5.00 $175.00 $5.78 $202.30 $8.00 $280.00 15.00 525.00
0057 5Q01FOE 1 Unit Furnish Field Office, Type E $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $5,310.00 $5,310.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 1600.00 1600.00
0058 5Q02MFE 18 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type E $2,000.00 $36,000.00 $2,000.00 $36,000.00 $265.50 $4,779.00 $500.00 $9,000.00 $3,504.00 $63,072.00 $1,300.00 $23,400.00 300.00 5400.00
0059 5VO1PIT 10 Each Test Pits $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $350.00 $3,500.00 $371.70 $3,717.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $300.00 $3,000.00 $1,300.00 $13,000.00 900.00 9000.00
0060 5W01CDV 595 L.F. Cleaning Existing Storm Drain, 12" to 48" Diameter $25.00 $14,875.00 $26.00 $15,470.00 $27.61 $16,427.95 $30.00 $17,850.00 $22.00 $13,090.00 $9.00 $5,355.00 20.00 11900.00
0061 5710066 285 L.F. 4" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $80.00 $22,800.00 $32.00 $9,120.00 $33.98 $9,684.30 $80.00 $22,800.00 $31.50 $8,977.50 $30.00 $8,550.00 40.00 11400.00
0062 5710032 130 L.F. 6" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $80.00 $10,400.00 $37.00 $4,810.00 $39.29 $5,107.70 $90.00 $11,700.00 $33.35 $4,335.50 $33.00 $4,290.00 48.00 6240.00
0063 5710034 204 L.F. 6" Plastic Gas Main $200.00 $40,800.00 $45.00 $9,180.00 $47.79 $9,749.16 $150.00 $30,600.00 $48.00 $9,792.00 $76.00 $15,504.00 54.00 11016.00
0064 5710069 4 Each Connection To Existing Sanitary Manhole $500.00 $2,000.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $2,655.00 $10,620.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,625.00 $10,500.00 $2,400.00 $9,600.00 2000.00 8000.00
0065 5710205 Unit Manhole, Sanitary Sewer (4' Diameter) $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,124.00 $2,124.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 3000.00 3000.00
0066 5710060 3 Each Curb Stop And Box $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $275.00 $825.00 $292.05 $876.15 $500.00 $1,500.00 $265.00 $795.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 1800.00 5400.00
0067 5710061 252 L.F. 8" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 52 $100.00 $25,200.00 $65.00 $16,380.00 $69.03 $17,395.56 $100.00 $25,200.00 $70.00 $17,640.00 $70.00 $17,640.00 80.00 20160.00
0068 5ZL01FHA Each Fire Hydrant Assemblies $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,250.00 $4,250.00 $4,513.50 $4,513.50 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 3500.00 3500.00
0069 5710314 Each Post Mounted Fire Department Connection $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,124.00 $2,124.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,840.00 $1,840.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 6800.00 6800.00
0070 5710284 Each Post Indicator Valve $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $1,327.50 $1,327.50 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,210.00 $1,210.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 1400.00 1400.00
0071 5710288 506 L.F. 4" Ductile Iron Water Pipe $70.00 $35,420.00 $58.00 $29,348.00 $61.60 $31,169.60 $100.00 $50,600.00 $53.00 $26,818.00 $62.00 $31,372.00 58.00 29348.00
0072 5ZL.03DP 484 L.F. 3" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 52 $70.00 $33,880.00 $65.00 $31,460.00 $69.03 $33,410.52 $100.00 $48,400.00 $70.00 $33,880.00 $90.00 $43,560.00 50.00 24200.00
0073 5ZL06DP 484 L.F. 6" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 52 $75.00 $36,300.00 $60.00 $29,040.00 $63.72 $30,840.48 $105.00 $50,820.00 $62.00 $30,008.00 $64.00 $30,976.00 68.00 32912.00
0074 5710313 1 Each Freeze Protection Enclosure $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $19,700.00 $19,700.00 $20,921.40 $20,921.40 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 4400.00 4400.00
0075 9A01UBW 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work $3,850,000.00 $3,850,000.00 $4,698,286.00 $4,698,286.00 $4,064,000.00 $4,064,000.00 $4,693,960.00 $4,693,960.00 $4,900,000.00 $4,900,000.00 $2,100,000.00 $2,100,000.00 6188000.00 6188000.00
0076 9A03UBW 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work $430,000.00 $430,000.00 $441,000.00 $441,000.00 $442,000.00 $442,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $465,000.00 $465,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 488000.00 488000.00
0077 9A04UBW 1 L.S. Building Electric Work $2,050,000.00 $2,050,000.00 $1,143,000.00 $1,143,000.00 $2,066,064.00 $2,066,064.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,100,000.00 $1,100,000.00 $2,200,000.00 $2,200,000.00 1988000.00 1988000.00
0078 9A44UBW 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work $800,000.00 $800,000.00 $1,146,000.00 $1,146,000.00 $1,371,328.14 $1,371,328.14 $1,050,000.00 $1,050,000.00 $1,460,000.00 $1,460,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 1167000.00 1167000.00
0079 9A45UBW 1 L.S. Building Structural Work $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $575,000.00 $575,000.00 $559,650.00 $559,650.00 $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $555,000.00 $555,000.00 $2,225,000.00 $2,225,000.00 2046619.00 2046619.00
0080 9A00130 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Architectural Work Allowances (NO-BID) $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 200000.00 200000.00
0081 9A00131 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 100000.00 100000.00
0082 9A00132 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 50000.00 50000.00
0083 9A00146 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Plumbing Work Allowances (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 50000.00 50000.00
0084 9A00135 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Structural Work Allowances (NO-BID) $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 150000.00 $150,000.00
0085 5710261 1 L.S. Site Electrical & Communication Work $130,000.00 $130,000.00 $725,000.00 $725,000.00 $281,430.00 $281,430.00 $385,000.00 $385,000.00 $850,000.00 $850,000.00 $360,000.00 $360,000.00 218000.00 218000.00
0086 5700018 13980 | Ton Off-Site Disposal of ID-27 Waste $50.00 $699,000.00 $36.00 $503,280.00 $38.23 $534,455.40 $50.00 $699,000.00 $46.60 $651,468.00 $131.00 $1,831,380.00 30.00 419400.00
0087 5Z0OFAHOB 1 C.P. Force Account for Hazardous Regulated Material Handling (NO-BID) $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 250000.00 250000.00
0088 5Z0ROA0B 1 L.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 25000.00 25000.00
0089 5700012 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (1) $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $49,800.00 $49,800.00 $52,887.60 $52,887.60 $49,800.00 $49,800.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 25000.00 25000.00
0090 5700013 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (2) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $19,116.00 $19,116.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $64,000.00 $64,000.00 45000.00 45000.00
0091 5700027 52 Each Bollards $600.00 $31,200.00 $350.00 $18,200.00 $371.70 $19,328.40 $350.00 $18,200.00 $385.00 $20,020.00 $2,300.00 $119,600.00 780.00 40560.00




Base Line Item Detail
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M & M Construction Co.
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Intercontinental Construction Contracting

0092 9A25UBW 1 Each 5 Ton Top Running Overhead Crane - Garage Bay $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $86,000.00 $86,000.00 $85,491.00 $85,491.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $126,000.00 $126,000.00 $95,500.00 $95,500.00 35000.00 35000.00
0093 9A26UBW 1 Each 5 Ton Top Running Overhead Crane - Welding Bay $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $76,000.00 $76,000.00 $85,491.00 $85,491.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $132,000.00 $132,000.00 $95,500.00 $95,500.00 31000.00 31000.00
0094 9A27UBW 4 Each Pneumatic Pump - Oil & Lubricants $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $6,007.73 $24,030.92 $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,500.00 $18,000.00 $6,000.00 $24,000.00 34000.00 136000.00
0095 9A28UBW 1 Each Pneumatic Pump - Grease $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $16,404.71 $16,404.71 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 34000.00 34000.00
0096 9A30UBW 12 Each Overhead Reels - Oil & Lubricants $4,000.00 $48,000.00 $4,000.00 $48,000.00 $4,730.41 $56,764.92 $1,000.00 $12,000.00 $4,200.00 $50,400.00 $1,000.00 $12,000.00 10000.00 120000.00
0097 9A31UBW 4 Each Overhead Reels - Compressed Air & Water $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $2,950.50 $11,802.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,075.00 $8,300.00 $1,475.00 $5,900.00 10000.00 40000.00
0098 9A32UBW 8 Each Overhead Reels - Electric Trouble Light $2,000.00 $16,000.00 $1,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,026.30 $16,210.40 $500.00 $4,000.00 $1,635.00 $13,080.00 $750.00 $6,000.00 6500.00 52000.00
0099 9A33UBW 2 Each Large Vehicle Lift $200,000.00 $400,000.00 $78,000.00 $156,000.00 $82,836.00 $165,672.00 $189,000.00 $378,000.00 $140,000.00 $280,000.00 $92,000.00 $184,000.00 35000.00 70000.00
0100 9A34UBW 1 Each Small Vehicle Lift $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $13,806.00 $13,806.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 19000.00 19000.00
0101 9A64UBW 1 Each Car Wash System $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $222,631.31 $222,631.31 $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $224,000.00 $224,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 12000.00 12000.00
0102 9A65UBW 1 Each Water Reclaim / Treatment System $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $139,000.00 $139,000.00 $285,678.00 $285,678.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $146,000.00 $146,000.00 $165,000.00 $165,000.00 35000.00 35000.00
0103 9A66UBW 1 Each AST 820 Gallon $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $11,164.81 $11,164.81 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $18,500.00 $18,500.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 16400.00 16400.00
0104 9A67UBW 1 Each Fluid Management System $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $12,839.58 $12,839.58 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 15000.00 15000.00
0105 7CO1TOP 1110 S.Y. Topsoil $6.00 $6,660.00 $6.50 $7,215.00 $6.37 $7,070.70 $15.00 $16,650.00 $6.85 $7,603.50 $8.00 $8,880.00 7.00 7770.00
0106 7DO3SED 1110 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $2.00 $2,220.00 $1.40 $1,554.00 $6.90 $7,659.00 $5.00 $5,550.00 $1.40 $1,554.00 $2.00 $2,220.00 6.00 6660.00
0107 9A00157 1 Each Wall Mounted Funnel $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,650.35 $1,650.35 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 2500.00 2500.00
0108 9A00158 2 Each Containment Pallet $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $600.00 $1,200.00 $1,062.00 $2,124.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $465.00 $930.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 1600.00 3200.00

Base Total $12,808,808.00 $13,086,000.90 $13,349,411.18 $13,965,800.00 $14,764,183.32 $16,854,520.00 $17,268,680.00




