
Base Line Item Detail J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc. & Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. A Joint VentureCarbro Constructors Corp. Ferreira Construction Co. Inc. Northeast Remsco Construction, Inc. D'annunzio & Sons, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $305,009.66 $305,009.66 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $201,888.25 $201,888.25
2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $648,000.00 $648,000.00 $618,000.00 $618,000.00 $742,000.00 $742,000.00 $1,400,000.00 $1,400,000.00 $780,000.00 $780,000.00
3 1GSCH0B 1 L.S. Progress Schedule (NO-BID) $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00
4 1HFP0B 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00
5 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $325,000.00 $325,000.00 $72,715.48 $72,715.48 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00
6 N2B0001 80 L.F. Removal of Existing Barrier $75.00 $6,000.00 $23.00 $1,840.00 $93.15 $7,452.00 $60.00 $4,800.00 $150.00 $12,000.00
7 2BETU0B 1 L.S. Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (NO-BID) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
8 2B02REX 3101 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $77.00 $238,777.00 $33.00 $102,333.00 $51.68 $160,259.68 $30.00 $93,030.00 $40.00 $124,040.00
9 2C01EMB 2571 C.Y. Embankment, Common $45.00 $115,695.00 $33.00 $84,843.00 $4.96 $12,752.16 $10.00 $25,710.00 $30.00 $77,130.00
10 2C02EMB 3167 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $45.00 $142,515.00 $50.00 $158,350.00 $50.63 $160,345.21 $28.00 $88,676.00 $40.00 $126,680.00
11 2C04EMB 79 C.Y. Porous Fill $50.00 $3,950.00 $54.00 $4,266.00 $88.74 $7,010.46 $105.00 $8,295.00 $130.00 $10,270.00
12 2D01DAM 1 L.S. Cofferdam No. 1 $850,000.00 $850,000.00 $335,000.00 $335,000.00 $1,052,492.68 $1,052,492.68 $550,000.00 $550,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00
13 2D02DAM 1 L.S. Cofferdam No. 2 $850,000.00 $850,000.00 $535,000.00 $535,000.00 $1,026,160.41 $1,026,160.41 $550,000.00 $550,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,300,000.00
14 2E01FEX 830 C.Y. Foundataion Excavation $75.00 $62,250.00 $65.00 $53,950.00 $101.08 $83,896.40 $90.00 $74,700.00 $130.00 $107,900.00
15 2G12A06 6 Ton Riprap Stone Aprons, 12" Thick, D50=6" $75.00 $450.00 $80.00 $480.00 $148.19 $889.14 $325.00 $1,950.00 $400.00 $2,400.00
16 2H00007 2923 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $8.00 $23,384.00 $10.00 $29,230.00 $7.10 $20,753.30 $13.00 $37,999.00 $8.00 $23,384.00
17 2H00016 27 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $200.00 $5,400.00 $50.00 $1,350.00 $259.22 $6,998.94 $730.00 $19,710.00 $200.00 $5,400.00
18 2H05DSC 135 KGAL Watering $10.00 $1,350.00 $20.00 $2,700.00 $159.41 $21,520.35 $9.50 $1,282.50 $110.00 $14,850.00
19 2H21TEC 190 Ton Temporary Stone, Grade B $50.00 $9,500.00 $80.00 $15,200.00 $57.04 $10,837.60 $60.00 $11,400.00 $60.00 $11,400.00
20 2J01DES 1 L.S. Demolition of Existing Structures $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $800,000.00 $800,000.00 $560,000.00 $560,000.00 $700,000.00 $700,000.00
21 2M00003 1 L.S. Vibration and Movement Monitoring $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $41,059.00 $41,059.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00
22 3A06ABC 2524 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6" Thick $8.00 $20,192.00 $15.00 $37,860.00 $14.03 $35,411.72 $10.00 $25,240.00 $15.00 $37,860.00
23 3A07ABC 4707 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6.5" Thick $10.00 $47,070.00 $17.00 $80,019.00 $15.20 $71,546.40 $9.00 $42,363.00 $15.00 $70,605.00
24 3BAPA0B 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00
25 3B01PJA 5774 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $2.00 $11,548.00 $0.50 $2,887.00 $2.29 $13,222.46 $2.50 $14,435.00 $2.00 $11,548.00
26 3B21SUP 2098 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 25H 64 Base Course $115.00 $241,270.00 $115.00 $241,270.00 $132.45 $277,880.10 $111.00 $232,878.00 $120.00 $251,760.00
27 3B24SUP 1290 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 19H 76 Intermediate Course $120.00 $154,800.00 $120.00 $154,800.00 $138.81 $179,064.90 $117.00 $150,930.00 $125.00 $161,250.00
28 3B25SUP 1601 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5H 76 Surface Course $125.00 $200,125.00 $122.00 $195,322.00 $145.40 $232,785.40 $122.00 $195,322.00 $130.00 $208,130.00
29 3B26TAC 506 GAL Tack Coat $5.00 $2,530.00 $12.00 $6,072.00 $10.01 $5,065.06 $9.00 $4,554.00 $12.00 $6,072.00
30 3B41ABS 59 Ton HMA Bridge Surfacing $176.00 $10,384.00 $185.00 $10,915.00 $206.04 $12,156.36 $180.00 $10,620.00 $250.00 $14,750.00
31 3B42ASB 743 S.Y. Membrane Waterproofing $30.00 $22,290.00 $28.00 $20,804.00 $30.50 $22,661.50 $30.00 $22,290.00 $25.00 $18,575.00
32 3C01BRS 1314 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $40.00 $52,560.00 $25.00 $32,850.00 $38.86 $51,062.04 $47.00 $61,758.00 $25.00 $32,850.00
33 3D05APS 116 S.Y. Bridge Approach Slab $500.00 $58,000.00 $475.00 $55,100.00 $762.43 $88,441.88 $480.00 $55,680.00 $500.00 $58,000.00
34 3E50PMR 6453 S.Y. Surface Milling, 2" Average Depth $15.00 $96,795.00 $12.00 $77,436.00 $16.48 $106,345.44 $18.00 $116,154.00 $12.00 $77,436.00
35 4A01SEJ 50 L.F. Strip Seal Expansion Joints $400.00 $20,000.00 $400.00 $20,000.00 $589.75 $29,487.50 $450.00 $22,500.00 $800.00 $40,000.00
36 4A04STC 328 C.Y. Concrete In Footings $650.00 $213,200.00 $1,200.00 $393,600.00 $545.75 $179,006.00 $655.00 $214,840.00 $1,000.00 $328,000.00
37 4A10AAF 48 C.Y. Concrete in Abutments Above Footings $1,355.00 $65,040.00 $1,900.00 $91,200.00 $1,749.06 $83,954.88 $2,500.00 $120,000.00 $1,100.00 $52,800.00
38 4A10PAF 326 C.Y. Concrete in Piers Above Footings $1,425.00 $464,550.00 $1,500.00 $489,000.00 $899.00 $293,074.00 $1,460.00 $475,960.00 $1,400.00 $456,400.00
39 4A10RFS 101200 LB Reinforcement Steel $1.80 $182,160.00 $2.00 $202,400.00 $1.97 $199,364.00 $1.75 $177,100.00 $1.80 $182,160.00
40 4A10RWF 26 C.Y. Concrete in Retaining Walls Above Footings $2,230.00 $57,980.00 $1,600.00 $41,600.00 $2,870.12 $74,623.12 $2,300.00 $59,800.00 $1,300.00 $33,800.00
41 4A11RFS 150847 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $2.00 $301,694.00 $2.50 $377,117.50 $2.16 $325,829.52 $1.75 $263,982.25 $1.85 $279,066.95
42 4A15DGR 590 Each Drill and Grout Reinforcement Bars $38.00 $22,420.00 $20.00 $11,800.00 $26.45 $15,605.50 $62.00 $36,580.00 $50.00 $29,500.00
43 4A40RFS 108 Each Mechanical Coupler $75.00 $8,100.00 $25.00 $2,700.00 $41.06 $4,434.48 $65.00 $7,020.00 $100.00 $10,800.00
44 N4A0001 1688 S.Y. Sawcut Grooved Deck Surface $5.00 $8,440.00 $4.00 $6,752.00 $4.66 $7,866.08 $3.25 $5,486.00 $6.00 $10,128.00
45 4C01SSC 3914 Each Shear Connectors $4.50 $17,613.00 $5.00 $19,570.00 $5.13 $20,078.82 $6.50 $25,441.00 $5.00 $19,570.00
46 4C04HMR 3 Each HLMR Bearings, 400 Kips to 950 Kips, Type F $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,396.17 $10,188.51 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $8,000.00 $24,000.00
47 4C05HMR 3 Each HLMR Bearings, 400 Kips to 950 Kips, Type G $3,750.00 $11,250.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,396.17 $10,188.51 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $8,000.00 $24,000.00
48 4C05SSL 1 L.S. Structural Steel $1,825,000.00 $1,825,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,425,000.00 $1,425,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00
49 4C29HMR 6 Each HLMR Bearings, 200 Kips to 450 Kips, Type G $3,250.00 $19,500.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $3,396.17 $20,377.02 $15,000.00 $90,000.00 $8,000.00 $48,000.00
50 4D22NTT 10100 FBM Furnish And Place New Treated Timber Above MLW $40.00 $404,000.00 $48.00 $484,800.00 $32.18 $325,018.00 $17.00 $171,700.00 $14.00 $141,400.00
51 4E00090 1502 L.F. Furnishing Treated Timber 12" Diameter Piles $25.00 $37,550.00 $24.00 $36,048.00 $17.38 $26,104.76 $17.25 $25,909.50 $30.00 $45,060.00
52 4E00092 1482 L.F. Driving 12" Diameter Timber Piles $50.00 $74,100.00 $49.00 $72,618.00 $36.55 $54,167.10 $30.00 $44,460.00 $60.00 $88,920.00
53 4E00093 8472 L.F. Furnishing HP 12x74 Steel Piles $45.00 $381,240.00 $44.00 $372,768.00 $62.62 $530,516.64 $46.50 $393,948.00 $48.00 $406,656.00
54 4E00094 6492 L.F. Driving HP 12x74 Steel Piles $18.00 $116,856.00 $26.00 $168,792.00 $39.55 $256,758.60 $21.00 $136,332.00 $48.00 $311,616.00
55 4E00095 113 Each Splices For HP 12x74 Steel Piles $100.00 $11,300.00 $475.00 $53,675.00 $377.50 $42,657.50 $325.00 $36,725.00 $1,500.00 $169,500.00
56 4E00101 113 Each Point Reinforcement for HP 12 X 74 Steel Piles $150.00 $16,950.00 $120.00 $13,560.00 $204.93 $23,157.09 $275.00 $31,075.00 $150.00 $16,950.00
57 4E00102 850 L.F. Driving HP 12 X 74 Steel Test Piles $65.00 $55,250.00 $85.00 $72,250.00 $89.88 $76,398.00 $88.00 $74,800.00 $80.00 $68,000.00
58 4E01EDP 1 L.S. Furnishing Equipment for Driving Piles $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $70,706.24 $70,706.24 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00
59 4E01PLT 12 Each Dynamic Pile Load Tests $2,000.00 $24,000.00 $5,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,996.03 $35,952.36 $1,250.00 $15,000.00 $2,600.00 $31,200.00
60 4H116LEB 12 Each Laminated Elastomeric Bearing, 8" X 10" $2,750.00 $33,000.00 $2,500.00 $30,000.00 $2,252.38 $27,028.56 $7,500.00 $90,000.00 $5,500.00 $66,000.00
61 4J01DAW 75 S.Y. Damp-proofing $50.00 $3,750.00 $100.00 $7,500.00 $88.71 $6,653.25 $76.00 $5,700.00 $50.00 $3,750.00
62 4L00004 36 L.F. 8" Drainage Pipe, (Fiberglass) $240.00 $8,640.00 $150.00 $5,400.00 $864.41 $31,118.76 $200.00 $7,200.00 $300.00 $10,800.00
63 4L07SCU 4 Each Scuppers $6,500.00 $26,000.00 $7,500.00 $30,000.00 $6,447.89 $25,791.56 $6,500.00 $26,000.00 $7,000.00 $28,000.00
64 4M06USP 116 S.Y. Stone Slope Protection $25.00 $2,900.00 $100.00 $11,600.00 $134.77 $15,633.32 $110.00 $12,760.00 $70.00 $8,120.00
65 4O01TSP 2540 S.F. Temporary Sheeting $40.00 $101,600.00 $75.00 $190,500.00 $101.86 $258,724.40 $60.00 $152,400.00 $60.00 $152,400.00
66 4Q00001 333 S.Y. Catches $575.00 $191,475.00 $1,500.00 $499,500.00 $488.19 $162,567.27 $75.00 $24,975.00 $400.00 $133,200.00
67 4Q08BDR 743 S.Y. Removal of Existing Surfacing $9.00 $6,687.00 $20.00 $14,860.00 $16.48 $12,244.64 $17.25 $12,816.75 $25.00 $18,575.00
68 4Q20H02 12 L.F. Headblock Repair, Type 2 $550.00 $6,600.00 $700.00 $8,400.00 $849.85 $10,198.20 $550.00 $6,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00
69 4Q30S01 360 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 1 $55.00 $19,800.00 $200.00 $72,000.00 $81.33 $29,278.80 $205.00 $73,800.00 $80.00 $28,800.00
70 4Q30S02 190 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 2 $75.00 $14,250.00 $225.00 $42,750.00 $104.51 $19,856.90 $260.00 $49,400.00 $230.00 $43,700.00
71 4Q30S06 80 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 6 $170.00 $13,600.00 $275.00 $22,000.00 $170.99 $13,679.20 $450.00 $36,000.00 $180.00 $14,400.00
72 4Q50J01 27 L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type 1 $600.00 $16,200.00 $400.00 $10,800.00 $192.62 $5,200.74 $460.00 $12,420.00 $280.00 $7,560.00
73 4Q50JF1 63 L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type F $1,150.00 $72,450.00 $700.00 $44,100.00 $310.55 $19,564.65 $460.00 $28,980.00 $1,100.00 $69,300.00
74 4QFA2E0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Emergency and Routine Bridge Repairs on NBHCE (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
75 4R25BSR 610 S.F. Substructure Membrane Waterproofing $14.00 $8,540.00 $15.00 $9,150.00 $10.20 $6,222.00 $9.65 $5,886.50 $15.00 $9,150.00
76 4S01WRR 470 L.F. Wire Rope $75.00 $35,250.00 $6.00 $2,820.00 $49.13 $23,091.10 $25.00 $11,750.00 $60.00 $28,200.00
77 4ZM02HPC 508 C.Y. Concrete in Deck Slabs, HPC $1,400.00 $711,200.00 $1,500.00 $762,000.00 $1,482.37 $753,043.96 $1,500.00 $762,000.00 $1,400.00 $711,200.00
78 4ZM03HPC 6 C.Y. Concrete in Headblock, HPC $2,000.00 $12,000.00 $4,000.00 $24,000.00 $1,967.23 $11,803.38 $2,700.00 $16,200.00 $1,500.00 $9,000.00
79 4ZM04HPC 109 C.Y. Concrete in Parapet, HPC $1,000.00 $109,000.00 $1,300.00 $141,700.00 $1,331.22 $145,102.98 $970.00 $105,730.00 $1,000.00 $109,000.00
80 5A08PUD 100 L.F. 8" Pipe Underdrain $28.00 $2,800.00 $109.00 $10,900.00 $53.10 $5,310.00 $11.00 $1,100.00 $50.00 $5,000.00
81 6A03RMS 1892 L.F. 3" Rigid Metallic Conduit, on Structures $29.00 $54,868.00 $40.00 $75,680.00 $35.48 $67,128.16 $30.00 $56,760.00 $38.00 $71,896.00
82 6A25JBD 5 Each Junction Box, Type D $1,250.00 $6,250.00 $1,300.00 $6,500.00 $1,503.48 $7,517.40 $1,300.00 $6,500.00 $1,800.00 $9,000.00
83 5B00VID 1796 L.F. Video Inspection of Pipes $5.00 $8,980.00 $6.00 $10,776.00 $3.52 $6,321.92 $4.00 $7,184.00 $5.00 $8,980.00
84 5B01CSD 1796 L.F. Cleaning Existing Storm Drains $9.00 $16,164.00 $26.00 $46,696.00 $11.73 $21,067.08 $4.00 $7,184.00 $5.00 $8,980.00
85 5B15RC3 684 L.F. 15" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $65.00 $44,460.00 $180.00 $123,120.00 $102.58 $70,164.72 $100.00 $68,400.00 $100.00 $68,400.00
86 5B15RCE 1 Each 15" Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $750.00 $750.00 $1,673.10 $1,673.10 $3,050.00 $3,050.00 $600.00 $600.00
87 5C00013 1 Each Reconstruct Inlet, Using Existing Frame, 0' tp 1.5' Depth $850.00 $850.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $793.31 $793.31 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
88 5C00050 1 Each Manhole, Type P-1S $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,528.31 $5,528.31 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
89 5C01ND1 3 Each Inlet, Type D1 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 $5,196.82 $15,590.46 $2,050.00 $6,150.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00
90 5C01ND3 4 Each Inlet, Type D3 $2,750.00 $11,000.00 $2,800.00 $11,200.00 $5,601.77 $22,407.08 $2,300.00 $9,200.00 $3,500.00 $14,000.00
91 5C05NG1 5 Each New Inlet Frame & Grate, Type G-1 $950.00 $4,750.00 $900.00 $4,500.00 $1,171.07 $5,855.35 $940.00 $4,700.00 $900.00 $4,500.00
92 5C05NG2 1 Each New Inlet Frame & Grate, Type G-2 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $1,581.69 $1,581.69 $3,400.00 $3,400.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
93 5C10INT 1 Each Inlet Converted to Manhole $2,250.00 $2,250.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,201.95 $2,201.95 $4,750.00 $4,750.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
94 5C20NP1 4 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,100.00 $8,400.00 $6,169.25 $24,677.00 $1,750.00 $7,000.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00
95 5C55CDS 34 Each Cleaning Existing Drainage Structures $200.00 $6,800.00 $340.00 $11,560.00 $351.93 $11,965.62 $170.00 $5,780.00 $200.00 $6,800.00
96 5E01ALC 1342 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $25.00 $33,550.00 $8.00 $10,736.00 $12.90 $17,311.80 $18.00 $24,156.00 $17.00 $22,814.00
97 5F01VCA 1804 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $30.00 $54,120.00 $32.00 $57,728.00 $44.17 $79,682.68 $30.00 $54,120.00 $30.00 $54,120.00
98 5H05CMB 380 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier $250.00 $95,000.00 $170.00 $64,600.00 $133.12 $50,585.60 $250.00 $95,000.00 $250.00 $95,000.00
99 5I00002 7 L.F. 4" Aluminum Tube, Concrete Mounted $32.00 $224.00 $280.00 $1,960.00 $235.55 $1,648.85 $255.00 $1,785.00 $260.00 $1,820.00

100 5I01SNP 316 S.F. Sign Panels $35.00 $11,060.00 $60.00 $18,960.00 $43.70 $13,809.20 $26.00 $8,216.00 $54.00 $17,064.00
101 5I11REM 7 Each Remove Signs $650.00 $4,550.00 $1,200.00 $8,400.00 $625.66 $4,379.62 $2,515.00 $17,605.00 $1,100.00 $7,700.00
102 5I16REL 11 Each Relocate Sign Panels $160.00 $1,760.00 $325.00 $3,575.00 $1,510.88 $16,619.68 $505.00 $5,555.00 $320.00 $3,520.00
103 5I05SPP 262 L.F. U-channel Post $8.00 $2,096.00 $13.00 $3,406.00 $18.91 $4,954.42 $15.50 $4,061.00 $14.00 $3,668.00
104 5J01PCA 1 Each Parapet Connection, Type A $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $2,250.00 $2,250.00 $2,316.90 $2,316.90 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00
105 5J01PCB 1 Each Parapet Connection, Type B $475.00 $475.00 $525.00 $525.00 $586.56 $586.56 $800.00 $800.00 $800.00 $800.00
106 5J01RBG 1927 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide rail $15.00 $28,905.00 $1.00 $1,927.00 $2.93 $5,646.11 $3.00 $5,781.00 $14.00 $26,978.00
107 5J01RGR 234 L.F. Raise Beam Guide Rail $3.00 $702.00 $33.00 $7,722.00 $35.19 $8,234.46 $32.00 $7,488.00 $12.00 $2,808.00
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108 5J52ABG 2 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $500.00 $1,000.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $762.53 $1,525.06 $800.00 $1,600.00 $1,100.00 $2,200.00
109 5J52BET 1 Each Beam Guide Rail Buried End Terminal $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $3,108.75 $3,108.75 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
110 5J52BGR 2192 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $20.00 $43,840.00 $33.00 $72,336.00 $34.61 $75,865.12 $32.00 $70,144.00 $32.00 $70,144.00
111 5N04PCS 209 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $60.00 $12,540.00 $85.00 $17,765.00 $90.77 $18,970.93 $60.00 $12,540.00 $60.00 $12,540.00
112 5O01CAR 2 Each Delineator, Type CA-R $100.00 $200.00 $105.00 $210.00 $63.44 $126.88 $70.00 $140.00 $110.00 $220.00
113 5O01CAW 6 Each Delineator, Type CA-W $100.00 $600.00 $105.00 $630.00 $64.98 $389.88 $70.00 $420.00 $110.00 $660.00
114 5O01PAY 4 Each Delineator, Type PA-Y $100.00 $400.00 $105.00 $420.00 $59.03 $236.12 $70.00 $280.00 $110.00 $440.00
115 5O01PAW 24 Each Delineator, Type PA-W $75.00 $1,800.00 $105.00 $2,520.00 $58.14 $1,395.36 $60.00 $1,440.00 $110.00 $2,640.00
116 5O01CAY 2 Each Delineator, Type CA-Y $100.00 $200.00 $105.00 $210.00 $72.64 $145.28 $60.00 $120.00 $110.00 $220.00
117 5P10TMP 8525 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $0.40 $3,410.00 $0.50 $4,262.50 $0.91 $7,757.75 $0.40 $3,410.00 $0.50 $4,262.50
118 5P12REM 12715 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $0.80 $10,172.00 $1.00 $12,715.00 $1.22 $15,512.30 $1.00 $12,715.00 $1.00 $12,715.00
119 5P14TMP 812 L.F. Removable Wet Weather Pavement Marking Tape $2.60 $2,111.20 $3.00 $2,436.00 $4.86 $3,946.32 $3.00 $2,436.00 $3.00 $2,436.00
120 5P20LLS 14607 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, Epoxy Resin $0.60 $8,764.20 $1.00 $14,607.00 $1.22 $17,820.54 $0.75 $10,955.25 $0.60 $8,764.20
121 5P30LLM 607 L.F. Traffic Markings, Lines, long - Life, Epoxy Resin $0.80 $485.60 $1.00 $607.00 $9.72 $5,900.04 $1.00 $607.00 $1.00 $607.00
122 5Q01FOD 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type D $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $20,470.35 $20,470.35 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00
123 5Q02MFD 18 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type D $2,250.00 $40,500.00 $500.00 $9,000.00 $4,221.65 $75,989.70 $1,850.00 $33,300.00 $4,800.00 $86,400.00
124 5X00016 1 Each Quadguard Impact Attenuator, 4 Bays, 24" Wide $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $19,900.09 $19,900.09 $16,600.00 $16,600.00 $26,000.00 $26,000.00
125 5X01FTA 1 Each FURNISHING TEMPORARY IMPACT ATTENUATOR, QUADGUARD, 6 BAYS, 24" WIDE $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $23,462.29 $23,462.29 $16,600.00 $16,600.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
126 5X00PRA 1 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,884.19 $3,884.19 $4,550.00 $4,550.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00
127 5X00RPR 1 Each Repair Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $3,765.69 $3,765.69 $7,550.00 $7,550.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00
128 5ZJ01STU 1 Each Stormwater Treatment Units $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $41,510.54 $41,510.54 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
129 5ZMFAS0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Snow Removal (NO-BID) $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00
130 6A00006 2825 L.F. #4/0 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $9.00 $25,425.00 $9.00 $25,425.00 $10.22 $28,871.50 $9.00 $25,425.00 $9.00 $25,425.00
131 6A00020 3 Each Bridge Mounted Navigation Lighting Assembly $8,000.00 $24,000.00 $7,900.00 $23,700.00 $10,067.31 $30,201.93 $8,400.00 $25,200.00 $9,000.00 $27,000.00
132 6A00021 2 Each Fender Mounted Navigation Lighting Assembly $7,000.00 $14,000.00 $6,800.00 $13,600.00 $19,689.59 $39,379.18 $16,500.00 $33,000.00 $17,000.00 $34,000.00
133 6A03FLX 36 L.F. 3" Flexible Conduit, on Structures $28.00 $1,008.00 $28.00 $1,008.00 $180.42 $6,495.12 $175.00 $6,300.00 $160.00 $5,760.00
134 6A02GWR 4419 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Ground Wire $3.00 $13,257.00 $3.00 $13,257.00 $3.61 $15,952.59 $3.50 $15,466.50 $4.00 $17,676.00
135 6A02MLC 15818 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $3.50 $55,363.00 $4.00 $63,272.00 $5.11 $80,829.98 $4.50 $71,181.00 $4.50 $71,181.00
136 6A02GPC 14014 L.F. #2 / O A.W.G. Power Cable $6.00 $84,084.00 $6.00 $84,084.00 $7.22 $101,181.08 $6.50 $91,091.00 $6.50 $91,091.00
137 6A03RNC 6517 L.F. 3" Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $10.00 $65,170.00 $11.00 $71,687.00 $18.04 $117,566.68 $16.00 $104,272.00 $16.00 $104,272.00
138 6A06GWR 1135 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Ground Wire $2.40 $2,724.00 $3.00 $3,405.00 $3.01 $3,416.35 $3.00 $3,405.00 $3.00 $3,405.00
139 6A02RMU 40 L.F. 2" Rigid Metallic Conduit, Underground $39.00 $1,560.00 $39.00 $1,560.00 $42.10 $1,684.00 $36.00 $1,440.00 $60.00 $2,400.00
140 6A06MLC 6006 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $2.80 $16,816.80 $3.00 $18,018.00 $3.61 $21,681.66 $4.00 $24,024.00 $4.00 $24,024.00
141 6A13RNC 438 L.F. 3" Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 80) $33.00 $14,454.00 $33.00 $14,454.00 $42.10 $18,439.80 $36.00 $15,768.00 $36.00 $15,768.00
142 6A20GWR 3570 L.F. #2/0 A.W.G. Ground Wire $4.50 $16,065.00 $5.00 $17,850.00 $4.81 $17,171.70 $5.00 $17,850.00 $5.00 $17,850.00
143 6A21JF1 22 Each Junction Box Foundation, Type 1 $2,500.00 $55,000.00 $2,500.00 $55,000.00 $3,379.83 $74,356.26 $3,000.00 $66,000.00 $2,900.00 $63,800.00
144 6A24JBC 2 Each Junction Box, Type C $2,250.00 $4,500.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $3,019.00 $6,038.00 $2,600.00 $5,200.00 $2,600.00 $5,200.00
145 6A65RAS 1 Lump Remove and Salvage Existing Facilities $33,000.00 $33,000.00 $33,000.00 $33,000.00 $25,258.48 $25,258.48 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
146 6B00022 1 Each Concrete Base Foundation, Type IV For Lighting Standard $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,209.75 $4,209.75 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00
147 6B07RWL 1 Each RELOCATE LIGHTING STANDARD $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $3,427.93 $3,427.93 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
148 6B15LMG 4 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-40 (150W Luminaire) $2,900.00 $11,600.00 $2,900.00 $11,600.00 $3,403.88 $13,615.52 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,900.00 $11,600.00
149 6B15TP2 4 Each Type P2 Luminaire, 150W $1,100.00 $4,400.00 $1,150.00 $4,600.00 $1,563.62 $6,254.48 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $1,400.00 $5,600.00
150 6B25LMG 10 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-40 (250W Luminaire) $2,900.00 $29,000.00 $2,950.00 $29,500.00 $2,201.10 $22,011.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $1,900.00 $19,000.00
151 6B25LMGS 4 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-40-SB $3,200.00 $12,800.00 $3,250.00 $13,000.00 $4,065.41 $16,261.64 $3,500.00 $14,000.00 $3,400.00 $13,600.00
152 6B25TP2 11 Each Type P2 Luminaire, 250W $1,300.00 $14,300.00 $1,300.00 $14,300.00 $1,563.62 $17,199.82 $1,500.00 $16,500.00 $1,400.00 $15,400.00
153 6B25TP3 3 Each Type P3 Luminaire, 250W $1,300.00 $3,900.00 $1,350.00 $4,050.00 $1,563.62 $4,690.86 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00
154 6B40LMG2 8 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG2-40 $2,800.00 $22,400.00 $2,850.00 $22,800.00 $3,427.94 $27,423.52 $3,000.00 $24,000.00 $2,900.00 $23,200.00
155 6B40TP4 14 Each Type P4 Luminaire, 400W $1,300.00 $18,200.00 $1,300.00 $18,200.00 $1,683.90 $23,574.60 $1,500.00 $21,000.00 $1,500.00 $21,000.00
156 6B00066 1 L.S. Temporary Lighting Systems $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $45,104.43 $45,104.43 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00
157 6B00103 3 Each Type E-1 Emergency Lighting Luminaire, 1500W Quartz, 120V $1,700.00 $5,100.00 $1,700.00 $5,100.00 $1,647.82 $4,943.46 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00
158 6C00008 15 Each 12" Flashing Warning Beacon Assembly $6,500.00 $97,500.00 $6,600.00 $99,000.00 $6,615.32 $99,229.80 $5,800.00 $87,000.00 $5,600.00 $84,000.00
159 7C01TOP 5861 S.Y. Topsoil $5.00 $29,305.00 $4.00 $23,444.00 $7.92 $46,419.12 $6.70 $39,268.70 $7.00 $41,027.00
160 7D01SED 365 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $1.00 $365.00 $0.50 $182.50 $1.17 $427.05 $1.50 $547.50 $2.00 $730.00
161 7D08SED 5497 S.Y. Seeding, Type L $0.60 $3,298.20 $0.50 $2,748.50 $1.35 $7,420.95 $1.50 $8,245.50 $1.30 $7,146.10
162 7F01SSM 5497 S.Y. Soil Stablization Matting $2.80 $15,391.60 $4.00 $21,988.00 $4.40 $24,186.80 $4.00 $21,988.00 $4.00 $21,988.00
163 8A06MPT 5 Barr Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $375.00 $1,875.00 $250.00 $1,250.00 $615.89 $3,079.45 $1,200.00 $6,000.00 $700.00 $3,500.00
164 8A07MPT 3 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $5,865.57 $17,596.71 $14,500.00 $43,500.00 $12,000.00 $36,000.00
165 8A30MPT 3 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $6,000.00 $18,000.00 $16,305.46 $48,916.38 $9,000.00 $27,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00
166 N8A0001 1600 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $25.00 $40,000.00 $40.00 $64,000.00 $35.86 $57,376.00 $25.00 $40,000.00 $20.00 $32,000.00
167 N8A0002 3380 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $40.00 $135,200.00 $20.00 $67,600.00 $32.63 $110,289.40 $21.00 $70,980.00 $30.00 $101,400.00
168 8B15MPT 1400 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol $1.00 $1,400.00 $1.00 $1,400.00 $110.85 $155,190.00 $20.00 $28,000.00 $75.00 $105,000.00
169 8B17MPT 4 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $10,000.00 $40,000.00 $6,000.00 $24,000.00 $23,308.34 $93,233.36 $25,000.00 $100,000.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.00
170 8B18MPT 2 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,250.00 $6,500.00 $5,960.62 $11,921.24 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00
171 8B20MPT 4 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $1,769.38 $7,077.52 $2,900.00 $11,600.00 $3,500.00 $14,000.00
172 8C01MPT 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices for State, County, and Local Roadways $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $43,280.40 $43,280.40 $275,000.00 $275,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
173 8C21MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 1 $27,500.00 $27,500.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $283,891.54 $283,891.54 $325,000.00 $325,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00
174 2N00004 10 CRWD Soil Borings $6,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $4,105.90 $41,059.00 $3,100.00 $31,000.00 $3,500.00 $35,000.00
175 5J00007 1 Each Telescoping Guide Rail End Terminal $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $4,663.12 $4,663.12 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00

$12,636,318.60 $12,672,580.00 $14,228,355.00 $14,276,537.95 $15,777,000.00Base Total


