
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $292,700.00 $292,700.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 

2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $1,100,000.00 $1,100,000.00 $1,330,000.00 $1,330,000.00 

3 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

4 1HFP0B 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 

5 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $283,600.00 $283,600.00 $1,100,000.00 $1,100,000.00 

6 2B02REX 324 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $69.00 $22,356.00 $75.00 $24,300.00 

7 2B15STS 4,207.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $1.00 $4,207.00 $19.00 $79,933.00 

8 2BETU0B 1 L.S.
Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess 
Materials (NO-BID)

$5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

9 2C01EMB 1,972.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $1.00 $1,972.00 $26.00 $51,272.00 

10 2C02EMB 55 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $52.00 $2,860.00 $50.00 $2,750.00 

11 2H00007 18,142.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $5.75 $104,316.50 $8.00 $145,136.00 

12 2H00016 94 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $160.00 $15,040.00 $200.00 $18,800.00 

13 2H25TEC 99 C.Y. Hay Bales $1.00 $99.00 $200.00 $19,800.00 

14 2K01TPF 2,259.00 L.F. Temporary Orange Plastic Fence $6.00 $13,554.00 $6.00 $13,554.00 

15 2M00008 20 Ton Disposal of Acid Producing Soil $60.00 $1,200.00 $0.01 $0.20 

16 3A08ABC 181 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8" Thick $25.00 $4,525.00 $22.00 $3,982.00 

17 3B21SUP 73 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 25H 64 Base Course $130.00 $9,490.00 $150.00 $10,950.00 

18 3B25SUP 38 Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5H 76 Surface Course $131.00 $4,978.00 $160.00 $6,080.00 

19 3B26TAC 46 GAL Tack Coat $5.00 $230.00 $3.00 $138.00 

20 3BAPA0B 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 

21 3C01BRS 15,784.00 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $24.25 $382,762.00 $34.00 $536,656.00 

22 3C03BRS 465 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 4" Thick $50.00 $23,250.00 $10.00 $4,650.00 

23 3E20PMR 170 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Variable Depth $63.00 $10,710.00 $29.00 $4,930.00 

24 4A04STC 60 C.Y. Concrete In Footings $1,410.00 $84,600.00 $700.00 $42,000.00 

25 4A11RFS 245,156.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $2.11 $517,279.16 $2.00 $490,312.00 

Base Line Item Detail PKF-Mark III, Inc. Union Paving & Construction Co., Inc.
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26 4C00021 1 L.S. Structural Steel (Approximately 15000 Pounds) $49,870.00 $49,870.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 

27 4F00015 1 Each Remove Existing Overhead Span Sign Structure $16,900.00 $16,900.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 

28 4F00016 7 Each Remove Existing Overhead Cantilever Sign Structure $7,500.00 $52,500.00 $11,000.00 $77,000.00 

29 4F00018 80 C.Y. Concrete Column For Sign Structures $1,715.00 $137,200.00 $1,000.00 $80,000.00 

30 4F01BMS 11 Each Remove Existing Bridge Mounted Sign Support $6,000.00 $66,000.00 $16,000.00 $176,000.00 

31 4F00022 1 L.S. Remove Existing Overhead Butterfly Sign Structure $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

32 4F05GMF 192 C.Y. Concrete Foundations for Ground Mounted Signs $285.00 $54,720.00 $775.00 $148,800.00 

33 4F11CSP 1,330.00 C.Y. Concrete in Structures, Pedestals $1,893.00 $2,517,690.00 $1,600.00 $2,128,000.00 

34 4F01RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

35 4F02RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 2 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

36 4F03RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 3 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

37 4F04RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 4 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

38 4F05RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 5 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

39 4F06RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 6 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

40 4F07RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 7 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

41 4F08RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 8 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

42 4F09RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 9 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

43 4F00023 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 10 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

44 4F00024 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 11 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

45 4F00025 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 12 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

46 4F01CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 1 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 

47 4F02CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 2 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

48 4F03CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 3 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

49 4F04CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 4 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

50 4F05CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 5 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

51 4F06CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 6 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

52 4F07CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 7 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 
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53 4F08CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 8 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

54 4F09CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 9 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

55 4F10CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 10 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

56 4F11CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 11 $59,000.00 $59,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

57 4F12CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 12 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

58 4F13CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 13 $58,000.00 $58,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

59 4F14CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 14 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

60 4F15CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 15 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

61 4F16CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 16 $59,000.00 $59,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

62 4F17CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 17 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

63 4F18CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 18 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

64 4F19CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 19 $59,000.00 $59,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

65 4F21CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 20 $59,000.00 $59,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

66 4F23CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 21 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

67 4F24CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 22 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

68 4F25CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 23 $59,000.00 $59,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

69 4F22CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 24 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

70 4F26CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 25 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

71 4F27CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 26 $57,000.00 $57,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

72 4F28CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 27 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

73 4F29CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 28 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

74 4F30CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 29 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

75 4F31CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 30 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

76 4F00026 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 31 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

77 4F00027 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 32 $58,000.00 $58,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

78 4F00028 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 33 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $69,130.20 $69,130.20 

79 4F00029 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 34 $58,000.00 $58,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 
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80 4F00030 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 35 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

81 4F00031 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 36 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

82 4F00032 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 37 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

83 4F00033 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 38 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

84 4F00034 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 39 $59,000.00 $59,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 

85 4F00035 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 40 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

86 4F00036 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 41 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

87 4F00037 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 42 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

88 4F00049 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 43 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 

89 4F01OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 1 $47,600.00 $47,600.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 

90 4F02OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 2 $46,500.00 $46,500.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 

91 4F26OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 1 $105,500.00 $105,500.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 

92 4F33OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 2 $122,000.00 $122,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 

93 4F34OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 3 $160,800.00 $160,800.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 

94 4F35OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 4 $172,000.00 $172,000.00 $185,000.00 $185,000.00 

95 4F36OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 5 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 

96 4F37OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 6 $114,000.00 $114,000.00 $115,000.00 $115,000.00 

97 4F38OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 7 $116,000.00 $116,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 

98 4F50OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 8 $116,000.00 $116,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 

99 4F51OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 9 $112,800.00 $112,800.00 $115,000.00 $115,000.00 

100 4F52OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 10 $121,500.00 $121,500.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 

101 4F53OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 11 $112,800.00 $112,800.00 $115,000.00 $115,000.00 

102 4F54OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 12 $109,000.00 $109,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 

103 4F44OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 13 $109,000.00 $109,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 

104 4F55OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 14 $106,000.00 $106,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 

105 4F46OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 15 $172,000.00 $172,000.00 $185,000.00 $185,000.00 

106 4F47OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 16 $180,000.00 $180,000.00 $215,000.00 $215,000.00 
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107 4F01MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 1 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 

108 4F02MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 2 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

109 4F03MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 3 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 

110 4F04MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 4 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 

111 4F05MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 5 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 

112 4F06MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 6 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 

113 4F07MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 7 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 

114 4F08MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 8 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 

115 4F09MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 9 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 

116 4F10MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 10 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 

117 4F11MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 11 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 

118 4F12MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 12 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 

119 4F13MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 13 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 

120 4F14MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 14 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 

121 4F15MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 15 $4,700.00 $4,700.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 

122 4F16MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 16 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 

123 4F00038 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 17 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 

124 4F00039 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 18 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 

125 4F00040 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 19 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 

126 4F00041 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 20 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 

127 4F00042 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 21 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

128 4F00048 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 22 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 

129 4O01TSP 150 S.F. Temporary Sheeting $60.00 $9,000.00 $110.00 $16,500.00 

130 4O02TSP 750 S.F. Temporary Sheeting to Remain in Place $76.00 $57,000.00 $110.00 $82,500.00 

131 4ZL0009 324 L.F. 36" Diameter Drilled Shaft $1,619.00 $524,556.00 $750.00 $243,000.00 

132 4ZL0014 1,215.00 L.F. 48" Drilled Shaft for Sign Structures $1,638.00 $1,990,170.00 $850.00 $1,032,750.00 

133 4ZL0016 1,707.00 L.F. 54" Drilled Shaft for Sign Structures $1,926.00 $3,287,682.00 $1,000.00 $1,707,000.00 

134 5A08PUD 820 L.F. 8" Pipe Underdrain $18.00 $14,760.00 $10.00 $8,200.00 

135 5D10INC 4 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $1,490.00 $5,960.00 $425.00 $1,700.00 

136 5H04CMB 27 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Roadway, Vaiable Height $301.00 $8,127.00 $500.00 $13,500.00 

137 5H00001 221 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Protection, Variable Height $301.00 $66,521.00 $265.00 $58,565.00 

138 5I01FSP 33,909.00 S.F. Furnish And Install Overhead Sign Panels $20.50 $695,134.50 $23.00 $779,907.00 

139 5I02FSP 16,223.00 S.F. Furnish And Install Ground Mounted Sign Panels $30.00 $486,690.00 $27.00 $438,021.00 

140 N5I0002 3,259.00 L.F. Timber Posts $34.25 $111,620.75 $67.00 $218,353.00 

141 5I00012 4,903.00 L.F. Timber Poles $72.80 $356,938.40 $62.00 $303,986.00 

142 5I00005 88 Each Remove Existing Overhead Sign Panels $1,700.00 $149,600.00 $2,300.00 $202,400.00 

143 5I00RGM 136 Each Removal of Existing Ground-Mounted Sign $1,225.00 $166,600.00 $1,750.00 $238,000.00 
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144 5I01RES 1 Each Relocate Existing Ground-Mounted Sign $3,780.00 $3,780.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 

145 5J00007 1 Each Telescoping Guide Rail End Terminal $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

146 5J00FGT 15 Each Flared Guide Rail Terminal $1,980.00 $29,700.00 $2,200.00 $33,000.00 

147 5J01PCA 3 Each Parapet Connection, Type A $1,660.00 $4,980.00 $2,200.00 $6,600.00 

148 5J01PCB 2 Each Parapet Connection, Type B $600.00 $1,200.00 $1,100.00 $2,200.00 

149 5J01RBG 2,982.00 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide rail $4.00 $11,928.00 $6.00 $17,892.00 

150 5J51BGE 175 L.F. Beam Guide Rail Element $5.00 $875.00 $8.00 $1,400.00 

151 5J51TTS 40 Each Tangent Guide Rail Terminal $2,400.00 $96,000.00 $2,500.00 $100,000.00 

152 5J52ABG 52 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $680.00 $35,360.00 $1,000.00 $52,000.00 

153 5J52BGD 25 L.F. Beam Guide Rail, Dual-Faced $26.00 $650.00 $110.00 $2,750.00 

154 5J52BGR 17,961.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $18.50 $332,278.50 $24.00 $431,064.00 

155 5J53RRS 175 L.F. Rub Rail $7.00 $1,225.00 $8.00 $1,400.00 

156 5J54BGP 119 Each Beam Guide Rail Post $42.00 $4,998.00 $83.00 $9,877.00 

157 5JGRP03 38 Each Beam Guide Rail Post, 10' Long $68.00 $2,584.00 $120.00 $4,560.00 

158 5P10TMP 2,040.00 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $1.00 $2,040.00 $1.20 $2,448.00 

159 5P12REM 12,162.00 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $0.90 $10,945.80 $1.00 $12,162.00 

160 5P13TMP 2,400.00 L.F. Removable Black Line Mask, 8" Wide $2.95 $7,080.00 $3.30 $7,920.00 

161 5P14TMP 6,465.00 L.F. Removable Wet Weather Pavement Marking Tape $2.40 $15,516.00 $2.75 $17,778.75 

162 5P21LLS 7,730.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $1.50 $11,595.00 $1.75 $13,527.50 

163 5Q01FOF 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type F $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 

164 5Q02MFF 24 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type F $2,500.00 $60,000.00 $4,500.00 $108,000.00 

165 5V01PIT 86 Each Test Pits $700.00 $60,200.00 $600.00 $51,600.00 

166 5X00PRA 29 Each
Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator, 
Quadguard

$900.00 $26,100.00 $100.00 $2,900.00 

167 5X00RPR 5 Each Repair Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard $1.00 $5.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 

168 5X02FTA 10 Each
FURNISHING TEMPORARY IMPACT ATTENUATOR, 
QUADGUARD, 9 BAYS, 24" WIDE

$500.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 

169 5ZD01RPM 1,108.00 Each Raised Pavement Markers $32.00 $35,456.00 $30.00 $33,240.00 

170 5ZD04RPM 319 Each Removal of Raised Pavement Markers $39.00 $12,441.00 $28.00 $8,932.00 

171 5ZL01JCP 1 L.S. Relocation of JCP&L Electrical Facilities No. 1 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

172 5ZL02JCP 1 L.S. Relocation of JCP&L Electrical Facilities No. 2 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

173 5ZL03JCP 1 L.S. Relocation of JCP&L Electrical Facilities No. 3 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 

174 5ZMFAS0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Snow Removal (NO-BID) $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 

175 5ZO0018 100 Ton Off-Site Disposal of ID-27 Waste $60.00 $6,000.00 $125.00 $12,500.00 

176 6A02MLC 2,550.00 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $4.00 $10,200.00 $6.00 $15,300.00 



Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

Base Line Item Detail PKF-Mark III, Inc. Union Paving & Construction Co., Inc.

177 6A03RNC 635 L.F. 3" Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $20.00 $12,700.00 $40.00 $25,400.00 

178 6A04MLC 1,000.00 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $3.00 $3,000.00 $7.00 $7,000.00 

179 6A08GWR 1,175.00 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $2.00 $2,350.00 $3.00 $3,525.00 

180 6A10MLC 525 L.F. #1/0 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $5.00 $2,625.00 $9.00 $4,725.00 

181 6A21JF1 1 Each Junction Box Foundation, Type 1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 

182 6A65RAS 1 Lump Remove and Salvage Existing Facilities $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 

183 6B01RLI 1 L.S. Relocate Surveillance Cameras $8,700.00 $8,700.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 

184 6B07RWL 1 Each RELOCATE LIGHTING STANDARD $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 

185 6C00008 1 Each 12" Flashing Warning Beacon Assembly $6,300.00 $6,300.00 $23,000.00 $23,000.00 

186 7C01TOP 21,672.00 S.Y. Topsoil $1.55 $33,591.60 $3.00 $65,016.00 

187 7D01SED 20,635.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $0.66 $13,619.10 $1.00 $20,635.00 

188 7D08SED 1,037.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type L $1.00 $1,037.00 $1.25 $1,296.25 

189 7F01SSM 1,037.00 S.Y. Soil Stablization Matting $4.82 $4,998.34 $4.00 $4,148.00 

190 8A01MPT 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $1,997,000.00 $1,997,000.00 $5,170,000.00 $5,170,000.00 

191 8A06MPT 100 Barr Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $100.00 $10,000.00 $400.00 $40,000.00 

192 8A07MPT 5 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $1.00 $5.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 

193 8A29MPT 1,000.00 M.H. Flaggers $1.00 $1,000.00 $0.01 $10.00 

194 8A30MPT 10 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $1.00 $10.00 $6,000.00 $60,000.00 

195 8B15MPT 6,000.00 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol $1.00 $6,000.00 $0.01 $60.00 

196 8B17MPT 10 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 

197 8B18MPT 12 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator $2,600.00 $31,200.00 $4,000.00 $48,000.00 

198 8B19MPT 600 M.H.
Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's 
Use

$1.00 $600.00 $0.01 $6.00 

199 8B20MPT 99 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator $1.00 $99.00 $500.00 $49,500.00 

200 N8A0001 10,600.00 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $28.25 $299,450.00 $15.00 $159,000.00 

201 N8A0002 70,480.00 L.F.
Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction 
Barrier

$1.00 $70,480.00 $0.01 $704.80 

202 8C100SCL 1 L.S.
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, 
and Local Roadways

$11,800.00 $11,800.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 

203 8CPTD0B 1 L.S. Police Traffic Directors (NO-BID) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

204 5Q01FAL 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

205 5Q02MFA 24 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type A $1,225.00 $29,400.00 $1,000.00 $24,000.00 

$22,474,470.65 $24,869,632.70 Base Total


