
Base Line Item Detail A. P. Construction, Inc. Hessert T.N.Ward Company JPC Group, Inc. The Bedwell Company

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $20,500.00 $20,500.00 $27,132.94 $27,132.94 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $118,352.00 $118,352.00
2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $14,300.00 $14,300.00 $1,443,732.34 $1,443,732.34 $570,000.00 $570,000.00 $723,067.00 $723,067.00
3 1GSCH0B 1 L.S. Progress Schedule (NO-BID) $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
4 1HFP0B 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
5 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $142,112.68 $142,112.68 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $133,221.00 $133,221.00
6 2A06CAG 3 Each Sealing of Abandoned Well $4,200.00 $12,600.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00 $3,754.94 $11,264.82 $1,300.00 $3,900.00 $3,333.33 $9,999.99
7 2A08CAG 1 Each Monitoring Well $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $5,245.00 $5,245.00 $3,637.60 $3,637.60 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $95,288.00 $95,288.00
8 2B02REX 8886 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $8.00 $71,088.00 $20.00 $177,720.00 $20.52 $182,340.72 $16.50 $146,619.00 $22.00 $195,492.00
9 2B15STS 870 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $6.00 $5,220.00 $20.00 $17,400.00 $10.48 $9,117.60 $17.50 $15,225.00 $11.26 $9,796.20
10 2C01EMB 1644 C.Y. Embankment, Common $12.00 $19,728.00 $6.30 $10,357.20 $4.66 $7,661.04 $35.00 $57,540.00 $4.37 $7,184.28
11 2C02EMB 1432 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $14.00 $20,048.00 $54.75 $78,402.00 $38.99 $55,833.68 $40.00 $57,280.00 $36.55 $52,339.60
12 2C14EMB 2335 S.Y. Geotextile Filter Fabric $3.00 $7,005.00 $1.15 $2,685.25 $3.95 $9,223.25 $5.00 $11,675.00 $1.96 $4,576.60
13 2E01CAL 373 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate Layer $75.00 $27,975.00 $116.00 $43,268.00 $94.63 $35,296.99 $58.00 $21,634.00 $109.92 $41,000.16
14 2E00002 3538 C.Y. Pea Gravel, 3/4" $85.00 $300,730.00 $58.00 $205,204.00 $78.65 $278,263.70 $77.00 $272,426.00 $71.39 $252,577.82
15 2E01FEX 5331 C.Y. Foundataion Excavation $20.00 $106,620.00 $20.00 $106,620.00 $42.52 $226,674.12 $36.00 $191,916.00 $55.00 $293,205.00
16 2G00002 18 Ton Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 12" Thick, (D50=6") $105.00 $1,890.00 $64.75 $1,165.50 $111.43 $2,005.74 $88.00 $1,584.00 $106.28 $1,913.04
17 2G10SEC 12 Ton Filter Blanket $110.00 $1,320.00 $60.35 $724.20 $160.34 $1,924.08 $120.00 $1,440.00 $39.00 $468.00
18 2G12A06 7 Ton Riprap Stone Aprons, 12" Thick, D50=6" $105.00 $735.00 $103.00 $721.00 $136.43 $955.01 $130.00 $910.00 $91.14 $637.98
19 2H00007 3647 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $7.00 $25,529.00 $4.50 $16,411.50 $6.71 $24,471.37 $6.00 $21,882.00 $9.62 $35,084.14
20 2H00021 1 Each Concrete Washout Facility $2,220.00 $2,220.00 $3,590.00 $3,590.00 $7,353.06 $7,353.06 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
21 2H40TEC 5 Each Inlet Filters $200.00 $1,000.00 $125.00 $625.00 $143.61 $718.05 $185.00 $925.00 $366.20 $1,831.00
22 2H45TEC 48 Ton Construction Driveway $75.00 $3,600.00 $27.75 $1,332.00 $44.70 $2,145.60 $65.00 $3,120.00 $96.56 $4,634.88
23 3A06ABC 8896 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6" Thick $10.00 $88,960.00 $9.90 $88,070.40 $10.10 $89,849.60 $13.75 $122,320.00 $13.34 $118,672.64
24 3B00006 1395 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5 M 64-22 Surface Course $105.00 $146,475.00 $84.00 $117,180.00 $103.66 $144,605.70 $110.00 $153,450.00 $108.59 $151,483.05
25 3B26TAC 945 GAL Tack Coat $1.00 $945.00 $10.00 $9,450.00 $0.11 $103.95 $1.00 $945.00 $8.21 $7,758.45
26 3B00007 2113 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25 M 64-22 Base Course $95.00 $200,735.00 $91.80 $193,973.40 $100.27 $211,870.51 $120.00 $253,560.00 $96.92 $204,791.96
27 3BAPA0B 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
28 3C03BRS 197 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 4" Thick $28.00 $5,516.00 $18.40 $3,624.80 $16.05 $3,161.85 $32.00 $6,304.00 $8.58 $1,690.26
29 3D08PCP 187 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement, 8" Thick $135.00 $25,245.00 $132.00 $24,684.00 $148.74 $27,814.38 $165.00 $30,855.00 $105.57 $19,741.59
30 3E07PMR 2379 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2" Depth $3.00 $7,137.00 $7.30 $17,366.70 $9.57 $22,767.03 $9.00 $21,411.00 $14.05 $33,424.95
31 3M03RMS 1264 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate, Size No. 3 $58.00 $73,312.00 $65.30 $82,539.20 $71.44 $90,300.16 $60.00 $75,840.00 $60.83 $76,889.12
32 4A10RFS 6131 LB Reinforcement Steel $2.00 $12,262.00 $1.38 $8,460.78 $2.35 $14,407.85 $2.75 $16,860.25 $1.50 $9,196.50
33 4O02TSP 1430 S.F. Temporary Sheeting to Remain in Place $55.00 $78,650.00 $53.35 $76,290.50 $117.34 $167,796.20 $155.00 $221,650.00 $145.00 $207,350.00
34 5A01PUD 77 L.F. 6-Inch Pipe Underdrain $40.00 $3,080.00 $30.00 $2,310.00 $39.09 $3,009.93 $39.00 $3,003.00 $29.05 $2,236.85
35 5A08PUD 823 L.F. 8" Pipe Underdrain $30.00 $24,690.00 $15.00 $12,345.00 $10.06 $8,279.38 $27.00 $22,221.00 $9.04 $7,439.92
36 5B12RC3 22 L.F. 12" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $100.00 $2,200.00 $190.00 $4,180.00 $96.16 $2,115.52 $75.00 $1,650.00 $51.64 $1,136.08
37 5B12FCE 1 Each 12" Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $1,316.36 $1,316.36 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $270.00 $270.00
38 5B15RC3 191 L.F. 15" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $55.00 $10,505.00 $75.00 $14,325.00 $70.94 $13,549.54 $66.50 $12,701.50 $59.83 $11,427.53
39 5B00008 425 L.F. 8" Corrugated Metal Pipe $65.00 $27,625.00 $36.00 $15,300.00 $31.06 $13,200.50 $52.00 $22,100.00 $34.76 $14,773.00
40 5B00102 27 L.F. 12" PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $140.00 $3,780.00 $76.00 $2,052.00 $70.58 $1,905.66 $85.00 $2,295.00 $59.19 $1,598.13
41 5C01ND2 1 Each Inlet, Type D2 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $5,300.00 $5,300.00 $3,392.25 $3,392.25 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $3,873.00 $3,873.00
42 5C01ND3 3 Each Inlet, Type D3 $3,300.00 $9,900.00 $3,075.00 $9,225.00 $3,081.58 $9,244.74 $3,800.00 $11,400.00 $3,873.00 $11,619.00
43 5C10RD3 1 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D3 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $3,387.58 $3,387.58 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $3,873.00 $3,873.00
44 5D10INC 100 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $625.00 $62,500.00 $550.00 $55,000.00 $487.68 $48,768.00 $748.00 $74,800.00 $535.35 $53,535.00
45 5E01ALC 100 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $20.00 $2,000.00 $33.65 $3,365.00 $26.67 $2,667.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $28.32 $2,832.00
46 5F01VCA 893 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $30.00 $26,790.00 $20.00 $17,860.00 $24.76 $22,110.68 $32.00 $28,576.00 $33.53 $29,942.29
47 5F01VCB 587 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type B $32.00 $18,784.00 $30.00 $17,610.00 $24.75 $14,528.25 $35.00 $20,545.00 $38.45 $22,570.15
48 5I01SNP 12 S.F. Sign Panels $25.00 $300.00 $36.80 $441.60 $25.82 $309.84 $30.00 $360.00 $24.17 $290.04
49 5I05SPP 60 L.F. U-channel Post $18.00 $1,080.00 $26.30 $1,578.00 $17.60 $1,056.00 $20.00 $1,200.00 $16.50 $990.00
50 5J52ABG 14 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $665.00 $9,310.00 $700.00 $9,800.00 $1,519.58 $21,274.12 $1,600.00 $22,400.00 $1,424.50 $19,943.00
51 5J52BGR 641 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $30.00 $19,230.00 $18.00 $11,538.00 $18.77 $12,031.57 $20.00 $12,820.00 $17.60 $11,281.60
52 5K00021 1018 L.F. Temporary Fencing, 96" High $35.00 $35,630.00 $5.50 $5,599.00 $8.37 $8,520.66 $25.00 $25,450.00 $18.00 $18,324.00
53 5K00050 2 Each Vehicular Gate, Type II, 72" High, 30' Wide $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,200.23 $6,400.46 $3,600.00 $7,200.00 $2,800.00 $5,600.00
54 5K00081 1 Each Vehicular Gate, Type II, 72" High, 15' Wide $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,920.14 $1,920.14 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00
55 5K01PGT 2 Each Pedestrian Gate, Type II, 72" High, 4' Wide $610.00 $1,220.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $880.06 $1,760.12 $625.00 $1,250.00 $500.00 $1,000.00
56 5K00069 1 Each Sliding Vehicular Gate (Motorized And Key Pad Activated) $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $21,675.00 $21,675.00 $22,401.62 $22,401.62 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
57 5K00082 1 Each Vehicular Sliding Gate, Type II, 72" High, 30' Wide $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.58 $8,000.58 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $8,200.00 $8,200.00
58 5K72CLB 2599 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 72" High $25.00 $64,975.00 $20.00 $51,980.00 $23.47 $60,998.53 $30.00 $77,970.00 $24.00 $62,376.00
59 5N04PCS 796 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $70.00 $55,720.00 $52.00 $41,392.00 $51.20 $40,755.20 $80.00 $63,680.00 $53.51 $42,593.96
60 5P21LLS 6466 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $2.00 $12,932.00 $1.40 $9,052.40 $1.60 $10,345.60 $1.50 $9,699.00 $1.00 $6,466.00
61 5P33LLM 35 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long - Life, Thermoplastic $7.00 $245.00 $19.00 $665.00 $21.12 $739.20 $20.00 $700.00 $5.00 $175.00
62 5Q01FOE 1 Unit Furnish Field Office, Type E $16,500.00 $16,500.00 $95,048.00 $95,048.00 $108,356.07 $108,356.07 $37,500.00 $37,500.00 $146,849.00 $146,849.00
63 5Q02MFE 24 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type E $50.00 $1,200.00 $1,086.00 $26,064.00 $2,614.57 $62,749.68 $2,600.00 $62,400.00 $1,321.92 $31,726.08
64 5V01PIT 10 Each Test Pits $1,108.00 $11,080.00 $335.00 $3,350.00 $1,661.99 $16,619.90 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $1,382.40 $13,824.00
65 5W01CDV 562 L.F. Cleaning Existing Storm Drain, 12" to 48" Diameter $11.00 $6,182.00 $8.50 $4,777.00 $9.81 $5,513.22 $7.50 $4,215.00 $11.00 $6,182.00
66 9A00057 18 Each Clean Outs $400.00 $7,200.00 $525.00 $9,450.00 $154.68 $2,784.24 $1,120.00 $20,160.00 $593.61 $10,684.98
67 5ZL0032 220 L.F. 6" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $35.00 $7,700.00 $68.00 $14,960.00 $70.26 $15,457.20 $50.00 $11,000.00 $59.79 $13,153.80
68 5ZL0068 4 Each 6" Sanitary Sewer Clean Out $560.00 $2,240.00 $435.00 $1,740.00 $453.11 $1,812.44 $880.00 $3,520.00 $1,168.25 $4,673.00
69 5ZL0015 25 L.F. 4" Sanitary Force Main $135.00 $3,375.00 $52.00 $1,300.00 $92.00 $2,300.00 $110.00 $2,750.00 $55.00 $1,375.00
70 5ZO0181 1 L.S. Septic Tank and Dosing Tanks $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $31,100.00 $31,100.00 $46,350.02 $46,350.02 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,692.00 $30,692.00
71 5ZO0182 1 L.S. Dosing Pumps System $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $18,360.00 $18,360.00 $31,132.92 $31,132.92 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $28,572.00 $28,572.00
72 5ZL03DP 605 L.F. 3" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 52 $80.00 $48,400.00 $91.00 $55,055.00 $74.67 $45,175.35 $74.00 $44,770.00 $65.24 $39,470.20
73 5ZL04DIP 275 L.F. 4" Ductile Iron Water Pipe Class 52 Force Main $90.00 $24,750.00 $103.00 $28,325.00 $69.34 $19,068.50 $68.00 $18,700.00 $65.96 $18,139.00
74 5ZO0183 5 Each 3" Water Valve $550.00 $2,750.00 $1,030.00 $5,150.00 $674.72 $3,373.60 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,133.40 $5,667.00
75 5ZL0059 2 Each Yard Hydrant $775.00 $1,550.00 $1,565.00 $3,130.00 $1,427.99 $2,855.98 $1,700.00 $3,400.00 $1,089.50 $2,179.00
76 5ZL0105 20 L.F. 2-4" Telephone Riser Conduit $28.00 $560.00 $72.00 $1,440.00 $75.30 $1,506.00 $90.00 $1,800.00 $100.00 $2,000.00
77 5ZL0162 605 L.F. 2-4" Telephone Duct Bank, PVC $23.00 $13,915.00 $48.00 $29,040.00 $50.20 $30,371.00 $60.00 $36,300.00 $49.22 $29,778.10
78 5ZL0173 4 Each 24" x 36" Telephone Junction Box $1,400.00 $5,600.00 $1,081.00 $4,324.00 $1,130.54 $4,522.16 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $1,250.00 $5,000.00
79 5ZO0184 1430 L.F. 2-2" Fiber Optic Duct Bank, PVC $18.00 $25,740.00 $40.00 $57,200.00 $41.83 $59,816.90 $50.00 $71,500.00 $45.19 $64,621.70
80 6A00065 1870 L.F. Communication Cable $6.00 $11,220.00 $0.00 $0.00 $14.93 $27,919.10 $32.00 $59,840.00 $4.90 $9,163.00
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81 9A00190 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1, Building A $1,900,000.00 $1,900,000.00 $3,714,476.00 $3,714,476.00 $1,690,505.79 $1,690,505.79 $3,200,000.00 $3,200,000.00 $3,883,375.00 $3,883,375.00
82 9A00191 1 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1, Building A $1,648,000.00 $1,648,000.00 $1,932,000.00 $1,932,000.00 $2,006,299.46 $2,006,299.46 $1,250,000.00 $1,250,000.00 $2,268,038.00 $2,268,038.00
83 9A00192 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1, Building A $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,178,384.00 $1,178,384.00 $1,022,915.71 $1,022,915.71 $1,415,000.00 $1,415,000.00 $1,110,100.00 $1,110,100.00
84 9A00193 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 1, Building A $1,050,000.00 $1,050,000.00 $968,053.00 $968,053.00 $987,301.13 $987,301.13 $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,178,153.00 $1,178,153.00
85 9A00194 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1, Building A $385,000.00 $385,000.00 $282,360.00 $282,360.00 $539,593.27 $539,593.27 $367,650.00 $367,650.00 $530,100.00 $530,100.00
86 9A00195 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1, Building B $180,000.00 $180,000.00 $125,600.00 $125,600.00 $84,901.48 $84,901.48 $179,700.00 $179,700.00 $155,507.38 $155,507.38
87 9A00196 1 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1, Building B $330,000.00 $330,000.00 $197,536.00 $197,536.00 $333,346.49 $333,346.49 $229,850.00 $229,850.00 $365,414.00 $365,414.00
88 9A00197 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1, Building B $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $37,500.00 $37,500.00 $37,544.91 $37,544.91 $729,650.00 $729,650.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00
89 9A00198 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 1, Building B $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $68,659.00 $68,659.00 $72,843.14 $72,843.14 $141,900.00 $141,900.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00
90 9A00199 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1, Building B $535,000.00 $535,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $254,168.31 $254,168.31 $126,450.00 $126,450.00 $398,500.00 $398,500.00
91 9A00266 1 C.P. Force Account For Building Work Allowances (NO-BID) $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00
92 5ZL0261 1 L.S. Site Electrical & Communication Work $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $929,934.00 $929,934.00 $972,550.32 $972,550.32 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $857,111.00 $857,111.00
93 6J13EDB 495 L.F. 2-5" Electric Duct Bank, HDPE $30.00 $14,850.00 $53.00 $26,235.00 $55.43 $27,437.85 $65.00 $32,175.00 $53.07 $26,269.65
94 6A25JPS 11 Each Junction Box, Type PS $1,385.00 $15,235.00 $1,319.00 $14,509.00 $1,379.45 $15,173.95 $2,800.00 $30,800.00 $2,000.00 $22,000.00
95 6A24JBC 5 Each Junction Box, Type C $6,000.00 $30,000.00 $1,634.00 $8,170.00 $1,708.88 $8,544.40 $3,300.00 $16,500.00 $6,500.00 $32,500.00
96 5ZOFAH0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Hazardous Regulated Material Handling (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
97 5ZOROA0B 1 L.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00
98 5ZO0012 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (1) $33,250.00 $33,250.00 $43,000.00 $43,000.00 $137,689.43 $137,689.43 $26,950.00 $26,950.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00
99 5ZO0027 82 Each Bollards $2,800.00 $229,600.00 $575.00 $47,150.00 $879.00 $72,078.00 $1,250.00 $102,500.00 $1,095.00 $89,790.00

100 5ZO0185 1 Each Post Mounted Knox Box $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $550.00 $550.00 $879.00 $879.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
101 9A00189 1 L.S. Building Equipment - Owner Furnished, Contractor Installed $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $53,500.00 $53,500.00 $190,163.81 $190,163.81 $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $205,387.00 $205,387.00
102 9A00188 1 L.S. Building Equipment - Contractor Furnished, Contractor Installed $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $53,500.00 $53,500.00 $143,352.59 $143,352.59 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $102,860.00 $102,860.00
103 7C01TOP 7449 S.Y. Topsoil $7.00 $52,143.00 $3.00 $22,347.00 $2.20 $16,387.80 $2.00 $14,898.00 $8.49 $63,242.01
104 7D03SED 5520 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $1.00 $5,520.00 $1.26 $6,955.20 $1.21 $6,679.20 $1.00 $5,520.00 $1.45 $8,004.00
105 7E00130 1929 S.Y. Native Grass/Wildflower Seed Mix $2.00 $3,858.00 $0.89 $1,716.81 $1.44 $2,777.76 $1.25 $2,411.25 $2.00 $3,858.00
106 N7E0042 9 Each Planting, Red Maple (Acer Rubrum) $445.00 $4,005.00 $315.65 $2,840.85 $666.71 $6,000.39 $1,000.00 $9,000.00 $500.00 $4,500.00
107 7E00080 416 Each Planting, Bearberry (Arctostaphylos Uva-ursi) $13.00 $5,408.00 $13.91 $5,786.56 $18.67 $7,766.72 $25.00 $10,400.00 $16.83 $7,001.28
108 7E00131 50 Each Planting, St. John's Wort (Hypericum Kalmianum) $25.00 $1,250.00 $55.64 $2,782.00 $29.34 $1,467.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $80.00 $4,000.00
109 N7E0064 102 Each Planting, Dwarf Fothergilla (Fothergilla Gardenii) $40.00 $4,080.00 $57.78 $5,893.56 $40.00 $4,080.00 $50.00 $5,100.00 $64.22 $6,550.44
110 N7E0045 32 Each Planting, Inkberry (Ilex Glabra) $135.00 $4,320.00 $86.67 $2,773.44 $61.34 $1,962.88 $60.00 $1,920.00 $150.00 $4,800.00
111 N7E0065 9 Each Planting, Eastern White Pine (Pinus Strobus) $330.00 $2,970.00 $197.95 $1,781.55 $346.69 $3,120.21 $320.00 $2,880.00 $444.44 $3,999.96
112 7E00132 9 Each Planting, Eastern Red Cedar (Juniperus Virginiana) $225.00 $2,025.00 $230.00 $2,070.00 $362.69 $3,264.21 $275.00 $2,475.00 $444.44 $3,999.96
113 7I02LNP 3843 S.Y. Gravel Paving $60.00 $230,580.00 $49.30 $189,459.90 $66.84 $256,866.12 $68.00 $261,324.00 $60.90 $234,038.70
114 7N00009 3 Each Flagpole $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,981.00 $8,943.00 $2,880.21 $8,640.63 $4,650.00 $13,950.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00
115 8B31MPT 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $5,300.00 $5,300.00 $3,520.25 $3,520.25 $3,350.00 $3,350.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00
116 5ZO0186 1 L.S. Universal Waste Removal (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

$12,369,947.00 $12,797,982.30 $13,556,037.14 $15,150,000.00 $15,992,782.00Base Total


