
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 1D10MOBX 1 L.S. Mobilization $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 

2 5Q01FAL 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $68,000.00 $68,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 

3 5Q02MFA 10 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type A $500.00 $5,000.00 $1,100.00 $11,000.00 $1,400.00 $14,000.00 

4 9A00078 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $5,900.00 $5,900.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $9,600.00 $9,600.00 

5 9A00079 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $13,800.00 $13,800.00 $22,100.00 $22,100.00 

6 9A00107 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 3 $9,400.00 $9,400.00 $13,800.00 $13,800.00 $20,650.00 $20,650.00 

7 9A00108 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 4 $12,300.00 $12,300.00 $16,100.00 $16,100.00 $23,800.00 $23,800.00 

8 9A00109 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 5 $12,300.00 $12,300.00 $13,800.00 $13,800.00 $20,350.00 $20,350.00 

9 9A00110 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 6 $7,800.00 $7,800.00 $9,200.00 $9,200.00 $17,200.00 $17,200.00 

10 9A00080 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $192,300.00 $192,300.00 $171,996.00 $171,996.00 $213,000.00 $213,000.00 

11 9A00081 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $170,900.00 $170,900.00 $177,109.00 $177,109.00 $213,000.00 $213,000.00 

12 9A00113 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3 $188,900.00 $188,900.00 $190,961.00 $190,961.00 $224,000.00 $224,000.00 

13 9A00114 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 4 $225,400.00 $225,400.00 $268,602.00 $268,602.00 $327,000.00 $327,000.00 

14 9A00115 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 5 $195,300.00 $195,300.00 $215,394.00 $215,394.00 $243,000.00 $243,000.00 

15 9A00116 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 6 $149,900.00 $149,900.00 $148,937.00 $148,937.00 $187,000.00 $187,000.00 

16 9AFAM0B 1 C.P.
Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-
BID)

$25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 

17 9AFAE0B 1 C.P.
Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances (NO-
BID)

$50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 

18 9A00173 1 C.P. Force Account for Temporary Heating Allowance (NO-BID) $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 

19 5ZO0021 1 Each Removal of Underground Storage Tanks $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $16,500.00 $16,500.00 

20 5ZOROA0B 1 L.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 

21 5ZOLAM0B 1 L.S. Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 

22 5ZOROL0B 1 L.S. Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

$1,522,900.00 $1,679,199.00 $1,959,200.00 

WHL Enterprises, Inc. T/A Bill Leary AC 
& Heating

Base Total

Base Line Item Detail H & S Construction and Mechanical Sunnyfield Corporation


