Base Line Item Detail A.P.S. Contracting Inc. Michael Riesz and Co. Niram, Inc. Mar-Bridge Enterprises Inc. Hessert Hall Building Corp. Alna Construction Corp. George Harms Construction Co., Inc. RCC Builders & Developers, Inc. Prismatic Development Worth Construction Co., Inc. A. P. Construction, Inc.
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 1DO1LAY 1|L.S. Construction Layout $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $86,400.00 $86,400.00 $27,250.00 $27,250.00 $20,500.00 $20,500.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $115,000.00 $115,000.00 $109,928.00 $109,928.00 $37,800.00 $37,800.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00
2 1D10MOB 1|L.S. Mobilization $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $129,600.00 $129,600.00 $9,265.00 $9,265.00 $14,300.00 $14,300.00 $715,000.00 $715,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $930,000.00 $930,000.00 $810,000.00 $810,000.00 $900,000.00 $900,000.00 $656,511.00 $656,511.00 $850,000.00 $850,000.00
3 1GSCHO0B 1|L.S. Progress Schedule (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
4 1HFPOB 1|L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
5 2A02CAG 1|L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $260,000.00 $260,000.00 $64,800.00 $64,800.00 $325,597.00 $325,597.00 $525,000.00 $525,000.00 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $577,225.00 $577,225.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $115,000.00 $115,000.00 $81,000.00 $81,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00
6 2B02REX 10005|C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $15.00 $150,075.00 $14.75 $147,573.75 $24.84 $248,524.20 $25.07 $250,825.35 $20.00 $200,100.00 $21.00 $210,105.00 $31.04 $310,555.20 $37.00 $370,185.00 $38.00 $380,190.00 $10.80 $108,054.00 $11.00 $110,055.00 $15.00 $150,075.00
7 2BETUOB 1|L.S. Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (NO-BID) $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
8 2EQ1FEX 3045|C.Y. Foundataion Excavation $30.00 $91,350.00 $27.50 $83,737.50 $32.40 $98,658.00 $25.07 $76,338.15 $20.00 $60,900.00 $12.00 $36,540.00 $26.00 $79,170.00 $11.00 $33,495.00 $33.00 $100,485.00 $21.60 $65,772.00 $21.00 $63,945.00 $22.00 $66,990.00
9 2H00007 2705|L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $15.00 $40,575.00 $8.50 $22,992.50 $8.21 $22,208.05 $8.28 $22,397.40 $4.50 $12,172.50 $5.00 $13,525.00 $7.00 $18,935.00 $7.00 $18,935.00 $8.00 $21,640.00 $3.50 $9,467.50 $3.60 $9,738.00 $7.00 $18,935.00
10 2H00016 34|Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $300.00 $10,200.00 $287.00 $9,758.00 $162.00 $5,508.00 $163.50 $5,559.00 $125.00 $4,250.00 $200.00 $6,800.00 $450.00 $15,300.00 $135.00 $4,590.00 $215.00 $7,310.00 $405.00 $13,770.00 $395.00 $13,430.00 $205.00 $6,970.00
11 2H00021 1|Each Concrete Washout Facility $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $1,222.98 $1,222.98 $3,590.00 $3,590.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $17,965.00 $17,965.00 $5,400.00 $5,400.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,900.00 $5,900.00
12 2H00023 300]L.F. Silt Fence on Pavement $7.00 $2,100.00 $31.00 $9,300.00 $12.96 $3,888.00 $13.08 $3,924.00 $4.50 $1,350.00 $12.00 $3,600.00 $20.00 $6,000.00 $13.00 $3,900.00 $9.00 $2,700.00 $5.40 $1,620.00 $5.25 $1,575.00 $12.00 $3,600.00
13 2H45TEC 25[Ton Construction Driveway $100.00 $2,500.00 $40.00 $1,000.00 $43.20 $1,080.00 $43.60 $1,090.00 $27.75 $693.75 $45.00 $1,125.00 $70.00 $1,750.00 $100.00 $2,500.00 $392.00 $9,800.00 $43.20 $1,080.00 $42.00 $1,050.00 $77.00 $1,925.00
14 3A08ABC 19480(S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8" Thick $13.00 $253,240.00 $9.00 $175,320.00 $14.04 $273,499.20 $15.26 $297,264.80 $11.50 $224,020.00 $14.00 $272,720.00 $22.86 $445,312.80 $13.25 $258,110.00 $17.00 $331,160.00 $11.15 $217,202.00 $12.60 $245,448.00 $13.00 $253,240.00
15 3B23SUP 6875|Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 19M 64 Base Course $92.00 $632,500.00 $91.00 $625,625.00 $97.20 $668,250.00 $97.01 $666,943.75 $75.00 $515,625.00 $85.00 $584,375.00 $93.00 $639,375.00 $80.00 $550,000.00 $118.00 $811,250.00 $95.00 $653,125.00 $92.40 $635,250.00 $105.00 $721,875.00
16 3B26TAC 1545|GAL Tack Coat $5.00 $7,725.00 $26.50 $40,942.50 $4.32 $6,674.40 $4.36 $6,736.20 $5.00 $7,725.00 $4.00 $6,180.00 $3.75 $5,793.75 $5.25 $8,111.25 $5.00 $7,725.00 $6.50 $10,042.50 $7.00 $10,815.00 $1.00 $1,545.00
17 3B35SUP 2250{Ton Superpave Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5M 64 Surface Course $100.00 $225,000.00 $95.75 $215,437.50 $108.00 $243,000.00 $110.09 $247,702.50 $86.00 $193,500.00 $94.00 $211,500.00 $108.00 $243,000.00 $85.00 $191,250.00 $132.00 $297,000.00 $102.60 $230,850.00 $100.00 $225,000.00 $118.00 $265,500.00
18 3B41SCS 500]L.F. Sealing Cracks in Bituminous Surface $10.00 $5,000.00 $1.25 $625.00 $5.40 $2,700.00 $5.45 $2,725.00 $1.00 $500.00 $5.00 $2,500.00 $1.10 $550.00 $11.50 $5,750.00 $2.00 $1,000.00 $5.40 $2,700.00 $5.25 $2,625.00 $6.00 $3,000.00
19 3BAPAOB 1|L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
20 3C01BRS 135]S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $50.00 $6,750.00 $150.00 $20,250.00 $64.80 $8,748.00 $114.45 $15,450.75 $38.00 $5,130.00 $25.00 $3,375.00 $38.00 $5,130.00 $38.00 $5,130.00 $52.00 $7,020.00 $19.45 $2,625.75 $19.00 $2,565.00 $45.00 $6,075.00
21 3D00007 1|Each Freshwater Rinse Concrete Slab and Curb $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $38,000.00 $38,000.00 $32,400.00 $32,400.00 $33,518.00 $33,518.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $17,495.00 $17,495.00 $17,010.00 $17,010.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
22 3D01SCS 1|Each Oil-Water Separator Concrete Slab $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $6,480.00 $6,480.00 $6,638.00 $6,638.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,020.00 $7,020.00 $6,825.00 $6,825.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00
23 3D12PCP 750]S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement, 12" Thick $108.00 $81,000.00 $172.80 $129,600.00 $153.36 $115,020.00 $154.78 $116,085.00 $198.00 $148,500.00 $110.00 $82,500.00 $180.00 $135,000.00 $196.00 $147,000.00 $170.00 $127,500.00 $181.45 $136,087.50 $33.60 $25,200.00 $160.00 $120,000.00
24 5B00011 215]|L.F. 6" Ductile Iron Pipe $130.00 $27,950.00 $91.00 $19,565.00 $64.80 $13,932.00 $64.31 $13,826.65 $80.00 $17,200.00 $80.00 $17,200.00 $58.65 $12,609.75 $62.00 $13,330.00 $130.00 $27,950.00 $162.00 $34,830.00 $158.00 $33,970.00 $55.00 $11,825.00
25 5B06PVC 405|L.F. 6" PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $70.00 $28,350.00 $65.00 $26,325.00 $64.80 $26,244.00 $65.40 $26,487.00 $90.00 $36,450.00 $76.00 $30,780.00 $86.01 $34,834.05 $68.00 $27,540.00 $74.00 $29,970.00 $59.40 $24,057.00 $100.00 $40,500.00 $35.00 $14,175.00
26 5B15RC3 1125|L.F. 15" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $120.00 $135,000.00 $50.75 $57,093.75 $54.00 $60,750.00 $54.40 $61,200.00 $80.00 $90,000.00 $60.00 $67,500.00 $68.04 $76,545.00 $52.00 $58,500.00 $61.00 $68,625.00 $70.20 $78,975.00 $131.00 $147,375.00 $75.00 $84,375.00
27 5B18DIP 170]|L.F. 18" Ductile Iron Pipe $250.00 $42,500.00 $185.00 $31,450.00 $140.40 $23,868.00 $141.70 $24,089.00 $230.00 $39,100.00 $105.00 $17,850.00 $173.24 $29,450.80 $105.00 $17,850.00 $144.00 $24,480.00 $178.20 $30,294.00 $278.00 $47,260.00 $120.00 $20,400.00
28 5B18RC3 105]|L.F. 18" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $200.00 $21,000.00 $75.25 $7,901.25 $57.24 $6,010.20 $57.77 $6,065.85 $115.00 $12,075.00 $80.00 $8,400.00 $68.04 $7,144.20 $56.00 $5,880.00 $85.00 $8,925.00 $102.60 $10,773.00 $131.00 $13,755.00 $90.00 $9,450.00
29 5C00108 2|Each Doghouse Manhole $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $4,150.00 $8,300.00 $4,536.00 $9,072.00 $4,578.00 $9,156.00 $6,900.00 $13,800.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $5,300.00 $10,600.00 $6,900.00 $13,800.00 $5,200.00 $10,400.00 $10,260.00 $20,520.00 $9,975.00 $19,950.00 $5,200.00 $10,400.00
30 5C01ND2 8|Each Inlet, Type D2 $4,000.00 $32,000.00 $3,720.00 $29,760.00 $2,916.00 $23,328.00 $2,943.00 $23,544.00 $3,995.00 $31,960.00 $3,000.00 $24,000.00 $3,750.00 $30,000.00 $3,700.00 $29,600.00 $4,900.00 $39,200.00 $2,700.00 $21,600.00 $2,625.00 $21,000.00 $5,200.00 $41,600.00
31 5CO1ND3 7|Each Inlet, Type D3 $4,000.00 $28,000.00 $3,500.00 $24,500.00 $2,862.00 $20,034.00 $2,888.50 $20,219.50 $3,550.00 $24,850.00 $3,000.00 $21,000.00 $3,750.00 $26,250.00 $3,400.00 $23,800.00 $4,864.00 $34,048.00 $3,024.00 $21,168.00 $2,940.00 $20,580.00 $4,800.00 $33,600.00
32 5C10ED1 1|Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using Existing Grate and Frame $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $1,188.00 $1,188.00 $1,199.00 $1,199.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $594.00 $594.00 $578.00 $578.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00
33 5C10ND1 1|Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using New Grate and Frame $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,955.00 $1,955.00 $1,566.00 $1,566.00 $1,580.50 $1,580.50 $2,150.00 $2,150.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,296.00 $1,296.00 $1,260.00 $1,260.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
34 5C10ND2 1|Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using New Grate and Frame $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,375.00 $2,375.00 $2,106.00 $2,106.00 $2,125.50 $2,125.50 $2,150.00 $2,150.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $5,600.00 $5,600.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $1,296.00 $1,296.00 $1,260.00 $1,260.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00
35 5C20NP1 2|Each Manhole, Type P-1 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,375.00 $6,750.00 $2,376.00 $4,752.00 $2,398.00 $4,796.00 $4,900.00 $9,800.00 $2,800.00 $5,600.00 $8,500.00 $17,000.00 $4,200.00 $8,400.00 $13,800.00 $27,600.00 $8,208.00 $16,416.00 $9,975.00 $19,950.00 $4,700.00 $9,400.00
36 5C20NP2 1|Each Manhole, Type P-2 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,050.00 $5,050.00 $4,104.00 $4,104.00 $4,142.00 $4,142.00 $6,950.00 $6,950.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $4,900.00 $4,900.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $10,260.00 $10,260.00 $9,975.00 $9,975.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
37 5D10INC 100]|C.Y. Incidental Concrete $500.00 $50,000.00 $550.00 $55,000.00 $723.60 $72,360.00 $730.30 $73,030.00 $400.00 $40,000.00 $375.00 $37,500.00 $500.00 $50,000.00 $300.00 $30,000.00 $300.00 $30,000.00 $270.00 $27,000.00 $262.00 $26,200.00 $300.00 $30,000.00
38 5F15DCC 35]|L.F. Drop Curb $35.00 $1,225.00 $27.50 $962.50 $23.76 $831.60 $23.97 $838.95 $35.00 $1,225.00 $35.00 $1,225.00 $35.00 $1,225.00 $30.00 $1,050.00 $37.00 $1,295.00 $30.25 $1,058.75 $29.40 $1,029.00 $55.00 $1,925.00
39 N5F0001 2590|L.F. 9" X 18" Concrete Curb $30.00 $77,700.00 $21.50 $55,685.00 $27.00 $69,930.00 $21.80 $56,462.00 $40.00 $103,600.00 $22.00 $56,980.00 $26.00 $67,340.00 $26.00 $67,340.00 $33.00 $85,470.00 $23.75 $61,512.50 $23.10 $59,829.00 $30.00 $77,700.00
40 5I01SNP 10 S.F. Sign Panels $25.00 $250.00 $38.00 $380.00 $54.00 $540.00 $54.50 $545.00 $32.00 $320.00 $35.00 $350.00 $35.20 $352.00 $51.00 $510.00 $44.00 $440.00 $34.55 $345.50 $33.60 $336.00 $20.00 $200.00
41 5105SPP | 57|L.F. [U-channel Post $15.00 $855.00 $17.00 $969.00 $10.80 $615.60 $10.90 $621.30 $15.00 $855.00 $25.00 $1,425.00 $17.10 $974.70 $36.00 $2,052.00 $21.00 $1,197.00 $5.40 $307.80 $6.00 $342.00 $25.00 $1,425.00
42 5J52ABG 14 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $500.00 $7,000.00 $540.00 $7,560.00 $1,036.80 $14,515.20 $545.00 $7,630.00 $500.00 $7,000.00 $600.00 $8,400.00 $500.00 $7,000.00 $510.00 $7,140.00 $670.00 $9,380.00 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 $750.00 $10,500.00 $590.00 $8,260.00
43 5J52BGR 888|L.F. Beam Guide Rail $20.00 $17,760.00 $22.00 $19,536.00 $97.20 $86,313.60 $27.25 $24,198.00 $25.00 $22,200.00 $28.00 $24,864.00 $25.00 $22,200.00 $20.00 $17,760.00 $34.00 $30,192.00 $36.70 $32,589.60 $39.00 $34,632.00 $30.00 $26,640.00
44 5K00001 1280|L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type Il, 84" High $50.00 $64,000.00 $33.00 $42,240.00 $41.04 $52,531.20 $35.45 $45,376.00 $20.00 $25,600.00 $33.00 $42,240.00 $32.52 $41,625.60 $33.00 $42,240.00 $45.00 $57,600.00 $35.10 $44,928.00 $41.00 $52,480.00 $38.00 $48,640.00
45 5K00021 1490|L.F. Temporary Fencing, 96" High $25.00 $37,250.00 $10.00 $14,900.00 $20.52 $30,574.80 $13.03 $19,414.70 $5.50 $8,195.00 $12.00 $17,880.00 $12.60 $18,774.00 $13.00 $19,370.00 $12.00 $17,880.00 $9.40 $14,006.00 $48.00 $71,520.00 $50.00 $74,500.00
46 5K00024 4{Each Vehicular Gate, Type I, 84" High, 30' Wide $8,000.00 $32,000.00 $9,500.00 $38,000.00 $3,780.00 $15,120.00 $2,746.80 $10,987.20 $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,600.00 $10,400.00 $2,520.00 $10,080.00 $2,550.00 $10,200.00 $3,440.00 $13,760.00 $2,722.00 $10,888.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00 $4,965.00 $19,860.00
47 5K00069 1|Each Sliding Vehicular Gate (Motorized And Key Pad Activated) $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $12,960.00 $12,960.00 $33,790.00 $33,790.00 $21,675.00 $21,675.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $48,760.00 $48,760.00 $49,000.00 $49,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $52,660.00 $52,660.00 $41,600.00 $41,600.00 $8,470.00 $8,470.00
48 5K00083 1|Each Pedestrian Gate, Type I, 84" High, 6' Wide $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $600.00 $600.00 $1,620.00 $1,620.00 $1,506.38 $1,506.38 $750.00 $750.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $1,382.00 $1,382.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $1,493.00 $1,493.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00
49 5K00085 2|Each Sliding Vehicular Gate, Type Il, 84" High, 30' Wide $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $6,750.00 $13,500.00 $6,480.00 $12,960.00 $26,574.20 $53,148.40 $20,800.00 $41,600.00 $7,960.00 $15,920.00 $7,800.00 $15,600.00 $7,900.00 $15,800.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $8,424.00 $16,848.00 $9,095.00 $18,190.00 $6,200.00 $12,400.00
50 5N04PCS 145]S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $60.00 $8,700.00 $65.75 $9,533.75 $81.00 $11,745.00 $81.75 $11,853.75 $82.00 $11,890.00 $56.00 $8,120.00 $76.50 $11,092.50 $74.00 $10,730.00 $93.00 $13,485.00 $63.20 $9,164.00 $62.00 $8,990.00 $85.00 $12,325.00
51 5NO7CHR 1|Each Concrete Handicap Ramp $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $800.00 $800.00 $648.00 $648.00 $436.00 $436.00 $1,150.00 $1,150.00 $950.00 $950.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $6,300.00 $6,300.00 $1,620.00 $1,620.00 $1,575.00 $1,575.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00
52 5P10TMP 725|L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $5.00 $3,625.00 $1.20 $870.00 $0.54 $391.50 $0.55 $398.75 $1.00 $725.00 $1.00 $725.00 $1.10 $797.50 $1.40 $1,015.00 $2.00 $1,450.00 $1.08 $783.00 $2.00 $1,450.00 $2.00 $1,450.00
53 5P21LLS 3110|L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $2.00 $6,220.00 $1.00 $3,110.00 $2.16 $6,717.60 $2.18 $6,779.80 $1.00 $3,110.00 $0.85 $2,643.50 $0.94 $2,923.40 $1.00 $3,110.00 $2.00 $6,220.00 $0.92 $2,861.20 $1.50 $4,665.00 $1.00 $3,110.00
54 5P33LLM 2935|S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long - Life, Thermoplastic $6.00 $17,610.00 $6.00 $17,610.00 $8.64 $25,358.40 $5.94 $17,433.90 $6.00 $17,610.00 $5.50 $16,142.50 $6.05 $17,756.75 $6.50 $19,077.50 $8.00 $23,480.00 $5.94 $17,433.90 $6.00 $17,610.00 $7.00 $20,545.00
55 5Q01FOE 1]|Unit Furnish Field Office, Type E $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $63,600.00 $63,600.00 $32,400.00 $32,400.00 $3,270.00 $3,270.00 $95,048.00 $95,048.00 $68,000.00 $68,000.00 $163,000.00 $163,000.00 $105,000.00 $105,000.00 $43,000.00 $43,000.00 $142,560.00 $142,560.00 $94,250.00 $94,250.00 $35,500.00 $35,500.00
56 5Q02MFE 29{Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type E $3,000.00 $87,000.00 $1,000.00 $29,000.00 $540.00 $15,660.00 $676.55 $19,619.95 $1,086.00 $31,494.00 $5,000.00 $145,000.00 $1,000.00 $29,000.00 $3,300.00 $95,700.00 $438.00 $12,702.00 $6,330.00 $183,570.00 $4,000.00 $116,000.00 $600.00 $17,400.00
57 5VO1PIT 20{Each Test Pits $1,000.00 $20,000.00 $610.00 $12,200.00 $648.00 $12,960.00 $654.00 $13,080.00 $335.00 $6,700.00 $250.00 $5,000.00 $400.00 $8,000.00 $340.00 $6,800.00 $4,200.00 $84,000.00 $540.00 $10,800.00 $2,365.00 $47,300.00 $600.00 $12,000.00
58 5W01CDV 1885|L.F. Cleaning Existing Storm Drain, 12" to 48" Diameter $30.00 $56,550.00 $18.50 $34,872.50 $18.36 $34,608.60 $9.81 $18,491.85 $8.50 $16,022.50 $10.00 $18,850.00 $22.00 $41,470.00 $25.00 $47,125.00 $35.00 $65,975.00 $24.30 $45,805.50 $2.80 $5,278.00 $25.00 $47,125.00
59 5200027 47|Each Bollards $600.00 $28,200.00 $400.00 $18,800.00 $594.00 $27,918.00 $468.70 $22,028.90 $575.00 $27,025.00 $600.00 $28,200.00 $445.00 $20,915.00 $690.00 $32,430.00 $940.00 $44,180.00 $702.00 $32,994.00 $683.00 $32,101.00 $1,180.00 $55,460.00
60 5210059 2|Each Yard Hydrant $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $2,210.00 $4,420.00 $3,456.00 $6,912.00 $1,744.00 $3,488.00 $2,950.00 $5,900.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,300.00 $6,600.00 $3,800.00 $7,600.00 $3,024.00 $6,048.00 $2,940.00 $5,880.00 $2,360.00 $4,720.00
61 5210062 955]|L.F. 2" Copper Water Pipe, Type K $45.00 $42,975.00 $48.00 $45,840.00 $55.08 $52,601.40 $55.59 $53,088.45 $65.00 $62,075.00 $40.00 $38,200.00 $50.81 $48,523.55 $69.00 $65,895.00 $44.00 $42,020.00 $91.80 $87,669.00 $89.00 $84,995.00 $46.00 $43,930.00
62 5210066 170]|L.F. 4" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $60.00 $10,200.00 $49.50 $8,415.00 $51.84 $8,812.80 $52.32 $8,894.40 $70.00 $11,900.00 $45.00 $7,650.00 $48.82 $8,299.40 $77.00 $13,090.00 $51.00 $8,670.00 $91.80 $15,606.00 $89.00 $15,130.00 $32.00 $5,440.00
63 5210078 1 Each Manhole, Sanitary Sewer $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $4,104.00 $4,104.00 $3,945.80 $3,945.80 $5,700.00 $5,700.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $4,900.00 $4,900.00 $4,100.00 $4,100.00 $3,078.00 $3,078.00 $2,993.00 $2,993.00 $5,800.00 $5,800.00
64 5210235 50]|L.F. 2" Plastic Gas Main $100.00 $5,000.00 $75.00 $3,750.00 $27.00 $1,350.00 $272.50 $13,625.00 $250.00 $12,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $65.00 $3,250.00 $75.00 $3,750.00 $108.00 $5,400.00 $105.00 $5,250.00 $120.00 $6,000.00
65 5210296 1|Each Water Meter and Vault $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $50,500.00 $50,500.00 $29,700.00 $29,700.00 $29,975.00 $29,975.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $41,000.00 $41,000.00 $9,612.00 $9,612.00 $9,345.00 $9,345.00 $17,750.00 $17,750.00
66 5210349 1|L.S. Fiber Optic Work $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $372,000.00 $372,000.00 $398,040.00 $398,040.00 $372,000.00 $372,000.00 $387,000.00 $387,000.00 $135,000.00 $135,000.00 $195,000.00 $195,000.00 $68,227.00 $68,227.00 $145,800.00 $145,800.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $146,000.00 $146,000.00
67 5210348 1|L.S. Site Electrical Work $550,000.00 $550,000.00 $1,219,000.00 $1,219,000.00 $1,023,000.00 $1,023,000.00 $1,444,500.00 $1,444,500.00 $1,023,000.00 $1,023,000.00 $1,546,000.00 $1,546,000.00 $1,048,000.00 $1,048,000.00 $1,100,000.00 $1,100,000.00 $850,000.00 $850,000.00 $1,047,600.00 $1,047,600.00 $1,617,000.00 $1,617,000.00 $2,450,000.00 $2,450,000.00
68 5210350 1|L.S. Utility Connection Fees (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
69 5210351 60|L.F. 1" Copper Water Pipe, Type K $50.00 $3,000.00 $39.50 $2,370.00 $54.00 $3,240.00 $54.50 $3,270.00 $65.00 $3,900.00 $35.00 $2,100.00 $50.81 $3,048.60 $110.00 $6,600.00 $45.00 $2,700.00 $70.20 $4,212.00 $68.25 $4,095.00 $70.00 $4,200.00
70 5ZL01FHA 1|Each Fire Hydrant Assemblies $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $6,820.00 $6,820.00 $7,020.00 $7,020.00 $7,085.00 $7,085.00 $8,150.00 $8,150.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $7,000.50 $7,000.50 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,400.00 $5,400.00 $5,250.00 $5,250.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00
71 5ZL.03DP 100]L.F. 3" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 52 $60.00 $6,000.00 $96.20 $9,620.00 $91.80 $9,180.00 $92.65 $9,265.00 $130.00 $13,000.00 $70.00 $7,000.00 $90.00 $9,000.00 $175.00 $17,500.00 $88.00 $8,800.00 $118.80 $11,880.00 $115.50 $11,550.00 $85.00 $8,500.00
72 5ZL06DP 285]|L.F. 6" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 52 $90.00 $25,650.00 $80.00 $22,800.00 $97.20 $27,702.00 $70.85 $20,192.25 $95.00 $27,075.00 $70.00 $19,950.00 $87.67 $24,985.95 $140.00 $39,900.00 $82.00 $23,370.00 $135.00 $38,475.00 $131.00 $37,335.00 $69.00 $19,665.00
73 5200012 1|L.S. Demolition of Buildings (1) $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $21,750.00 $21,750.00 $22,113.00 $22,113.00 $19,620.00 $19,620.00 $20,475.00 $20,475.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $20,475.00 $20,475.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $22,115.00 $22,115.00 $17,600.00 $17,600.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00
74 5200013 1]L.S. Demolition of Buildings (2) $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,760.00 $50,760.00 $29,975.00 $29,975.00 $47,000.00 $47,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $47,000.00 $47,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $37,000.00 $37,000.00 $50,760.00 $50,760.00 $59,000.00 $59,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00
75 5200014 1|L.S. Demolition of Buildings (3) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,400.00 $4,400.00 $4,320.00 $4,320.00 $8,175.00 $8,175.00 $4,135.00 $4,135.00 $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $4,135.00 $4,135.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,466.00 $4,466.00 $8,800.00 $8,800.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00
76 5200018 8309|Ton Off-Site Disposal of ID-27 Waste $55.00 $456,995.00 $35.00 $290,815.00 $117.72 $978,135.48 $78.48 $652,090.32 $50.00 $415,450.00 $54.00 $448,686.00 $72.00 $598,248.00 $39.00 $324,051.00 $66.00 $548,394.00 $62.65 $520,558.85 $61.00 $506,849.00 $125.00 $1,038,625.00
77 5Z0FAHOB 1|C.P. Force Account for Hazardous Regulated Material Handling (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
78 5Z0R0OA0B 1|L.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00
79 7CO1TOP 1380|S.Y. Topsoil $8.00 $11,040.00 $25.00 $34,500.00 $7.56 $10,432.80 $4.36 $6,016.80 $4.00 $5,520.00 $5.00 $6,900.00 $4.00 $5,520.00 $3.00 $4,140.00 $4.00 $5,520.00 $4.32 $5,961.60 $5.00 $6,900.00 $2.00 $2,760.00
80 7DO3SED 1380|S.Y. Seeding, Type C $5.00 $6,900.00 $2.50 $3,450.00 $2.16 $2,980.80 $1.31 $1,807.80 $1.20 $1,656.00 $1.20 $1,656.00 $1.20 $1,656.00 $3.00 $4,140.00 $2.00 $2,760.00 $1.30 $1,794.00 $3.00 $4,140.00 $2.00 $2,760.00
81 7N00009 3|Each Flagpole $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $3,024.00 $9,072.00 $4,227.38 $12,682.14 $2,981.00 $8,943.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $5,900.00 $17,700.00 $3,775.00 $11,325.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,400.00 $7,200.00
82 9A00189 1|L.S. Building Equipment - Owner Furnished, Contractor Installed $650,000.00 $650,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $48,600.00 $48,600.00 $259,700.00 $259,700.00 $448,052.00 $448,052.00 $290,000.00 $290,000.00 $270,000.00 $270,000.00 $215,000.00 $215,000.00 $240,683.00 $240,683.00 $275,400.00 $275,400.00 $265,000.00 $265,000.00 $240,000.00 $240,000.00
83 9A00190 1|L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1, Building A $4,220,000.00 $4,220,000.00 $3,461,104.50 $3,461,104.50 $4,774,000.00 $4,774,000.00 $4,370,590.00 $4,370,590.00 $5,637,279.00 $5,637,279.00 $4,717,607.00 $4,717,607.00 $3,806,709.00 $3,806,709.00 $5,475,000.00 $5,475,000.00 $6,400,000.00 $6,400,000.00 $6,482,560.00 $6,482,560.00 $5,506,988.00 $5,506,988.00 $2,653,000.00 $2,653,000.00
84 9A00191 1|L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1, Building A $650,000.00 $650,000.00 $2,200,000.00 $2,200,000.00 $550,800.00 $550,800.00 $572,450.00 $572,450.00 $540,000.00 $540,000.00 $535,728.00 $535,728.00 $2,160,000.00 $2,160,000.00 $777,000.00 $777,000.00 $409,367.00 $409,367.00 $636,840.00 $636,840.00 $2,175,930.00 $2,175,930.00 $3,300,000.00 $3,300,000.00
85 9A00192 1|L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1, Building A $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,400,000.00 $1,400,000.00 $1,600,560.00 $1,600,560.00 $1,524,750.00 $1,524,750.00 $1,136,000.00 $1,136,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,157,000.00 $1,157,000.00 $1,330,000.00 $1,330,000.00 $997,218.00 $997,218.00 $1,343,640.00 $1,343,640.00 $1,075,000.00 $1,075,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $1,700,000.00
86 9A00193 1]L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 1, Building A $1,650,000.00 $1,650,000.00 $2,319,280.00 $2,319,280.00 $1,957,000.00 $1,957,000.00 $2,013,740.00 $2,013,740.00 $1,882,000.00 $1,882,000.00 $1,969,219.00 $1,969,219.00 $1,700,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $2,325,000.00 $2,325,000.00 $2,300,000.00 $2,300,000.00 $2,209,790.00 $2,209,790.00 $1,928,000.00 $1,928,000.00 $2,120,000.00 $2,120,000.00
87 9A00194 1|L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1, Building A $430,000.00 $430,000.00 $540,600.00 $540,600.00 $442,800.00 $442,800.00 $558,540.00 $558,540.00 $386,000.00 $386,000.00 $498,583.00 $498,583.00 $365,000.00 $365,000.00 $630,000.00 $630,000.00 $731,011.00 $731,011.00 $490,370.00 $490,370.00 $479,000.00 $479,000.00 $765,930.00 $765,930.00
88 9A00195 1|L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1, Building B $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $174,000.00 $174,000.00 $112,715.00 $112,715.00 $185,525.00 $185,525.00 $129,835.00 $129,835.00 $525,000.00 $525,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $127,593.00 $127,593.00 $123,040.00 $123,040.00 $100,530.00 $100,530.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00
89 9A00196 1|L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1, Building B $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $32,400.00 $32,400.00 $37,450.00 $37,450.00 $43,000.00 $43,000.00 $25,112.00 $25,112.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,937.00 $40,937.00 $63,850.00 $63,850.00 $39,100.00 $39,100.00 $185,000.00 $185,000.00
90 9A00197 1|L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1, Building B $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $224,000.00 $224,000.00 $259,200.00 $259,200.00 $241,680.00 $241,680.00 $218,000.00 $218,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $183,000.00 $183,000.00 $215,000.00 $215,000.00 $187,595.00 $187,595.00 $168,790.00 $168,790.00 $177,508.00 $177,508.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00
91 9A00198 1|L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 1, Building B $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $113,500.00 $113,500.00 $153,000.00 $153,000.00 $155,820.00 $155,820.00 $147,000.00 $147,000.00 $154,000.00 $154,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $115,000.00 $115,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $109,930.00 $109,930.00 $105,000.00 $105,000.00 $118,000.00 $118,000.00
92 9A00266 1|C.P. Force Account For Building Work Allowances (NO-BID) $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00
93 1F00002 1|L.S. NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (NO-BID) $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00
94 5200186 1|L.S. Universal Waste Removal (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
95 9A00199 1|L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1, Building B $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $11,880.00 $11,880.00 $83,924.33 $83,924.33 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $77,500.00 $77,500.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $6,524.20 $6,524.20 $73,730.00 $73,730.00 $79,000.00 $79,000.00 $60,470.00 $60,470.00

Base Total $14,923,020.00 $15,989,000.00 $16,399,047.43 $16,428,000.00 $16,436,270.75 $16,701,916.00 $16,800,000.00 $18,134,471.75 $18,386,041.20 $18,486,794.45 $18,774,000.00 $19,728,540.00




