
Base Line Item Detail Gaudelli Bros Inc. WHL Enterprises, Inc. T/A Bill Leary AC & Heating ACP Contrtacting Inc

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1 5ZO1HVAC 1 L.S. HVAC Equipment Removal and Replacement at Various Locations $994,200.00 $994,200.00 $1,063,000.00 $1,063,000.00 $1,175,000.00 $1,175,000.00 
2 9AFAE0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 
3 9AFAM0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 
4 9A00173 1 C.P. Force Account for Temporary Heating Allowance (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 
5 5ZOROA0B 1 L.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 
6 5ZOLAM0B 1 L.S. Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 
7 5ZOROL0B 1 L.S. Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 

$1,274,200.00 $1,343,000.00 $1,455,000.00 Base Total


