
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $5,750.00 $5,750.00 

2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $330,000.00 $330,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $415,000.00 $415,000.00 $628,561.00 $628,561.00 

3 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $16,500.00 $16,500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $2,875.00 $2,875.00 

4 1HFP0B 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

5 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $128,000.00 $128,000.00 $112,300.00 $112,300.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $184,200.00 $184,200.00 $265,000.00 $265,000.00 $13,606.00 $13,606.00 

6 2A06CAG 45 Each Sealing of Abandoned Well $725.00 $32,625.00 $700.00 $31,500.00 $2,500.00 $112,500.00 $2,000.00 $90,000.00 $800.00 $36,000.00 $1,380.00 $62,100.00 

7 2A08CAG 18 Each Monitoring Well $3,100.00 $55,800.00 $6,000.00 $108,000.00 $4,500.00 $81,000.00 $5,125.00 $92,250.00 $3,300.00 $59,400.00 $3,220.00 $57,960.00 

8 2B02REX 1,936.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $20.00 $38,720.00 $13.00 $25,168.00 $35.00 $67,760.00 $16.60 $32,137.60 $40.00 $77,440.00 $69.00 $133,584.00 

9 2B15STS 573 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $10.00 $5,730.00 $13.00 $7,449.00 $30.00 $17,190.00 $10.50 $6,016.50 $1.00 $573.00 $9.20 $5,271.60 

10 2C02EMB 984 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $39.00 $38,376.00 $32.00 $31,488.00 $28.00 $27,552.00 $37.45 $36,850.80 $55.00 $54,120.00 $46.00 $45,264.00 

11 2C01EMB 18,599.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $9.00 $167,391.00 $33.60 $624,926.40 $24.00 $446,376.00 $17.40 $323,622.60 $15.00 $278,985.00 $36.80 $684,443.20 

12 2E01CAL 4 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate Layer $100.00 $400.00 $158.00 $632.00 $60.00 $240.00 $125.00 $500.00 $100.00 $400.00 $115.00 $460.00 

13 2E01FEX 500 C.Y. Foundataion Excavation $20.00 $10,000.00 $32.00 $16,000.00 $35.00 $17,500.00 $28.00 $14,000.00 $32.00 $16,000.00 $69.00 $34,500.00 

14 2H00007 2,602.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $5.00 $13,010.00 $7.00 $18,214.00 $11.00 $28,622.00 $6.50 $16,913.00 $8.00 $20,816.00 $2.30 $5,984.60 

15 2H40TEC 15 Each Inlet Filters $150.00 $2,250.00 $315.00 $4,725.00 $400.00 $6,000.00 $120.00 $1,800.00 $150.00 $2,250.00 $103.50 $1,552.50 

16 2H45TEC 103 Ton Construction Driveway $45.00 $4,635.00 $42.00 $4,326.00 $65.00 $6,695.00 $65.00 $6,695.00 $40.00 $4,120.00 $126.50 $13,029.50 

17 2H00021 2 Each Concrete Washout Facility $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,575.00 $3,150.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $18,000.00 $36,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,875.00 $5,750.00 

18 2B11REC 17,005.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Contaminated Soil $23.00 $391,115.00 $21.00 $357,105.00 $20.00 $340,100.00 $12.10 $205,760.50 $19.00 $323,095.00 $17.62 $299,628.10 

19 3A05ABC 4,102.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 5" Thick $8.00 $32,816.00 $9.00 $36,918.00 $15.00 $61,530.00 $7.75 $31,790.50 $7.00 $28,714.00 $11.50 $47,173.00 

20 3A08ABC 678 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8" Thick $12.75 $8,644.50 $14.00 $9,492.00 $20.00 $13,560.00 $12.75 $8,644.50 $10.00 $6,780.00 $18.40 $12,475.20 

21 3BAPA0B 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

22 3B34HMA 848 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19M 76 Intermediate Course $110.00 $93,280.00 $100.00 $84,800.00 $100.00 $84,800.00 $95.00 $80,560.00 $110.00 $93,280.00 $141.45 $119,949.60 

23 3B33HMA 283 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M 64 Base Course $103.00 $29,149.00 $92.00 $26,036.00 $100.00 $28,300.00 $95.00 $26,885.00 $100.00 $28,300.00 $141.45 $40,030.35 

24 3B32HMA 1,253.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M 76 Surface Course $106.00 $132,818.00 $100.00 $125,300.00 $110.00 $137,830.00 $98.00 $122,794.00 $110.00 $137,830.00 $179.40 $224,788.20 

25 3D01SCS 1 Each Oil-Water Separator Concrete Slab $6,700.00 $6,700.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $9,450.00 $9,450.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $3,335.00 $3,335.00 

26 3E07PMR 5,926.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2" Depth $4.75 $28,148.50 $10.50 $62,223.00 $8.00 $47,408.00 $4.25 $25,185.50 $6.50 $38,519.00 $5.75 $34,074.50 

27 3B26TAC 1,163.00 GAL Tack Coat $5.40 $6,280.20 $4.00 $4,652.00 $6.00 $6,978.00 $4.50 $5,233.50 $0.01 $11.63 $4.60 $5,349.80 

28 3D08PCP 83 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement, 8" Thick $120.00 $9,960.00 $91.00 $7,553.00 $100.00 $8,300.00 $175.00 $14,525.00 $175.00 $14,525.00 $142.60 $11,835.80 

29 4A10RFS 382 LB Reinforcement Steel $3.00 $1,146.00 $3.50 $1,337.00 $10.00 $3,820.00 $2.00 $764.00 $4.00 $1,528.00 $2.30 $878.60 

30 4O02TSP 9,380.00 S.F. Temporary Sheeting to Remain in Place $44.00 $412,720.00 $80.00 $750,400.00 $60.00 $562,800.00 $98.70 $925,806.00 $75.00 $703,500.00 $28.75 $269,675.00 

31 5B04PVC 149 L.F. 4" PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $40.00 $5,960.00 $36.75 $5,475.75 $65.00 $9,685.00 $25.00 $3,725.00 $35.00 $5,215.00 $46.00 $6,854.00 

32 5B06PVC 348 L.F. 6" PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $45.00 $15,660.00 $37.80 $13,154.40 $70.00 $24,360.00 $35.00 $12,180.00 $30.00 $10,440.00 $46.00 $16,008.00 

33 5B00093 51 L.F. 3" PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $40.00 $2,040.00 $42.00 $2,142.00 $60.00 $3,060.00 $23.00 $1,173.00 $35.00 $1,785.00 $46.00 $2,346.00 

34 5B18RC3 356 L.F. 18" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $60.00 $21,360.00 $42.00 $14,952.00 $115.00 $40,940.00 $40.00 $14,240.00 $65.00 $23,140.00 $63.25 $22,517.00 

35 5ZL0066 45 L.F. 4" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $50.00 $2,250.00 $42.00 $1,890.00 $65.00 $2,925.00 $35.00 $1,575.00 $65.00 $2,925.00 $51.75 $2,328.75 

36 5ZL0032 42 L.F. 6" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $50.00 $2,100.00 $42.00 $1,764.00 $68.00 $2,856.00 $38.00 $1,596.00 $70.00 $2,940.00 $48.30 $2,028.60 

37 5ZL0044 822 L.F. 8" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $40.00 $32,880.00 $44.10 $36,250.20 $71.00 $58,362.00 $40.00 $32,880.00 $60.00 $49,320.00 $62.00 $50,964.00 

38 5C00022 2 Each Reset Existing Casting $650.00 $1,300.00 $1,575.00 $3,150.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $250.00 $500.00 $400.00 $800.00 $230.00 $460.00 

39 5C01ND3 2 Each Inlet, Type D3 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $3,675.00 $7,350.00 $3,700.00 $7,400.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $3,200.00 $6,400.00 $4,025.00 $8,050.00 

40 5C10ED3 2 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D3, Using Existing Grate and Frame $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,150.00 $6,300.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $1,850.00 $3,700.00 $1,600.00 $3,200.00 $2,300.00 $4,600.00 

41 5C25EP1 2 Each Reconstructed Manhole, Type P-1, Using Existing Cover and Frame $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,150.00 $6,300.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $1,450.00 $2,900.00 $1,600.00 $3,200.00 $2,300.00 $4,600.00 

42 5C40RSF 3 Each Reset Frame $500.00 $1,500.00 $1,575.00 $4,725.00 $1,700.00 $5,100.00 $250.00 $750.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $230.00 $690.00 

43 5D10INC 9 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $850.00 $7,650.00 $840.00 $7,560.00 $700.00 $6,300.00 $600.00 $5,400.00 $1,200.00 $10,800.00 $345.00 $3,105.00 

44 N5F0001 2,233.00 L.F. 9" X 18" Concrete Curb $21.00 $46,893.00 $16.80 $37,514.40 $28.00 $62,524.00 $22.00 $49,126.00 $28.00 $62,524.00 $26.45 $59,062.85 

45 5I01SNP 41 S.F. Sign Panels $20.00 $820.00 $25.00 $1,025.00 $35.00 $1,435.00 $28.00 $1,148.00 $20.00 $820.00 $21.28 $872.48 

46 N5I0002 183 L.F. Timber Posts $16.50 $3,019.50 $30.00 $5,490.00 $30.00 $5,490.00 $24.00 $4,392.00 $50.00 $9,150.00 $17.83 $3,262.89 

47 5J52ABG 3 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $1,300.00 $3,900.00 $1,330.00 $3,990.00 $1,300.00 $3,900.00 $950.00 $2,850.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,374.25 $4,122.75 

48 5J52BGR 220 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $51.00 $11,220.00 $60.00 $13,200.00 $60.00 $13,200.00 $35.00 $7,700.00 $40.00 $8,800.00 $57.44 $12,636.80 

49 5K72TCL 338 L.F. Temporary Chain Link Fence , 72" High $8.50 $2,873.00 $10.50 $3,549.00 $15.00 $5,070.00 $22.00 $7,436.00 $35.00 $11,830.00 $18.79 $6,351.02 

50 5K00021 2,005.00 L.F. Temporary Fencing, 96" High $10.00 $20,050.00 $12.60 $25,263.00 $25.00 $50,125.00 $25.50 $51,127.50 $35.00 $70,175.00 $10.89 $21,834.45 

51 5N04PCS 130 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $70.00 $9,100.00 $56.70 $7,371.00 $100.00 $13,000.00 $45.00 $5,850.00 $85.00 $11,050.00 $72.97 $9,486.10 

52 5N07CHR 1 Each Concrete Handicap Ramp $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $945.00 $945.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $1,500.10 $1,500.10 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $345.00 $345.00 

53 5P21LLS 6,166.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $0.65 $4,007.90 $0.80 $4,932.80 $2.00 $12,332.00 $1.50 $9,249.00 $0.65 $4,007.90 $0.69 $4,254.54 

54 5P33LLM 108 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long - Life, Thermoplastic $9.00 $972.00 $10.00 $1,080.00 $2.00 $216.00 $35.00 $3,780.00 $10.00 $1,080.00 $9.78 $1,056.24 

55 5Q01FOD 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type D $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $105,000.00 $105,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $63,767.50 $63,767.50 

56 5Q02MFD 14 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type D $4,500.00 $63,000.00 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 $2,500.00 $35,000.00 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 $3,200.00 $44,800.00 $1,523.75 $21,332.50 

57 5V01PIT 20 Each Test Pits $325.00 $6,500.00 $315.00 $6,300.00 $1,000.00 $20,000.00 $200.00 $4,000.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $28.75 $575.00 

58 5ZL0069 2 Each Connection To Existing Sanitary Manhole $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $3,150.00 $6,300.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 $920.00 $1,840.00 

59 5ZL0088 6 Each Manhole, Sanitary Sewer, 5' Diameter $4,500.00 $27,000.00 $4,200.00 $25,200.00 $4,000.00 $24,000.00 $4,000.00 $24,000.00 $3,200.00 $19,200.00 $7,475.00 $44,850.00 
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60 5ZL0295 1 Each 3" Sanitary Sewer Clean Out $420.00 $420.00 $1,575.00 $1,575.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $450.00 $450.00 $500.00 $500.00 $172.50 $172.50 

61 5ZL0067 1 Each 4" Sanitary Sewer Clean Out $420.00 $420.00 $1,575.00 $1,575.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $450.00 $450.00 $500.00 $500.00 $230.00 $230.00 

62 5ZL0068 1 Each 6" Sanitary Sewer Clean Out $550.00 $550.00 $1,680.00 $1,680.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $475.00 $475.00 $500.00 $500.00 $287.50 $287.50 

64 5ZL0136 470 L.F. 6" Ductile Iron Water Pipe $70.00 $32,900.00 $68.25 $32,077.50 $90.00 $42,300.00 $65.00 $30,550.00 $70.00 $32,900.00 $85.10 $39,997.00 

65 5ZL0020 1 Each Water Service Connection $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $5,775.00 $5,775.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $4,125.00 $4,125.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $13,225.00 $13,225.00 

66 5ZL10MTD 1 Each Manufactured Treatment Devices $21,700.00 $21,700.00 $31,500.00 $31,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $31,210.00 $31,210.00 $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $46,000.00 $46,000.00 

67 5ZL0332 92 L.F. 3" Plastic Gas Main $80.00 $7,360.00 $50.00 $4,600.00 $65.00 $5,980.00 $60.00 $5,520.00 $35.00 $3,220.00 $51.75 $4,761.00 

68 5ZO0027 10 Each Bollards $600.00 $6,000.00 $945.00 $9,450.00 $700.00 $7,000.00 $325.00 $3,250.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $573.85 $5,738.50 

69 9A01UBW 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work $1,082,000.00 $1,082,000.00 $1,764,334.55 $1,764,334.55 $1,620,000.00 $1,620,000.00 $2,324,767.00 $2,324,767.00 $320,000.00 $320,000.00 $1,548,324.25 $1,548,324.25 

70 9A03UBW 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work $243,000.00 $243,000.00 $156,000.00 $156,000.00 $220,000.00 $220,000.00 $153,500.00 $153,500.00 $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $242,650.00 $242,650.00 

71 9A04UBW 1 L.S. Building Electric Work $445,000.00 $445,000.00 $430,900.00 $430,900.00 $466,000.00 $466,000.00 $376,000.00 $376,000.00 $550,000.00 $550,000.00 $485,748.00 $485,748.00 

72 9A44UBW 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work $568,000.00 $568,000.00 $529,000.00 $529,000.00 $585,000.00 $585,000.00 $530,000.00 $530,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $690,000.00 $690,000.00 

73 9A45UBW 1 L.S. Building Structural Work $410,000.00 $410,000.00 $265,000.00 $265,000.00 $340,000.00 $340,000.00 $274,000.00 $274,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $316,250.00 $316,250.00 

74 9AFAA0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Architectural Work Allowances (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 

75 9AFAE0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

76 9AFAM0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

77 9AFAP0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Plumbing Work Allowances (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

78 9AFAS0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Structural Work Allowances (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

79 5ZL0261 1 L.S. Site Electrical & Communication Work $123,700.00 $123,700.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $111,000.00 $111,000.00 $119,151.50 $119,151.50 

80 5ZO0018 8,500.00 Ton Off-Site Disposal of ID-27 Waste $43.00 $365,500.00 $48.30 $410,550.00 $60.00 $510,000.00 $53.15 $451,775.00 $85.00 $722,500.00 $71.88 $610,980.00 

81 2MTSW0B 100 Each Testing of Soils for Waste Classification (NO-BID) $500.00 $50,000.00 $500.00 $50,000.00 $500.00 $50,000.00 $500.00 $50,000.00 $500.00 $50,000.00 $500.00 $50,000.00 

82 5ZOFAH0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Hazardous Regulated Material Handling (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 

83 5ZO0012 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (1) $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $51,000.00 $51,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $32,350.00 $32,350.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $37,202.50 $37,202.50 

84 5ZO0013 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (2) $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $56,500.00 $56,500.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $12,200.00 $12,200.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $14,030.00 $14,030.00 

85 5ZO0014 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (3) $29,200.00 $29,200.00 $24,800.00 $24,800.00 $33,000.00 $33,000.00 $16,400.00 $16,400.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $18,860.00 $18,860.00 

86 5ZO0015 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (4) $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $49,300.00 $49,300.00 $53,000.00 $53,000.00 $29,350.00 $29,350.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $33,752.50 $33,752.50 

87 5ZO0021 4 Each Removal of Underground Storage Tanks $18,000.00 $72,000.00 $15,750.00 $63,000.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00 $27,500.00 $110,000.00 $20,000.00 $80,000.00 $69,000.00 $276,000.00 

88 5ZOROA0B 1 L.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 

89 5ZO0186 1 L.S. Universal Waste Removal (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 

90 5ZO0046 1 Each Waste Oil Tank, 250 Gallons $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $9,481.75 $9,481.75 

91 5ZO0140 1 Each Leak Monitoring System $7,150.00 $7,150.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,840.00 $1,840.00 

92 9A00157 1 Each Wall Mounted Funnel $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $500.00 $500.00 $300.00 $300.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,750.00 $5,750.00 

93 5N01HPD 1 L.S. Helipad $98,000.00 $98,000.00 $105,000.00 $105,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $130,000.00 $130,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $54,872.25 $54,872.25 

94 7C01TOP 3,596.00 S.Y. Topsoil $3.10 $11,147.60 $8.50 $30,566.00 $8.00 $28,768.00 $4.50 $16,182.00 $1.50 $5,394.00 $2.30 $8,270.80 

95 7D03SED 3,596.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $1.00 $3,596.00 $1.50 $5,394.00 $4.00 $14,384.00 $1.40 $5,034.40 $1.00 $3,596.00 $1.04 $3,739.84 

96 7.00E+68 3 Each Planting, Eastern Redbud (Cercis canadensis) $350.00 $1,050.00 $435.00 $1,305.00 $120.00 $360.00 $300.00 $900.00 $450.00 $1,350.00 $385.25 $1,155.75 

97 N7E0055 20 Each Planting, Stella D'Oro Daylilly (Hemerocallis Stella D'Oro) $17.00 $340.00 $25.00 $500.00 $40.00 $800.00 $10.00 $200.00 $20.00 $400.00 $18.40 $368.00 

98 7.00E+59 16 Each Planting, Blue Rug Juniper (Juniperus Horizontalis) $53.00 $848.00 $45.00 $720.00 $35.00 $560.00 $45.00 $720.00 $40.00 $640.00 $57.50 $920.00 

99 7.00E+60 1,340.00 Each Planting, Creeping Lilyturf (Liriope Spiciata) $17.00 $22,780.00 $12.00 $16,080.00 $8.00 $10,720.00 $7.00 $9,380.00 $9.00 $12,060.00 $18.40 $24,656.00 

100 N7E0057 30 Each Planting, King Alfred Daffodil (Narcissus) $5.25 $157.50 $1.75 $52.50 $5.00 $150.00 $10.00 $300.00 $5.00 $150.00 $5.75 $172.50 

101 7.00E+62 30 Each Planting, Primeur Daffodil (Narcissus 'Primeur') $5.25 $157.50 $1.75 $52.50 $5.00 $150.00 $10.00 $300.00 $5.00 $150.00 $5.75 $172.50 

102 7.00E+127 3 Each Planting, Blue Spruce (Picea Pungens 'Bakeri') $375.00 $1,125.00 $275.00 $825.00 $60.00 $180.00 $300.00 $900.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $402.50 $1,207.50 

103 7.00E+58 20 Each Planting, Black Eyed Susan (Rudbeckia Fulgida Speciosa) $17.00 $340.00 $20.00 $400.00 $15.00 $300.00 $15.00 $300.00 $20.00 $400.00 $18.40 $368.00 

104 N7E0045 16 Each Planting, Inkberry (Ilex Glabra) $65.00 $1,040.00 $90.00 $1,440.00 $20.00 $320.00 $60.00 $960.00 $75.00 $1,200.00 $69.00 $1,104.00 

105 7L01NVA 560 S.Y. Nonvegetative Surface, Hot Mix Asphalt $23.50 $13,160.00 $53.00 $29,680.00 $100.00 $56,000.00 $23.00 $12,880.00 $38.57 $21,599.20 $179.40 $100,464.00 

106 8B31MPT 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $27,500.00 $27,500.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $82,410.00 $82,410.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $6,900.00 $6,900.00 

$6,542,511.20 $7,237,000.00 $7,696,913.00 $7,727,000.00 $7,736,547.73 $8,114,889.16 Base Total


