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Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $378,000.00 $378,000.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $307,000.00 $307,000.00

2 1D10MOB 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $1,335,000.00 $1,335,000.00 $1,380,000.00 $1,380,000.00 $1,630,000.00 $1,630,000.00 $2,100,000.00 $2,100,000.00

3 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $18,592.00 $18,592.00 $1.00 $1.00

4 1HFP0B 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00

5 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00

6 2B02REX 855 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $38.00 $32,490.00 $72.00 $61,560.00 $65.69 $56,164.95 $300.00 $256,500.00

7 2B15STS 970 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $8.00 $7,760.00 $10.00 $9,700.00 $36.78 $35,676.60 $114.00 $110,580.00

8 2BETU0B 1 L.S.
Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (NO-
BID)

$5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

9 2C01EMB 395 C.Y. Embankment, Common $19.00 $7,505.00 $49.50 $19,552.50 $42.27 $16,696.65 $175.00 $69,125.00

10 2C02EMB 1,325.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $43.00 $56,975.00 $90.50 $119,912.50 $58.73 $77,817.25 $116.00 $153,700.00

11 2H00007 7,675.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $4.50 $34,537.50 $9.50 $72,912.50 $9.09 $69,765.75 $15.00 $115,125.00

12 2H00016 108 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $110.00 $11,880.00 $210.00 $22,680.00 $192.62 $20,802.96 $190.00 $20,520.00

13 2H25TEC 300 C.Y. Hay Bales $1.00 $300.00 $115.00 $34,500.00 $111.81 $33,543.00 $109.00 $32,700.00

14 2K01TPF 660 L.F. Temporary Orange Plastic Fence $5.00 $3,300.00 $10.00 $6,600.00 $5.36 $3,537.60 $10.00 $6,600.00

15 2M00008 200 Ton Disposal of Acid Producing Soil $39.00 $7,800.00 $65.00 $13,000.00 $66.54 $13,308.00 $0.01 $2.00

16 3A07ABC 2,485.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6.5" Thick $29.00 $72,065.00 $32.00 $79,520.00 $29.93 $74,376.05 $61.00 $151,585.00

17 3B26TAC 185 GAL Tack Coat $1.00 $185.00 $5.00 $925.00 $5.07 $937.95 $6.00 $1,110.00

18 3B32HMA 440 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M 76 Surface Course $110.00 $48,400.00 $150.00 $66,000.00 $240.59 $105,859.60 $529.00 $232,760.00

19 3B33HMA 1,110.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M 64 Base Course $108.00 $119,880.00 $77.00 $85,470.00 $232.06 $257,586.60 $529.00 $587,190.00

20 3B34HMA 515 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19M 76 Intermediate Course $108.00 $55,620.00 $96.00 $49,440.00 $240.56 $123,888.40 $529.00 $272,435.00

21 3BAPA0B 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00

22 3C01BRS 12,880.00 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $35.00 $450,800.00 $25.00 $322,000.00 $56.07 $722,181.60 $25.00 $322,000.00

23 3C03BRS 290.00 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 4" Thick $16.00 $4,640.00 $18.00 $5,220.00 $42.61 $12,356.90 $35.00 $10,150.00

24 3E20PMR 1035 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Variable Depth $51.00 $52,785.00 $16.00 $16,560.00 $43.66 $45,188.10 $59.00 $61,065.00

25 4A11RFS 197205 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $2.00 $394,410.00 $1.45 $285,947.25 $3.02 $595,559.10 $2.50 $493,012.50

26 4C00025 1 L.S. Structural Steel (Approximately 8700 Pounds) $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $32,700.00 $32,700.00 $28,007.18 $28,007.18 $201,500.00 $201,500.00

27 4F00015 24 Each Remove Existing Overhead Span Sign Structure $16,100.00 $386,400.00 $12,250.00 $294,000.00 $85,000.00 $2,040,000.00 $21,000.00 $504,000.00

28 4F00016 8 Each Remove Existing Overhead Cantilever Sign Structure $7,400.00 $59,200.00 $9,500.00 $76,000.00 $21,391.46 $171,131.68 $14,050.00 $112,400.00

29 4F00018 38 C.Y. Concrete Column For Sign Structures $1,790.00 $68,020.00 $975.00 $37,050.00 $2,347.42 $89,201.96 $1,068.00 $40,584.00

30 4F00051 2 Each Remove Existing Overhead Butterfly Sign Structure $8,100.00 $16,200.00 $11,500.00 $23,000.00 $20,133.28 $40,266.56 $14,050.00 $28,100.00

31 4F01BMS 13 Each Remove Existing Bridge Mounted Sign Support $5,400.00 $70,200.00 $8,200.00 $106,600.00 $10,271.74 $133,532.62 $14,050.00 $182,650.00

32 4F01GMP 11645 LB Aluminum Posts for Ground Mounted Signs $18.00 $209,610.00 $16.00 $186,320.00 $18.46 $214,966.70 $41.00 $477,445.00

33 4F05GMF 120 C.Y. Concrete Foundations for Ground Mounted Signs $200.00 $24,000.00 $1,220.00 $146,400.00 $1,941.37 $232,964.40 $2,805.00 $336,600.00

34 4F11CSP 721 C.Y. Concrete in Structures, Pedestals $1,893.00 $1,364,853.00 $670.00 $483,070.00 $2,514.63 $1,813,048.23 $4,100.00 $2,956,100.00

35 4F01RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 1 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $19,655.26 $19,655.26 $18,400.00 $18,400.00

36 4F02RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 2 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $19,655.26 $19,655.26 $18,400.00 $18,400.00

37 4F03RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 3 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $19,655.26 $19,655.26 $18,400.00 $18,400.00
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38 4F04RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 4 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $19,655.26 $19,655.26 $18,400.00 $18,400.00

39 4F05RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 5 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00 $19,655.26 $19,655.26 $18,400.00 $18,400.00

40 4F06RCS 1 L.S. Relocate Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 6 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $32,250.00 $32,250.00 $19,655.26 $19,655.26 $18,400.00 $18,400.00

41 4F01CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 1 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $51,560.00 $51,560.00

42 4F02CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 2 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $51,960.00 $51,960.00

43 4F03CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 3 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $51,960.00 $51,960.00

44 4F04CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 4 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $51,960.00 $51,960.00

45 4F05CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 5 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $51,960.00 $51,960.00

46 4F06CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 6 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $51,960.00 $51,960.00

47 4F07CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 7 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $51,960.00 $51,960.00

48 4F08CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 8 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $51,960.00 $51,960.00

49 4F09CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 9 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $51,840.00 $51,840.00

50 4F10CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 10 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $52,240.00 $52,240.00

51 4F11CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 11 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $52,240.00 $52,240.00

52 4F12CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 12 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $52,630.00 $52,630.00

53 4F13CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 13 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $53,020.00 $53,020.00

54 4F14CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 14 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $53,020.00 $53,020.00

55 4F15CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 15 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $53,420.00 $53,420.00

56 4F16CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 16 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $53,420.00 $53,420.00

57 4F17CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 17 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $53,420.00 $53,420.00

58 4F18CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 18 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $53,420.00 $53,420.00

59 4F19CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 19 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $53,420.00 $53,420.00

60 4F21CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 20 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $53,420.00 $53,420.00

61 4F23CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 21 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $53,420.00 $53,420.00

62 4F24CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 22 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $53,420.00 $53,420.00

63 4F25CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 23 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $52,320.00 $52,320.00

64 4F22CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 24 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $52,720.00 $52,720.00

65 4F26CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 25 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $54,400.00 $54,400.00

66 4F27CSS 1 L.S. Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 26 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $54,400.00 $54,400.00

67 4F01OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 1 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $54,410.00 $54,410.00

68 4F02OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 2 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $54,410.00 $54,410.00

69 4F03OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 3 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $51,625.00 $51,625.00

70 4F04OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 4 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $50,650.00 $50,650.00

71 4F05OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 5 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $50,610.00 $50,610.00

72 4F06OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 6 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $51,580.00 $51,580.00

73 4F07OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 7 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $52,590.00 $52,590.00

74 4F08OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 8 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $51,400.00 $51,400.00

75 4F09OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 9 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $51,980.00 $51,980.00

76 4F10OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 10 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $51,980.00 $51,980.00

77 4F11OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 11 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $52,200.00 $52,200.00

78 4F12OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 12 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $47,250.00 $47,250.00

79 4F13OBS 1 L.S. Overhead Butterfly Sign Support Structure No. 13 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $52,200.00 $52,200.00

80 4F26OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 1 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $93,885.00 $93,885.00

81 4F33OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 2 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $198,000.00 $198,000.00 $86,675.00 $86,675.00

82 4F34OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 3 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $199,900.00 $199,900.00 $91,450.00 $91,450.00

83 4F35OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 4 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $214,500.00 $214,500.00 $91,450.00 $91,450.00
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84 4F36OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 5 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $211,150.00 $211,150.00 $91,450.00 $91,450.00

85 4F37OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 6 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $211,150.00 $211,150.00 $95,870.00 $95,870.00

86 4F38OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 7 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $198,200.00 $198,200.00 $95,870.00 $95,870.00

87 4F50OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 8 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $211,150.00 $211,150.00 $95,870.00 $95,870.00

88 4F51OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 9 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $218,500.00 $218,500.00 $95,870.00 $95,870.00

89 4F52OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 10 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $198,000.00 $198,000.00 $249,800.00 $249,800.00 $98,300.00 $98,300.00

90 4F53OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 11 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $212,250.00 $212,250.00 $98,300.00 $98,300.00

91 4F54OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 12 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $198,200.00 $198,200.00 $98,300.00 $98,300.00

92 4F44OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 13 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $180,000.00 $180,000.00 $234,100.00 $234,100.00 $100,700.00 $100,700.00

93 4F55OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 14 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $180,000.00 $180,000.00 $234,650.00 $234,650.00 $104,300.00 $104,300.00

94 4F46OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 15 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $201,600.00 $201,600.00 $104,300.00 $104,300.00

95 4F47OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 16 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $211,700.00 $211,700.00 $104,300.00 $104,300.00

96 4F48OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 17 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $214,500.00 $214,500.00 $108,000.00 $108,000.00

97 4F49OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 18 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $198,200.00 $198,200.00 $122,400.00 $122,400.00

98 4F56OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 19 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $213,400.00 $213,400.00 $122,400.00 $122,400.00

99 4F57OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 20 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $213,400.00 $213,400.00 $122,400.00 $122,400.00

100 4F58OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 21 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $219,000.00 $219,000.00 $93,600.00 $93,600.00

101 4F59OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 22 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $200,500.00 $200,500.00 $93,600.00 $93,600.00

102 4F60OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 23 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $198,200.00 $198,200.00 $103,000.00 $103,000.00

103 4F61OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 24 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $207,800.00 $207,800.00 $108,750.00 $108,750.00

104 4F62OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 25 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $197,000.00 $197,000.00 $110,200.00 $110,200.00

105 4F63OSS 1 L.S. Overhead Span Sign Support Structure No. 26 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $219,000.00 $219,000.00 $133,500.00 $133,500.00

106 4F30BMS 1 L.S. Bridge Mounted Sign Support Structure No. 1 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $20,730.00 $20,730.00

107 4F01CMS 1 L.S. Concrete Mounted Sign Support Structure No. 1 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $15,250.00 $15,250.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,865.00 $4,865.00

108 4F02CMS 1 L.S. Concrete Mounted Sign Support Structure No. 2 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $15,250.00 $15,250.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,865.00 $4,865.00

109 4F01MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 1 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $15,200.00 $15,200.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

110 4F02MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 2 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $15,200.00 $15,200.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

111 4F03MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 3 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $15,200.00 $15,200.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

112 4F04MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 4 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $15,200.00 $15,200.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

113 4F05MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 5 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $15,200.00 $15,200.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

114 4F06MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 6 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $15,200.00 $15,200.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

115 4F07MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 7 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $15,200.00 $15,200.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

116 4F08MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 8 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $6,100.00 $6,100.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

117 4F09MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 9 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $6,100.00 $6,100.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

118 4F10MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 10 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

119 4F11MSS 1 L.S. Modify Sign Structure No. 11 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

120 4ZL0001 3632 L.F. 30" Diameter Drilled Shaft $1,498.00 $5,440,736.00 $800.00 $2,905,600.00 $777.20 $2,822,790.40 $1,183.00 $4,296,656.00

121 4ZL0016 1344 L.F. 54" Drilled Shaft for Sign Structures $2,251.00 $3,025,344.00 $875.00 $1,176,000.00 $1,603.22 $2,154,727.68 $1,476.00 $1,983,744.00

122 4ZN0177 1 L.S.
Furnish And Install Overhead Span VMS/VSLS Support 
Structure, Turnpike MP 69.30 NSI

$151,000.00 $151,000.00 $285,000.00 $285,000.00 $340,000.00 $340,000.00 $263,500.00 $263,500.00

123 5A08PUD 2400 L.F. 8" Pipe Underdrain $15.00 $36,000.00 $41.00 $98,400.00 $19.35 $46,440.00 $150.00 $360,000.00

124 5D10INC 155 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $1,000.00 $155,000.00 $367.00 $56,885.00 $1,198.40 $185,752.00 $0.01 $1.55

125 5E01ALC 125 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $14.00 $1,750.00 $26.00 $3,250.00 $33.47 $4,183.75 $27.00 $3,375.00

126 5F00002 60 S.Y. Concrete Island, 4" Thick $52.00 $3,120.00 $52.00 $3,120.00 $120.96 $7,257.60 $190.00 $11,400.00

127 5F01VCA 175 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $64.00 $11,200.00 $18.00 $3,150.00 $79.52 $13,916.00 $65.00 $11,375.00

128 5F01VCB 275 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type B $64.00 $17,600.00 $18.00 $4,950.00 $56.00 $15,400.00 $65.00 $17,875.00
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129 5H00001 181 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Protection, Variable Height $124.00 $22,444.00 $80.00 $14,480.00 $292.32 $52,909.92 $773.00 $139,913.00

130 5H01CMB 465 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Roadway $124.00 $57,660.00 $82.00 $38,130.00 $427.84 $198,945.60 $773.00 $359,445.00

131 5H03CMB 2295 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Protection $124.00 $284,580.00 $84.00 $192,780.00 $273.28 $627,177.60 $773.00 $1,774,035.00

132 5H04CMB 27 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Roadway, Vaiable Height $124.00 $3,348.00 $130.00 $3,510.00 $560.00 $15,120.00 $773.00 $20,871.00

133 5H30CRR 1277 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier Removal, Roadway $39.00 $49,803.00 $7.50 $9,577.50 $79.93 $102,070.61 $126.00 $160,902.00

134 5I00005 322 Each Remove Existing Overhead Sign Panels $850.00 $273,700.00 $0.01 $3.22 $0.01 $3.22 $2,800.00 $901,600.00

135 5I00RGM 43 Each Removal of Existing Ground-Mounted Sign $650.00 $27,950.00 $2,550.00 $109,650.00 $551.72 $23,723.96 $2,850.00 $122,550.00

136 5I01FSP 67644 S.F. Furnish And Install Overhead Sign Panels $19.50 $1,319,058.00 $45.00 $3,043,980.00 $36.43 $2,464,270.92 $42.00 $2,841,048.00

137 5I02FSP 6181 S.F. Furnish And Install Ground Mounted Sign Panels $25.00 $154,525.00 $35.00 $216,335.00 $40.99 $253,359.19 $42.00 $259,602.00

138 5I05SPP 1645 L.F. U-channel Post $16.00 $26,320.00 $15.00 $24,675.00 $21.34 $35,104.30 $33.00 $54,285.00

139 5I16REL 2 Each Relocate Sign Panels $3,700.00 $7,400.00 $4,750.00 $9,500.00 $5,339.65 $10,679.30 $16,815.00 $33,630.00

140 5J00FGT 10 Each Flared Guide Rail Terminal $1,700.00 $17,000.00 $2,200.00 $22,000.00 $2,240.00 $22,400.00 $2,950.00 $29,500.00

141 5J01PCA 42 Each Parapet Connection, Type A $1,650.00 $69,300.00 $1,800.00 $75,600.00 $1,904.00 $79,968.00 $2,183.00 $91,686.00

142 5J01PCB 43 Each Parapet Connection, Type B $650.00 $27,950.00 $265.00 $11,395.00 $280.00 $12,040.00 $236.00 $10,148.00

143 5J01RBG 10534 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide rail $3.70 $38,975.80 $1.10 $11,587.40 $1.12 $11,798.08 $1.00 $10,534.00

144 5J51BGE 100 L.F. Beam Guide Rail Element $4.00 $400.00 $9.00 $900.00 $8.96 $896.00 $18.00 $1,800.00

145 5J51TTS 3 Each Tangent Guide Rail Terminal $2,200.00 $6,600.00 $2,200.00 $6,600.00 $2,240.00 $6,720.00 $3,540.00 $10,620.00

146 5J52ABG 21 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $640.00 $13,440.00 $540.00 $11,340.00 $560.00 $11,760.00 $885.00 $18,585.00

147 5J52BGD 113 L.F. Beam Guide Rail, Dual-Faced $24.00 $2,712.00 $31.00 $3,503.00 $31.36 $3,543.68 $42.00 $4,746.00

148 5J52BGR 11772 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $22.00 $258,984.00 $28.75 $338,445.00 $29.68 $349,392.96 $19.50 $229,554.00

149 5J53RRS 2940 L.F. Rub Rail $7.00 $20,580.00 $6.50 $19,110.00 $6.72 $19,756.80 $11.80 $34,692.00

150 5J54BGP 104 Each Beam Guide Rail Post $37.00 $3,848.00 $56.00 $5,824.00 $61.60 $6,406.40 $88.50 $9,204.00

151 5P10TMP 1000 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.05 $1,050.00 $0.90 $900.00 $1.90 $1,900.00

152 5P11REM 1110 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Mechanical $1.50 $1,665.00 $1.60 $1,776.00 $2.24 $2,486.40 $1.65 $1,831.50

153 5P12REM 11595 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $0.95 $11,015.25 $1.05 $12,174.75 $2.52 $29,219.40 $1.50 $17,392.50

154 5P13TMP 550 L.F. Removable Black Line Mask, 8" Wide $3.95 $2,172.50 $4.00 $2,200.00 $6.72 $3,696.00 $3.55 $1,952.50

155 5P14TMP 2100 L.F. Removable Wet Weather Pavement Marking Tape $2.45 $5,145.00 $2.50 $5,250.00 $4.48 $9,408.00 $2.20 $4,620.00

156 5P21LLS 10920 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $1.50 $16,380.00 $1.55 $16,926.00 $1.40 $15,288.00 $2.40 $26,208.00

157 5Q01FOF 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type F $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $180,000.00 $180,000.00 $95,148.93 $95,148.93 $51,920.00 $51,920.00

158 5Q02MFF 30 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type F $1,650.00 $49,500.00 $5,700.00 $171,000.00 $4,883.20 $146,496.00 $4,500.00 $135,000.00

159 5V01PIT 107 Each Test Pits $540.00 $57,780.00 $490.00 $52,430.00 $665.69 $71,228.83 $0.01 $1.07

160 5X00PRA 21 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard $4,200.00 $88,200.00 $5,300.00 $111,300.00 $2,352.00 $49,392.00 $4,060.00 $85,260.00

161 5X00RPR 5 Each Repair Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard $700.00 $3,500.00 $2,550.00 $12,750.00 $2,800.00 $14,000.00 $0.01 $0.05

162 5X02FTA 12 Each
FURNISHING TEMPORARY IMPACT ATTENUATOR, 
QUADGUARD, 9 BAYS, 24" WIDE

$9,000.00 $108,000.00 $12,200.00 $146,400.00 $11,536.00 $138,432.00 $32,300.00 $387,600.00

163 5X03FTA 2 Each
Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator, Quadguard, 4 Bays, 
24" Wide

$8,000.00 $16,000.00 $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $8,232.00 $16,464.00 $25,300.00 $50,600.00

164 5X51QIA 2 Each Quadguard Impact Attenuator, 3 Bays, 24" Wide $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $16,000.00 $32,000.00 $16,532.37 $33,064.74 $32,300.00 $64,600.00

165 5ZMFAS0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Snow Removal (NO-BID) $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00

166 5ZO0018 200 Ton Off-Site Disposal of ID-27 Waste $40.00 $8,000.00 $65.00 $13,000.00 $76.60 $15,320.00 $0.01 $2.00

167 5ZO0066 435 L.F. Transite Duct Removal $20.00 $8,700.00 $55.00 $23,925.00 $84.00 $36,540.00 $362.00 $157,470.00

168 5ZZ43GR 1 Each Controlled Release Terminal Anchorages $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 $2,016.00 $2,016.00 $1,180.00 $1,180.00

169 5ZZ65GR 1 Each Controlled Release Terminal $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 $2,016.00 $2,016.00 $1,180.00 $1,180.00

170 6A00006 4440 L.F. #4/0 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $7.00 $31,080.00 $12.50 $55,500.00 $11.76 $52,214.40 $14.00 $62,160.00

171 6A00017 200 L.F. 3" Rigid Metallic Conduit, PVC Coated, Exposed $82.00 $16,400.00 $57.00 $11,400.00 $173.60 $34,720.00 $65.00 $13,000.00

172 6A00048 90 L.F. 3" Rigid Metallic Conduit in Concrete $41.00 $3,690.00 $28.00 $2,520.00 $106.40 $9,576.00 $56.50 $5,085.00
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173 6A02MLC 3640 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $3.20 $11,648.00 $5.00 $18,200.00 $7.34 $26,717.60 $5.30 $19,292.00

174 6A02PGE 260 L.F. 2" PVC Coated Galvanized Conduit, Exposed $51.00 $13,260.00 $42.00 $10,920.00 $162.40 $42,224.00 $47.20 $12,272.00

175 6A03RMS 100 L.F. 3" Rigid Metallic Conduit, on Structures $47.50 $4,750.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $42.00 $4,200.00 $112.00 $11,200.00

176 6A03RNC 3145 L.F. 3" Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $16.00 $50,320.00 $41.00 $128,945.00 $47.60 $149,702.00 $35.40 $111,333.00

177 6A04GWR 1110 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Ground Wire $3.00 $3,330.00 $3.10 $3,441.00 $5.04 $5,594.40 $3.50 $3,885.00

178 6A04MLC 1130 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $3.10 $3,503.00 $3.10 $3,503.00 $4.70 $5,311.00 $14.00 $15,820.00

179 6A06GWR 1045 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Ground Wire $2.40 $2,508.00 $2.60 $2,717.00 $3.36 $3,511.20 $3.00 $3,135.00

180 6A06MLC 5230 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $2.15 $11,244.50 $3.10 $16,213.00 $4.20 $21,966.00 $3.50 $18,305.00

181 6A08GWR 1885 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.70 $3,204.50 $2.10 $3,958.50 $2.80 $5,278.00 $2.40 $4,524.00

182 6A08SLC 830 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Series Lighting Cable $5.75 $4,772.50 $2.10 $1,743.00 $5.60 $4,648.00 $2.40 $1,992.00

183 6A10GWR 250 L.F. #10 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.20 $300.00 $2.10 $525.00 $2.24 $560.00 $2.25 $562.50

184 6A10MLC 940 L.F. #1/0 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $5.70 $5,358.00 $5.75 $5,405.00 $8.40 $7,896.00 $6.75 $6,345.00

185 6A11MLC 500 L.F. #10 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $2.80 $1,400.00 $2.10 $1,050.00 $3.36 $1,680.00 $2.25 $1,125.00

186 6A13RNC 240 L.F. 3" Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 80) $25.50 $6,120.00 $45.00 $10,800.00 $50.40 $12,096.00 $41.00 $9,840.00

187 6A21JF1 1 Each Junction Box Foundation, Type 1 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,850.00 $2,850.00 $6,025.60 $6,025.60 $4,950.00 $4,950.00

188 6A24JBC 7 Each Junction Box, Type C $2,500.00 $17,500.00 $2,500.00 $17,500.00 $3,740.80 $26,185.60 $4,485.00 $31,395.00

189 6A65RAS 1 Lump Remove and Salvage Existing Facilities $198,000.00 $198,000.00 $295,000.00 $295,000.00 $61,600.00 $61,600.00 $258,400.00 $258,400.00

190 6B00088 1 Each Concrete Base Foundation, Type I For Lighting Standard $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $2,770.00 $2,770.00 $3,080.00 $3,080.00 $3,540.00 $3,540.00

191 6B08RWL 2 Each Relocate Light Pole and Luminaire $3,850.00 $7,700.00 $2,600.00 $5,200.00 $3,080.00 $6,160.00 $2,950.00 $5,900.00

192 6C00008 2 Each 12" Flashing Warning Beacon Assembly $8,400.00 $16,800.00 $5,250.00 $10,500.00 $2,800.00 $5,600.00 $5,900.00 $11,800.00

193 6C01ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure No. 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $19,992.00 $19,992.00 $20,180.00 $20,180.00

194 6C02ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure No. 2 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,656.00 $12,656.00 $13,800.00 $13,800.00

195 6C03ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure No. 3 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $19,992.00 $19,992.00 $20,650.00 $20,650.00

196 6C04ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure No. 4 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,656.00 $12,656.00 $20,650.00 $20,650.00

197 6C05ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure No. 5 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $19,992.00 $19,992.00 $20,180.00 $20,180.00

198 6C06ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 6 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $23,520.00 $23,520.00 $20,120.00 $20,120.00

199 6C07ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 7 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $12,656.00 $12,656.00 $12,685.00 $12,685.00

200 6C08ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 8 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $16,318.40 $16,318.40 $16,520.00 $16,520.00

201 6C09ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 9 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $12,656.00 $12,656.00 $13,925.00 $13,925.00

202 6C10ISS 1 L.S. Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 10 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $12,656.00 $12,656.00 $13,925.00 $13,925.00

203 6C01MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $9,408.00 $9,408.00 $12,460.00 $12,460.00

204 6C02MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 2 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $13,250.00 $13,250.00 $14,728.00 $14,728.00 $15,165.00 $15,165.00

205 6C03MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 3 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $25,368.00 $25,368.00 $26,845.00 $26,845.00

206 6C04MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 4 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $22,568.00 $22,568.00 $15,930.00 $15,930.00

207 6C05MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 5 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $29,500.00 $29,500.00 $30,688.00 $30,688.00 $32,450.00 $32,450.00

208 6C06MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 6 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $21,500.00 $21,500.00 $25,368.00 $25,368.00 $23,775.00 $23,775.00

209 6C07MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 7 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $25,300.00 $25,300.00

210 6C08MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 8 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $22,900.00 $22,900.00 $25,368.00 $25,368.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

211 6C09MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 9 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $23,500.00 $23,500.00 $30,688.00 $30,688.00 $26,000.00 $26,000.00

212 6C10MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 10 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $30,688.00 $30,688.00 $27,730.00 $27,730.00

213 6C11MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 11 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $21,500.00 $21,500.00

214 6C12MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 12 $15,500.00 $15,500.00 $29,500.00 $29,500.00 $41,328.00 $41,328.00 $32,500.00 $32,500.00

215 6C13MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 13 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $18,620.00 $18,620.00

216 6C14MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 14 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $17,050.00 $17,050.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $18,700.00 $18,700.00

217 6C15MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 15 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $22,500.00 $22,500.00 $30,968.00 $30,968.00 $24,840.00 $24,840.00

218 6C16MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 16 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $21,500.00 $21,500.00 $25,368.00 $25,368.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00
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219 6C17MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 17 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,500.00 $20,500.00 $30,968.00 $30,968.00 $22,700.00 $22,700.00

220 6C18MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 18 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,500.00 $20,500.00 $30,968.00 $30,968.00 $22,650.00 $22,650.00

221 6C19MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 19 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $27,500.00 $27,500.00 $41,328.00 $41,328.00 $30,500.00 $30,500.00

222 6C20MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 20 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $23,750.00 $23,750.00 $36,008.00 $36,008.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00

223 6C21MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 21 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,500.00 $20,500.00 $30,968.00 $30,968.00 $27,500.00 $27,500.00

224 6C22MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 22 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $14,728.00 $14,728.00 $19,900.00 $19,900.00

225 6C23MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 23 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $18,725.00 $18,725.00

226 6C24MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 24 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $25,368.00 $25,368.00 $36,000.00 $36,000.00

227 6C25MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 25 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $21,900.00 $21,900.00

228 6C26MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 26 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $22,500.00 $22,500.00 $30,688.00 $30,688.00 $26,000.00 $26,000.00

229 6C27MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 27 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $14,728.00 $14,728.00 $14,870.00 $14,870.00

230 6C28MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 28 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $16,950.00 $16,950.00

231 6C29MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 29 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $14,728.00 $14,728.00 $14,950.00 $14,950.00

232 6C30MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 30 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $30,688.00 $30,688.00 $27,800.00 $27,800.00

233 6C31MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 31 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $14,728.00 $14,728.00 $24,130.00 $24,130.00

234 6C32MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 32 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $14,728.00 $14,728.00 $27,230.00 $27,230.00

235 6C33MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 33 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $25,368.00 $25,368.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00

236 6C34MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 34 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $24,130.00 $24,130.00

237 6C35MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 35 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $25,368.00 $25,368.00 $32,780.00 $32,780.00

238 6C36MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 36 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $46,648.00 $46,648.00 $24,130.00 $24,130.00

239 6C37MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 37 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $25,368.00 $25,368.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00

240 6C38MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 38 $14,500.00 $14,500.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $30,385.00 $30,385.00

241 6C39MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 39 $14,500.00 $14,500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $41,608.00 $41,608.00 $31,730.00 $31,730.00

242 6C40MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 40 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $36,008.00 $36,008.00 $16,650.00 $16,650.00

243 6C41MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 41 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $14,728.00 $14,728.00 $23,000.00 $23,000.00

244 6C42MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 42 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $25,368.00 $25,368.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00

245 6C43MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 43 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $14,728.00 $14,728.00 $23,100.00 $23,100.00

246 6C44MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 44 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $25,252.00 $25,252.00

247 6C45MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 45 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00

248 6C46MSS 1 L.S. Modify Illumination For Sign Structure Location No. 46 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $20,048.00 $20,048.00 $22,050.00 $22,050.00

249 6HSMI0B 1 L.S. System Manufacturer Installation and Testing (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

250 6J00007 1 L.S. Spare Parts $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $39,200.00 $39,200.00 $38,810.20 $38,810.20

251 6J00017 1 Each Variable Message Sign Installation $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $11,760.00 $11,760.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00

252 6J00018 1 Each Variable Speed Limit Sign Installation $5,100.00 $5,100.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $2,275.00 $2,275.00

253 6J00024 1 Each CCTV Camera, ITSS Mounted $12,900.00 $12,900.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $12,320.00 $12,320.00 $18,720.00 $18,720.00

254 6J00032 2 Each Wireless Access Point, ITSS Mounted $9,000.00 $18,000.00 $8,300.00 $16,600.00 $12,320.00 $24,640.00 $9,025.00 $18,050.00

255 6J00076 1 Each Radio Antenna Mount $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $4,100.00 $4,100.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $4,425.00 $4,425.00

256 6J00085 6 Each Aviation Beacon $2,600.00 $15,600.00 $2,000.00 $12,000.00 $7,280.00 $43,680.00 $2,185.00 $13,110.00

257 6J00112 1 Each End Node Radio Installation $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,920.00 $3,920.00 $4,365.00 $4,365.00

258 6J00150 1 Each End Node Radio Relocation $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $7,280.00 $7,280.00 $1,770.00 $1,770.00

259 6J00160 1 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 1 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $16,600.00 $16,600.00 $48,440.00 $48,440.00 $18,175.00 $18,175.00

260 6J00161 1 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 2 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $35,280.00 $35,280.00 $9,820.00 $9,820.00

261 6J00170 2 Each Flashing Beacon and Controller Cabinet $7,000.00 $14,000.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 $39,200.00 $78,400.00 $12,390.00 $24,780.00

262 7C01TOP 8055 S.Y. Topsoil $1.50 $12,082.50 $7.00 $56,385.00 $2.24 $18,043.20 $2.35 $18,929.25

263 7D01SED 7185 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $0.85 $6,107.25 $1.75 $12,573.75 $1.01 $7,256.85 $1.25 $8,981.25

264 7D08SED 870 S.Y. Seeding, Type L $0.65 $565.50 $2.40 $2,088.00 $1.12 $974.40 $1.25 $1,087.50



Base Line Item Detail PKF-Mark III, Inc. George Harms Construction Co., Inc. Crisdel Group, Inc. Midlantic Construction LLC

265 7F01SSM 870 S.Y. Soil Stablization Matting $4.50 $3,915.00 $11.75 $10,222.50 $5.60 $4,872.00 $6.00 $5,220.00

266 8A01MPT 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $3,256,000.00 $3,256,000.00 $215,825.00 $215,825.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $3,000,000.00 $3,000,000.00

267 8A06MPT 100 Barr Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $280.00 $28,000.00 $380.00 $38,000.00 $459.08 $45,908.00 $0.01 $1.00

268 8A07MPT 10 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $1.00 $10.00 $5,450.00 $54,500.00 $2,800.00 $28,000.00 $0.01 $0.10

269 8A30MPT 8 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $1.00 $8.00 $5,280.00 $42,240.00 $20,720.28 $165,762.24 $0.01 $0.08

270 8B15MPT 6000 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol $1.00 $6,000.00 $84.50 $507,000.00 $0.01 $60.00 $0.01 $60.00

271 8B17MPT 18 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $1.00 $18.00 $19,500.00 $351,000.00 $10.00 $180.00 $59,000.00 $1,062,000.00

272 8B18MPT 16 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator $4,000.00 $64,000.00 $5,000.00 $80,000.00 $6,411.88 $102,590.08 $3,450.00 $55,200.00

273 8B19MPT 600 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $1.00 $600.00 $135.00 $81,000.00 $131.86 $79,116.00 $0.01 $6.00

274 8B20MPT 134 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator $1,000.00 $134,000.00 $3,200.00 $428,800.00 $259.61 $34,787.74 $4,060.00 $544,040.00

275 N8A0001 12140 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $29.00 $352,060.00 $24.50 $297,430.00 $38.80 $471,032.00 $25.50 $309,570.00

276 N8A0002 66340 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $24.00 $1,592,160.00 $20.00 $1,326,800.00 $0.01 $663.40 $37.50 $2,487,750.00

277 8C100SCL 1 L.S.
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and 
Local Roadways

$6,000.00 $6,000.00 $130,250.00 $130,250.00 $69,000.00 $69,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00

278 8CPTD0B 1 L.S. Police Traffic Directors (NO-BID) $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $28,500.00

$26,978,815.80 $26,994,376.37 $31,893,104.33 $41,071,856.55Base Total


