
Contract T500.355 Base Line Item Detail Patock Construction Company Joseph A. Natoli Construction Corp. Michael Riesz and Co. Hall Building Corp. Brockwell and Carrington Contractors Alna Construction Corp. A. P. Construction, Inc. D&K Construction Company Inc

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $33,000.00 $33,000.00 $26,250.00 $26,250.00 $25,200.00 $25,200.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $95,200.00 $95,200.00
2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $615,000.00 $615,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $595,000.00 $595,000.00
3 1F00002 1 L.S. NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
4 1GSCH0B 1 L.S. Progress Schedule (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
5 1HFP0B 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
6 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $207,375.00 $207,375.00 $68,975.00 $68,975.00 $178,000.00 $178,000.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $166,100.00 $166,100.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $267,750.00 $267,750.00
7 2A06CAG 1 Each Sealing of Abandoned Well $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,730.00 $2,730.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $5,800.00 $5,800.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $17,850.00 $17,850.00
8 2A08CAG 1 Each Monitoring Well $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $1,890.00 $1,890.00 $5,250.00 $5,250.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $4,760.00 $4,760.00
9 2B02REX 10,967.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $23.00 $252,241.00 $39.64 $434,731.88 $44.75 $490,773.25 $39.00 $427,713.00 $47.00 $515,449.00 $42.00 $460,614.00 $15.00 $164,505.00 $7.14 $78,304.38
10 2B15STS 1,395.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $8.00 $11,160.00 $12.60 $17,577.00 $23.95 $33,410.25 $10.00 $13,950.00 $35.00 $48,825.00 $7.00 $9,765.00 $6.00 $8,370.00 $4.76 $6,640.20
11 2C01EMB 972.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $22.00 $21,384.00 $21.00 $20,412.00 $31.50 $30,618.00 $28.00 $27,216.00 $35.00 $34,020.00 $10.00 $9,720.00 $13.00 $12,636.00 $9.52 $9,253.44
12 2C02EMB 2,709.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $45.00 $121,905.00 $31.50 $85,333.50 $27.90 $75,581.10 $40.00 $108,360.00 $53.00 $143,577.00 $30.00 $81,270.00 $15.00 $40,635.00 $41.65 $112,829.85
13 2C14EMB 2,117.00 S.Y. Geotextile Filter Fabric $3.00 $6,351.00 $3.15 $6,668.55 $2.35 $4,974.95 $4.00 $8,468.00 $5.20 $11,008.40 $2.50 $5,292.50 $3.00 $6,351.00 $3.57 $7,557.69
14 2E01CAL 481 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate Layer $57.00 $27,417.00 $60.90 $29,292.90 $44.50 $21,404.50 $55.00 $26,455.00 $34.23 $16,464.63 $65.00 $31,265.00 $81.00 $38,961.00 $42.84 $20,606.04
15 2E01FEX 1,800.00 C.Y. Foundataion Excavation $20.00 $36,000.00 $29.40 $52,920.00 $42.00 $75,600.00 $18.00 $32,400.00 $42.10 $75,780.00 $25.00 $45,000.00 $23.00 $41,400.00 $11.90 $21,420.00
16 3M03RMS 1,294.00 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate, Size No. 3 $52.00 $67,288.00 $42.00 $54,348.00 $52.90 $68,452.60 $50.00 $64,700.00 $98.00 $126,812.00 $66.00 $85,404.00 $90.00 $116,460.00 $59.50 $76,993.00
17 2H00007 2,955.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $3.00 $8,865.00 $6.30 $18,616.50 $8.65 $25,560.75 $6.00 $17,730.00 $3.50 $10,342.50 $7.00 $20,685.00 $66.00 $195,030.00 $5.95 $17,582.25
18 2H00016 20 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $250.00 $5,000.00 $157.50 $3,150.00 $346.50 $6,930.00 $200.00 $4,000.00 $115.00 $2,300.00 $150.00 $3,000.00 $8.00 $160.00 $208.25 $4,165.00
19 2H00021 1 Each Concrete Washout Facility $7,800.00 $7,800.00 $525.00 $525.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $714.00 $714.00
20 2H45TEC 200 Ton Construction Driveway $42.00 $8,400.00 $52.50 $10,500.00 $63.00 $12,600.00 $45.00 $9,000.00 $52.00 $10,400.00 $34.00 $6,800.00 $85.00 $17,000.00 $35.70 $7,140.00
21 3A06ABC 17,042.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6" Thick $10.00 $170,420.00 $8.40 $143,152.80 $6.80 $115,885.60 $9.50 $161,899.00 $11.50 $195,983.00 $10.00 $170,420.00 $10.00 $170,420.00 $7.14 $121,679.88
22 3B00006 2,038.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5 M 64-22 Surface Course $92.00 $187,496.00 $86.10 $175,471.80 $89.25 $181,891.50 $90.00 $183,420.00 $96.00 $195,648.00 $92.00 $187,496.00 $118.00 $240,484.00 $102.34 $208,568.92
23 3B00007 4,147.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25 M 64-22 Base Course $82.00 $340,054.00 $76.65 $317,867.55 $82.50 $342,127.50 $79.00 $327,613.00 $93.00 $385,671.00 $79.00 $327,613.00 $81.00 $335,907.00 $99.96 $414,534.12
24 3B26TAC 1,372.00 GAL Tack Coat $5.00 $6,860.00 $0.53 $727.16 $18.90 $25,930.80 $5.00 $6,860.00 $4.85 $6,654.20 $3.50 $4,802.00 $2.00 $2,744.00 $7.14 $9,796.08
25 3BAPA0B 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
26 3C02BRS 140 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 6" Thick $40.00 $5,600.00 $14.70 $2,058.00 $28.70 $4,018.00 $48.00 $6,720.00 $17.30 $2,422.00 $12.00 $1,680.00 $85.00 $11,900.00 $11.90 $1,666.00
27 3C03BRS 388.00 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 4" Thick $28.00 $10,864.00 $13.65 $5,296.20 $14.00 $5,432.00 $35.00 $13,580.00 $9.20 $3,569.60 $110.00 $42,680.00 $55.00 $21,340.00 $8.33 $3,232.04
28 3D08PCP 346.00 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement, 8" Thick $120.00 $41,520.00 $132.30 $45,775.80 $145.00 $50,170.00 $105.00 $36,330.00 $143.00 $49,478.00 $105.00 $36,330.00 $175.00 $60,550.00 $85.68 $29,645.28
29 4A10RFS 8,393.00 LB Reinforcement Steel $2.00 $16,786.00 $2.10 $17,625.30 $2.10 $17,625.30 $2.50 $20,982.50 $3.00 $25,179.00 $2.15 $18,044.95 $3.00 $25,179.00 $7.14 $59,926.02
30 4A10STC 4.00 C.Y. Concrete In Bridge Parapet $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $1,575.00 $6,300.00 $2,100.00 $8,400.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $1,800.00 $7,200.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $1,350.00 $5,400.00 $1,190.00 $4,760.00
31 4A11RFS 1,350.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $2.00 $2,700.00 $3.15 $4,252.50 $2.10 $2,835.00 $2.80 $3,780.00 $3.50 $4,725.00 $2.15 $2,902.50 $3.00 $4,050.00 $7.56 $10,206.00
32 5A01PUD 138 L.F. 6-Inch Pipe Underdrain $50.00 $6,900.00 $37.80 $5,216.40 $72.45 $9,998.10 $85.00 $11,730.00 $60.25 $8,314.50 $88.00 $12,144.00 $48.00 $6,624.00 $30.94 $4,269.72
33 5A08PUD 610 L.F. 8" Pipe Underdrain $52.00 $31,720.00 $42.00 $25,620.00 $31.08 $18,958.80 $89.00 $54,290.00 $64.00 $39,040.00 $94.00 $57,340.00 $35.00 $21,350.00 $33.92 $20,691.20
34 9A00057 21 Each Clean Outs $350.00 $7,350.00 $892.50 $18,742.50 $672.00 $14,112.00 $1,200.00 $25,200.00 $460.00 $9,660.00 $1,400.00 $29,400.00 $500.00 $10,500.00 $357.00 $7,497.00
35 5B00012 175 L.F. 8" Ductile Iron Pipe $68.00 $11,900.00 $68.25 $11,943.75 $145.00 $25,375.00 $80.00 $14,000.00 $109.00 $19,075.00 $64.00 $11,200.00 $100.00 $17,500.00 $88.06 $15,410.50
36 5B01CSD 1,797.00 L.F. Cleaning Existing Storm Drains $12.00 $21,564.00 $15.75 $28,302.75 $19.00 $34,143.00 $15.00 $26,955.00 $56.00 $100,632.00 $15.00 $26,955.00 $65.00 $116,805.00 $17.85 $32,076.45
37 5B08PVC 638 L.F. 8" PVC, Schedule 80 $38.00 $24,244.00 $44.10 $28,135.80 $68.25 $43,543.50 $45.00 $28,710.00 $81.00 $51,678.00 $59.00 $37,642.00 $70.00 $44,660.00 $46.41 $29,609.58
38 5B18RC3 685.00 L.F. 18" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $60.00 $41,100.00 $42.00 $28,770.00 $65.10 $44,593.50 $55.00 $37,675.00 $100.00 $68,500.00 $50.00 $34,250.00 $185.00 $126,725.00 $48.79 $33,421.15
39 5C01ND1 1 Each Inlet, Type D1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $3,575.00 $3,575.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,565.00 $3,565.00 $2,150.00 $2,150.00 $3,850.00 $3,850.00 $3,332.00 $3,332.00
40 5C01ND2 2 Each Inlet, Type D2 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,625.00 $5,250.00 $3,672.00 $7,344.00 $2,700.00 $5,400.00 $4,025.00 $8,050.00 $2,700.00 $5,400.00 $3,850.00 $7,700.00 $3,689.00 $7,378.00
41 5C01ND3 4 Each Inlet, Type D3 $3,100.00 $12,400.00 $2,625.00 $10,500.00 $3,600.00 $14,400.00 $2,900.00 $11,600.00 $4,200.00 $16,800.00 $2,650.00 $10,600.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $3,570.00 $14,280.00
42 5C10ED2 3.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using Existing Grate and Frame $1,100.00 $3,300.00 $1,312.50 $3,937.50 $1,192.00 $3,576.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00 $1,700.00 $5,100.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,071.00 $3,213.00
43 5C10INT 1.00 Each Inlet Converted to Manhole $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,362.50 $2,362.50 $2,161.00 $2,161.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $2,050.00 $2,050.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,309.00 $1,309.00
44 5C10ND1 1 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using New Grate and Frame $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $1,940.00 $1,940.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,785.00 $1,785.00
45 5C10ND2 2.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using New Grate and Frame $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $2,625.00 $5,250.00 $1,475.00 $2,950.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,200.00 $6,400.00 $1,904.00 $3,808.00
46 5C20NP1 1 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $446.25 $446.25 $3,396.00 $3,396.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,856.00 $2,856.00
47 5C40RSF 4.00 Each Reset Frame $450.00 $1,800.00 $1,242.50 $4,970.00 $1,192.00 $4,768.00 $800.00 $3,200.00 $288.00 $1,152.00 $750.00 $3,000.00 $650.00 $2,600.00 $476.00 $1,904.00
48 5D10INC 114 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $450.00 $51,300.00 $598.50 $68,229.00 $630.00 $71,820.00 $710.00 $80,940.00 $660.00 $75,240.00 $650.00 $74,100.00 $750.00 $85,500.00 $357.00 $40,698.00
49 5E01ALC 100.00 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $20.00 $2,000.00 $26.25 $2,625.00 $51.45 $5,145.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $38.08 $3,808.00
50 5F01VCA 1,626.00 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $21.00 $34,146.00 $18.90 $30,731.40 $23.10 $37,560.60 $22.00 $35,772.00 $31.00 $50,406.00 $20.00 $32,520.00 $42.00 $68,292.00 $21.42 $34,828.92
51 5F01VCB 520 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type B $22.00 $11,440.00 $18.90 $9,828.00 $24.40 $12,688.00 $24.00 $12,480.00 $33.50 $17,420.00 $21.00 $10,920.00 $42.00 $21,840.00 $24.99 $12,994.80
52 5I01SNP 40 S.F. Sign Panels $16.00 $640.00 $38.85 $1,554.00 $38.85 $1,554.00 $45.00 $1,800.00 $23.00 $920.00 $44.00 $1,760.00 $15.00 $600.00 $25.59 $1,023.60
53 5I05SPP 169.00 L.F. U-channel Post $16.00 $2,704.00 $22.05 $3,726.45 $22.05 $3,726.45 $14.00 $2,366.00 $35.00 $5,915.00 $11.00 $1,859.00 $20.00 $3,380.00 $23.21 $3,922.49
54 5J00FGT 1 Each Flared Guide Rail Terminal $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $3,045.00 $3,045.00 $3,045.00 $3,045.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 $2,737.00 $2,737.00
55 5J01PCA 1 Each Parapet Connection, Type A $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $3,018.75 $3,018.75 $3,020.00 $3,020.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $2,875.00 $2,875.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $1,785.00 $1,785.00
56 5J52ABG 12 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $1,400.00 $16,800.00 $1,312.50 $15,750.00 $1,312.50 $15,750.00 $1,250.00 $15,000.00 $2,100.00 $25,200.00 $1,250.00 $15,000.00 $1,250.00 $15,000.00 $1,547.00 $18,564.00
57 5J52BGR 1,134.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $27.00 $30,618.00 $28.35 $32,148.90 $28.35 $32,148.90 $26.00 $29,484.00 $37.00 $41,958.00 $27.00 $30,618.00 $35.00 $39,690.00 $31.83 $36,095.22
58 5J01RSG 200 L.F. Reset Beam Guide Rail $18.00 $3,600.00 $8.40 $1,680.00 $8.40 $1,680.00 $10.00 $2,000.00 $38.00 $7,600.00 $8.00 $1,600.00 $30.00 $6,000.00 $20.83 $4,166.00
59 5K00021 1,325.00 L.F. Temporary Fencing, 96" High $10.00 $13,250.00 $16.80 $22,260.00 $10.00 $13,250.00 $8.50 $11,262.50 $52.00 $68,900.00 $8.80 $11,660.00 $40.00 $53,000.00 $29.75 $39,418.75
60 5K00050 4 Each Vehicular Gate, Type II, 72" High, 30' Wide $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,730.00 $10,920.00 $2,625.00 $10,500.00 $2,900.00 $11,600.00 $17,000.00 $68,000.00 $2,866.00 $11,464.00 $3,033.00 $12,132.00 $2,915.50 $11,662.00
61 5K00087 1 Each Motorized Vehicular Sliding Gate System, 30' Wide $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $33,180.00 $33,180.00 $38,750.00 $38,750.00 $47,000.00 $47,000.00 $42,500.00 $42,500.00 $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $55,152.00 $55,152.00 $36,295.00 $36,295.00
62 5K72CLB 1,646.00 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 72" High $27.50 $45,265.00 $28.35 $46,664.10 $33.60 $55,305.60 $28.00 $46,088.00 $41.00 $67,486.00 $27.10 $44,606.60 $30.00 $49,380.00 $27.37 $45,051.02
63 5N04PCS 513 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $65.00 $33,345.00 $61.95 $31,780.35 $70.35 $36,089.55 $62.00 $31,806.00 $75.00 $38,475.00 $65.00 $33,345.00 $75.00 $38,475.00 $59.50 $30,523.50
64 5P21LLS 6,102.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $1.00 $6,102.00 $0.79 $4,820.58 $0.60 $3,661.20 $2.00 $12,204.00 $1.15 $7,017.30 $2.00 $12,204.00 $2.00 $12,204.00 $0.67 $4,088.34
65 5P33LLM 208 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long - Life, Thermoplastic $5.00 $1,040.00 $9.45 $1,965.60 $5.80 $1,206.40 $15.00 $3,120.00 $11.50 $2,392.00 $15.00 $3,120.00 $25.00 $5,200.00 $6.55 $1,362.40
66 5Q01FOE 1 Unit Furnish Field Office, Type E $89,000.00 $89,000.00 $93,712.50 $93,712.50 $63,000.00 $63,000.00 $58,000.00 $58,000.00 $53,000.00 $53,000.00 $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $28,560.00 $28,560.00
67 5Q02MFE 24 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type E $650.00 $15,600.00 $525.00 $12,600.00 $1,270.00 $30,480.00 $3,600.00 $86,400.00 $3,400.00 $81,600.00 $1,000.00 $24,000.00 $125.00 $3,000.00 $357.00 $8,568.00
68 5V01PIT 10 Each Test Pits $750.00 $7,500.00 $210.00 $2,100.00 $604.00 $6,040.00 $800.00 $8,000.00 $900.00 $9,000.00 $600.00 $6,000.00 $1,250.00 $12,500.00 $238.00 $2,380.00
69 4ZN0176 12 C.Y. Flowable Fill $400.00 $4,800.00 $945.00 $11,340.00 $349.00 $4,188.00 $250.00 $3,000.00 $300.00 $3,600.00 $190.00 $2,280.00 $200.00 $2,400.00 $101.15 $1,213.80
70 5ZL0032 450 L.F. 6" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $40.00 $18,000.00 $56.70 $25,515.00 $48.40 $21,780.00 $52.00 $23,400.00 $103.00 $46,350.00 $190.00 $85,500.00 $38.00 $17,100.00 $41.65 $18,742.50
71 5ZL0068 6 Each 6" Sanitary Sewer Clean Out $400.00 $2,400.00 $892.50 $5,355.00 $672.00 $4,032.00 $350.00 $2,100.00 $575.00 $3,450.00 $350.00 $2,100.00 $630.00 $3,780.00 $357.00 $2,142.00
72 5ZL0078 1 Each Manhole, Sanitary Sewer $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $3,150.00 $3,150.00 $5,250.00 $5,250.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,200.00 $6,200.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $5,589.00 $5,589.00 $2,737.00 $2,737.00
73 5ZL0059 2.00 Each Yard Hydrant $800.00 $1,600.00 $3,150.00 $6,300.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,050.00 $4,100.00 $3,100.00 $6,200.00 $900.00 $1,800.00 $2,142.00 $4,284.00
74 5ZL01FHA 1 Each Fire Hydrant Assemblies $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,775.00 $5,775.00 $7,075.00 $7,075.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $4,046.00 $4,046.00
75 5ZL0136 360 L.F. 6" Ductile Iron Water Pipe $90.00 $32,400.00 $68.25 $24,570.00 $76.00 $27,360.00 $85.00 $30,600.00 $110.00 $39,600.00 $72.00 $25,920.00 $90.00 $32,400.00 $63.07 $22,705.20
76 5ZL0284 1 Each Post Indicator Valve $4,600.00 $4,600.00 $2,625.00 $2,625.00 $6,700.00 $6,700.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,547.00 $1,547.00
77 5ZL06WVU 2 Each 6" Water Valve $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $1,575.00 $3,150.00 $3,318.00 $6,636.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $11,000.00 $22,000.00 $1,368.50 $2,737.00
78 5ZL0364 2 Each 2" Water Valve $1,300.00 $2,600.00 $1,575.00 $3,150.00 $2,236.00 $4,472.00 $800.00 $1,600.00 $1,100.00 $2,200.00 $720.00 $1,440.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $714.00 $1,428.00
79 5ZL0358 4.00 Each 1 1/2" Water Valve $800.00 $3,200.00 $525.00 $2,100.00 $1,450.00 $5,800.00 $600.00 $2,400.00 $520.00 $2,080.00 $550.00 $2,200.00 $4,500.00 $18,000.00 $476.00 $1,904.00
80 5ZL0359 1,000.00 L.F. 1 1/2" Copper Water Pipe, Type K $27.00 $27,000.00 $52.50 $52,500.00 $52.80 $52,800.00 $39.00 $39,000.00 $64.00 $64,000.00 $39.00 $39,000.00 $38.00 $38,000.00 $38.08 $38,080.00
81 5ZL0062 340 L.F. 2" Copper Water Pipe, Type K $30.00 $10,200.00 $57.75 $19,635.00 $60.70 $20,638.00 $45.00 $15,300.00 $155.00 $52,700.00 $44.00 $14,960.00 $50.00 $17,000.00 $42.84 $14,565.60
82 5ZL0105 20.00 L.F. 2-4" Telephone Riser Conduit $96.00 $1,920.00 $50.40 $1,008.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $98.00 $1,960.00 $15.00 $300.00 $20.00 $400.00 $30.94 $618.80
83 5ZL0162 245 L.F. 2-4" Telephone Duct Bank, PVC $57.00 $13,965.00 $20.90 $5,120.50 $60.00 $14,700.00 $70.00 $17,150.00 $57.00 $13,965.00 $16.75 $4,103.75 $2.00 $490.00 $33.32 $8,163.40
84 5ZL0235 35 L.F. 2" Plastic Gas Main $35.00 $1,225.00 $52.50 $1,837.50 $73.50 $2,572.50 $150.00 $5,250.00 $69.00 $2,415.00 $100.00 $3,500.00 $30.00 $1,050.00 $119.00 $4,165.00
85 9A00188 1 L.S. Building Equipment - Contractor Furnished, Contractor Installed $135,000.00 $135,000.00 $196,900.00 $196,900.00 $271,300.00 $271,300.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $216,580.00 $216,580.00
86 9A00189 1 L.S. Building Equipment - Owner Furnished, Contractor Installed $139,000.00 $139,000.00 $289,800.00 $289,800.00 $199,500.00 $199,500.00 $289,000.00 $289,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $238,000.00 $238,000.00
87 9A01UBW 1.00 L.S. Building Architectural Work $5,621,000.00 $5,621,000.00 $3,766,842.81 $3,766,842.81 $4,383,097.60 $4,383,097.60 $3,085,000.00 $3,085,000.00 $5,350,000.00 $5,350,000.00 $7,700,000.00 $7,700,000.00 $2,700,000.00 $2,700,000.00 $3,332,000.00 $3,332,000.00
88 9A03UBW 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work $560,000.00 $560,000.00 $716,000.00 $716,000.00 $510,000.00 $510,000.00 $771,000.00 $771,000.00 $625,000.00 $625,000.00 $710,000.00 $710,000.00 $660,000.00 $660,000.00 $714,000.00 $714,000.00
89 9A04UBW 1 L.S. Building Electric Work $1,950,000.00 $1,950,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $2,047,500.00 $2,047,500.00 $1,957,000.00 $1,957,000.00 $3,150,000.00 $3,150,000.00 $2,200,000.00 $2,200,000.00 $2,333,600.00 $2,333,600.00 $2,618,000.00 $2,618,000.00
90 9A44UBW 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work $1,720,000.00 $1,720,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,604,400.00 $1,604,400.00 $1,624,000.00 $1,624,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $2,228,280.00 $2,228,280.00 $1,785,000.00 $1,785,000.00
91 9A45UBW 1 L.S. Building Structural Work $575,000.00 $575,000.00 $2,488,200.00 $2,488,200.00 $1,975,000.00 $1,975,000.00 $2,564,000.00 $2,564,000.00 $610,000.00 $610,000.00 $551,000.00 $551,000.00 $3,400,000.00 $3,400,000.00 $2,701,300.00 $2,701,300.00
92 9A00266 1 C.P. Force Account For Building Work Allowances (NO-BID) $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00
93 5ZO0184 1,110.00 L.F. 2-2" Fiber Optic Duct Bank, PVC $20.00 $22,200.00 $26.36 $29,259.60 $21.00 $23,310.00 $24.00 $26,640.00 $57.00 $63,270.00 $16.75 $18,592.50 $20.00 $22,200.00 $33.32 $36,985.20
94 6A00012 300 L.F. Network Cable $5.00 $1,500.00 $1.21 $363.00 $5.25 $1,575.00 $10.00 $3,000.00 $5.80 $1,740.00 $2.20 $660.00 $3.00 $900.00 $2.62 $786.00
95 5ZL0362 9 Each FOC Precast Concrete Manhole $6,000.00 $54,000.00 $5,565.00 $50,085.00 $8,400.00 $75,600.00 $8,000.00 $72,000.00 $895.00 $8,055.00 $4,000.00 $36,000.00 $8,800.00 $79,200.00 $4,760.00 $42,840.00
96 6J00065 700 L.F. Multi-Mode Fiber Optic Cable, 6-Fibers $2.86 $2,002.00 $4.04 $2,828.00 $3.10 $2,170.00 $9.50 $6,650.00 $23.00 $16,100.00 $12.00 $8,400.00 $15.00 $10,500.00 $14.28 $9,996.00
97 2MTSW0B 25 Each Testing of Soils for Waste Classification (NO-BID) $500.00 $12,500.00 $500.00 $12,500.00 $500.00 $12,500.00 $500.00 $12,500.00 $500.00 $12,500.00 $500.00 $12,500.00 $500.00 $12,500.00 $500.00 $12,500.00
98 5ZO0018 500.00 Ton Off-Site Disposal of ID-27 Waste $94.00 $47,000.00 $59.85 $29,925.00 $51.50 $25,750.00 $125.00 $62,500.00 $58.00 $29,000.00 $60.00 $30,000.00 $500.00 $250,000.00 $71.40 $35,700.00
99 5ZOFAH0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Hazardous Regulated Material Handling (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
100 5ZOROA0B 1 L.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00
101 5ZO0012 1 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (1) $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $73,290.00 $73,290.00 $64,050.00 $64,050.00 $74,000.00 $74,000.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $72,590.00 $72,590.00
102 5ZO0185 1 Each Post Mounted Knox Box $850.00 $850.00 $3,885.00 $3,885.00 $3,150.00 $3,150.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,600.00 $4,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $595.00 $595.00
103 5ZO0027 92 Each Bollards $500.00 $46,000.00 $840.00 $77,280.00 $420.00 $38,640.00 $620.00 $57,040.00 $920.00 $84,640.00 $500.00 $46,000.00 $3,300.00 $303,600.00 $595.00 $54,740.00
104 5ZO0186 1 L.S. Universal Waste Removal (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
105 5ZL0348 1 L.S. Site Electrical Work $177,000.00 $177,000.00 $189,000.00 $189,000.00 $188,000.00 $188,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $460,000.00 $460,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $310,000.00 $310,000.00 $2,618,000.00 $2,618,000.00
106 7C01TOP 8,054.00 S.Y. Topsoil $2.00 $16,108.00 $1.68 $13,530.72 $17.85 $143,763.90 $5.00 $40,270.00 $4.00 $32,216.00 $1.75 $14,094.50 $10.00 $80,540.00 $9.52 $76,674.08
107 7E00130 881 S.Y. Native Grass/Wildflower Seed Mix $2.00 $1,762.00 $1.23 $1,083.63 $1.35 $1,189.35 $2.00 $1,762.00 $2.10 $1,850.10 $2.00 $1,762.00 $3.00 $2,643.00 $3.57 $3,145.17
108 7D03SED 7,173.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $1.00 $7,173.00 $1.37 $9,827.01 $2.40 $17,215.20 $1.20 $8,607.60 $2.10 $15,063.30 $0.90 $6,455.70 $2.00 $14,346.00 $1.79 $12,839.67
109 7.00E+68 13 Each Planting, Eastern Redbud (Cercis canadensis) $520.00 $6,760.00 $315.00 $4,095.00 $367.50 $4,777.50 $350.00 $4,550.00 $345.00 $4,485.00 $495.00 $6,435.00 $1,250.00 $16,250.00 $714.00 $9,282.00
110 7E00131 100 Each Planting, St. John's Wort (Hypericum Kalmianum) $36.00 $3,600.00 $40.32 $4,032.00 $29.00 $2,900.00 $55.00 $5,500.00 $34.00 $3,400.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $59.50 $5,950.00
111 N7E0010 38 Each Planting, Bayberry (Myrica Pensylvanica) $80.00 $3,040.00 $116.55 $4,428.90 $40.00 $1,520.00 $55.00 $2,090.00 $63.00 $2,394.00 $75.00 $2,850.00 $30.00 $1,140.00 $89.25 $3,391.50
112 N7E0041 8.00 Each Planting, Red Oak (Quercus Rubra) $510.00 $4,080.00 $693.00 $5,544.00 $577.50 $4,620.00 $475.00 $3,800.00 $760.00 $6,080.00 $495.00 $3,960.00 $1,250.00 $10,000.00 $773.50 $6,188.00
113 N7E0042 26 Each Planting, Red Maple (Acer Rubrum) $510.00 $13,260.00 $655.20 $17,035.20 $577.50 $15,015.00 $490.00 $12,740.00 $720.00 $18,720.00 $495.00 $12,870.00 $500.00 $13,000.00 $803.25 $20,884.50
114 7E00136 32 Each Planting, Butterfly Honey Suckle (Diervilla Sessifolia) $55.00 $1,760.00 $50.40 $1,612.80 $45.00 $1,440.00 $70.00 $2,240.00 $55.00 $1,760.00 $50.00 $1,600.00 $1,250.00 $40,000.00 $59.50 $1,904.00
115 7E00137 83 Each Planting, Ink Holly (Ilex Glabra Shamrock) $55.00 $4,565.00 $50.72 $4,209.76 $39.00 $3,237.00 $55.00 $4,565.00 $47.00 $3,901.00 $50.00 $4,150.00 $1,250.00 $103,750.00 $47.60 $3,950.80
116 7I02LNP 3,145.00 S.Y. Gravel Paving $31.00 $97,495.00 $10.29 $32,362.05 $28.45 $89,475.25 $32.00 $100,640.00 $52.00 $163,540.00 $67.00 $210,715.00 $70.00 $220,150.00 $3.57 $11,227.65
117 7N00009 3 Each Flagpole $2,200.00 $6,600.00 $3,150.00 $9,450.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $4,800.00 $14,400.00 $2,200.00 $6,600.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $1.79 $5.37
118 8B31MPT 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $7,665.00 $7,665.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $78,000.00 $78,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $8.00 $8.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $29,750.00 $29,750.00

Base Total $14,270,104.00 $14,737,000.00 $15,128,000.00 $15,461,253.60 $17,136,988.53 $17,250,473.00 $17,448,099.00 $18,258,037.07


