
Base Line Item Detail Niram, Inc. Joseph A. Natoli Construction Corp. Hall Construction Co., Inc. Hall Building Corp. Alna Construction Corp. Dobco Inc.

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $64,800.00 $64,800.00 $31,500.00 $31,500.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $105,000.00 $105,000.00 $275,000.00 $275,000.00

2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $129,600.00 $129,600.00 $1,376,713.70 $1,376,713.70 $1,890,000.00 $1,890,000.00 $1,150,000.00 $1,150,000.00 $325,000.00 $325,000.00 $1,750,000.00 $1,750,000.00

3 1F00002 1 L.S. NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (NO-BID) $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00

4 1GSCH0B 1 L.S. Progress Schedule (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

5 1HFP0B 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00

6 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $140,400.00 $140,400.00 $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $590,000.00 $590,000.00 $340,000.00 $340,000.00 $288,502.00 $288,502.00 $975,000.00 $975,000.00

7 2B02REX 36400 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $24.84 $904,176.00 $24.05 $875,420.00 $20.00 $728,000.00 $20.00 $728,000.00 $17.50 $637,000.00 $45.00 $1,638,000.00

8 2B15STS 6500 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $17.28 $112,320.00 $15.75 $102,375.00 $8.00 $52,000.00 $9.00 $58,500.00 $5.40 $35,100.00 $15.00 $97,500.00

9 2BETU0B 1 L.S. Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

10 2C01EMB 46000 C.Y. Embankment, Common $17.28 $794,880.00 $19.22 $884,120.00 $10.00 $460,000.00 $28.50 $1,311,000.00 $23.45 $1,078,700.00 $28.00 $1,288,000.00

11 2E01FEX 17100 C.Y. Foundataion Excavation $30.24 $517,104.00 $36.75 $628,425.00 $15.00 $256,500.00 $28.00 $478,800.00 $25.00 $427,500.00 $30.00 $513,000.00

12 2G12A06 180 Ton Riprap Stone Aprons, 12" Thick, D50=6" $81.00 $14,580.00 $110.25 $19,845.00 $70.00 $12,600.00 $62.00 $11,160.00 $61.40 $11,052.00 $95.00 $17,100.00

13 2H00007 2750 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $5.40 $14,850.00 $6.83 $18,782.50 $7.00 $19,250.00 $5.60 $15,400.00 $5.65 $15,537.50 $6.00 $16,500.00

14 2H00016 72 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $162.00 $11,664.00 $262.50 $18,900.00 $200.00 $14,400.00 $150.00 $10,800.00 $120.00 $8,640.00 $275.00 $19,800.00

15 2H00021 2 Each Concrete Washout Facility $2,700.00 $5,400.00 $2,625.00 $5,250.00 $7,000.00 $14,000.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00 $15,000.00 $30,000.00

16 2H00023 100 L.F. Silt Fence on Pavement $10.80 $1,080.00 $27.30 $2,730.00 $5.00 $500.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $15.00 $1,500.00

17 2H25TEC 330 C.Y. Hay Bales $421.20 $138,996.00 $40.95 $13,513.50 $120.00 $39,600.00 $20.00 $6,600.00 $12.00 $3,960.00 $75.00 $24,750.00

18 2H45TEC 70 Ton Construction Driveway $43.20 $3,024.00 $51.45 $3,601.50 $80.00 $5,600.00 $60.00 $4,200.00 $46.75 $3,272.50 $75.00 $5,250.00

19 3A08ABC 36250 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8" Thick $11.88 $430,650.00 $10.24 $371,200.00 $10.00 $362,500.00 $12.00 $435,000.00 $11.10 $402,375.00 $16.00 $580,000.00

20 3B00003 6100 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M 76-22 Surface Course $97.20 $592,920.00 $100.80 $614,880.00 $85.00 $518,500.00 $91.00 $555,100.00 $96.00 $585,600.00 $110.00 $671,000.00

21 3B00004 15750 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19M 76-22 Intermediate Course $93.96 $1,479,870.00 $94.50 $1,488,375.00 $95.00 $1,496,250.00 $89.00 $1,401,750.00 $94.00 $1,480,500.00 $110.00 $1,732,500.00

22 3B26TAC 9600 GAL Tack Coat $4.32 $41,472.00 $2.89 $27,744.00 $2.00 $19,200.00 $4.00 $38,400.00 $5.00 $48,000.00 $2.00 $19,200.00

23 3B41SCS 1000 L.F. Sealing Cracks in Bituminous Surface $6.48 $6,480.00 $1.05 $1,050.00 $5.00 $5,000.00 $6.00 $6,000.00 $2.50 $2,500.00 $5.00 $5,000.00

24 3BAPA0B 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

25 3C01BRS 455 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $20.00 $9,100.00 $36.75 $16,721.25 $30.00 $13,650.00 $25.00 $11,375.00 $21.15 $9,623.25 $20.00 $9,100.00

26 3D00007 1 Each Freshwater Rinse Concrete Slab and Curb $5,940.00 $5,940.00 $27,657.00 $27,657.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $17,100.00 $17,100.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00

27 3D01SCS 2 Each Oil-Water Separator Concrete Slab $6,480.00 $12,960.00 $3,150.00 $6,300.00 $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 $7,525.00 $15,050.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00

28 3D12PCP 740 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement, 12" Thick $178.20 $131,868.00 $231.00 $170,940.00 $280.00 $207,200.00 $170.00 $125,800.00 $137.50 $101,750.00 $200.00 $148,000.00

29 3E14PMR 15550 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 5" Depth $2.70 $41,985.00 $6.30 $97,965.00 $12.00 $186,600.00 $8.20 $127,510.00 $6.20 $96,410.00 $10.00 $155,500.00

30 4A10RFS 260 LB Reinforcement Steel $5.40 $1,404.00 $5.25 $1,365.00 $2.00 $520.00 $5.00 $1,300.00 $1.75 $455.00 $2.50 $650.00

31 5B00011 70 L.F. 6" Ductile Iron Pipe $64.80 $4,536.00 $47.78 $3,344.60 $60.00 $4,200.00 $60.00 $4,200.00 $60.00 $4,200.00 $85.00 $5,950.00

32 5B00012 330 L.F. 8" Ductile Iron Pipe $102.60 $33,858.00 $90.30 $29,799.00 $70.00 $23,100.00 $80.00 $26,400.00 $78.00 $25,740.00 $95.00 $31,350.00

33 5B06PVC 1360 L.F. 6" PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $64.80 $88,128.00 $53.55 $72,828.00 $25.00 $34,000.00 $32.00 $43,520.00 $30.45 $41,412.00 $60.00 $81,600.00

34 5B12DIP 110 L.F. 12" Ductile Iron Pipe $97.20 $10,692.00 $76.65 $8,431.50 $110.00 $12,100.00 $82.00 $9,020.00 $80.65 $8,871.50 $150.00 $16,500.00

35 5B12FCE 1 Each 12" Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $1,728.00 $1,728.00 $1,680.00 $1,680.00 $800.00 $800.00 $1,180.00 $1,180.00 $1,125.00 $1,125.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00

36 5B12RC3 100 L.F. 12" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $54.00 $5,400.00 $42.00 $4,200.00 $52.00 $5,200.00 $60.00 $6,000.00 $52.40 $5,240.00 $50.00 $5,000.00

37 5B14DIP 230 L.F. 14" Ductile Iron Pipe $129.60 $29,808.00 $92.40 $21,252.00 $130.00 $29,900.00 $92.00 $21,160.00 $90.65 $20,849.50 $220.00 $50,600.00

38 5B15RC3 210 L.F. 15" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $70.20 $14,742.00 $61.95 $13,009.50 $65.00 $13,650.00 $65.00 $13,650.00 $54.00 $11,340.00 $75.00 $15,750.00

39 5B15RC4 130 L.F. 15" Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class IV $59.40 $7,722.00 $47.25 $6,142.50 $70.00 $9,100.00 $61.00 $7,930.00 $57.50 $7,475.00 $78.00 $10,140.00

40 5B15RCE 1 Each 15" Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $1,836.00 $1,836.00 $1,732.50 $1,732.50 $800.00 $800.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,410.00 $1,410.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00

41 5B18DIP 120 L.F. 18" Ductile Iron Pipe $145.80 $17,496.00 $128.10 $15,372.00 $160.00 $19,200.00 $116.00 $13,920.00 $112.25 $13,470.00 $275.00 $33,000.00

42 5B18RC3 2770 L.F. 18" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $59.40 $164,538.00 $47.25 $130,882.50 $120.00 $332,400.00 $55.00 $152,350.00 $54.20 $150,134.00 $82.00 $227,140.00

43 5B18RCE 7 Each 18" Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $1,998.00 $13,986.00 $1,785.00 $12,495.00 $1,000.00 $7,000.00 $1,680.00 $11,760.00 $1,675.00 $11,725.00 $6,500.00 $45,500.00

44 5B24RC3 1150 L.F. 24" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $75.60 $86,940.00 $63.00 $72,450.00 $125.00 $143,750.00 $67.00 $77,050.00 $67.90 $78,085.00 $95.00 $109,250.00

45 5B24RCE 3 Each 24" Reinforced Concrete Flared End Sections $2,160.00 $6,480.00 $1,890.00 $5,670.00 $1,100.00 $3,300.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,010.00 $6,030.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00

46 5C00004 3 Each Outlet Control Structure $17,280.00 $51,840.00 $16,800.00 $50,400.00 $25,000.00 $75,000.00 $24,000.00 $72,000.00 $24,000.00 $72,000.00 $70,000.00 $210,000.00

47 5C01ND1 3 Each Inlet, Type D1 $3,024.00 $9,072.00 $2,730.00 $8,190.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $2,900.00 $8,700.00 $1,990.00 $5,970.00 $3,250.00 $9,750.00

48 5C01ND2 17 Each Inlet, Type D2 $3,240.00 $55,080.00 $3,622.50 $61,582.50 $3,500.00 $59,500.00 $3,080.00 $52,360.00 $3,075.00 $52,275.00 $3,500.00 $59,500.00

49 5C01ND3 16 Each Inlet, Type D3 $3,564.00 $57,024.00 $3,465.00 $55,440.00 $2,400.00 $38,400.00 $3,260.00 $52,160.00 $3,125.00 $50,000.00 $3,750.00 $60,000.00

50 5C01RMH 2 Each Reconstructed Manhole, Sanitary Sewer $1,080.00 $2,160.00 $630.00 $1,260.00 $5,100.00 $10,200.00 $2,700.00 $5,400.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00

51 5C10ED2 2 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using Existing Grate and Frame $1,080.00 $2,160.00 $945.00 $1,890.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00

52 5C10ND3 1 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D3, Using New Grate and Frame $2,160.00 $2,160.00 $1,837.50 $1,837.50 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

53 5C20NP1 5 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $5,400.00 $27,000.00 $5,250.00 $26,250.00 $5,200.00 $26,000.00 $3,700.00 $18,500.00 $3,650.00 $18,250.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00

54 5C20NP2 4 Each Manhole, Type P-2 $6,480.00 $25,920.00 $6,300.00 $25,200.00 $7,800.00 $31,200.00 $5,800.00 $23,200.00 $5,575.00 $22,300.00 $6,500.00 $26,000.00

55 5D10INC 110 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $723.60 $79,596.00 $420.00 $46,200.00 $300.00 $33,000.00 $500.00 $55,000.00 $200.00 $22,000.00 $685.00 $75,350.00

56 5F15DCC 90 L.F. Drop Curb $37.80 $3,402.00 $31.50 $2,835.00 $20.00 $1,800.00 $25.00 $2,250.00 $20.00 $1,800.00 $32.00 $2,880.00

57 5I01SNP 115 S.F. Sign Panels $36.72 $4,222.80 $39.90 $4,588.50 $16.00 $1,840.00 $50.00 $5,750.00 $17.25 $1,983.75 $35.00 $4,025.00

58 5I05SPP 345 L.F. U-channel Post $20.52 $7,079.40 $21.00 $7,245.00 $20.00 $6,900.00 $18.00 $6,210.00 $20.00 $6,900.00 $22.00 $7,590.00

59 5J52ABG 15 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $1,377.00 $20,655.00 $84.00 $1,260.00 $1,350.00 $20,250.00 $900.00 $13,500.00 $1,275.00 $19,125.00 $1,500.00 $22,500.00

60 5J52BGD 350 L.F. Beam Guide Rail, Dual-Faced $40.50 $14,175.00 $157.50 $55,125.00 $40.00 $14,000.00 $35.00 $12,250.00 $37.50 $13,125.00 $42.00 $14,700.00

61 5J52BGR 700 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $27.00 $18,900.00 $89.25 $62,475.00 $26.00 $18,200.00 $28.00 $19,600.00 $24.50 $17,150.00 $29.00 $20,300.00

62 5K00019 650 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 48" High $27.00 $17,550.00 $25.73 $16,724.50 $22.00 $14,300.00 $27.00 $17,550.00 $31.34 $20,371.00 $25.00 $16,250.00

63 5K00021 5400 L.F. Temporary Fencing, 96" High $20.52 $110,808.00 $15.49 $83,646.00 $23.00 $124,200.00 $13.00 $70,200.00 $43.50 $234,900.00 $11.00 $59,400.00

64 5K00050 4 Each Vehicular Gate, Type II, 72" High, 30' Wide $12,960.00 $51,840.00 $3,045.00 $12,180.00 $2,700.00 $10,800.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,445.00 $9,780.00 $3,500.00 $14,000.00

65 5K00052 7 Each Pedestrian Gate, Type II, 72" High, 6' Wide $2,592.00 $18,144.00 $1,260.00 $8,820.00 $1,300.00 $9,100.00 $1,300.00 $9,100.00 $1,537.00 $10,759.00 $2,000.00 $14,000.00

66 5K00069 2 Each Sliding Vehicular Gate (Motorized And Key Pad Activated) $12,960.00 $25,920.00 $40,031.25 $80,062.50 $26,500.00 $53,000.00 $36,000.00 $72,000.00 $52,600.00 $105,200.00 $45,000.00 $90,000.00

67 5K00071 1 Each Vehicular Gate, Type II, 72" High, 40' Wide $5,400.00 $5,400.00 $36,173.55 $36,173.55 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,600.00 $4,600.00 $5,875.00 $5,875.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00

68 5K72CLB 4650 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 72" High $37.80 $175,770.00 $24.11 $112,111.50 $22.00 $102,300.00 $26.00 $120,900.00 $26.12 $121,458.00 $32.00 $148,800.00

69 5N04PCS 2600 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $77.76 $202,176.00 $66.15 $171,990.00 $60.00 $156,000.00 $50.00 $130,000.00 $42.50 $110,500.00 $75.00 $195,000.00

70 5N07CHR 6 Each Concrete Handicap Ramp $1,242.00 $7,452.00 $1,076.25 $6,457.50 $500.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,120.00 $12,720.00 $1,500.00 $9,000.00

71 5P21LLS 23000 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $2.16 $49,680.00 $0.83 $19,090.00 $0.80 $18,400.00 $1.50 $34,500.00 $0.80 $18,400.00 $1.00 $23,000.00

72 5P33LLM 1030 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long - Life, Thermoplastic $8.64 $8,899.20 $9.98 $10,279.40 $6.00 $6,180.00 $5.85 $6,025.50 $6.25 $6,437.50 $15.00 $15,450.00

73 5Q01FOE 2 Unit Furnish Field Office, Type E $32,400.00 $64,800.00 $85,312.50 $170,625.00 $120,000.00 $240,000.00 $65,000.00 $130,000.00 $216,000.00 $432,000.00 $110,000.00 $220,000.00

74 5Q02MFE 68 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type E $540.00 $36,720.00 $1,050.00 $71,400.00 $3,500.00 $238,000.00 $3,000.00 $204,000.00 $1,000.00 $68,000.00 $500.00 $34,000.00



Base Line Item Detail Niram, Inc. Joseph A. Natoli Construction Corp. Hall Construction Co., Inc. Hall Building Corp. Alna Construction Corp. Dobco Inc.

75 5U01CAN 1 L.S. Canopy $129,600.00 $129,600.00 $58,579.50 $58,579.50 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $57,000.00 $57,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

76 5V01PIT 40 Each Test Pits $864.00 $34,560.00 $813.75 $32,550.00 $500.00 $20,000.00 $400.00 $16,000.00 $200.00 $8,000.00 $800.00 $32,000.00

77 5W02CDV 550 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drains, 15" to 24" Diameter $10.80 $5,940.00 $26.25 $14,437.50 $22.00 $12,100.00 $16.00 $8,800.00 $15.25 $8,387.50 $20.00 $11,000.00

78 5ZL0022 2 Each Manufactured Treatment Devices, Type 1 $48,600.00 $97,200.00 $47,250.00 $94,500.00 $45,000.00 $90,000.00 $67,000.00 $134,000.00 $61,761.00 $123,522.00 $75,000.00 $150,000.00

79 5ZL0023 2 Each Manufactured Treatment Devices, Type 2 $57,240.00 $114,480.00 $55,650.00 $111,300.00 $40,000.00 $80,000.00 $69,000.00 $138,000.00 $63,011.00 $126,022.00 $75,000.00 $150,000.00

80 5ZL0032 1050 L.F. 6" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $51.84 $54,432.00 $44.10 $46,305.00 $78.00 $81,900.00 $32.00 $33,600.00 $29.10 $30,555.00 $65.00 $68,250.00

81 5ZL0059 1 Each Yard Hydrant $1,620.00 $1,620.00 $1,601.25 $1,601.25 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

82 5ZL0062 50 L.F. 2" Copper Water Pipe, Type K $54.00 $2,700.00 $50.40 $2,520.00 $60.00 $3,000.00 $40.00 $2,000.00 $30.00 $1,500.00 $60.00 $3,000.00

83 5ZL0066 110 L.F. 4" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $43.20 $4,752.00 $34.65 $3,811.50 $60.00 $6,600.00 $35.00 $3,850.00 $28.00 $3,080.00 $65.00 $7,150.00

84 5ZL0070 1 L.S. Sanitary Pump Station $156,600.00 $156,600.00 $152,250.00 $152,250.00 $92,000.00 $92,000.00 $180,000.00 $180,000.00 $159,800.00 $159,800.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00

85 5ZL0078 4 Each Manhole, Sanitary Sewer $3,564.00 $14,256.00 $3,202.50 $12,810.00 $4,900.00 $19,600.00 $3,800.00 $15,200.00 $3,216.00 $12,864.00 $4,500.00 $18,000.00

86 5ZL01FHA 2 Each Fire Hydrant Assemblies $6,480.00 $12,960.00 $6,037.50 $12,075.00 $8,500.00 $17,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,900.00 $9,800.00 $7,500.00 $15,000.00

87 5ZL0235 90 L.F. 2" Plastic Gas Main $27.00 $2,430.00 $73.50 $6,615.00 $10.00 $900.00 $120.00 $10,800.00 $65.00 $5,850.00 $75.00 $6,750.00

88 5ZL0296 2 Each Water Meter and Vault $65,880.00 $131,760.00 $64,050.00 $128,100.00 $36,000.00 $72,000.00 $32,000.00 $64,000.00 $30,000.00 $60,000.00 $55,000.00 $110,000.00

89 5ZL0350 1 L.S. Utility Connection Fees (NO-BID) $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00

90 5ZL0386 175 Each Bin Blocks $648.00 $113,400.00 $126.00 $22,050.00 $340.00 $59,500.00 $110.00 $19,250.00 $86.45 $15,128.75 $470.00 $82,250.00

91 5ZL0387 700 L.F. 2" Sanitary Force Main $97.20 $68,040.00 $94.50 $66,150.00 $80.00 $56,000.00 $80.00 $56,000.00 $40.00 $28,000.00 $125.00 $87,500.00

92 5ZL0388 1 L.S. Site Electrical Work - Location No. 1 $900,000.00 $900,000.00 $1,488,000.00 $1,488,000.00 $1,600,000.00 $1,600,000.00 $2,287,000.00 $2,287,000.00 $891,500.00 $891,500.00 $925,000.00 $925,000.00

93 5ZL0389 1 L.S. Site Electrical Work - Location No. 2 $707,000.00 $707,000.00 $706,940.00 $706,940.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $890,000.00 $890,000.00 $339,000.00 $339,000.00 $750,000.00 $750,000.00

94 5ZL0390 1 L.S. Fiber Optic Work - Location No. 1 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $118,000.00 $118,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $333,000.00 $333,000.00 $95,860.00 $95,860.00

95 5ZL0391 1 L.S. Fiber Optic Work - Location No. 2 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $34,518.00 $34,518.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $37,000.00 $37,000.00 $432,000.00 $432,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

96 5ZL03DP 560 L.F. 3" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 52 $91.80 $51,408.00 $78.75 $44,100.00 $75.00 $42,000.00 $90.00 $50,400.00 $88.12 $49,347.20 $85.00 $47,600.00

97 5ZL06DP 2260 L.F. 6" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 52 $129.60 $292,896.00 $120.75 $272,895.00 $120.00 $271,200.00 $115.00 $259,900.00 $113.50 $256,510.00 $82.00 $185,320.00

98 5ZO0018 4500 Ton Off-Site Disposal of ID-27 Waste $64.80 $291,600.00 $49.35 $222,075.00 $44.00 $198,000.00 $55.00 $247,500.00 $31.50 $141,750.00 $95.00 $427,500.00

99 5ZO0027 134 Each Bollards $756.00 $101,304.00 $630.00 $84,420.00 $550.00 $73,700.00 $575.00 $77,050.00 $350.00 $46,900.00 $600.00 $80,400.00

100 5ZO0185 2 Each Post Mounted Knox Box $270.00 $540.00 $3,675.00 $7,350.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $950.00 $1,900.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00

101 5ZO0186 1 L.S. Universal Waste Removal (NO-BID) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

102 5ZOFAH0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Hazardous Regulated Material Handling (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

103 5ZOROA0B 1 L.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $405,000.00 $405,000.00 $405,000.00 $405,000.00 $405,000.00 $405,000.00 $405,000.00 $405,000.00 $405,000.00 $405,000.00 $405,000.00 $405,000.00

104 7C01TOP 23800 S.Y. Topsoil $7.56 $179,928.00 $2.10 $49,980.00 $2.50 $59,500.00 $2.50 $59,500.00 $2.00 $47,600.00 $5.00 $119,000.00

105 7D03SED 23800 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $2.16 $51,408.00 $2.63 $62,594.00 $1.00 $23,800.00 $1.45 $34,510.00 $1.30 $30,940.00 $2.00 $47,600.00

106 7N00009 6 Each Flagpole $3,024.00 $18,144.00 $5,250.00 $31,500.00 $3,500.00 $21,000.00 $3,200.00 $19,200.00 $2,500.00 $15,000.00 $4,500.00 $27,000.00

107 9A00174 1 L.S. Relocation Of Brine System $53,838.00 $53,838.00 $100,616.25 $100,616.25 $93,300.00 $93,300.00 $58,000.00 $58,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

108 9A00190 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1, Building A $6,711,000.00 $6,711,000.00 $5,748,400.00 $5,748,400.00 $5,000,000.00 $5,000,000.00 $6,360,000.00 $6,360,000.00 $14,200,000.00 $14,200,000.00 $7,300,000.00 $7,300,000.00

109 9A00191 1 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1, Building A $777,000.00 $777,000.00 $555,500.00 $555,500.00 $650,000.00 $650,000.00 $621,000.00 $621,000.00 $3,000,000.00 $3,000,000.00 $650,000.00 $650,000.00

110 9A00192 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1, Building A $1,720,000.00 $1,720,000.00 $1,720,000.00 $1,720,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $1,750,000.00 $1,750,000.00 $1,720,000.00 $1,720,000.00 $1,750,000.00 $1,750,000.00

111 9A00193 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 1, Building A $1,400,000.00 $1,400,000.00 $2,700,000.00 $2,700,000.00 $2,500,000.00 $2,500,000.00 $2,650,000.00 $2,650,000.00 $2,818,000.00 $2,818,000.00 $2,500,000.00 $2,500,000.00

112 9A00194 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1, Building A $718,000.00 $718,000.00 $873,000.00 $873,000.00 $835,000.00 $835,000.00 $898,000.00 $898,000.00 $466,000.00 $466,000.00 $826,000.00 $826,000.00

113 9A00195 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1, Building B $2,117,000.00 $2,117,000.00 $3,081,300.00 $3,081,300.00 $3,300,000.00 $3,300,000.00 $4,120,000.00 $4,120,000.00 $509,000.00 $509,000.00 $2,950,000.00 $2,950,000.00

114 9A00196 1 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1, Building B $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $59,000.00 $59,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $3,000,000.00 $3,000,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

115 9A00197 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1, Building B $49,000.00 $49,000.00 $49,000.00 $49,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $49,000.00 $49,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

116 9A00198 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 1, Building B $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $124,000.00 $124,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $135,000.00 $135,000.00 $366,000.00 $366,000.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00

117 9A00202 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 2, Building A $3,587,000.00 $3,587,000.00 $3,474,600.00 $3,474,600.00 $2,955,030.00 $2,955,030.00 $3,900,000.00 $3,900,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $5,750,000.00 $5,750,000.00

118 9A00205 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 1, Building E $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $1,235,000.00 $1,235,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,340,000.00 $1,340,000.00 $573,000.00 $573,000.00 $1,235,000.00 $1,235,000.00

119 9A00206 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 2, Building A $1,196,000.00 $1,196,000.00 $1,385,500.00 $1,385,500.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,275,000.00 $1,275,000.00 $1,660,000.00 $1,660,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00

120 9A00211 1 L.S. Building Equipment - Owner Furnished Contractor Installed - Location No. 1 $226,800.00 $226,800.00 $367,500.00 $367,500.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $420,000.00 $420,000.00 $550,000.00 $550,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00

121 9A00212 1 L.S. Building Equipment - Owner Furnished Contractor Installed - Location No. 2 $162,000.00 $162,000.00 $203,100.00 $203,100.00 $260,000.00 $260,000.00 $240,000.00 $240,000.00 $325,000.00 $325,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00

122 9A00214 1 L.S. Building Mechanicall Work - Location No. 2, Building A $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,250,000.00 $1,250,000.00 $1,250,000.00 $1,250,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00

123 9A00216 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1, Building E $218,000.00 $218,000.00 $258,000.00 $258,000.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $295,000.00 $295,000.00 $177,800.00 $177,800.00 $198,000.00 $198,000.00

124 9A00217 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 2, Building A $418,000.00 $418,000.00 $474,000.00 $474,000.00 $550,000.00 $550,000.00 $577,000.00 $577,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $596,000.00 $596,000.00

125 9A00223 1 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 2, Building A $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $293,500.00 $293,500.00 $360,000.00 $360,000.00 $345,000.00 $345,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00

126 9A00226 1 L.S. Demolition Of Buildings - Location No. 1, Building 1 $64,800.00 $64,800.00 $103,500.00 $103,500.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $208,000.00 $208,000.00 $184,784.00 $184,784.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00

127 9A00227 1 L.S. Demolition Of Buildings - Location No. 1, Building 2 $16,200.00 $16,200.00 $58,800.00 $58,800.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $54,035.00 $54,035.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00

128 9A00232 1 L.S. Liquid De-Icer Storage Tank And Accessories - Location No. 1 $10,800.00 $10,800.00 $16,500.00 $16,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

129 9A00266 1 C.P. Force Account For Building Work Allowances (NO-BID) $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00

130 9A00315 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1, Building E $1,204,000.00 $1,204,000.00 $732,700.00 $732,700.00 $2,800,000.00 $2,800,000.00 $1,523,000.00 $1,523,000.00 $982,000.00 $982,000.00 $2,750,000.00 $2,750,000.00

131 9A00316 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1, Building E $907,000.00 $907,000.00 $907,000.00 $907,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $895,000.00 $895,000.00 $907,000.00 $907,000.00 $950,000.00 $950,000.00

132 9A00317 1 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1, Building E $110,000.00 $110,000.00 $145,000.00 $145,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $145,000.00 $145,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00

133 N5F0001 8050 L.F. 9" X 18" Concrete Curb $28.08 $226,044.00 $25.20 $202,860.00 $23.00 $185,150.00 $21.00 $169,050.00 $20.00 $161,000.00 $29.00 $233,450.00

134 5ZL0034 90 L.F. 6" Plastic Gas Main $48.60 $4,374.00 $81.90 $7,371.00 $12.00 $1,080.00 $95.00 $8,550.00 $90.00 $8,100.00 $200.00 $18,000.00

135 5ZL0397 340 L.F. 4" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 52 $64.80 $22,032.00 $52.50 $17,850.00 $65.00 $22,100.00 $65.00 $22,100.00 $60.00 $20,400.00 $89.00 $30,260.00

136 8C21MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 1 $32,400.00 $32,400.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $43,000.00 $43,000.00 $41,400.00 $41,400.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

137 8C22MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 2 $29,700.00 $29,700.00 $18,375.00 $18,375.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $21,710.00 $21,710.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

138 8C00001 1 L.S. Police Traffic Directors on Location No. 1 (NO-BID) $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

139 8C00002 1 L.S. Police Traffic Directors on Location No. 2 (NO-BID) $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

Base Total $37,650,964.40 $41,087,000.00 $43,993,000.00 $45,455,350.50 $49,972,698.95 $50,875,015.00


