
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P500.392 Bid Date: November 13, 2015

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1 1D01LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $7,131.00 $7,131.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 
2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $220,000.00 $220,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $205,000.00 $205,000.00 
3 1F00002 1 L.S. NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 
4 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $45,727.00 $45,727.00 $18,500.00 $18,500.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 
5 1HFP0B 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 
6 2A02CAG 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $50,776.00 $50,776.00 $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $32,660.00 $32,660.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $42,000.00 $42,000.00 
7 2A06CAG 1 Each Sealing of Abandoned Well $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,633.00 $1,633.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 
8 2A08CAG 1 Each Monitoring Well $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $6,530.00 $6,530.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 
9 2B02REX 590 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $15.00 $8,850.00 $30.00 $17,700.00 $75.00 $44,250.00 $21.50 $12,685.00 $44.00 $25,960.00 $63.00 $37,170.00 

10 2E01CAL 207 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate Layer $60.00 $12,420.00 $70.00 $14,490.00 $50.00 $10,350.00 $54.00 $11,178.00 $48.00 $9,936.00 $63.00 $13,041.00 
11 2E01FEX 1,165.00 C.Y. Foundataion Excavation $24.40 $28,426.00 $35.00 $40,775.00 $75.00 $87,375.00 $22.00 $25,630.00 $44.00 $51,260.00 $32.00 $37,280.00 
12 2H00007 700 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $6.00 $4,200.00 $6.50 $4,550.00 $8.00 $5,600.00 $5.40 $3,780.00 $8.00 $5,600.00 $6.00 $4,200.00 
13 2H00016 5 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $160.00 $800.00 $300.00 $1,500.00 $125.00 $625.00 $272.00 $1,360.00 $165.00 $825.00 $112.00 $560.00 
14 2H25TEC 7 C.Y. Hay Bales $75.00 $525.00 $165.00 $1,155.00 $50.00 $350.00 $22.00 $154.00 $300.00 $2,100.00 $480.00 $3,360.00 
15 2H45TEC 50 Ton Construction Driveway $50.00 $2,500.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $54.50 $2,725.00 $45.00 $2,250.00 $22.00 $1,100.00 
16 3A06ABC 1,030.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6" Thick $15.00 $15,450.00 $15.00 $15,450.00 $10.00 $10,300.00 $9.80 $10,094.00 $14.50 $14,935.00 $8.00 $8,240.00 
17 3BAPA0B 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 
18 3B26TAC 470 GAL Tack Coat $4.00 $1,880.00 $5.00 $2,350.00 $6.00 $2,820.00 $7.40 $3,478.00 $5.00 $2,350.00 $1.00 $470.00 
19 3B32HMA 670 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M 76 Surface Course $95.00 $63,650.00 $105.00 $70,350.00 $109.00 $73,030.00 $87.60 $58,692.00 $115.00 $77,050.00 $112.00 $75,040.00 
20 3B00009 270 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M 76 Base Course $115.00 $31,050.00 $105.00 $28,350.00 $150.00 $40,500.00 $117.00 $31,590.00 $94.00 $25,380.00 $112.00 $30,240.00 
21 3D10PCP 507 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement, 10" Thick $155.00 $78,585.00 $210.00 $106,470.00 $130.00 $65,910.00 $120.00 $60,840.00 $160.00 $81,120.00 $165.00 $83,655.00 
22 5B06PVC 465 L.F. 6" PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $30.00 $13,950.00 $50.00 $23,250.00 $50.00 $23,250.00 $34.80 $16,182.00 $64.00 $29,760.00 $70.00 $32,550.00 
23 5B15RC3 220 L.F. 15" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $40.00 $8,800.00 $70.00 $15,400.00 $60.00 $13,200.00 $51.00 $11,220.00 $50.00 $11,000.00 $61.00 $13,420.00 
24 5C10ED3 1 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D3, Using Existing Grate and Frame $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,252.00 $1,252.00 $1,850.00 $1,850.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 
25 5C01ND3 3 Each Inlet, Type D3 $2,250.00 $6,750.00 $3,200.00 $9,600.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,830.00 $8,490.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 
26 5D10INC 1 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $544.00 $544.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $850.00 $850.00 
27 5F01VCA 1,200.00 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $24.00 $28,800.00 $24.00 $28,800.00 $26.00 $31,200.00 $19.60 $23,520.00 $28.00 $33,600.00 $27.00 $32,400.00 
28 5F20CWS 2 Each Concrete Wheel Stops $100.00 $200.00 $150.00 $300.00 $120.00 $240.00 $63.00 $126.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $100.00 $200.00 
29 5I01SNP 3 S.F. Sign Panels $25.00 $75.00 $125.00 $375.00 $27.00 $81.00 $27.00 $81.00 $50.00 $150.00 $27.00 $81.00 
30 5I05SPP 16 L.F. U-channel Post $15.00 $240.00 $20.00 $320.00 $17.00 $272.00 $10.00 $160.00 $15.00 $240.00 $16.00 $256.00 
31 5K00013 301 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 96" High $36.00 $10,836.00 $50.00 $15,050.00 $35.00 $10,535.00 $39.00 $11,739.00 $50.00 $15,050.00 $45.00 $13,545.00 
32 5K00018 1 Each Vehicular Gate, Type II, 96" High, 40' Wide $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 
33 5N00001 270 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, Reinforced, 4" Thick $46.00 $12,420.00 $65.00 $17,550.00 $73.00 $19,710.00 $78.40 $21,168.00 $50.00 $13,500.00 $73.00 $19,710.00 
34 5N07CHR 1 Each Concrete Handicap Ramp $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $598.00 $598.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,130.00 $1,130.00 
35 5O01PAW 2 Each Delineator, Type PA-W $95.00 $190.00 $105.00 $210.00 $100.00 $200.00 $217.00 $434.00 $75.00 $150.00 $100.00 $200.00 
36 5O01PAXW 2 Each Delineator, Type PAX-W $95.00 $190.00 $105.00 $210.00 $100.00 $200.00 $217.00 $434.00 $75.00 $150.00 $100.00 $200.00 
37 5P21LLS 1,200.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $1.50 $1,800.00 $2.50 $3,000.00 $1.65 $1,980.00 $2.75 $3,300.00 $2.75 $3,300.00 $1.60 $1,920.00 
38 5P33LLM 12 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long - Life, Thermoplastic $10.00 $120.00 $12.00 $144.00 $11.00 $132.00 $6.50 $78.00 $22.00 $264.00 $11.00 $132.00 
39 5Q01FOA 1 Unit Furnish Field Office, Type A $94,500.00 $94,500.00 $130,000.00 $130,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $7,600.00 $7,600.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $33,000.00 $33,000.00 
40 5Q02MFA 8 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type A $1,000.00 $8,000.00 $500.00 $4,000.00 $1,750.00 $14,000.00 $925.00 $7,400.00 $500.00 $4,000.00 $2,120.00 $16,960.00 
41 5V01PIT 2 Each Test Pits $350.00 $700.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $400.00 $800.00 $952.00 $1,904.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $310.00 $620.00 
42 5ZL0032 200 L.F. 6" Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $35.00 $7,000.00 $72.00 $14,400.00 $60.00 $12,000.00 $30.50 $6,100.00 $55.00 $11,000.00 $67.00 $13,400.00 
43 5ZL0059 1 Each Yard Hydrant $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,720.00 $2,720.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $530.00 $530.00 
44 5ZL0062 280 L.F. 2" Copper Water Pipe, Type K $40.00 $11,200.00 $75.00 $21,000.00 $70.00 $19,600.00 $35.90 $10,052.00 $44.00 $12,320.00 $56.00 $15,680.00 
45 5ZL0261 1 L.S. Site Electrical & Communication Work $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $195,000.00 $195,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $135,270.00 $135,270.00 $112,350.00 $112,350.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 
46 5ZL0346 1 L.S. Sanitary Sewer Service Connection $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,720.00 $2,720.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $2,120.00 $2,120.00 
47 5ZL0362 2 Each FOC Precast Concrete Manhole $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,200.00 $6,400.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $4,355.00 $8,710.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,950.00 $15,900.00 
48 5ZL0364 3 Each 2" Water Valve $375.00 $1,125.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $1,465.00 $4,395.00 $1,250.00 $3,750.00 $650.00 $1,950.00 
49 5ZL0375 220 L.F. #600 kCMil Cable $32.00 $7,040.00 $20.00 $4,400.00 $26.00 $5,720.00 $68.60 $15,092.00 $28.00 $6,160.00 $58.00 $12,760.00 
50 5ZL0382 300 L.F. 2- 1 1/4" FOC Duct Bank, PVC $34.00 $10,200.00 $17.50 $5,250.00 $40.00 $12,000.00 $40.00 $12,000.00 $38.50 $11,550.00 $40.00 $12,000.00 
51 5ZO0027 18 Each Bollards $375.00 $6,750.00 $650.00 $11,700.00 $1,000.00 $18,000.00 $2,720.00 $48,960.00 $600.00 $10,800.00 $650.00 $11,700.00 
52 6A01GWR 220 L.F. #1/0 A.W.G. Ground Wire $15.00 $3,300.00 $5.00 $1,100.00 $8.00 $1,760.00 $28.80 $6,336.00 $4.75 $1,045.00 $6.00 $1,320.00 
53 6J00065 350 L.F. Multi-Mode Fiber Optic Cable, 6-Fibers $19.00 $6,650.00 $5.00 $1,750.00 $21.00 $7,350.00 $22.90 $8,015.00 $6.00 $2,100.00 $53.00 $18,550.00 
54 6J17EDB 380 L.F. 2-5" Electric Duct Bank, PVC $37.00 $14,060.00 $75.00 $28,500.00 $50.00 $19,000.00 $32.00 $12,160.00 $43.75 $16,625.00 $26.00 $9,880.00 
55 7C01TOP 450 S.Y. Topsoil $6.00 $2,700.00 $4.00 $1,800.00 $11.00 $4,950.00 $10.90 $4,905.00 $8.00 $3,600.00 $10.00 $4,500.00 
56 7D02SED 450 S.Y. Seeding, Type B $2.00 $900.00 $2.50 $1,125.00 $2.00 $900.00 $5.50 $2,475.00 $2.50 $1,125.00 $3.00 $1,350.00 
57 9A00266 1 C.P. Force Account For Building Work Allowances (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 
58 9A00159 1 L.S. Modular Trailer and Accessories $165,000.00 $165,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $316,480.00 $316,480.00 $130,000.00 $130,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 
59 9A01UBW 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work $1,242,742.00 $1,242,742.00 $2,500,000.00 $2,500,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,247,500.00 $1,247,500.00 $3,500,450.10 $3,500,450.10 $1,572,000.00 $1,572,000.00 
60 9A04UBW 1 L.S. Building Electric Work $65,500.00 $65,500.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $70,470.00 $70,470.00 $128,400.00 $128,400.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 
61 9A44UBW 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $38,300.00 $38,300.00 $29,750.00 $29,750.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 
62 9A45UBW 1 L.S. Building Structural Work $1,804,000.00 $1,804,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $1,659,000.00 $1,659,000.00 $2,265,000.00 $2,265,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $2,345,000.00 $2,345,000.00 

$3,999,000.00 $4,222,724.00 $4,492,990.00 $4,763,777.00 $4,873,805.10 $5,163,570.00 

Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc.Base Line Item Detail Alna Construction Corp. Dobco Inc. J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc. Belmont Construction Corp. UniMak LLC
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