
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P100.342 Bid Date: November 13, 2015

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $340,000.00 $340,000.00 $357,000.00 $357,000.00 $370,000.00 $370,000.00 $428,000.00 $428,000.00 
2 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $9,300.00 $9,300.00 $1.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 
3 1HFP0B 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 
4 3B01PJA 2,750.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $2.00 $5,500.00 $8.00 $22,000.00 $3.47 $9,542.50 $7.14 $19,635.00 $16.77 $46,117.50 
5 3B04DOT 1,700.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M64 Surface Course $445.00 $756,500.00 $475.00 $807,500.00 $239.16 $406,572.00 $341.00 $579,700.00 $317.14 $539,138.00 
6 3B30CLS 200 L.F. Cleaning Inside Shoulders $0.20 $40.00 $10.00 $2,000.00 $1.79 $358.00 $1.00 $200.00 $22.00 $4,400.00 
7 3B30HMA 60 Ton Temporary Surfacing $500.00 $30,000.00 $300.00 $18,000.00 $374.85 $22,491.00 $2,000.00 $120,000.00 $794.61 $47,676.60 
8 3B31CLS 200 L.F. Cleaning Outside Shoulders $0.20 $40.00 $10.00 $2,000.00 $1.79 $358.00 $1.00 $200.00 $22.00 $4,400.00 
9 3B41SCS 500 L.F. Sealing Cracks in Bituminous Surface $2.00 $1,000.00 $6.50 $3,250.00 $8.25 $4,125.00 $10.97 $5,485.00 $4.26 $2,130.00 

10 3B42ASB 6,700.00 S.Y. Membrane Waterproofing $23.00 $154,100.00 $25.00 $167,500.00 $12.40 $83,080.00 $25.71 $172,257.00 $18.44 $123,548.00 
11 3B45HPP 10 Ton High Performance Cold Patch $540.00 $5,400.00 $150.00 $1,500.00 $238.92 $2,389.20 $400.00 $4,000.00 $2,674.62 $26,746.20 
12 3B52CSM 290 L.F. Crack Spanning Membrane $14.00 $4,060.00 $25.00 $7,250.00 $12.85 $3,726.50 $23.13 $6,707.70 $27.63 $8,012.70 
13 3BAPA0B 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 
14 3C03ASR 540 S.Y. Shoulder Reconstruction $50.00 $27,000.00 $50.00 $27,000.00 $82.22 $44,398.80 $93.00 $50,220.00 $387.03 $208,996.20 
15 3E20PMR 1,850.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Variable Depth $42.00 $77,700.00 $65.00 $120,250.00 $43.46 $80,401.00 $60.00 $111,000.00 $177.84 $329,004.00 
16 3E55PMR 1,900.00 L.F. Remove Existing Rumble Strip $29.00 $55,100.00 $25.00 $47,500.00 $11.62 $22,078.00 $15.93 $30,267.00 $16.52 $31,388.00 
17 3F01MRS 2,000.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $11.00 $22,000.00 $4.00 $8,000.00 $5.89 $11,780.00 $15.89 $31,780.00 $6.19 $12,380.00 
18 3L01SSJ 290 L.F. Sawing and Sealing Joints in Asphalt Concrete Overlay $4.00 $1,160.00 $10.00 $2,900.00 $25.75 $7,467.50 $17.78 $5,156.20 $26.25 $7,612.50 
19 4A11RFS 52,250.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $2.00 $104,500.00 $2.25 $117,562.50 $2.58 $134,805.00 $2.43 $126,967.50 $2.57 $134,282.50 
20 4C01SSC 50 Each Shear Connectors $4.00 $200.00 $15.00 $750.00 $10.20 $510.00 $12.16 $608.00 $10.50 $525.00 
21 4H116LEB 2 Each Laminated Elastomeric Bearing, 8" X 10" $17,000.00 $34,000.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00 $19,188.75 $38,377.50 $13,164.11 $26,328.22 $14,680.22 $29,360.44 
22 4K08PES 2,460.00 S.F. Repainting Existing Steelwork $35.00 $86,100.00 $25.00 $61,500.00 $30.60 $75,276.00 $38.94 $95,792.40 $26.25 $64,575.00 
23 4L00001 7 Each Repair Drainage Pipe $4,700.00 $32,900.00 $12,000.00 $84,000.00 $3,984.73 $27,893.11 $4,230.39 $29,612.73 $6,500.00 $45,500.00 
24 4L02BDR 12 Each Plug Existing Scuppers $1,040.00 $12,480.00 $600.00 $7,200.00 $1,802.83 $21,633.96 $1,279.65 $15,355.80 $826.78 $9,921.36 
25 4L04BDI 2 Each Repair Bridge Drop Inlet $1,750.00 $3,500.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $956.01 $1,912.02 $1,168.94 $2,337.88 $1,748.08 $3,496.16 
26 4L05CBD 510 L.F. Clean Bridge Drainage System $34.00 $17,340.00 $20.00 $10,200.00 $49.87 $25,433.70 $23.71 $12,092.10 $29.65 $15,121.50 
27 4Q00006 100 C.F. Additional 1P Deck Joint Material $273.00 $27,300.00 $250.00 $25,000.00 $254.95 $25,495.00 $303.89 $30,389.00 $262.45 $26,245.00 
28 N4Q0001 1 L.S. Concrete Repair Material $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $23,857.28 $23,857.28 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $53,479.80 $53,479.80 
29 N4Q0002 6,400.00 S.F. Furnishing, Installation and Removal of Temporary Shielding $28.00 $179,200.00 $25.00 $160,000.00 $24.87 $159,168.00 $23.49 $150,336.00 $32.05 $205,120.00 
30 4Q03BDR 600 S.Y. Concrete Deck Replacement with Catches $990.00 $594,000.00 $950.00 $570,000.00 $1,176.25 $705,750.00 $1,685.31 $1,011,186.00 $2,000.00 $1,200,000.00 
31 4Q08BDR 6,700.00 S.Y. Removal of Existing Surfacing $42.00 $281,400.00 $55.00 $368,500.00 $38.62 $258,754.00 $60.00 $402,000.00 $30.49 $204,283.00 
32 4Q18SJS 350 L.F. Silicone Joint Seal $50.00 $17,500.00 $18.00 $6,300.00 $89.41 $31,293.50 $70.10 $24,535.00 $26.68 $9,338.00 
33 4Q24BDR 9,540.00 L.F. Reinforcement Steel, Field Anti - Corrosion Coating $0.10 $954.00 $7.00 $66,780.00 $6.07 $57,907.80 $6.78 $64,681.20 $2.50 $23,850.00 
34 4Q30S02 50 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 2 $90.00 $4,500.00 $100.00 $5,000.00 $117.98 $5,899.00 $110.31 $5,515.50 $74.05 $3,702.50 
35 4Q30S04 50 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 4 $135.00 $6,750.00 $235.00 $11,750.00 $247.16 $12,358.00 $180.56 $9,028.00 $135.62 $6,781.00 
36 4Q30S05 8,800.00 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 5 $50.00 $440,000.00 $70.00 $616,000.00 $69.15 $608,520.00 $103.21 $908,248.00 $59.64 $524,832.00 
37 4Q30S06 100 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 6 $138.00 $13,800.00 $245.00 $24,500.00 $177.28 $17,728.00 $180.57 $18,057.00 $135.86 $13,586.00 
38 4Q30S5A 100 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 5A $74.00 $7,400.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $92.87 $9,287.00 $152.23 $15,223.00 $71.40 $7,140.00 
39 4Q30SUD 200 S.F. Repair Underdeck Spalls (Clean and Coat) $37.00 $7,400.00 $55.00 $11,000.00 $195.55 $39,110.00 $229.33 $45,866.00 $187.09 $37,418.00 
40 4Q50J01 450 L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type 1 $237.00 $106,650.00 $475.00 $213,750.00 $318.69 $143,410.50 $591.96 $266,382.00 $323.78 $145,701.00 
41 4Q50J1P 260 L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type 1P $280.00 $72,800.00 $410.00 $106,600.00 $141.64 $36,826.40 $258.71 $67,264.60 $145.80 $37,908.00 
42 4Q50JF1 45 L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type F $859.00 $38,655.00 $875.00 $39,375.00 $847.20 $38,124.00 $1,339.96 $60,298.20 $789.23 $35,515.35 
43 4Q51J1P 570 L.F. Joint Replacement, Type 1P $270.00 $153,900.00 $400.00 $228,000.00 $141.64 $80,734.80 $258.61 $147,407.70 $145.80 $83,106.00 
44 4Q60JSR 490 L.F. Joint Seal Replacement, Type 1 $135.00 $66,150.00 $200.00 $98,000.00 $70.04 $34,319.60 $112.29 $55,022.10 $54.62 $26,763.80 
45 4QFAE0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Emergency and Routine Bridge Repairs (NO-BID) $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 
46 4R00003 45 S.F. Repair Concrete Diaphragm $230.00 $10,350.00 $350.00 $15,750.00 $427.80 $19,251.00 $373.32 $16,799.40 $1,175.00 $52,875.00 
47 4R00022 250 L.F. Clean Bridge Seat $29.00 $7,250.00 $15.00 $3,750.00 $39.75 $9,937.50 $49.40 $12,350.00 $18.04 $4,510.00 
48 4R01BSR 65 S.F. Sidewalk, Parapet and Curb Surface Repairs $68.00 $4,420.00 $110.00 $7,150.00 $177.84 $11,559.60 $244.78 $15,910.70 $172.84 $11,234.60 
49 4R01RSC 50 S.F. Vertical Spall Repair $95.00 $4,750.00 $120.00 $6,000.00 $293.22 $14,661.00 $327.72 $16,386.00 $1,160.86 $58,043.00 
50 4R01SC1 100 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Abutment $175.00 $17,500.00 $260.00 $26,000.00 $490.35 $49,035.00 $281.66 $28,166.00 $976.08 $97,608.00 
51 4R01SC2 20 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Abutment $204.00 $4,080.00 $300.00 $6,000.00 $551.82 $11,036.40 $373.32 $7,466.40 $553.57 $11,071.40 
52 4R02BSR 3 Each Replace Structural Steel Diaphragm $13,500.00 $40,500.00 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $19,057.93 $57,173.79 $12,852.55 $38,557.65 $12,928.28 $38,784.84 
53 4R02SC1 600 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Pier $375.00 $225,000.00 $275.00 $165,000.00 $408.69 $245,214.00 $327.72 $196,632.00 $669.48 $401,688.00 
54 4R02SC2 50 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Pier $375.00 $18,750.00 $375.00 $18,750.00 $522.00 $26,100.00 $396.12 $19,806.00 $498.81 $24,940.50 
55 4R11RSS 5 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type A $4,600.00 $23,000.00 $4,500.00 $22,500.00 $6,018.00 $30,090.00 $7,861.99 $39,309.95 $7,407.30 $37,036.50 
56 4R13RSS 1 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type C $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $5,600.00 $5,600.00 $4,947.00 $4,947.00 $8,862.50 $8,862.50 $6,257.21 $6,257.21 
57 4R14BSR 2,200.00 S.F. Substructure Waterproofing $13.00 $28,600.00 $10.00 $22,000.00 $39.64 $87,208.00 $11.08 $24,376.00 $15.00 $33,000.00 
58 4R25BSR 5,800.00 S.F. Substructure Membrane Waterproofing $40.00 $232,000.00 $10.00 $58,000.00 $13.06 $75,748.00 $14.59 $84,622.00 $18.38 $106,604.00 
59 4R26RBG 2 Each Reconstruct Bearing Area $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,944.94 $17,889.88 $9,290.81 $18,581.62 $8,258.14 $16,516.28 
60 4ZH01SPP 2 Each Install, Maintain and Remove Steel Protection Plate $500.00 $1,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,759.66 $11,519.32 $1.00 $2.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 
61 4ZH03SPP 1 L.S. Picking Up and Returning Authority's Steel Protection Plates $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,070.11 $2,070.11 $1.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 
62 4ZI0001 150 S.F. Repair Prestressed Concrete Stringer, Type 1 $450.00 $67,500.00 $400.00 $60,000.00 $459.74 $68,961.00 $493.44 $74,016.00 $1,175.00 $176,250.00 
63 4ZN01TS 1 L.S. Temporary Supports for Concrete Deck, Location No. 1 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $82,222.99 $82,222.99 $43,025.23 $43,025.23 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 
64 4ZN02TS 1 L.S. Temporary Supports for Concrete Deck, Location No. 2 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $91,517.71 $91,517.71 $43,025.23 $43,025.23 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 
65 4ZN03TS 1 L.S. Temporary Supports for Concrete Deck, Location No. 3 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $17,693.01 $17,693.01 $4,481.79 $4,481.79 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 
66 5C55CDS 15 Each Cleaning Existing Drainage Structures $525.00 $7,875.00 $500.00 $7,500.00 $1,092.85 $16,392.75 $547.11 $8,206.65 $1,512.00 $22,680.00 
67 5C60RIG 3 Each Replace Existing Inlet Grate $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $740.78 $2,222.34 $1,830.68 $5,492.04 $981.80 $2,945.40 
68 5D10INC 20 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $250.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $20,000.00 $1,500.00 $30,000.00 $849.82 $16,996.40 $3,062.17 $61,243.40 
69 5E01ALC 95 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $20.00 $1,900.00 $40.00 $3,800.00 $47.06 $4,470.70 $89.43 $8,495.85 $300.00 $28,500.00 
70 5K01REP 135 L.F. Repair Chain Link Fence $65.00 $8,775.00 $100.00 $13,500.00 $84.66 $11,429.10 $60.79 $8,206.65 $87.15 $11,765.25 
71 5P10TMP 1,000.00 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.02 $1,020.00 $1.22 $1,220.00 $1.05 $1,050.00 
72 5P13TMP 3,400.00 L.F. Removable Black Line Mask, 8" Wide $3.00 $10,200.00 $3.00 $10,200.00 $3.01 $10,234.00 $3.59 $12,206.00 $3.57 $12,138.00 
73 5P14TMP 6,000.00 L.F. Removable Wet Weather Pavement Marking Tape $2.00 $12,000.00 $2.25 $13,500.00 $2.14 $12,840.00 $5.00 $30,000.00 $1.68 $10,080.00 
74 5P21LLS 5,000.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $2.00 $10,000.00 $2.00 $10,000.00 $2.04 $10,200.00 $2.43 $12,150.00 $2.10 $10,500.00 
75 5Q01FOC 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $24,458.99 $24,458.99 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 
76 5Q02MFC 12 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $2,100.00 $25,200.00 $5,000.00 $60,000.00 $4,906.20 $58,874.40 $3,829.78 $45,957.36 $3,000.00 $36,000.00 
77 5ZD01RPM 200 Each Raised Pavement Markers $5.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $10,000.00 $50.49 $10,098.00 $60.18 $12,036.00 $47.25 $9,450.00 
78 5ZD05RPM 50 Each Furnish and Install Raised Pavement Marker Reflective Lens $5.00 $250.00 $25.00 $1,250.00 $35.70 $1,785.00 $60.18 $3,009.00 $15.75 $787.50 
79 5ZL0151 475 L.F. Removal of Water Pipe $55.00 $26,125.00 $20.00 $9,500.00 $126.16 $59,926.00 $160.99 $76,470.25 $32.00 $15,200.00 
80 6AMEW0B 1 L.S. Miscellaneous Electrical Work (NO-BID) $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

Base Line Item Detail Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. Halmar International LLC Crisdel Group, Inc. IEW Construction Group Inc. Tarheel Enterprises, Inc.
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81 7F01SSM 35 S.Y. Soil Stablization Matting $58.00 $2,030.00 $15.00 $525.00 $139.21 $4,872.35 $26.83 $939.05 $42.00 $1,470.00 
82 7L01NVA 50 S.Y. Nonvegetative Surface, Hot Mix Asphalt $35.00 $1,750.00 $65.00 $3,250.00 $255.69 $12,784.50 $155.98 $7,799.00 $65.00 $3,250.00 
83 N8A0001 1,140.00 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $5.00 $5,700.00 $10.00 $11,400.00 $20.67 $23,563.80 $1.00 $1,140.00 $40.00 $45,600.00 
84 N8A0002 340 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $96.00 $32,640.00 $35.00 $11,900.00 $52.40 $17,816.00 $70.00 $23,800.00 $28.00 $9,520.00 
85 8A01MPT 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $470,000.00 $470,000.00 $487,668.62 $487,668.62 $571,966.68 $571,966.68 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 
86 8A06MPT 2 Barr Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $210.00 $420.00 $400.00 $800.00 $631.82 $1,263.64 $1.00 $2.00 $400.00 $800.00 
87 8A07MPT 1 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $1.00 $1.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,550.00 $2,550.00 $1.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 
88 8A35MPT 20 Day Placing and Removing Portable Variable Message Sign $100.00 $2,000.00 $125.00 $2,500.00 $326.89 $6,537.80 $200.00 $4,000.00 $1,000.00 $20,000.00 
89 8B18MPT 2 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $7,000.00 $14,000.00 $6,071.79 $12,143.58 $1.00 $2.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 
90 8B19MPT 100 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $75.00 $7,500.00 $75.00 $7,500.00 $149.05 $14,905.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $150.00 $15,000.00 
91 8B20MPT 1 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,256.64 $1,256.64 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 
92 8B26MPT 120 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $100.00 $12,000.00 $500.00 $60,000.00 $3,565.49 $427,858.80 $750.00 $90,000.00 $3,250.00 $390,000.00 
93 8C21MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 1 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $71,588.86 $71,588.86 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 
94 8C22MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 2 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $16,683.96 $16,683.96 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 
95 8C23MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 3 $44,100.00 $44,100.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $106,905.60 $106,905.60 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 
96 8C24MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 4 $39,000.00 $39,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $91,109.91 $91,109.91 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 
97 8C25MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 5 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $71,588.86 $71,588.86 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 
98 8C26MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 6 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $71,588.86 $71,588.86 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 
99 8CPTD0B 1 L.S. Police Traffic Directors (NO-BID) $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 

$5,139,445.00 $6,268,542.50 $6,566,000.00 $7,413,541.27 $7,999,999.99 Base Total
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