New Jersey Turnpike Authority

P100.377

Base Line Item Detail Ferreira Construction Co. Inc. Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. D'Annunzio & Sons, Inc. IEW Construction Group Inc. Crisdel Group, Inc.
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $419,000.00! $419,000.00 $448,000.00 $448,000.00 $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $575,000.00 $575,000.00
2 1G01SCH 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $24,255.00 $24,255.00 $5,563.85 $5,563.85 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
3 1HFPOB 1.00 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
4 2J11DES 1.00 L.S. Demolition of Existing Structures No. 1 $200,000.00! $200,000.00 $130,000.00 $130,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 65,487.02 $65,487.02 $150,000.00 $150,000.00
5 2J12DES 1.00 L.S. Demolition of Existing Structures No. 2 $125,000.00! $125,000.00 $35,500.00 $35,500.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 98,715.75 $98,715.75 $200,000.00 $200,000.00
6 2J13DES 1.00 L.S. Demolition of Existing Structures No. 3 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 25,334.48 $25,334.48 $45,000.00 $45,000.00
7 3BO1PJA 1,670.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $5.00. $8,350.00 $3.00. $5,010.00 $4.00 $6,680.00 $6.74 $11,255.80 $4.62 $7,715.40
8 3B04DOT 1,500.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M64 Surface Course $380.00 $570,000.00 $500.00 $750,000.00 $380.00 $570,000.00 $330.00 $495,000.00 $289.55 $434,325.00
9 3B30CLS 200.00 L.F. Cleaning Inside Shoulders $1.00. $200.00 $0.20 $40.00 $2.00 $400.00 $3.34 $668.00 $1.80 $360.00
10 3B30HMA 45.00 Ton Temporary Surfacing $450.00 $20,250.00 $800.00 $36,000.00 $450.00 $20,250.00 $1,018.74 $45,843.30 $315.89 $14,215.05
11 3B31CLS 200.00 L.F. Cleaning Outside Shoulders $1.00. $200.00 $0.20 $40.00 $2.00 $400.00 $3.34 $668.00 $1.80 $360.00
12 3B41SCS 500.00 L.F. Sealing Cracks in Bituminous Surface $5.00. $2,500.00 $2.00 $1,000.00 $2.00 $1,000.00 $3.34 $1,670.00 $7.92 $3,960.00
13 3B42ASB 4,250.00 S.Y. Membrane Waterproofing $28.00 $119,000.00 $18.00 $76,500.00 $20.00 $85,000.00 $38.17 $162,222.50 $15.90 $67,575.00
14 3B45HPP 10.00 Ton High Performance Cold Patch $465.00 $4,650.00 $540.00 $5,400.00 $200.00 $2,000.00 $556.39 $5,563.90 $246.41 $2,464.10
15 3B52CSM 560 L.F. Crack Spanning Membrane $16.00 $8,960.00 $3.00. $1,680.00 $20.00 $11,200.00 $25.80 $14,448.00 $17.33 $9,704.80
16 3BAPAOB 1.00 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
17 3C03ASR 50| S.Y. Shoulder Reconstruction $25.00 $1,250.00 $62.00 $3,100.00 $140.00 $7,000.00 $111.28 $5,564.00 $132.93 $6,646.50
18 3E20PMR 1900 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Variable Depth $40.00 $76,000.00 $40.00 $76,000.00 $25.00 $47,500.00 $8.73 $16,587.00 $63.56 $120,764.00
19 3E55PMR 1,805.00 L.F. Remove Existing Rumble Strip $21.00 $37,905.00 $18.00 $32,490.00 $10.00 $18,050.00 $14.73 $26,587.65 $15.41 $27,815.05
20 3FO1IMRS 2,000.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $9.00. $18,000.00 $16.00 $32,000.00 $5.00 $10,000.00 $5.56 $11,120.00 $13.17 $26,340.00
21 3L01SSJ 490.00 L.F. Sawing and Sealing Joints in Asphalt Concrete Overlay $10.00. $4,900.00 $4.00 $1,960.00 $20.00 $9,800.00 $19.30 $9,457.00 $36.88 $18,071.20
22 4A01STC 48 C.Y. Concrete In Substructure Above Footings $3,000.00 $144,000.00 $3,000.00 $144,000.00; $4,000.00 $192,000.00; $1,644.11 $78,917.28 $3,022.83 $145,095.84
23 4A11RFS 38,700.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $3.00. $116,100.00 $2.00 $77,400.00 $4.00 $154,800.00 $2.78 $107,586.00 $3.25 $125,775.00
24 4A15DGR 500.00 Each Drill and Grout Reinforcement Bars $29.00 $14,500.00 $30.00 $15,000.00 $30.00 $15,000.00 $127.22 $63,610.00 $14.32 $7,160.00
25 4A20BPB 66.00 L.F. Barrier Parapet, Bridge $420.00 $27,720.00 $474.00 $31,284.00 $450.00 $29,700.00 $754.70 $49,810.20 $360.50 $23,793.00
26 4B02PCB 64.00 L.F. Prestressed Concrete Beam, 36 PA Beam $420.00 $26,880.00 $640.00 $40,960.00 $1,000.00 $64,000.00| $1,023.62 $65,511.68 $627.66 $40,170.24
27 4C01SSC 50.00 Each Shear Connectors $28.00 $1,400.00 $5.00 $250.00 $10.00 $500.00 $11.13 $556.50 $25.75 $1,287.50
28 4H81LEB 99 Each Laminated Elastomeric Bearing, 10" x 12" $11,500.00 $1,138,500.00 $12,500.00 $1,237,500.00 $7,200.00 $712,800.00; $10,471.45 $1,036,673.55 $13,467.49 $1,333,281.51
29 4H96LEB 21 Each Laminated Elastomeric Bearing, 8" x 20" $13,500.00 $283,500.00 $14,000.00 $294,000.00; $13,000.00 $273,000.00; $13,488.09 $283,249.89 $13,764.48 $289,054.08
30 4K08PES 1,400.00 S.F. Repainting Existing Steelwork $30.00 $42,000.00 $67.00 $93,800.00 $60.00 $84,000.00 $55.64 $77,896.00 $28.84 $40,376.00
31 400001 2.00 Each Repair Drainage Pipe $920.00 $1,840.00 $3,450.00 $6,900.00 $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $3,787.38 $7,574.76 $4,778.03 $9,556.06
32 4100004 15.00 L.F. 8" Drainage Pipe, (Fiberglass) $160.00 $2,400.00 $345.00 $5,175.00 $500.00 $7,500.00 $370.80 $5,562.00 $416.42 $6,246.30
33 4L01BDR 2.00 Each Inlet Frames and Grates $6,300.00 $12,600.00 $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $13,000.00 $26,000.00 $5,958.44 $11,916.88 $17,140.33 $34,280.66
34 4L02BDR 7.00 Each Plug Existing Scuppers $500.00 $3,500.00 $1,300.00 $9,100.00 $800.00 $5,600.00 $1,857.02 $12,999.14 $1,493.59 $10,455.13
35 4L04BDI 8.00 Each Repair Bridge Drop Inlet $210.00 $1,680.00 $1,250.00 $10,000.00 $2,100.00 $16,800.00 $1,461.33 $11,690.64 $777.78 $6,222.24
36 4L05CBD 90.00 L.F. Clean Bridge Drainage System $20.00 $1,800.00 $20.00 $1,800.00 $65.00 $5,850.00 $53.39 $4,805.10 $36.97 $3,327.30
37 4M04USP 20.00 S.Y. Repair Concrete Slope Protection $250.00 $5,000.00 $208.00 $4,160.00 $420.00 $8,400.00 $1,163.55 $23,271.00 $699.68 $13,993.60
38 4Q00006 100.00 C.F. Additional 1P Deck Joint Material $0.01 $1.00 $372.00 $37,200.00 $400.00 $40,000.00 $413.22 $41,322.00 $382.48 $38,248.00
39 4Q00007 240.00 L.F. Furnishing, Installation and Removal of Temporary Catch, Location No. 1 $290.00 $69,600.00 $300.00 $72,000.00| $320.00 $76,800.00 $242.96 $58,310.40 $230.99 $55,437.60
40 4Q00008 66 L.F. Furnishing, Installation and Removal of Temporary Catch, Location No. 2 $290.00 $19,140.00 $360.00 $23,760.00| $360.00 $23,760.00| $579.78 $38,265.48 $1,234.80 $81,496.80
41 N4Q0001 1.00 L.S. Concrete Repair Material $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $38,473.99 $38,473.99 $9,673.02 $9,673.02
42 N4Q0002 5,200.00 S.F. Furnishing, Installation and Removal of Temporary Shielding $12.00 $62,400.00 $18.00 $93,600.00 $22.00 $114,400.00; $23.31 $121,212.00 $24.16 $125,632.00
43 4Q02BDR 80 S.Y. Concrete Deck Replacement $560.00 $44,800.00 $678.00 $54,240.00 $500.00 $40,000.00 $1,420.34 $113,627.20 $1,159.56 $92,764.80
44 4Q03BDR 350.00 S.Y. Concrete Deck Replacement with Catches $1,000.00 $350,000.00 $973.00 $340,550.00 $950.00 $332,500.00 $2,308.21 $807,873.50 $1,400.29 $490,101.50
45 4Q05BDR 4.00 Each Diaphragms $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $11,485.09 $45,940.36 $5,160.24 $20,640.96
46 4Q08BDR 4,250.00 S.Y Removal of Existing Surfacing $50.00 $212,500.00 $40.00 $170,000.00 $36.00 $153,000.00 $72.78 $309,315.00 $38.83 $165,027.50
47 4Q15BDR 80 S.Y. Removal of Existing Concrete Deck $350.00 $28,000.00 $575.00 $46,000.00 $80.00 $6,400.00 $1,467.76 $117,420.80 $958.40 $76,672.00
48 4Q18SJS 1380 L.F. Silicone Joint Seal $15.00 $20,700.00 $66.00 $91,080.00 $35.00 $48,300.00 $71.97 $99,318.60 $27.58 $38,060.40
49 4Q24BDR 1520 L.F. Reinforcement Steel, Field Anti - Corrosion Coating $3.50, $5,320.00 $0.10, $152.00 $6.00 $9,120.00 $7.77 $11,810.40 $12.26 $18,635.20
50 4Q30S02 50.00 S.F Spall Repair, Type 2 $115.00 $5,750.00 $70.00 $3,500.00 $45.00 $2,250.00 $143.00 $7,150.00 $130.65 $6,532.50
51 4Q30S04 50.00 S.F Spall Repair, Type 4 $135.00 $6,750.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $140.00 $7,000.00 $343.42 $17,171.00 $258.08 $12,904.00
52 4Q30S05 5,200.00 S.F Spall Repair, Type 5 $52.00 $270,400.00 $51.00 $265,200.00 $42.00 $218,400.00 $90.00 $468,000.00 $81.51 $423,852.00
53 4Q30S06 50| S.F Spall Repair, Type 6 $183.00 $9,150.00 $114.00 $5,700.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $315.27 $15,763.50 $287.06 $14,353.00
54 4Q30S5B 100 S.F Spall Repair, Type 5B $123.00 $12,300.00 $65.00 $6,500.00 $70.00 $7,000.00 $170.82 $17,082.00 $153.01 $15,301.00
55 4Q30STU 120 S.F Spall Repair, Type U $169.00 $20,280.00 $294.00 $35,280.00 $110.00 $13,200.00 $481.44 $57,772.80 $262.46 $31,495.20
56 4Q30SUD 380 S.F. Repair Underdeck Spalls (Clean and Coat) $60.00 $22,800.00 $92.00 $34,960.00 $160.00 $60,800.00 $118.62 $45,075.60 $165.75 $62,985.00
57 40Q50J01 300.00 L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type 1 $250.00 $75,000.00 $500.00 $150,000.00 $330.00 $99,000.00 $709.66 $212,898.00 $342.90 $102,870.00
58 40Q50J02 40 L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type 2 $600.00 $24,000.00 $850.00 $34,000.00 $420.00 $16,800.00 $2,398.22 $95,928.80 $1,023.12 $40,924.80
59 4Q50J1P 80| L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type 1P $480.00 $38,400.00 $328.00 $26,240.00 $430.00 $34,400.00 $370.22 $29,617.60 $342.68 $27,414.40
60 40Q51J1P 335 L.F. Joint Replacement, Type 1P $220.00 $73,700.00 $281.00 $94,135.00 $160.00 $53,600.00 $344.96 $115,561.60 $159.37 $53,388.95
61 4Q60JSR 760 L.F. Joint Seal Replacement, Type 1 $40.00 $30,400.00 $99.00 $75,240.00 $120.00 $91,200.00 $90.68 $68,916.80 $69.78 $53,032.80
62 4QFAEOB 1 C.P Force Account for Emergency and Routine Bridge Repairs (NO-BID) $100,000.00! $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00
63 4R00003 65.00 S.F. Repair Concrete Diaphragm $200.00 $13,000.00 $454.00 $29,510.00 $200.00 $13,000.00 $278.03 $18,071.95 $218.10 $14,176.50
64 4R00022 100.00 L.F. Clean Bridge Seat $5.00! $500.00 $23.00 $2,300.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $55.64 $5,564.00 $46.07 $4,607.00
65 4R01BSR 63.00 S.F Sidewalk, Parapet and Curb Surface Repairs $125.00 $7,875.00 $71.00 $4,473.00 $110.00 $6,930.00 $196.86 $12,402.18 $173.43 $10,926.09
66 4R01RSC 100.00 S.F Vertical Spall Repair $100.00 $10,000.00 $95.00 $9,500.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $362.82 $36,282.00 $334.54 $33,454.00
67 4R01SC1 1,000.00 S.F Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Abutment $220.00 $220,000.00 $244.00 $244,000.00 $190.00 $190,000.00 $283.59 $283,590.00 $243.61 $243,610.00
68 4R01SC2 50.00 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Abutment $270.00 $13,500.00 $295.00 $14,750.00 $260.00 $13,000.00 $368.38 $18,419.00 $314.88 $15,744.00
69 4R02BSR 5.00 Each Replace Structural Steel Diaphragm $7,000.00 $35,000.00 $13,500.00 $67,500.00 $4,500.00 $22,500.00 $4,190.82 $20,954.10 $9,991.00 $49,955.00
70 4R02SC1 1100 S.F Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Pier $230.00 $253,000.00 $224.00 $246,400.00 $210.00 $231,000.00 $283.59 $311,949.00 $182.90 $201,190.00
71 4R02SC2 60| S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Pier $235.00 $14,100.00 $275.00 $16,500.00 $280.00 $16,800.00 $368.38 $22,102.80 $228.64 $13,718.40
72 4R11RSS 10| Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type A $4,000.00 $40,000.00 $4,400.00 $44,000.00 $2,800.00 $28,000.00 $3,840.43 $38,404.30 $3,836.75 $38,367.50
73 4R12RSS 2 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type B $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $2,833.24 $5,666.48 $3,605.00 $7,210.00
74 4R13RSS 12.00 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type C $4,000.00 $48,000.00 $3,500.00 $42,000.00 $2,900.00 $34,800.00 $3,829.30 $45,951.60 $3,131.20 $37,574.40
75 4R14BSR 1,300.00 S.F. Substructure Waterproofing $15.00 $19,500.00 $19.00 $24,700.00 $14.00 $18,200.00 $14.05 $18,265.00 $17.18 $22,334.00
76 4R14RSS 1.00 Each Repair Structural Steel, Type D $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $3,801.34 $3,801.34 $18,447.30 $18,447.30
77 4R15RSS 5.00 Each Repair Structural Steel, Type E $6,900.00 $34,500.00 $18,600.00 $93,000.00 $4,200.00 $21,000.00 $14,667.95 $73,339.75 $16,943.50 $84,717.50
78 4R16RSS 1.00 Each Repair Structural Steel, Type F $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,800.00 $4,800.00 $2,833.23 $2,833.23 $6,077.00 $6,077.00
79 4R17RSS 1 Each Repair Structural Steel, Type G $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $3,912.62 $3,912.62 $8,085.50 $8,085.50
80 4R25BSR 10600 S.F. Substructure Membrane Waterproofing $12.00! $127,200.00 $19.00 $201,400.00| $11.00 $116,600.00| $11.07 $117,342.00 $11.03 $116,918.00
81 4R26RBG 8 Each Reconstruct Bearing Area $2,500.00 $20,000.00 $3,000.00 $24,000.00 $3,500.00 $28,000.00 $3,897.69 $31,181.52 $11,098.72 $88,789.76
82 4R30RBG 1 Each Reset Bearing $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $9,049.91 $9,049.91 $8,852.85 $8,852.85
83 4R41TSS 5 Each Temporary Support $10,000.00 $50,000.00 $11,300.00 $56,500.00 $6,200.00 $31,000.00 $7,047.30 $35,236.50 $10,495.21 $52,476.05
84 4ZF0058 175.00 S.Y. Concrete-Filled Steel Decking $550.00 $96,250.00 $204.00 $35,700.00 $830.00 $145,250.00 $429.55 $75,171.25 $1,154.67 $202,067.25
85 4ZHO1SPP 2 Each Install, Maintain and Remove Steel Protection Plate $500.00 $1,000.00| $1,500.00 $3,000.00| $3,000.00 $6,000.00| $556.39 $1,112.78 $5,829.80 $11,659.60
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86 4ZHO3SPP 1 L.S. Picking Up and Returning Authority's Steel Protection Plates $450.00 $450.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,112.77 $1,112.77 $1,420.27 $1,420.27
87 4710001 140 S.F. Repair Prestressed Concrete Stringer, Type 1 $290.00 $40,600.00 $450.00 $63,000.00| $570.00 $79,800.00 $822.17 $115,103.80 $283.05 $39,627.00
88 4710002 20| S.F. Repair Prestressed Concrete Stringer, Type 2 $425.00 $8,500.00 $500.00 $10,000.00 $600.00 $12,000.00 $822.16 $16,443.20 $514.12 $10,282.40
89 4710003 35.00 L.F. Repair Prestressed Concrete Stringer, Type 3 $1,000.00 $35,000.00 $3,500.00 $122,500.00; $3,000.00 $105,000.00; $3,354.95 $117,423.25 $1,500.49 $52,517.15
90 4ZJ01SMF 1740 S.F. Remove and Reset Stone Masonry $150.00 $261,000.00 $143.00 $248,820.00 $85.00 $147,900.00 $300.71 $523,235.40 $229.12 $398,668.80
91 4ZKO1RSM 2550 L.F. Repoint Stone Masonry $25.00 $63,750.00 $35.00 $89,250.00 $45.00 $114,750.00 $36.85 $93,967.50 $21.74 $55,437.00
92 4ZNO1TS 1 L.S. Temporary Supports for Concrete Deck, Location No. 1 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $38,873.84 $38,873.84 $63,433.82 $63,433.82
93 4ZN02TS 1.00 L.S. Temporary Supports for Concrete Deck, Location No. 2 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $77,747.66 $77,747.66 $123,532.84 $123,532.84
94 5C55CDS 10 Each Cleaning Existing Drainage Structures $500.00 $5,000.00 $550.00 $5,500.00 $900.00 $9,000.00 $442.22 $4,422.20 $347.30 $3,473.00
95 5C60RIG 10.00 Each Replace Existing Inlet Grate $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $900.00 $9,000.00 $1,871.26 $18,712.60 $1,411.13 $14,111.30
96 5D10INC 20.00 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $200.00 $4,000.00 $500.00 $10,000.00 $150.00 $3,000.00 $556.38 $11,127.60 $3,061.25 $61,225.00
97 5E01ALC 20 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $28.00. $560.00 $25.00 $500.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $55.64 $1,112.80 $94.37 $1,887.40
98 5F01VCD 75 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type D $110.00 $8,250.00 $75.00 $5,625.00 $140.00 $10,500.00 $136.28 $10,221.00 $110.21 $8,265.75
99 5K00017 620 L.F. Reset Fence $80.00. $49,600.00 $83.00 $51,460.00| $55.00 $34,100.00 $55.64 $34,496.80 $77.25 $47,895.00
100 5K01REP 25 L.F. Repair Chain Link Fence $50.00. $1,250.00 $390.00 $9,750.00 $60.00 $1,500.00 $111.28 $2,782.00 $360.50 $9,012.50
101 5N04PCS 70 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $110.00 $7,700.00 $95.00 $6,650.00 $160.00 $11,200.00 $153.96 $10,777.20 $129.78 $9,084.60
102 5P10TMP 6300 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $1.00; $6,300.00 $1.00 $6,300.00 $0.35 $2,205.00 $0.34 $2,142.00 $1.03 $6,489.00
103 5P11REM 1000 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Mechanical $2.00; $2,000.00 $2.00 $2,000.00 $2.20 $2,200.00 $2.23 $2,230.00 $5.15 $5,150.00
104 5P12REM 2500 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $3.00; $7,500.00 $2.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $2,500.00 $1.01 $2,525.00 $3.09 $7,725.00
105 5P13TMP 1000 L.F. Removable Black Line Mask, 8" Wide $4.00; $4,000.00 $4.00 $4,000.00 $3.20 $3,200.00 $3.28 $3,280.00 $6.18 $6,180.00
106 5P14TMP 1000 L.F. Removable Wet Weather Pavement Marking Tape $3.00; $3,000.00 $2.00 $2,000.00 $2.20 $2,200.00 $2.28 $2,280.00 $4.12 $4,120.00
107 5P21LLS 6500 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $5.00! $32,500.00 $4.60 $29,900.00 $2.80 $18,200.00 $2.83 $18,395.00 $2.06 $13,390.00
108 5Q01FOC 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $24,094.24 $24,094.24 $31,144.49 $31,144.49
109 5Q02MFC 12.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $2,500.00 $30,000.00 $3,500.00 $42,000.00 $4,200.00 $50,400.00 $3,505.22 $42,062.64 $5,366.30 $64,395.60
110 5ZD01RPM 200 Each Raised Pavement Markers $40.00. $8,000.00 $50.00 $10,000.00 $50.00 $10,000.00 $50.07 $10,014.00 $46.35 $9,270.00
111 5ZD0O5RPM 50 Each Furnish and Install Raised Pavement Marker Reflective Lens $25.00 $1,250.00 $25.00 $1,250.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $16.69 $834.50 $20.60 $1,030.00
112 6AMEWOB 1 L.S. Miscellaneous Electrical Work (NO-BID) $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00| $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00
113 7F01SSM 35 S.Y Soil Stablization Matting $120.00 $4,200.00 $40.00 $1,400.00 $50.00 $1,750.00 $15.97 $558.95 $55.95 $1,958.25
114 7LOINVA 50 S.Y. Nonvegetative Surface, Hot Mix Asphalt $45.00 $2,250.00 $75.00 $3,750.00 $210.00 $10,500.00 $915.04 $45,752.00 $235.82 $11,791.00
115 N8A0001 600 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $5.00 $3,000.00| $10.00 $6,000.00| $40.00 $24,000.00 $11.91 $7,146.00 $38.37 $23,022.00
116 N8A0002 440 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $25.00 $11,000.00 $75.00 $33,000.00 $30.00 $13,200.00 $67.04 $29,497.60 $54.32 $23,900.80
117 8A01IMPT 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $145,119.00 $145,119.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00; $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $470,000.00 $470,000.00 $563,999.55 $563,999.55
118 8A06MPT 2 Barr Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $100.00 $200.00| $200.00 $400.00| $700.00 $1,400.00 $111.28 $222.56 $757.94 $1,515.88
119 8AQ07MPT 1.00 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $500.00 $500.00| $1.00 $1.00| $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $556.38 $556.38 $2,575.00 $2,575.00
120 8A35MPT 20.00 Day Placing and Removing Portable Variable Message Sign $1.00 $20.00 $200.00 $4,000.00| $900.00 $18,000.00 $166.92 $3,338.40 $70.04 $1,400.80
121 8B18MPT 2.00 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator $2,200.00 $4,400.00| $3,500.00 $7,000.00| $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,869.66 $7,739.32 $6,312.13 $12,624.26
122 8B19MPT 100.00 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $1.00 $100.00| $50.00 $5,000.00| $100.00 $10,000.00 $111.28 $11,128.00 $128.97 $12,897.00
123 8B20MPT 2.00 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator $1,200.00 $2,400.00| $4,000.00 $8,000.00| $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $1,378.16 $2,756.32 $889.40 $1,778.80
124 8B26MPT 120.00 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $1,300.00 $156,000.00 $100.00 $12,000.00 $2,300.00 $276,000.00 $2,110.57 $253,268.40 $3,918.31 $470,197.20
125 8B34MPT 120.00 L.F. Modular Glare Screen System $10.00. $1,200.00 $12.00 $1,440.00 $20.00 $2,400.00 $25.54 $3,064.80 $33.46 $4,015.20
126 8C21MLR 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $48,078.48 $48,078.48 $24,976.81 $24,976.81
127 8C22MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 2 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $48,431.22 $48,431.22 $30,983.98 $30,983.98
128 8C23MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 3 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $47,956.07 $47,956.07 $10,323.12 $10,323.12
129 8C24MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 4 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $47,860.37 $47,860.37 $9,544.65 $9,544.65
130 8C25MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 5 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $49,674.19 $49,674.19 $35,088.14 $35,088.14
131 8C26MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 6 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $61,324.17 $61,324.17 $40,066.10 $40,066.10
132 8C27MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 7 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $50,648.97 $50,648.97 $90,537.32 $90,537.32
133 8C28MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 8 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $64,120.56 $64,120.56 $76,249.09 $76,249.09
134 8C29MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 9 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $50,465.37 $50,465.37 $10,238.36 $10,238.36
135 8C30MLR 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 10 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $61,114.57 $61,114.57 $256,689.06 $256,689.06
136 8C31MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 11 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $48,345.54 $48,345.54 $207,177.36 $207,177.36
137 8C32MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 12 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $50,026.93 $50,026.93 $99,873.00 $99,873.00
138 8C33MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 13 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $85,336.27 $85,336.27 $109,564.17 $109,564.17
139 8CPTDOB 1.00 L.S. Police Traffic Directors (NO-BID) $150,000.00! $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00
140 8DRRCOB 1.00 L.S. Railroad Reimbursement Costs (NO-BID) $190,000.00! $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00
141 8EQIMTE 1.00 L.S. Marine Transport Engineer to Work Site, No. 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00| $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,112.77 $1,112.77 $15,868.44 $15,868.44
142 8E02MTE 1.00 L.S. Marine Transport Engineer to Work Site, No. 2 $2,500.00 $2,500.00| $1,000.00 $1,000.00| $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,112.77 $1,112.77 $29,780.86 $29,780.86
143 8EO3MTE 1.00 L.S. Marine Transport Engineer to Work Site, No. 3 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,112.77 $1,112.77 $32,193.19 $32,193.19

Base Total

$7,787,000.00

$8,520,615.00

$9,087,000.00

$10,749,984.36

$10,953,389.00

Page 2 of 2




