New Jersey Turnpike Authority

Base Line Item Detail

Contract No. T500.402

WHL Enterprises, Inc. T/A Bill Leary AC &

Kaser Mechanical, LLC

Gaudelli Bros Inc.

ACP Contracting Inc.

Shelby Mechanical Inc

Heating
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 1D10MOBX 1 L.S. Mobilization $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $118,243.00 $118,243.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00
2 9A00078 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $11,315.00 $11,315.00 $17,708.00 $17,708.00 $26,586.00 $26,586.00 $18,430.00 $18,430.00
3 9A00079 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $9,715.00 $9,715.00 $16,776.00 $16,776.00 $22,867.00 $22,867.00 $14,112.00 $14,112.00
4 9A00107 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 3 $14,500.00 $14,500.00 $12,600.00 $12,600.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $27,826.00 $27,826.00 $22,590.00 $22,590.00
5 9A00108 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 4 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $11,440.00 $11,440.00 $18,291.00 $18,291.00 $22,867.00 $22,867.00 $17,435.00 $17,435.00
6 9A00109 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 5 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $23,500.00 $23,500.00 $26,173.00 $26,173.00 $21,496.00 $21,496.00
7 9A00110 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 6 $37,000.00 $37,000.00 $31,055.00 $31,055.00 $55,300.00 $55,300.00 $67,308.00 $67,308.00 $54,930.00 $54,930.00
8 9A00080 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $182,300.00 $182,300.00 $207,000.00 $207,000.00 $185,475.00 $185,475.00 $201,196.00 $201,196.00 $209,400.00 $209,400.00
9 9A00081 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $129,000.00 $129,000.00 $135,800.00 $135,800.00 $152,396.00 $152,396.00 $168,220.00 $168,220.00 $169,700.00 $169,700.00
10 9A00113 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3 $194,000.00 $194,000.00 $208,000.00 $208,000.00 $218,793.00 $218,793.00 $211,749.00 $211,749.00 $256,600.00 $256,600.00
11 9A00114 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 4 $197,000.00 $197,000.00 $211,200.00 $211,200.00 $203,700.00 $203,700.00 $215,896.00 $215,896.00 $237,500.00 $237,500.00
12 9A00115 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 5 $213,000.00 $213,000.00 $235,700.00 $235,700.00 $228,949.00 $228,949.00 $255,293.00 $255,293.00 $327,800.00 $327,800.00
13 9A00116 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 6 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $247,000.00 $247,000.00 $237,550.00 $237,550.00 $223,041.00 $223,041.00 $264,300.00 $264,300.00
14 9AFAEOB 1.00 C.P. Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
15 9AFAMOB 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
16 9AFAAOB 1.00 C.P. Force Account for Building Architectural Work Allowances (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
17 5ZOROA0B 1 L.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00
18 5ZOLAMOB 1 L.S. Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00
19 5ZOROLOB 1 L.S. Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00
20 9A00173 1 C.P. Force Account for Temporary Heating Allowance (NO-BID) $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00

$1,708,300.00 $1,819,825.00 $1,883,438.00 $2,067,265.00 $2,111,793.00

Page 1 of 2

Bid Date: 05/03/2016



New Jersey Turnpike Authority

Base Line Item Detail

Contract No. T500.402

Amco Enterprises Inc

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total

1 1D10MOBX 1 L.S. Mobilization $180,000.00 $180,000.00
2 9A00078 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $11,760.00 $11,760.00
3 9A00079 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $10,080.00 $10,080.00
4 9A00107 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 3 $13,080.00 $13,080.00
5 9A00108 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 4 $11,880.00 $11,880.00
6 9A00109 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 5 $11,964.00 $11,964.00
7 9A00110 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 6 $33,360.00 $33,360.00
8 9A00080 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $241,000.00 $241,000.00
9 9A00081 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $215,000.00 $215,000.00
10 9A00113 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3 $285,000.00 $285,000.00
11 9A00114 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 4 $251,000.00 $251,000.00
12 9A00115 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 5 $275,000.00 $275,000.00
13 9A00116 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 6 $265,000.00 $265,000.00
14 9AFAEOB 1.00 C.P. Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00
15 9AFAMOB 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00
16 9AFAAOB 1.00 C.P. Force Account for Building Architectural Work Allowances (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00
17 5ZOROA0B 1 L.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $100,000.00 $100,000.00
18 5ZOLAMOB 1 L.S. Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $75,000.00 $75,000.00
19 5ZOROLOB 1 L.S. Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $30,000.00 $30,000.00
20 9A00173 1 C.P. Force Account for Temporary Heating Allowance (NO-BID) $150,000.00 $150,000.00

$2,284,124.00
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