New Jersey Turnpike Authority

P200.418

Base Line Item Detail Earle Asphalt Company Crisdel Group, Inc. C.J. Hesse Intercounty Paving Associates, LLC Stavola Contracting Co., Inc.
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $605,000.00 $605,000.00 $616,033.33 $616,033.33 $454,254.00 $454,254.00; $934,088.00 $934,088.00; $1,104,184.94 $1,104,184.94;
2 1HFPOB 1.00 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00; $250,000.00 $250,000.00; $250,000.00 $250,000.00; $250,000.00 $250,000.00
3 2A02CAG 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $362,500.00 $362,500.00 $45,670.03 $45,670.03 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
4 3BO1PJA 419,000.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $0.05. $20,950.00 $0.49 $205,310.00 $0.35 $146,650.00 $0.27 $113,130.00 $0.35 $146,650.00
5 3B26TAC 75,000.00 GAL Tack Coat $0.25 $18,750.00 $3.01 $225,750.00 $4.00 $300,000.00 $0.01 $750.00 $2.50 $187,500.00
6 3B32HMA 110,000.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M 76 Surface Course $59.50. $6,545,000.00 $65.58 $7,213,800.00 $71.75 $7,892,500.00 $75.00 $8,250,000.00; $82.00 $9,020,000.00
7 3B46BCS 110.00 Each Bituminous Core Samples $15.00 $1,650.00 $75.00 $8,250.00 $230.00 $25,300.00 $75.00 $8,250.00 $150.00 $16,500.00
8 3BAPAOB 1.00 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $375,000.00 $375,000.00 $375,000.00 $375,000.00; $375,000.00 $375,000.00; $375,000.00 $375,000.00; $375,000.00 $375,000.00
9 3E09PMR 755,000.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2-1/2" Depth $1.50, $1,132,500.00 $2.60. $1,963,000.00 $3.00 $2,265,000.00 $3.25 $2,453,750.00] $2.75 $2,076,250.00
10 3FO1IMRS 246,000.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $1.75 $430,500.00 $0.18 $44,280.00 $0.40 $98,400.00 $0.20 $49,200.00 $0.65 $159,900.00
11 5C40RSF 10.00 Each Reset Frame $350.00 $3,500.00 $854.20 $8,542.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $750.00 $7,500.00 $600.00 $6,000.00
12 5C00054 10.00 Each Reset Frames, Various Types with Extensions $250.00 $2,500.00 $310.00 $3,100.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $800.00 $8,000.00 $250.00 $2,500.00
13 5P20LLS 2,700.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, Epoxy Resin $1.90 $5,130.00 $1.95 $5,265.00 $2.00 $5,400.00 $2.55 $6,885.00 $1.25 $3,375.00
14 5P21LLS 392,000.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $1.00 $392,000.00 $1.72 $674,240.00 $1.80 $705,600.00 $2.00 $784,000.00 $1.80 $705,600.00
15 5P31LLM 39000 L.F. Traffic Markings, Lines, Long - Life, Thermoplastic $1.47 $57,330.00 $1.72 $67,080.00 $1.55 $60,450.00 $2.00 $78,000.00 $1.80 $70,200.00
16 5P33LLM 250.00 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long - Life, Thermoplastic $9.50 $2,375.00 $11.35 $2,837.50 $10.00 $2,500.00 $15.00 $3,750.00 $9.50 $2,375.00
17 5Q02FOB 2 Each Furnish Field Office, Type B $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,341.52 $40,683.04 $40,000.00 $80,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00
18 5Q02MFB 9 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $1,000.00 $9,000.00 $4,000.00 $36,000.00 $5,000.00 $45,000.00 $3,200.00 $28,800.00 $2,000.00 $18,000.00
19 5ZD01RPM 4,600.00 Each Raised Pavement Markers $23.70. $109,020.00 $23.79 $109,434.00 $25.00 $115,000.00 $25.00 $115,000.00 $24.50 $112,700.00
20 6J00001 70.00 Each In-Pavement Wireless Sensor $1,330.00 $93,100.00 $917.06 $64,194.20] $1,300.00 $91,000.00 $1,400.00 $98,000.00 $1,500.00 $105,000.00
21 8A0LMPT 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $624,908.63 $624,908.63 $473,886.36 $473,886.36 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00; $200,000.00 $200,000.00
22 8A29MPT 1000 M.H. Flaggers $0.01 $10.00 $0.01 $10.00 $100.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $0.01 $10.00
23 8A30MPT 6.00 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $2,500.00 $15,000.00 $5,060.00 $30,360.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $0.01 $0.06
24 8B15MPT 1,000.00 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol $0.01 $10.00 $0.01 $10.00 $125.00 $125,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $0.01 $10.00
25 1DO1LAY 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $1,850.00 $1,850.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
26 1DINT136 1.00 L.S. Mobilization (Int. 136) $14,971.17 $14,971.17 $23,631.84 $23,631.84 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
27 1G01SCH 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $750.00 $750.00 $3,660.00 $3,660.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00
28 1HINT136 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) (Int. 136) $600.00 $600.00 $600.00 $600.00 $600.00 $600.00 $600.00 $600.00 $600.00 $600.00
29 2BETUOB 1 L.S. Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (NO-BID) $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
30 2BO4REX 1,000.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation and Embankment $24.60 $24,600.00 $76.79 $76,790.00 $35.00 $35,000.00 $50.00 $50,000.00 $28.00 $28,000.00
31 2B15STS 150.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $20.70 $3,105.00 $23.57 $3,535.50 $15.00 $2,250.00 $15.00 $2,250.00 $16.00 $2,400.00
32 2H00007 800.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black $7.75 $6,200.00 $5.99 $4,792.00 $7.00 $5,600.00 $6.50 $5,200.00 $6.00 $4,800.00
33 2H00016 5.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $95.20 $476.00 $192.39 $961.95 $200.00 $1,000.00 $165.00 $825.00 $150.00 $750.00
34 3A08ABC 2,200.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8" Thick $12.60 $27,720.00 $19.60 $43,120.00 $15.00 $33,000.00 $11.50 $25,300.00 $14.00 $30,800.00
35 3BINT136 540.00 GAL Tack Coat (Int. 136) $0.10. $54.00 $3.02 $1,630.80 $4.00 $2,160.00 $1.00 $540.00 $2.50 $1,350.00
36 3B00015 900.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19M76 Base Course $93.50 $84,150.00 $89.37 $80,433.00 $72.00 $64,800.00 $70.00 $63,000.00 $80.00 $72,000.00
37 3E07PMR 1,500.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2" Depth $8.00. $12,000.00 $6.71 $10,065.00 $5.00 $7,500.00 $6.00 $9,000.00 $6.00 $9,000.00
38 3EINT136 1,700.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2-1/2" Depth (Int. 136) $7.50 $12,750.00 $8.19 $13,923.00 $6.00. $10,200.00 $6.25 $10,625.00] $6.00 $10,200.00
39 3I03SAS 550.00 Ton Asphalt Rubber Open Graded Friction Course $240.00 $132,000.00 $198.87 $109,378.50; $225.00 $123,750.00; $175.00 $96,250.00 $175.00 $96,250.00
40 5CINT136 1 Each Reset Frame (Int. 136) $250.00 $250.00 $1,034.21 $1,034.21 $500.00 $500.00 $785.00 $785.00 $600.00 $600.00
41 5101RES 1.00 Each Relocate Existing Ground-Mounted Sign $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,066.99 $1,066.99 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $660.00 $660.00 $500.00 $500.00
42 5001PAW 10.00 Each Delineator, Type PA-W $20.00 $200.00 $123.96 $1,239.60 $55.00 $550.00 $16.00 $160.00 $95.00 $950.00
43 5PINT136 3000 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long Life, Thermoplastic (Int. 136) $1.70, $5,100.00 $3.45 $10,350.00 $1.80 $5,400.00 $3.75 $11,250.00 $1.80 $5,400.00
44 5YO5RMM 1.00 Each Relocate Tenth of Mile Marker and Post $350.00 $350.00 $227.40 $227.40 $220.00 $220.00 $100.00 $100.00 $40.00 $40.00
45 5ZDINT136 30.00 Each Raised Pavement Markers (Int. 136) $77.65 $2,329.50 $55.15 $1,654.50 $82.00 $2,460.00 $60.00 $1,800.00 $26.00 $780.00
46 7C01TOP 725.00 S.Y Topsoil $1.25 $906.25 $5.47 $3,965.75 $8.00. $5,800.00 $4.00 $2,900.00 $8.00 $5,800.00
47 7D17SED 725 S.Y. Seeding, Type W $1.50 $1,087.50 $2.00 $1,450.00 $2.00 $1,450.00 $1.00 $725.00 $1.00 $725.00
48 N8A0001 1080 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $10.00. $10,800.00 $20.00 $21,600.00 $50.00 $54,000.00 $30.00 $32,400.00 $45.00 $48,600.00
49 8AINT136 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices (Int. 136) $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $50,989.29 $50,989.29 $11,667.41 $11,667.41 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
50 8A00013 1.00 Each Temporary Crash Cushion, Frangible Module Type $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $5,865.21 $5,865.21 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
51 8A06MPT 8.00 Barr Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $0.01] $0.08 $600.00 $4,800.00 $3,250.00 $26,000.00 $275.00 $2,200.00 $1,500.00 $12,000.00
52 N8A0002 1,080.00 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $18.50 $19,980.00 $10.00 $10,800.00 $11.00 $11,880.00 $15.00 $16,200.00 $15.00 $16,200.00

Base Total $11,492,113.13 $12,957,300.00 $13,714,141.41 $14,123,223.00 $15,070,000.00
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