New Jersey Turnpike Authority

P100.378

Base Line ltem Detail

Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc.

IEW Construction Group Inc.

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $415,000.00! $415,000.00 $562,492.02 $562,492.02
2 1G01SCH 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,255.29 $1,255.29
3 1HFPOB 1.00 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
4 3B01PJA 4,940.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $7.50, $37,050.00 $3.47 $17,141.80
5 3B04DOT 1,600.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M64 Surface Course $535.00 $856,000.00 $500.00 $800,000.00
6 3B30CLS 200.00 L.F. Cleaning Inside Shoulders $0.10; $20.00 $3.77 $754.00
7 3B30HMA 82.00 Ton Temporary Surfacing $1,500.00 $123,000.00 $1,072.97 $87,983.54]
8 3B31CLS 200.00 L.F. Cleaning Outside Shoulders $0.10; $20.00 $3.77 $754.00
9 3B41SCS 500.00 L.F. Sealing Cracks in Bituminous Surface $4.00; $2,000.00 $3.77 $1,885.00
10 3B42ASB 6,525.00 S.Y. Membrane Waterproofing $27.00 $176,175.00 $26.19 $170,889.75
11 3B45HPP 10{Ton High Performance Cold Patch $540.00 $5,400.00 $627.65 $6,276.50
12 3BAPAOB 1.00 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
13 3B52CSM 110.00 L.F. Crack Spanning Membrane $10.00. $1,100.00 $16.42 $1,806.20
14 3C01BRS 44.00 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $61.00. $2,684.00 $188.29 $8,284.76
15 3C03ASR 2300 S.Y. Shoulder Reconstruction $70.00 $161,000.00 $125.53 $288,719.00
16 3E20PMR 2,740.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Variable Depth $50.00. $137,000.00 $5.42 $14,850.80
17 3E55PMR 925 L.F. Remove Existing Rumble Strip $50.00. $46,250.00 $21.49 $19,878.25
18 3FO1IMRS 2785 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $16.00 $44,560.00 $4.73 $13,173.05
19 3L01SSJ 110.00 L.F. Sawing and Sealing Joints in Asphalt Concrete Overlay $5.00! $550.00 $16.97 $1,866.70
20 4A11RFS 19,200.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $2.00; $38,400.00 $2.29 $43,968.00
21 4A15DGR 25.00 Each Drill and Grout Reinforcement Bars $40.00 $1,000.00 $83.46 $2,086.50
22 4A20BPB 225 L.F. Barrier Parapet, Bridge $540.00 $121,500.00 $941.47 $211,830.75
23 4C01SSC 50.00 Each Shear Connectors $5.00. $250.00 $12.55 $627.50
24 4H81LEB 64.00 Each Laminated Elastomeric Bearing, 10" x 12" $18,000.00 $1,152,000.00 $14,148.12 $905,479.68
25 4KO8PES 400.00 S.F. Repainting Existing Steelwork $80.00. $32,000.00 $62.76 $25,104.00|
26 4100001 1.00 Each Repair Drainage Pipe $4,399.00 $4,399.00 $3,745.16 $3,745.16
27 4L02BDR 2.00 Each Plug Existing Scuppers $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $1,520.59 $3,041.18
28 4L04BDI 6 Each Repair Bridge Drop Inlet $1,400.00 $8,400.00 $1,828.34 $10,970.04
29 4L05CBD 380 L.F. Clean Bridge Drainage System $25.00 $9,500.00 $14.44 $5,487.20
30 N4Q0001 1.00 L.S. Concrete Repair Material $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $43,401.77 $43,401.77
31 N4Q0002 200.00 S.F. Furnishing, Installation and Removal of Temporary Shielding $22.00 $4,400.00 $83.74 $16,748.00|
32 4Q00006 100.00 C.F. Additional 1P Deck Joint Material $330.00 $33,000.00 $328.95 $32,895.00
33 4Q00007 140.00 L.F. Furnishing, Installation and Removal of Temporary Catch, Location No. 1 $410.00 $57,400.00 $492.19 $68,906.60
34 4Q00008 20.00 L.F. Furnishing, Installation and Removal of Temporary Catch, Location No. 2 $700.00 $14,000.00 $663.28 $13,265.60
35 4Q00009 40.00 L.F. Furnishing, Installation and Removal of Temporary Catch, Location No. 3 $530.00 $21,200.00 $513.58 $20,543.20
36 4Q00010 65.00 L.F. Furnishing, Installation and Removal of Temporary Catch, Location No. 4 $540.00 $35,100.00 $525.09 $34,130.85
37 4Q02BDR 220.00 S.Y. Concrete Deck Replacement $480.00 $105,600.00 $1,383.89 $304,455.80;
38 4Q03BDR 35.00 S.Y. Concrete Deck Replacement with Catches $1,550.00 $54,250.00 $2,246.98 $78,644.30]
39 4Q08BDR 6,475.00 S.Y. Removal of Existing Surfacing $50.00 $323,750.00 $100.00 $647,500.00,
40 4Q15BDR 205 S.Y. Removal of Existing Concrete Deck $345.00 $70,725.00 $1,513.47 $310,261.35
41 4Q18SJS 270.00 L.F. Silicone Joint Seal $75.00 $20,250.00 $70.29 $18,978.30]
42 4Q20H01 10.00 L.F. Headblock Repair, Type 1 $435.00 $4,350.00 $334.15 $3,341.50
43 4Q24BDR 1350 L.F. Reinforcement Steel, Field Anti - Corrosion Coating $0.10; $135.00 $7.46 $10,071.00|
44 4Q30S02 50.00 S.F Spall Repair, Type 2 $70.00 $3,500.00 $145.53 $7,276.50
45 4Q30S04 100.00 S.F Spall Repair, Type 4 $225.00 $22,500.00 $378.75 $37,875.00
46 4Q30S05 8,595.00 S.F Spall Repair, Type 5 $60.00 $515,700.00 $93.90 $807,070.50;
47 4Q30S5B 33 S.F Spall Repair, Type 5B $71.00 $2,343.00 $170.64 $5,631.12
48 4Q30S06 100 S.F Spall Repair, Type 6 $100.00 $10,000.00 $362.41 $36,241.00|
49 4Q30SUD 10 S.F. Repair Underdeck Spalls (Clean and Coat) $25.00 $250.00 $111.52 $1,115.20
50 40Q50J01 540.00 L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type 1 $265.00 $143,100.00 $447.97 $241,903.80;
51 4Q50J1P 60.00 L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type 1P $370.00 $22,200.00 $300.00 $18,000.00
52 40Q51J1P 1,180.00 L.F. Joint Replacement, Type 1P $301.00 $355,180.00 $300.00 $354,000.00
53 4Q60JSR 575 L.F. Joint Seal Replacement, Type 1 $140.00 $80,500.00 $94.30 $54,222.50
54 4QFAEOB 1 C.P Force Account for Emergency and Routine Bridge Repairs (NO-BID) $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00;
55 4R01RSC 70| S.F Vertical Spall Repair $99.00 $6,930.00 $404.51 $28,315.70
56 4R01SC1 340 S.F Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Abutment $289.00 $98,260.00 $279.28 $94,955.20
57 4R01SC2 35.00 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Abutment $295.00 $10,325.00 $395.88 $13,855.80
58 4R02BSR 3 Each Replace Structural Steel Diaphragm $18,500.00 $55,500.00 $9,957.86 $29,873.58
59 4R02SC1 660 S.F Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Pier $360.00 $237,600.00 $279.28 $184,324.80;
60 4R02SC2 65 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Pier $380.00 $24,700.00 $393.09 $25,550.85
61 4R11RSS 3 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type A $5,100.00 $15,300.00 $4,853.40 $14,560.20
62 4R14BSR 8900 S.F Substructure Waterproofing $21.00 $186,900.00 $10.67 $94,963.00
63 4R25BSR 4,825.00 S.F. Substructure Membrane Waterproofing $22.00 $106,150.00 $12.36 $59,637.00
64 4R26RBG 2.00 Each Reconstruct Bearing Area $4,200.00 $8,400.00 $4,000.24 $8,000.48
65 4R41TSS 10.00 Each Temporary Support $12,800.00 $128,000.00 $8,451.51 $84,515.10
66 4ZHO1SPP 2.00 Each Install, Maintain and Remove Steel Protection Plate $750.00 $1,500.00 $627.65 $1,255.30
67 4ZHO3SPP 1.00 L.S. Picking Up and Returning Authority's Steel Protection Plates $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,255.29 $1,255.29
68 4710001 515.00 S.F Repair Prestressed Concrete Stringer, Type 1 $525.00 $270,375.00 $628.78 $323,821.70,
69 4210002 25.00 S.F. Repair Prestressed Concrete Stringer, Type 2 $575.00 $14,375.00| $735.51 $18,387.75
70 4710003 20 L.F. Repair Prestressed Concrete Stringer, Type 3 $3,500.00 $70,000.00] $3,727.42 $74,548.40|
71 5C60RIG 6 Each Replace Existing Inlet Grate $2,300.00 $13,800.00] $2,305.99 $13,835.94
72 5D10INC 20| C.Y. Incidental Concrete $450.00 $9,000.00 $627.65 $12,553.00
73 5F00001 45 L.F. 9" X 16" Concrete Vertical Curb $60.00 $2,700.00 $502.12 $22,595.40
74 5J01PCA 2.00 Each Parapet Connection, Type A $8,200.00 $16,400.00| $10,167.88 $20,335.76
75 5J01PCB 2.00 Each Parapet Connection, Type B $4,900.00 $9,800.00 $4,393.53 $8,787.06
76 5K00012 55.00 L.F. Chain-Link Fence, Aluminum Coated Steel, Bridge, 6'-3" High (NJDOT) $150.00 $8,250.00 $345.21 $18,986.55
77 5P10TMP 17,690.00 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $1.00; $17,690.00 $1.26 $22,289.40
78 5P12REM 10,075.00 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $3.00; $30,225.00 $1.26 $12,694.50
79 5P21LLS 14800 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long - Life, thermoplastic $2.00; $29,600.00] $3.77 $55,796.00|
80 5Q01FOC 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $25,000.00 $25,000.00] $25,264.29 $25,264.29
81 5Q02MFC 12 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $3,100.00 $37,200.00 $3,954.17 $47,450.04
82 5ZD01RPM 200 Each Raised Pavement Markers $45.00! $9,000.00 $62.76 $12,552.00
83 5ZD05RPM 50 Each Furnish and Install Raised Pavement Marker Reflective Lens $25.00! $1,250.00 $18.83 $941.50
84 6A03RMS 140.00 L.F. 3" Rigid Metallic Conduit, on Structures $48.00! $6,720.00| $62.76 $8,786.40|
85 N8A0001 1000 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $8.00 $8,000.00 $13.43 $13,430.00
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86 N8A0002 1600 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $64.00. $102,400.00 $50.00 $80,000.00
87 8A0LMPT 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $1,467,700.19 $1,467,700.19
88 8A06MPT 2 Barr Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $220.00 $440.00 $125.53 $251.06
89 8A07MPT 1.00 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $1.00; $1.00 $627.65 $627.65
90 8B18MPT 2 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $4,365.29 $8,730.58
91 8B19MPT 100 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $50.00. $5,000.00 $125.53 $12,553.00
92 8B20MPT 7 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator $2,500.00 $17,500.00 $1,407.09 $9,849.63
93 8B26MPT 202.00 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $100.00 $20,200.00 $301.27 $60,856.54
94 8B34MPT 570 L.F. Modular Glare Screen System $12.00. $6,840.00 $28.81 $16,421.70]
95 8A35MPT 20.00 Day Placing and Removing Portable Variable Message Sign $162.00 $3,240.00 $188.29 $3,765.80
96 8C21MLR 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 1 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
97 8C22MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 2 $38,000.00 $38,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
98 8C23MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 3 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
99 8C24MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 4 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
100 8C25MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 5 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $10,915.58 $10,915.58
101 8C26MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 6 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
102 8C27MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 7 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
103 8C28MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 8 $39,000.00 $39,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
104 8C29MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 9 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
105 8C30MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 10 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
106 8C31MLR 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 11 $27,000.00 $27,000.00 $6,276.47 $6,276.47
107 8CPTDOB 1 L.S. Police Traffic Directors (NO-BID) $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00
108 8DRRCOB 1 L.S. Railroad Reimbursement Costs (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
Base Total $7,782,762.00 $9,853,895.75
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