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NJTA Manual for Unit Codes Summary of Revisions

SUMMARY OF REVISIONS

The original Manual for Unit Codes was published in February 2009. This page serves to
show all changes that have been made to the document since then.

Date Revision(s)

March 2009 e Added instructions and figures related to the Import Checkout
List feature in Section 4.3.1.

April 2010 e Added a Combined List option for Unit Code Electronic

Submissions in Section 2.2.

e Added instructions on the order of Unit Codes to Section 2.3.

¢ Revised the instructions and figure for Section 2.4.

e Added examples to Section 2.5.

e Added new Section 2.6 — “Proposal ltem Guidelines.”
November 2010 e Revised Figure 2 in Section 3.4.1

e Revised Figure 3 in Section 3.4.1

e Revised the Figure 5 instructions and picture in Section 3.4.1

e Revised Figure 9 in Section 3.4.1
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SECTION 1
OVERVIEW

The Authority uses CapEx™ Manager (hereinafter referred to as “Capex”), a web-based
application, as its capital expenditure manager for construction contracts. Capex tracks
construction contracts from advertisement to completion. The Scope of Work of a contract
is defined in Capex through the use of unique Proposal Items referred to as “Unit Codes”. It
is the Engineer’s responsibility to develop this list of Unit Codes during design.

As of the date of this Manual, there are over 4,000 Unit Codes defined in Capex, about half
of which represent Proposal Items identified in the Authority’s Standard Specifications (sixth
edition 2004) and the Standard Supplementary Specifications. The other half includes
Proposal Items that are not defined in the standards (non-standard items).

The Authority maintains and updates the master Unit Code list through additions,
corrections and deletions. The Engineer shall therefore only use the latest Unit Code list.
The Engineer shall not create any codes nor assume that codes used in previous contract
documents are still valid. It is the Engineer’s responsibility to use as many Unit Codes that
already exist in Capex during the design process, but may request Unit Codes for unissued
standard and non-standard items during phase submissions.
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2.1

2.2.

SECTION 2
PROCEDURE

Development of Proposal Iltems

Design submissions require the development of contract Proposal Items in the form
of a list of proposed Unit Codes. Existing Unit Codes can be viewed through a
Microsoft Access database application entitled “Unit Code.mdb” which is updated
regularly. The Engineer shall obtain the latest copy of the program which is available
in a downloadable packet from http://www.state.nj.us/turnpike/professional-
services.html.

Refer to Section 2.6 of this manual for Proposal Iltem Guidelines, which provides
further instructions on how to determine the appropriate Unit Code and/or Item
Description of your desired Proposal Item.

Phase Unit Code Electronic Submissions

The Engineer has two options for Unit Code Electronic Submissions: (1) submitting a
Known and Requested Unit Code lists separately in two spreadsheets, or (2)
submitting the lists in a single combined spreadsheet.

Option 1: Separate Lists

The first list includes those items for which the Unit Codes are known (these include
available standard and non-standard items). This list shall be submitted in excel
format with the “Unit Code”, “Description” and “Unit” columns only (all text fields).
This list shall be referred to as the Known Unit Codes list. For example:

Unit Code Description Unit
1DO1LAY CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT L.S.
1D10MOB MOBILIZATION L.S.
1G01SCH PROGRESS SCHEDULE L.S.
2A02CAG CLEARING AND GRUBBING L.S.
2B02REX ROADWAY EXCAVATION, EARTH C.Y.
2BO5REX ROADWAY EXCAVATION, MUCK C.Y.

The file name of this submission shall be “<Contract No.> Phase < > knowncodes.xls
(i.e. “T100.011 Phase B knowncodes.xIs”).

Prior to submission of the Known Unit Codes list, it is recommended that the
Engineer utilize the procedure outlined in 3.4.3 of this manual as a final check.

April 2010 30f 20



NJTA Manual for Unit Codes Section 2

The second list shall include anticipated Proposal Items for which Unit Codes do not
exist. This list shall also be submitted in excel format with “Section” (Proposed
Specifications Section Number), “Section Title, If Non-Standard” (Proposed
Specifications Section Title), “Description” and “Unit” columns only. This list shall be
referred to as the Requested Unit Codes list. For example:

Section Section Title, If Non-Standard Description Unit
417 Deck Joint Reconstruction LF.
428 Fender System Plastic Lumber C.F.
503 Outlet Structure Each

The file name of this submission shall be “<Contract No.> Phase < > requestedcodes.xls
(i.e. “T100.011 Phase C requestedcodes.xIs”).

Option 2: Combined List

Alternatively, the known and requested codes can be submitted into one combined
listt. A sample submittal spreadsheet entitled “T200.001 Phase C
requestedandknowncodes.xls” is included in the downloadable packet for Unit
Code.mdb, which is set up like so:

Unit Code Description Unit Section Number Section Title
2H45TEC Construction Driveway Tons
Requested Code 1 LS. 212 Non-Standard Title 1
Laminated Elastomeric Bearing,
4H19LEB 9" x 10 %" Each

Requested Codes should be situated on the list in the Unit Code order that is
explained in Section 2.3.

The method of submittal (i.e. e-mail, CD) shall be determined by the Authority
and may vary from contract to contract.

Once submitted, the Authority will check the Known Unit Codes and will address
the Requested Unit Codes as follows:

e Find or Issue a Unit Code using the exact anticipated Proposal Item
wording.

e Find or Issue a Unit Code using a modified Proposal Item wording: This
is done at times to make the description generic enough to allow for Unit
Code re-use or to follow existing naming conventions (see Section 2.6 of
this manual for typical naming conventions). This may also be
encountered if a Unit Code was found to apply to the Proposal Item.

e Request a clarification.

All excel files should be free of titles, merged or hidden cells, equations and links

to other cells. All information should be shown on the first worksheet. Remaining
worksheets should not contain any information.
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2.3.

2.4.

April 2010

Development of Phase Unit Code Lists

The Engineer shall submit Known Unit Codes and Requested Unit Codes for
Phases B, C and D. In most cases, there will be no Requested Unit Codes at
Phase D.

For these submissions, the list of Unit Codes shall be in the same order as
proposed to appear in the contract documents, such as the proposal pages and
the estimate of quantity sheets and individual quantity boxes on the plans.

The order of Unit Codes shall be as they would appear in the project’s final
compiled Specifications (Standard combined with Supplementary). In other
words, it is sequential by Subsection, with Standard items first followed by Non-
Standard items in the order they appear in the Supplementary Specifications.
(Refer to Section 2.5 of this manual for more information on Non-Standard
Sections and Items.)

Sorting Unit Codes in this manner allows for easier navigation between proposed
item lists and the specifications during design, bidding, and construction.
Although it is easier to sort Unit Codes alphanumerically, it is not preferred.

The Engineer shall notify the Authority if any Unit Codes created specifically for
the contract during previous phases are no longer needed.

Phase D Capex Submission

The Engineer shall submit an additional excel file which contains the final list of
Unit Codes. The file shall contain columns for “ltem No.”(number field), “Item No.
Ext.”, “Unit Code” (text field), “Description”, “Unit of Measure”, “Number of Units”
(number field), “Unit Price” (number field), “Line Total”, and “Bid Requirement”.
The list shall be in the same order as they appear in the contract documents. It

should look like so (columns which are shown with no data may remain blank):

Item Iltem Unit Descrintion | Unit of Measure Number of | Unit Line Total Bid

No. 'No.Ext. Code P Units Price Requirement
1 1DO1LAY 1 100000 Base

2 5K00001 600 30.5 Base

The file name of this submission shall be “<Contract No.> capex.xIs (i.e. “T100.011 capex.xIs”).
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2.5.

April 2010

Regarding Non-standard Sections and Items

Non-standard sections are specifications sections not included in the Authority’s
Standard Specifications (sixth edition 2004). All non-standard sections are
issued numbers and titles in Capex sequentially which are not required to match
the contract documents.

The Engineer shall number non-standard section numbers sequentially for their
contract documents. For example, if “Sawing and Sealing Joints” (Section 312 in
Capex) is the only non-standard section in a contract, the Engineer shall utilize
311 for their contract documents (since 310 is the last standard section). Also,
the Engineer can use a different section title if using an item in a non-standard
section. For example, the Unit Code 4ZHO02SPP, “Furnish Steel Protection Plate”
is in Capex Non-standard Section 434 entitled “Steel Protection Plates”. The
Engineer can use that Unit Code but with a different section title such as
“Miscellaneous Structural ltems”.

Non-standard items are Proposal Items not defined in the Authority’s Standard
Specifications (sixth edition 2004). These can include Proposal Items issued
under standard or non-standard specifications sections. The Engineer should try
to use the same specifications section numbering for non-standard Proposal
Items issued under standard specifications sections, rather than creating a new
non-standard section in the specifications.

Here are some examples in properly using non-standard items:

Non-standard Proposal Item 2H40TEC, Inlet Filters, was issued in the Unit Code
database under Standard Section 208 — Temporary Soil Erosion and Dust
Control. It should therefore appear in Section 208 of the Supplementary
Specifications rather than being placed in a new non-standard section.

Non-standard Proposal Iltem 5ZL0001, 6-6" Electric Conduit Bank, Concrete
Encased, was issued in the Unit Code database under non-Standard Section 538
— Utilities. A “Utilities” Section does not have to appear in Section 538 of the
Supplementary Specifications, but rather the first available non-Standard Section
number.
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2.6.

April 2010

Proposal Item Guidelines

The Authority’s current list of issued items, as found in the latest Unit Code.mdb
file, follows certain Item Description conventions which the Engineer is urged to
adhere to as closely as possible when developing Proposal Items. Unit
Code.mdb is an ever-evolving database which is updated with every new design
contract in which an unissued Standard or Non-Standard Item is proposed.
These guidelines serve to aid the Engineer in choosing or creating the
appropriate Item Description for their Proposal Items so as to eliminate as many
errors as possible during Electronic Submissions of Phase B, C, and D.

The first step the Engineer should take is to use the search functions in the
latest Unit Code.mdb file, which is outlined in section 3.4.3 of this manual. In
most cases, the desired Proposal Item exists in one form or another. To help
discern whether it is better to use an existing Unit Code or request a new one,
items have been categorized as follows:

1) Generic Items

Generic Items are items which may differ from project to project in terms of
manufacturer, material, size, location, etc., but are still allowed to be chosen as a
Proposal Item. For example,

4F01CSS Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 1

is an item that has been used on multiple projects even though the sign support
structures are not the same from project to project.

With Generic Items, the Engineer is allowed to use clarifiers in parentheses for
the item description. For example, if the project has 2 sign support structures —
one located at milepost 48.2N and another located at milepost 49.4N — the
Engineer may use the following Proposal ltems:

4F01CSS Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 1 (48.2N)
4F02CSS Overhead Cantilever Sign Support Structure No. 2 (49.4N)

Making proper use of Generic Items, and clarifiers, is a good way to avoid
requesting new Unit Codes that are not necessary.

2) Specific ltems

Specific Items are items which fundamentally require their own Unit Code based
on their unique properties. Specific Items most notably apply to Pay Items that
appear in the Standard Specifications with a blank underscore or parentheses,
indicating that it should be filled in with the appropriate Type, Dimensions, etc.
This is most common with Structural and Electrical items. For example,
Subsection 402.14 of the Standard Specifications lists the following two Pay
Items:
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Prestressed Concrete Beams, Type Linear Foot
Prestressed Concrete Deck Units, (Depth) x (Width) Linear Foot

Theoretically, there can be an infinite number of Specific Items in the database,
so they are issued on an as-needed basis. If the exact description for the
Proposal Item does not exist, the Engineer should request a new Unit Code.

3) “No-Bid” Lump Sum Items

“‘No-Bid” Lump Sum items are items whose descriptions are based on the
proposed no-bid cost of the item. For example,

3B100APA Asphalt Price Adjustment. (This is a NO-BID, Lump Sum item
for this contract. The Lump Sum price is $100,000. Enter a
Unit Price of $100,000 as your bid for this item.)

was issued based on the $100,000 cost from the Engineer's Estimate. For
certain cases, like with “No-Bid” Lump Sum ltems, the text in parentheses do not
act as a clarifier but rather as the item’s actual description in the database.

The Engineer is urged to round their lump-sum costs to the nearest $1,000,
$10,000, $25,000, or $50,000 depending on the magnitude of the cost, e.g. if an
estimated cost is $705,000, the Engineer would be asked to round to $700,000.
Use best judgment; this prevents the creation of items with ultimately insignificant
digits.

4) Special Unit Codes

Refer to Appendix B of this manual regarding Special Unit Codes such as “DO
NOT USE”, “RESERVED”, and “TO BE REASSIGNED”.

5) NJDOT Unit Codes

NJDOT Unit Codes exist in the database because they are issued for Authority
contracts which require NJDOT items, usually due to the presence of NJDOT
property within project limits. The Engineer is advised not to use these items
unless directed by the Project Engineer.

These are but a few examples in a database comprised of thousands of
various items, many of which do not fall under these categories. The
Engineer is left to use best judgment when determining what description is
appropriate for their Proposal Items, and will otherwise be instructed by the
Authority on what to use during Phase submissions.
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3.1

3.2

3.3

3.4

SECTION 3
UNIT CODE PROGRAM USERS GUIDE

Contents

Included in the downloadable packet are the following files:

Unit Code.mdb: Database application that contains all of the Unit Codes.
Manual for Unit Codes.doc: Instructions on program use.

Sample excel spreadsheets used for the database application program features.
Sample excel spreadsheets required for Phase submissions.

Introduction

Unit Code.mdb is an Access Database Application which allows a user to look up the
latest Unit Codes. The following features are available:

1. Print/View/Search Unit Codes: A user can look up codes through filters and key
word searches. A “checkout” feature allows a user to select the items needed for
a specific contract. The selected items can be exported in excel format where it
can be manipulated into contract documents (i.e. proposal pages, engineer’s
estimates). Database includes cost history information.

2. Reports: This feature allows a user to look up Unit Codes added for contracts
after September of 2007 via Contract Number and modified bid tabulations which
show unit price information only.

3. Check Unit Codes From Spreadsheet: This feature allows a user to check an
existing list of Unit Codes for correctness.

4. Check Engineers Estimate: This tool compares an estimate to historical unit
price data. The Engineer shall be responsible to develop unit costs based
on the specific contract requirements, methods of construction,
construction sequencing, etc. Each contract is unique and the Engineer
shall take all factors into account in the preparation of the contract’s unit
costs and the development of the Engineer’s Estimate.

Requirements

e System Requirements: Microsoft Access 2003
e Help and Support: Contact Ana Tatoris at 732-750-5300 x8262 or via e-mail at
tatoris@turnpike.state.nj.us.

Directions
Screen shots on the following pages are gray scale. For forms, button backgrounds

are color-coded as follows: Reports are blue, Quit/Exit red and Checked Out items
are pink. For reports, color coding is explained in each report header or footer.
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Open Unit Code.mdb to enter the main menu. See Figure 1.

Unit Codes

Updated 10/13/2010

3:22:31 PM

i Print/View/Search Unit :

Codes

Reports

Check Unit Codes

Check Engineers Estimate

ﬂ

3.4.1 Print/View/Search Unit Codes:

Figure 1) Main Menu.

When the top button (“Print/View/Search Unit Codes”) of the Main Menu is selected,
the following form opens:

Filtering by Division

X

Filtering by Keyword(s)

e

Quick Find

va

Select Specifications Division(s) Type in portion of Description i.e. uick Find - Type in proposed Item. If it exists, you will see Sect. and Description K
& 100 & so0 & por AND § "concrete”. Do not use quotes, commas,
JOR N and®, "or" or "in" within the boxes Ho Match
200 @ o0 lect all
select al i
& 300 & 700 l— Filter
& 400 & 800 unselect all [ RemovefFilter |I
. Unit Price Information
H Print Export ltems Import . .
‘Uncheck All;  Checkout Checkout .ﬁs Print [tem Preview
H l (Export.xls) : List Sections Only
: Items List ——
R Unit Price Summary for All Data
check Issued AvePrice AveQwy Mo Last Date
out | DivSect Source CapExSectionDescription  Description )l UnitCode  Units For Contracts Contract  Updated
|-|N|1m|:lm | ICONTRDLOFWOHK As-Built Survey / M1D00O1 [LS. [T700.08% 5225050 1 7 hist | [l P2 | /52008
Wl [n[ro0]108 ] [ conTROL OF WORK 1D01HDS [Each [T8£5.120.701%"] nist | (1l [ ereow
I~ [200]204 standard | cONTROL OF WORK Use these buttons to prlnt 1DO1LAY |LS. $40158634 1 B
CheckOUt if1o0[108 | [ conTROL OF WORK out Items or Sections 1D01SDP |LS. [T100.115 58430637 1 * hise | |l [[Fooss | smerees
ji[100[10s | [conTROL OF WoORK currently filtered on the 002157 [Ls. st | [l T
|l |1m|:lm ISt.anr.Iaru ICONTRDLOFWOHK fOrm_ 1D10MOB[LS. 117151463 1 22 pise [ 3 [ | 252008
|-|N|1DD|JDE. | | OOy M1FODD2 [Each 5125586 | 2.713286] 7 st | [l ’559.1zq.zoz| 2/2/2002
|_|N|1m|:ms [ | Concrete Washout Facility NIFOOO1 |LS. 52187183 1 BT
1100 [108 Permit Fees [This is a NO BID, Lump Sum item for this cont 1FO1PMF (LS. [F200.155 5250000 1 Ul hist P200.15% 77172010
r i v
I T

Figure 2) Print/View/Search Unit Codes Form.

1. This form allows a user to view Unit Codes filtered by Division, Section or
Keywords. It also includes a Quick Find feature.

November 2010
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Filtering By Division: Division Filters can be applied by selecting/unselecting
sections in the top left hand corner. See Figure 3.

Filtering By Keyword(s): Keyword filters can be used by typing in up to two
keywords or strings of texts in the field boxes within the middle top section.
This feature is useful when there is uncertainty about the exact wording of an
item. Do not use quotes (*), ‘and’, ‘or’, ‘in’ within the keyword filter
boxes. See Figures 3 and 4.

Filtering By Division and By Keyword are designed to work together. Using
these filters in conjunction with the General Filtering feature described below,
however, can only be done in top to bottom order. Use Division and
Keyword(s) first, then General Filtering.

Quick Find: The field box within the top right hand corner can be used in
order to determine if a Unit Code exists. See Figure 4.

General Filtering: A user can filter for a specific Section, Contract or Units, by
right clicking the mouse in the appropriate field and selecting either “Filter By
Selection”, “Filter Excluding Selection”, or “Filter For:____ ”. As indicated
before, using these filters in conjunction with the Division or Keyword Filters
can only be completed in top to bottom order. Users are cautioned to
remember to remove existing Filters by right clicking the mouse and selecting
“‘Remove Filter” or by pressing the “Remove Filter’ button on the form. See

Figure 5.

General Sorting: At any time, a user can sort any of the visible fields in
ascending or descending order by right clicking on the field desired and
selecting “Sort Ascending” or “Sort Descending”. General Sorting works with
all filters.

Printing Lists: At any time, a user can print out a hard copy of the records
fitered on the form through Filtering by Division and Keyword(s) only by
pressing the “Print Item List” button. To print a list of all items within the
database, press the “Print Item List” button with no Division or Keyword
filters. Filters through General Filtering (right click) will NOT be reflected in
the report. See Figure 6.

Preview Sections Only: This feature prints out all of the specifications
sections of the filtered records on the form. All “Non-Standard” Sections are
highlighted in purple. See Figure 6.

View Price Information: Unit price information for the past year, if available,
can be viewed by double-clicking the Unit Code field. Unit price information
for all data collected can be viewed directly on the form.
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Select Specifications Division(s) Type in portion of Description i.e. Quick Find - Type in proposed ltem. If it exists, you will see Sect. and Description
= 100 & 500 & poT AND | "concrete”. Do Ot use quotes, coMmMas,
fOR | “and", “or" or “in" within the boxes I Ho Match
* 200 & E00
select all i
& 300 & 700 l—”e":" i Filter i
& 400 & 100 unselect all lr Remove Filter
Print Import
Export ltems = =
Uncheck Al Checkout po Checkout m Print Iltem Preview
% (Export.xls) : List Sections Only
ems ist —
Unit Price Summary for All Data
chec) Issued AvePrice  AveQry Mo Last Date
out | DivSect Source CapExSectionDescription  Dascription UnitCode  Units For Contracts Contract  Updated
|_| |5m)|5m | IUNDERDR.AINS Clean Existing Trench Drain N5SA0005 [LF. $13.50 125 * st | |l |:zmm4 | 2/2/2002
|_| [so0[s01 | [unDERDRAINS 16" Trench Drain N5A0002 |LF. 5214326 | 4376667 5 nise | [l F200 |
|_| |5|}0|5m | IUNDERDMINS 10" Trench Drain M5SAQ001 [LF. 518797 320 7 hist | [l |’1lJ:|st4 | 2/8/2008
l_INISDDISD:l | [UnDERDRAINS 12" Trench Drain SA00011 |LF. [T263.120.202%] 517257 100) T hise | | [[EeE om0z [ torane:
l-INISDDISD:l | IUNDERDRJ\INS 24" Trench Drain 5A00005 |LF. [T265.120.604 538761 113 * hist | [l |-55;1zo.sm| 2172008
|_| |7oo|705 IStam‘JarrJ IPLANTING Subdrainage in Trenches FE31DRN |LF. hist Ml | /272002
Select Specifications Division(s) Type in portion of Description i.e. Quick Find - Type in proposed ltem. If it exists, you will see Sect. and Description
= 100 & so0 & Dot AND | "concrete”. Do not use quotes, commas,
fOR | "ang", "or" or "in" within the boxes Ho Match
@ 200 * so0
select all ;
* 300 & 700 [trench drain Filter
& a0 & 200 unselect all [ | RemoveFilter
Print Import
Export ltems i i
Uncheck Al Checkout - Checkout m Print [tem Preview
ltems [, List List Sections Only
Unit Price Summaryfor All Data
checl Issued AvePrice  AveQty Mo Last Date
out | DivSect Source CapExSectionDescription  Description UnitCode  Units For Contracts Contract  Updated
|_| [soofs01 | [unDERDRAINS Clean Existing Trench Drain NSADDOS |L.F. 51350 125 L opise [ g [[FRo00es [ 2meoes
|_| [soafson | [unDERDRAINS 16" Trench Drain N5A0002 |LF. 521426 | 437.5667 st | | [Freees [ wmeeee
|-| IEDDISDJ | IUNDERDH}HNS 10" Trench Drain M5SA0001 [LF. 526797 350 % nist | |l |’1oa.:|za | 2/3/2008
I_INISDDISD:I | IUNDERDH.A\NS 12" Trench Drain SAQ0011 [LF. [T285.120.202°" 517257 100] T onist | |l |-as;1zazaz| 10/172008]
I-INIEDDIEDJ | IUNDERDH.NNS |u"Trenm Drain 5AQ0005 |LF. [T865.120.604 538761 119 * hist | [l |’55;.1205m| 2/17/2008]
. . “ .y s . e s
different methods used to find all “trench drain” items within all Divisions.
Select Specifications Division(s) Type in portion of Description i.e. Quick Find - Type in proposed Iltem. If it exists, you will see Sect. and Description
# 100 & soo & poT AND | “concrete”. Do not use quotes, commas, .
JOR | wang®, "or or "in® within the boxes 2b01rex Section 202 - ROADWAY EXCAVATION
& 200 & 600 LS Roadwiay Excavation, Earth
select all Filter
& 300 & 700 I(IEarm;
& a00 & g0 unselect all IW Remove Filter
Print Import
Export Items =
Uncheck Al Checkout po Checkout m Preview
(Export.xls) " i Sections Only
Items List H .
H Unit Price Summary for All Data
check Issued AvePrice AveQry  No Last Date
out | DivSect Source CapExSectionDescription  Description UnitCode  Units For Contracts Contract  Updated
|-| |zau|zm |mnuaru ICLERR\NGANDGRUBB\NG Clearing and Grubbing 2A02CAG LS. 1 4 hist | [l ’asa.uamfl 2/8/2008)
|_| [200]201 [standard [ CLEARING AND GRUBBING  Clearing and Grubbing 2ADLCAG [Acre S1s20204 | 325625 * hist | [l [EeEeocez | 2mmece

Figure 4) Example showing Filtering By Keyword(s) “clearing” and “grubbing”,
and using Quick Find to determine if “2BO1REX” exists.

2| Copy e s Figure 5) Example showing General

[ing of Abandoned Wer Filtering of the field “Section” for number

51 sotatoz :gw“"”c'“z “201”. This tool is available when the user

il setzton — right clicks in any field. Note other filtering

_ and sorting options. Box below shows
it Y| Eauals. prompt when “equal’ is selected.

Equals 201" Does Mot Equal...
Does Mot Equal "201° Begins With... ﬂﬂ
Contains "201° Does Mot Begin With..,
Does Mot Contain "201° Contains... Section Number is Equal to I
w Does Mot Contain...
b | IROADWAYE)(CAVATION Ends With... | QI I Cancel |
B [standard [ROADWAY EXCAVATION Does Mot End With...
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Kection 201 - CLEARING AND GRUBBING
Sectiann 202 - ROADWAY EXCAVATION

Kectian 203 - EMBANKMENT

Kaction 204 - CHANNEL EXCAVATION

Kaction 205 - FOUNDATION EXCAVATION
Kection 206 - TRENCH EXCAVATION

Section 207 - STONE FOR EROSTON CONTROL
Section 208

Kection 209 - SUBGRADE

KRection 210 - DEMOLITION OF EXISTING STRUCTURES
Sectionn 211 - TEMPORARY FENCING

Kection 212 - SUBBASE

Tead, J Hayword Filler 1 (1) Contract Number last Used
Uniit Code Kevword Filler 2 (2) "Sandard " if Urit Code is a Pay lem
List ¥ defined in the Sandard Specifications 2004
District Filters 4 "Supplement" if [hit Code iz a Pay Rem
defined in the Sandard SUPPLEMENTE
SECTTONS in Purple Signifies a "Non-Standard " Section
DIVISTON 400
Section 401  Section - Per CapEx  Socjion 407 - CONCRETE STRUCTURES Loy
Sowwce (2) e ID Deseription Iris  ‘Coutract (1)
11 Seddan 4a00001  Concrete Seal in Cofferdams CY.  T30.064
) 4A00002  Modular E xpension Jaint, (Type A "3 Movement) LF. H
2 4200003 Precad Ricid Frame LF. T 300064 Flgure 6) Report
o 4400004 Conorete Collar Each generated from
i) SEdard JAMCCS Concrete Core Sampling Each  T100.042 o
5 Stadw 4ARICSH  Concrete In Strudures, Headval s CY. Pzonozi ltem List (tO p)
il SEdard JAMLMC  Latex Modified Concrete Oweday, 152" Thick CY “ . H ”
&) SEdand 4ALS0  LowSlump High Density Concrete Orverlay, 172" Thick S.Y. PreVIeW SeCtlonS O n Iy
(bottom). Note
Section Listing Eeyword Filier 1 gpplll_c?ble ﬁ_elztyword and
Eeywond Filter 2 istric ilters
Al Nowu-Standard Seck District Filte T4 200 300 L0 500 60 THE H H H
e T e oo indicated in the header
DIVISION 100 and all “Non-Standard”
Section 104 - CONTROL OF WORK Sections are shown i
KSection 106 reen
Section 107 - PROSECTTON AND PROGRESS g .
Section 109
DIVISION 200

November 2010

The checkout feature allows a user to export a list of Unit Codes in electronic
format. The list can later be pasted or imported into the user’s contract
documents such as contract sheets, proposal pages or the Engineer’s Estimate.
While looking up Unit Codes, a user can “check” V' the items required for a
Contract.

Checkout Items: Click the check out box adjacent to the item to add an item
to (or remove an item from) the Checkout List. All checked items will turn
pink. The “Uncheck All” button may be used to clear all selected Checkout
Iltems. All changes to the checkout list are automatically saved to the
file. The user should therefore be wary of all changes that are made by
anyone who has access to that file. See Figure 7.

View Checkout Items: Press the “Print Checkout Items” button OR right click
the check box and select “Filter by Selection. See Figures 8 and 9.

Export Checkout Items in Excel: Press the “Export Checkout Items in Excel”
button. An output file “export.xIs” will be created in the folder selected. See
Figure 10.

Import Checkout List: Allows the user to import the items to the checkout list
that are in an export checkout excel file format. This is useful for users that
are actively working on developing a checkout list when a new version of the
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database is issued by the Authority. The user can then export the list from
the “old” version, download the new database, then import the previous

checkout list.

check Issued AvePrice AveOty  MNo Last Date
out | DivSect Source CapExSection Description  Description UnitCode  Units For Contracts Contract  Updated
|7|N|mo|1oa | [ conTROL OF WORK Historic District Sign 1D01HDS [Each [T863.120.701°° nist | (1l [] [ ereow
|_|N|1oo|1oa | ICONTRDLOFWORK As-Built Survey niDoool [Ls. [T700.085 1 = hist | |nd |—.'m152 | /572008
|_| [100[104 [standard | cONTROL OF WORK Maobilization 1D10MOB|LS. $1171351453 1 BT N
|—| |1Do|1m IStanﬂArd ICDNTRDLDFWDRK Construction Layout 1DO1LAY LS. S40168634 1 & st | [1d I’asa.uuzczl 27272002
|_|N|:Loo|1oa | [ cONTROL OF WORK Shop Drawing Preparation 10015DP [LS. [T100.11E 55430637 1 T opist | |ad [0 | enmane:
|_|N|1Do|104 | ICONTROLOFWORK Construction Layout for COP #1 Structures 1D02LST LS. hist |.H.| | 2272008
|_|N|:LDD|105 | | Concrete Washout Facility N1FD00L LS. 52257183 1 i hist | [yl [[Eeeezeser ] zemces
|7|N|mo|1os | | 0il Only Emergency Spill Kit H1FD002 [Each S125586 | 2.714286] 7 nist | |nd |-ss;.1zozaz| 2/272002
Figure 7) Check Items Feature. Checked items are shaded pink.
- -~
Checkout I[tems Report
Averages over I Year Fatetf over I Year
Source  Itan ID Description Units | Cost M Min Qty |Contracts Bidders

Section [ 04 - CONTROL OF WORKE

11 MW1D0001 As-Built Survey L=, $16,101.00 $25,000.00 $5,000.00 1 1 5

Section 107 - PROSECTION AND PROGRESS

2 Standard 1GISCH Progress Schedule Lump $5,358.72 $a0,000.00 §1.00 1 10 45

Section 100

3 Supplement 1101 MAB aintensnce Bond LS ————— o Cost Data Available-———————-—

Section 407 - CONCRETE STRUCTURES

4] Standarnd 4A06LMC Latex Modlified Concrete Cweday, 1- SY.,  ————_—— o Cost Data Available-——————-—

34" Thick
21 Standard 4A06LS0 LowvSlum p High D ensity Concrete SY. e — o Cost Data Available-———————-—
Crverlary, 1-3/4" Thick

B) Standard 4060 Class B Concrete Overlay 1-3/4" Thick S,  ——————- o Cost Data Available-———————-—

H 113 - ” H H
Figure 8) Report generated from “Print Checkout Items”. Note unit price
information is included in this report.

check Issued AvePrice AveQty  No Last Date
out | DivSect Source CapExSectionDescription  Description UnitCode  Units For Contracts Contract  Updated
Fi| [200]202 [standard |[ROADWAY EXCAVATION Overload Removal 2B200VR [C.Y. s1212 | 2778633 ¢ pise | gl [FEesroecz [ 2mmooe
|7| [200]202 [standard  |ROADWAY EXCAVATION Roadway Excavation, Muck 2BOSREX [C.Y. 52488 | 134222 ® hist | | [Peeieaer] zmmees
|7| [200]202 [standard  [ROADWAY EXCAVATION Roadway Excavation and Embankment 2BOMREX [C.Y. 52767 | 6347109 B
|7|N|zm|zuz | | EMBANKMENT Clay Liner 2c00005 C.v. [T263.120.601° 52405 22883 T hist | | [EEReser ] wmsaees
& Cut
3 Copy
%1 sortselected to Cleared
%l | sort Cleared to Selected
Is Selected
Is Mot Selected
X

Figure 9) Form filtered for all checked out items.
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Microsoft Office Access x|

Please select the Folder or directory where wou want to save your export file (export.xis)

x|
Look in: I'_| My Documents j @ -3 Q ~A Ci Tools =
A o B} . .
M#‘Bt reer pecs Figure 10) Various prompts
ecent =) My Music
Decuments il pitures to select folder where the
== sample advertisements « ” . .
‘ e v export.xls” file is to be
Deskop (Do s saved. The bottom figure
57, (Citest includes a view of the
My Documents eXpOFtX|S flle
My Computer
., .
My’\ll&_)w}mk Folder name: || | oK
Places Cancel

Microsoft Office Access |

Your export file has been saved to C:\Documents and Settingsitatoris My Documents) export, xls

A B C D E F G H | J

1 [Section ltemID  |Descriptio Units Source | Latest CorAve hax bdin Mo Bidders x
| 2 |Section101001LAY  Constructic Lump Surr Standard |\ T200.017 | 2203783 1412481 1 38
| 3 |Section10M1D000T As-Built SULS. T700.069 16101 25000 5000 5
| 4 |Section10N1FO00Z | Qil Only ErEach T200.017 | 1491.46 3000 750 7
| & |Section 202800001 Basinand CY.
| 6 |Section202B04REX Roadway CY. Standard |P200.021 | 28.21833 B0 12.75 18

7 | Section 20 258200%R. Cverload 1C.Y. Standard T200.017 | 19.79286 36 [ 7

3.4.2. View Reports:

When the button (“Reports”) of the Main Menu is selected, the following form opens:

Select a Contract I - I \:::EW Ul;lcilt 1 F 1 1 T b b
Codes Adde:
odes Adde igure 11) Top combo box
— shows Unit Codes added
Select a Contract 710 j o
Underground Storage T-E;rﬁ:_ |_||:.-\;|.rau:les 00 per CO ntraCt . T h e bOttO m
R-1319C Guardrail Terminal Replacement e
T100,009-1 | Repainking Structural Steel Mie 0 to Mile 116 3f27(z007 combo box shows modified
T100.010  Bridge Deck Repairs and Resurfacing, Mile 83 to Mile 122 1/4/2007 H H H
Ti00.011  Bridge Deck Repairs and Resurfacing Mile 0 to 83 and the 117145200 bld tabu Iatlon reports (u n |t
Rl T100.022 | Miscellanecus Repairs (MP O to 122) & PHMTE & MWBHCE 117137200 .
n T100.042  Morthern Deck Repairs & Resurf (MP 83 ko 122) & NEHCE 11/28(200 prlces on IV) .
T100.0458 Inketim Cabwalk Safety Improvements Struckure Mo, N2, 6/25/2008 ¥

This form allows the user to print items added specifically for a recent Contract. This
data is only available for the Contracts entered since the fall of 2007 when the
Authority began to track this information (See Figure 12). The second type of report
prints out a modified bid tabulation consisting of unit price information only (See
Figure 13).
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Contreet 7700069

Unit Codes Recently Added

EROZION CONTROL

Section Ttem ID Description Units

1 Section 104 -CONTROLOF  WADOO0A As-Built Survey LS.
WIORHK

2 Section 202 - ROADW &Y M2ZB0002 Devaterning LS.
EXCAVATION

3 Section 207 -STOME FOR 2600001 Riprap and Scour Holes Ton
EROSION CONTROL

4 Section 207 -STOME FOR 2GOBSEC  Stone for Erosion Contrdl Ton

Figure 12) Report generated when the Contract is selected.

U 't P - I f t Unit High Price (Yellow) Contractor Name in Contractor Name in Orange denotes
n I rl Ce n O rl I Ia IO n Unit Low Price {Blue) Green denoes Low Lowest Responsible Bidder if dif ferent
Apparent Bidder From Low Apparent Bidder
P700.047 6/26,/2008
SLACK, TED INDEPERDENCE PALMER WEST SPARK
Underground Storage Tank Upgrades ENVIRONMENTA CONSTRUCTORS, ASSOC., INC. ELECTRIC
L SERVICES, INC. T/ A ABJ . SERVICE, INC.
Qua‘ltity Average INC Eghsl RULTION
1010MC8  Wobilization L.5. 1 $32,051.25 944000 F150, 584,00 450,000,00 $65,000,00
SBIIMPT  Maintenance and Protection of Traffic L.5. 1 45,875.00 $10,000,00 £5 000,00 $10,000,00 $2,500.00
Ac00001  Rermewe and Replace STz at Mantenance LS. 1 $229,497 50 20408000 $22EE0000  $285,00000  §233,410.00
District 21
900002 Remowe and Replace LSTs at Bass Rier Base |5, 1 $204,5334,00 $182 526,00 F282 250,00 $175,000.00 $179,760.00
Bid
9C00003  Eitend Existing Ballast Pad for Tank E61 2 5, 1 §7.772.50 $11,590.00 45.000.00 $4.500.00 $10,000.00
B River
AC00004  Remenve, Dispose of and Replace Existing L.5. 1 $17,535.00 $22,540,00 $14,600,00 $18,000,00 $15,000,00
Ballast Pad For Tank E-61 at Bass River
SCO000E  Remowe, Dispose of and Replace Existing LS 1 $20,055.00 $22,540.00 F14E00.00 $28,000.00 F15,000.00
Badlst Pad For Tank E-60 at Bass River
ACO0006  Upgrade Tark E-41 at Woodbridge Motor Pocl |5, 1 $30,311.75 $72,412.00  $122 260.00 $99,000.00 $£9,375.00
AC00007  Rermowe, Replace and Upgrade LETs at LS. 1 $200,251.00 $149069.00 $253 50000  $250,000.00  $150,735.00
Mainten znc e District Mo, 1
AC0000%  Remewd and Replace LET & Mainten ance L.5. 1 $162,446 75 F0576200  $170,30000 §244,000.00  $129,225.00
Castrict Mo, 6
1 acoooo Excavation and Stockpiling of Contarninated Ton 2000 $12.75 10,00 10,00 F17.00 $18.00
Sail
Ac00010 Additional Ball to Replace Contaminated Soil Ton 2000 $26.,19 420,00 $24.75 $22.00 $12.00
Ac00011  Loading, Tranportation and Cisposal of Ton 2000 $5E.73 60,00 $64.90 $42.00 4EE.00
Contarninated Soil
=TI Removd and Cisposal of Cont aminated zallon 75000 .77 F1.00 .49 $1.05 $0.55
Groundwater
o Acooo1z IMobilization of Yacuum Trock Each 12 $547.00 $800.00 $488.00 $250.00 $EE0.00

Figure 13) Report generated when the Contract is selected.

Report shows unit prices by

bidders by contract. High and low unit prices are highlighted and averages are calculated.
The bottom of the report does show total bid amount and % difference from the EE.

3.4.3. Check Unit Codes from

Spreadsheet:

When the bottom button (“Check Unit Codes”) of the Main Menu is selected, the

following form opens:

Spreadsheet Must have the fields:
“Unit Code”, "Description” and “Unit"
Must be saved as an Excel File on your

Show All Items In Unit Code Order

computer or network.

Show All Iteme In Spreadsheet Order

example

Unit Code  [Description Lnit
1D10MOE  [Mobilization Lurnp Surm
1G015CH  |Progress Schedule Lump Sum
[?B25RBS  [Regrade Berm la'H

Show Missing Items In Spreadsheet Order

Figure 14) Check Unit
Codes from Spreadsheet
form.

The last option allows the user to check whether a spreadsheet has the correct Unit
Codes. This feature is useful if a consultant is working off of an existing electronic
list of items. The spreadsheet to be checked must be saved as an Excel File and be

accessible from the user's computer.

“‘Description” and “Unit” (See

November 2010

Section 2.2).

The fields must be named “Unit Code”,
For best results, use a “clean”
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spreadsheet, free of merged cells, references, equations, macros, formats, hidden
columns or rows. Since this tool compares units for an exact match to the database,
the Engineer should use the list of units in Appendix A which are the standard units

currently used by the Authority. See Figure 15.

There are three reports available. The first lists all items in Unit Code order. See
Figure 16. The second lists all items in the same order as the Spreadsheet. The last
report shows ONLY those items that are missing Unit Codes. In the first two reports,
all items that have incorrect or missing Unit Codes are highlighted. All descriptions
and units that do not match exactly are also highlighted. See Figure 17.

B Microsoft Excel - checkitems

ITEMS MISSING

This report lists olf itemns in the Unit Code field of the
ch\Documents arad Settings\Al

In AscenicBng Unit Code Order Users\ D xis spz if the Hemr
does not exist in Cop Fx, it will be highlighted
ftem Descriptions, Units and Section AS they appear in CopEx
Unit Code  Description Units  Section
dat1sfo Silica Fume Concrete Owverlay, 1-1/4" Thick [
Silica Fume Cancrete Owerlay, 3" Thick 5. Sedion 401 - CONCRETE STRUCTURES
Ja20cdr Concrete Divider Replacement LF
Concrete Divider Replacement LF. Sedion 401 - CONCRETE STRUCTURES
Jadrfs Mechanical Coupler Unit
Mechanical Coupler Each Sedion 401 - CONCRETE STRUCTURES
4r121ss Repair Structural Stesl, Type & Each
MSSING
Sz00002 Parapat Anchor Bott Repacement Each
Parapst Anchor Bok Replacement Each Sedion 541 - MISCELLANEOUS SECTION 500 ITEMS
5zo0003 Railroad Proective Barrier LF
Railroad Pratective Barrier LF Sedion 541 - MISCELLANEOUS SECTION 500 ITEMS
ndalnl 3 Parapgt Replacement, Str. Mo, 14314 LF
Parapg Replacement, Str. Mo, 14314 LF Sedion 401 - CONCRETE STRUCTURES
ndannt 4 Parapat Replacement, Str. Mo, 15034 LF
Parapet Replacement, Str. Mo, 150,38 LF. Sedion 401 - CONCRETE STRUCTURES
ndl0002 Muodify 3" Drainage Pipe, Str. Mo, 138 6 Ls
Muodify 3" Drainage P ipe, Str. No. 138 6 LS Sedion 412 - BRIDGE DRAIMNAGE STRUCTURES
ndz0001 Clean and Waterproot Concrete Parapets sF
MSSIHG

Figure 16) Sample report in Ascending Unit Code Order. Note:
If a Unit Code in the checkitems.xls spreadsheet does not match
any of the Unit Codes in the database, it is highlighted as

‘MISSING”.

November 2010

@J File Edit Wiew Insert Format Tools Data  Window  Help
N5 H 29 9 655 2 =-3 e
EZ3 - 23
A | B | ©
1 |Unit Code  Description Unit Figure 15) Sample
2 |da20cdr Concrete Divider Replacement LF “checkitems.xIs” file.
3 |ndadl13 Farapet Replacement, Str. Mo, 14914 LF
4 |ndadn14 Farapet Replacement, Str. Mo, 15034 LF
5 |ndl000Z hodify 8" Drainage Pipe, Str. No. 1386 LS
B |nd=z0001 Clean and YWWaterproof Concrete Parapets SF
¥ |5zo0002 Farapet Anchor Bolt Replacement Each
g |5zo0003 Railroad Protective Barrier LF
9 |4a11sfo Silica Fume Concrete Owerlay, 1-1/4" Thick [
10 |da40rs Mechanical Coupler LInit
11 |4r121ss Repair Structural Steel, Type A Each
12
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this contract. The Lump Sum price is $250,000.
Enter a Unit Price of $250,000 a3 your kid forthis
item )
4R1BSR Sidewalk, Parspet and Curb Surface Repairs SF.
MIS SING
AROTRSC Yertical Spall Repair SF.
MIS SING
4IHO3SPP Picking Up and Retuming Authority's Stesl LS.
Protection Plates
Picking Up and Retuming Authority's Steel LS Sedion 434 - STEEL PROTECTION PLATES
Protedion Plates
4IMIZHPC Concretein Deck Slabs, HPC (o'
Concretein Deck Slabs, HPC CY. Sedion 433
sB0M1CSD Cleaning Exigting Storm Drains Each
Cleaning Exigting Storm Draing LF. Sedion 502 - STORM DRAINS
S0P CG Parapet Connection, Type G Each
Parape Connedtion, Type & Each Sedion 510 - GUARD RAIL
SJ01PCTE Parapet Connection, Type TR Each
Parape Connection, Type TH Each Sedion 510 - GUARD RAIL
SJ20RGA Raize Guard Rail, Type & LF.
Raize Guard Rail, Type & LF. Sedlion 510 - GUARD RAIL
SJSIETW Exdruder Terminal Each
Estruder Terminal Each Sedion 510 - GUARD RAIL
SHOMBRF Bridge Fenciig, 100" High LF.
Bridge F encing, 60" High L.F. Sedion 511 - FENCING
SKOZBRF Bridge F encing, Curved Top, 107 High LF.
Eruﬂ& F encini, Cw Top, 10™ Hﬂh LF S_Edlnn 511 - FENCINL}

Figure 17) Sample report showing missing numbers
AND units and descriptions that do not match. Note that
even if the units are highlighted as not matching, they
may be correct (i.e. LS vs. L.S.).

3.4.4. Check Engineer’s Estimate:

When the “Check Engineer’'s Estimate” button is selected on the main menu, the
following form opens:

Spreadsheet Must have the Ffields:
"Unit Code”. "Unit Price” and "Quant"”

Unit: Code Unit: Price Quant
1010MOB 125000 1
1G015CH 30000 1
2B25RES 420 56

From Date: 413/2008
10f2(2008

To Date:

11mo| 18mo | all I

Load
Spreadsheet

il

Figure 18) Users are able to compare unit

engineer’s estimate to historical prices.

prices in their

Check Engineer's Estimate

Prices herein are for information, This information shall not
be used directly for the development of estimates. Costs for
Engireer Estimates shall #ill be derived specifically for each  Contracks  Quantity

contract,

1 1D01LAY LS, Constructon Layout
1010M0 L5, Mobilization
1G015CH LS. Progress Schedule
2A02CAG LS, Jearing and Grubbing
ZBOZREX C¥.  Roadway Excavalion, Eath

%% Diff compares the EE unit price to the "Average™

Using Bid Data from 6f2[2008
o 1zfifz00E
Averages over Time Period Contract Info
No of Total oo Diff
99 ° Quantity EE(N/A)  Average Max Min NoBidders | Unit Price Quant (M'J)
5 5 1 $413,651.71 $2,515,000,00 $L05 660 $300,000,00 1 27 4E%,
12 1z 1 $559,58141 $3,200,000,00 $10,000,00 575 1,000,000.00 1 12, 37%
7 7 1 $22,100,32 $200,000,00 F1.00 643 $50,000,00 1 176, 74 %:
4 4 1 4392,165.38 $2,125,000,00 45,000.00 7.00 $20,000.00 1 04, 78%
5 130101 26020.2 $a4.96 400,00 $1.00 650 f20.00 36114 _44,40%

Figure 19) Report comparing unit prices to a historical average.

range of dates.

November 2010

Users can select any
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APPENDIX A
APPROVED UNITS FOR PROPOSAL ITEMS

Approved Units Definition,
If Different

Acre

Bag

Barrel

C.F. Cubic Foot

C.P. Cost Plus

C.Y. Cubic Yard

Crew Days

Each

Each 55 Gal. Drum

FBM

Foot Board Measure

Gallon

Hour

L.F. Linear Foot

L.S. Lump Sum

M.G. Mega Gallons

M.H. Man Hours

MFBM 1000 Feet Board
Measure

Month

Pound

S.F. Square Foot

S.Y. Square Yard

Thousand Gallons

Ton

Unit

Week
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APPENDIX B
ABOUT SPECIAL UNIT CODES

Some Unit Codes are placed under special categories as follows:

DO NOT USE - Unit code descriptions are preceded with “DO NOT USE” when Authority policy
or practice calls for the unit code to be inactivated. These unit codes are still visible in the
database since they are part of previous bid tabulations and have cost information. New
Contracts should not use any DO NOT USE items in their Phase B or C submissions. A Unit
Code in the DO NOT USE category that does not have any bid history may be deleted from the
system.

RESERVED - A Unit Code request that is questionable is preceded with “RESERVED”. In other
words, the Authority will issue the Unit Code as requested but may be asking for a description or
unit change to better fit Authority naming conventions. New Contracts using a RESERVED item
are cautioned that the description may change. In some cases, RESERVED items end up not
being used for its intended project but remain in the database with “(Description to be entered
upon first use)” in the item description. These are typically deleted after a period of time, but may
be re-issued with an updated description if the Engineer includes the request in the Requested
Codes List submission.

TO BE REASSIGNED — A Unit Code that is no longer required for a contract AND has not been
requested on another Contract is preceded with “TO BE REASSIGNED”. This means that if
another Consultant does not request that Unit Code within a few months, the Unit Code may be
re-used.
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